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CHAPTER 1 - INTRODUCTION 

A. PURPOSEOFTHE 
FOREST PLAN 

This Land and Resource Management Plan (For- 
est Plan) directs the management of the Lassen 
National Forest (Figure 1-1) It does not apply to 
any State, pnvate, or other Federal land mthin 
the Forest boundaries The Plan’s purpose is to 
gude the integrated protection and use of the 
Forest’s resources, meet requirements ofleasla- 
tion, and address local, reaonal, and national 
issues To accomplish this, the Forest Plan 

sets the Forest Goals and Objectives for the 
next 10-15 years (the planning period), 

sets the Standards and Guidelines, and the 
approximate timing and location of prac- 
tices necessary to  achieve these goals and 
objectives, and 

sets the requirements for monitonng and 
evaluation needed to  insure that manage- 
ment direction is implemented and its objec- 
tives are met, and to  tngger changes in that 
direction, if needed 

Preparation of Forest Plans is required by the 
Forest and Rangeland Renewable Resources 
Planning Act of 1974 (RPA), as amended by the 
National Forest Management Act of 1976 
(NFMA), and the implementing regulations found 
in the Code of Federal Regulations (36 CFR 219, 
issued September 30,1982) 

Provlsions of the National Environmental Policy 
Act of 1969 (NEPA) require analysis of a Forest 
Plan’s envlronmental impacts The accompany- 
ing Envlronmental Impact Statement (EIS) de- 
scribes the management alternatives considered 
for the Lassen National Forest and the environ- 
mental effects of each The preferred alternative 
is identified, which is developed into this Forest 
Plan The Plan and the EIS are to be considered 
as a whole, rather than as separate documents 

B. RELATIONSHIP TO 
EXISTING FOREST 
PLANNING 

This comprehensive, integrated Plan applies t o  
all areas and resources of the Forest Therefore, 
it either supersedes exlsting p$ns or incorpo- 
rates them by reference The disposition of each 
existing plan is shown in Appendur A Where 
existing plans are incorporated by reference, 
they must be consistent mth  Forest Goals and 
Objectives and other management direction 
herein As necessary, these plans mll be amended 
to be consistent m t h  the Forest Plan, once it is 
approved 

This Plan also requires preparation of certain 
resource implementation plans to further define 
management direction These implementation 
plans are also listed in Appendur A Note that 
Congressional designation is required for new 
wilderness or  Wild and Scenic Rivers before 
implementation plans for these areas are begun 

Upon approval of this Plan by the Reaonal 
Forester, all land and resource management 
activities and all budget proposals will be based 
on the Plan As soon as practicable after ap- 
proval, all permits, contracts, cooperative agree- 
ments, and other instruments for use and occu- 
pancy of the Forest’s lands mll be brought into 
conformance mth the Plan, subject to existing 
nghts Note that prevlous contracts for timber or 
other commodities not yet harvested may pre- 
clude bnngmg such activities into full conform- 
ance m t h  this Plan. 

c. PLAN 
IMPLEMENTATION 

The Forest Plan and resource implementation 
plans w11 be carned out by the Distnct Rangers 
and their staffs Each of the Lassen’s three 
districts covers 12 to 19 “Management Areas”. 
The Plan is compnsed ofa set ofForest Goals and 
Objectives, and Standards and Gmdelines for 
theForest andforeachManagementArea. These 
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reflect the capability and suitability of the land 
to support vanous aetivlties The Distnct Rang- 
ers’staffs mll  plan andconduct resource projects 
that meetthis direction Projectsmll continue to 
be planned and evaluated through the interdis- 
ciplinary process. District and Forest staffs will 
conduct environmental analyses and document 
them in the appropriate environmental docu- 
ments (such as Envlronmental Assessments), 
which will be tiered to  the Forest Plan EIS (40 
CFR 1508.28) 

If a proposed project on National Forest land is 
determined to  be incompatible mth the direction 
of the Plan, the project wlll be revlsed or not 
permitted. Conficts that recur will result in a 
renew of the relevant management direction in 
the Plan, according to  its monitonng and evalu- 
ation process (Chapter 5), and may lead to Plan 
amendment or revmion 

By the time the Forest Plan is implemented in 
1992, budget proposals for 1993 and 1994 m11 
have been subnntted to Congress based on cur- 
rent planrung. These budgets may or may not 
meet budget requirements of the approved For- 
est Plan. Moreover, Congressional appropna- 
tions and allocations of the Chief and Resonal 
Forester during any future penod may or may 
not meet budget requirements of the approved 
Forest Plan. In these situations, the Forest 
Supervisor wll change the proposed Plan imple- 
mentation schedules to  reflect differences be- 
tween proposed Plan budgets and actual appro- 
pnated funds (36 CFR 219.10e) 

D. MONITORINGAND 
EVALUATION 

The Forest will momtor Forest Plan implemen- 
tation to  determine dit is being mplemented as 
designed (implementation monitor~g),  if imple- 
mentation is effective in meeting the Plan’s ob- 
jectives (effectiveness monitonng), and if the 
Plan’s initial assumptions are correct (vahda- 
tion monitonng) Specific monitonng requre- 
ments are listed in Chapter 5 of this Plan The 
Forest mll collect and evaluate the monitonng 
results regularly to determine the need for 
changes in the Plan An annual monitonng 
report m11 be prepared to inform the public on 
the progress in implementing the Plan. 

1-2 

E. REVISIONS, 
AMENDMENTS 

As directed by NFMA, the Forest Plan mll be 
revlsed at  least every 15 years and ordmanly 
every 10 years It may also be revlsed whenever 
the Forest Supervisor de t emnes  that con&- 
tions or demands, mcludmg the RPA program, 
have changed sufficiently to affect goals or uses 
for the entire Forest Under a schedule approved 
by the Chief of the Forest Semce, the Forest 
Supervisor prepares and the Regonal Forester 
approves Forest Plan revlsions For the purpose 
of a possible revlsion, the Forest Supervisor wll 
review conditions of the lands covered by tlns 
Plan at  least every five years 

Between Plan revlsions, it can be amended to 
reflect changmg conditions The Forest Supem- 
sor can prepare and approve an amendment If 
the change is not sigmficant; such changes can 
be expected annually to  adjust some ofthe Plan’s 
details. If the change is significant, the Forest 
Supemsorprepares the amendment forRegiona1 
Forester approval Public notification and ad- 
herence to  NEPA procedures are required in 
either case. 

F. PLAN ORGANIZATION 

This Forest Plan has s1x sections. 

Chapter 1 Introduction. 

Chapter 2 Issues summanzes the pubhc 
issues, management concerns, and resource 
opportunities affectingthe Forest, andshows 
how the Plan addresses them. 

Chapter 3 Summary of the Analysis of the 
Management Situation summanzes both the 
Analysis of the Management Situation (in 
the planning records) and the EIS Affected 
Envlronment (Chapter 3) It descnbes the 
management situation, supply and demand, 
and the need and opportunity for change in 
management direction for the vanous re- 
sources. 

Chapter 4 Management Direction is the 
heart of the Plan It contains the Forest 
Goals, Forest Objectives, Forest Standards 
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and Guidelines, Prescnptions for particular 
lunds of land, and Management Area Direc- 
tion. The Management Area maps show 
where the prescnptions are applied For an 
illustration of the hierarchy of Management 
Direction, see Figure 4-1 

Chapter 5Monztonng.sets requmements for 
monitonng and evaluating both the imple- 
mentation and theresults ofthe Forest Plan. 

Chapter 6 Appendzces contains a vanety of 
background and specific program informa- 
tion 

G. APPEALRIGHTS 

A Record of Decision (ROD) has not been issued 
by the Reaonal Forester t o  approve this Plan. 
Because of the number of changes since the draft 
EIS and Plan were released in 1986, there will be 
a 60 day public comment penod. Public com- 
ments should focus on new or additional factual 
information regarding the issues or where the 
analysis may have been incomplete Renewers 
of this final Plan and EIS must structure their 
participation dunng the public comment penod 
so it alerts the Forest Semce to  the reviewer’s 
position and contentions This w11 allow the 
Reaonal Forester to meamngfully consider them 
and respond to them in the ROD. 

Upon Regonal Forester approval of the Plan in 
the ROD, the Forest Semce has an internal 
administrative renew process available to  mem- 
bers of the pubhc who wsh to  challenge a Forest 

Semce decision An administrative appeal of 
the decision to approve the Lassen National 
Forest Plan can be filed according to Code of 
Federal Regulations provlsions (36 CFR Part 
217). Decisions made dunng the Forest plan- 
ning process pnor to issuance of the Record of 
Decision are not subject t o  administrative ap- 
peal. 

The Planning Records for this Plan (36 CFR 
219 10(h)) are available for review a t  the Forest 
Supemsor’s office and are hereby incorporated 
by reference into this Plan. 

Two copies of the notice of appeal should he sent 
within 90 days from the date this decision was 
published in the legal notice section of the Sacra- 
mento Bee, Sacramento, California 

Two copies of the notice of appeal must be sub- 
mitted to  

Chief (1570) 
USDA Forest Servlce 
Auditor’s Building 
201 14th Street, SW 
Washington, DC 20250 

Questions regarding this Plan and EIS shouldbe 
sent to 

Forest Supervisor 
Lassen Nahonal Forest 
55 South Sacramento Street 
Susanvllle, CA 96130 
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CHAPTER 2 - PUBLIC ISSUES AND 
MANAGEMENT CONCERNS 

In late 1979 and early 1980, the Forest identified 
issues and concerns through public involvement 
and Forest Staff suggestions. These public is- 
sues and management concerns, raised and 
addressed by this Plan, fall under the general 
term “issues” The process of seekmg, receivmg, 
and developing these issues is descnbed in the 
FEIS, Appendlx A How each issue is answered 
wth each management alternatwe is shown in 
Table 2-19 of the FEIS How the 26 issues are 
answered by this Plan (the Preferred Alternative 
from the FEIS) IS summanzed below. 

1. AIR QUALITY How should air quality be 
protected in vanous areas from actinties on the 
Forest? 

Forest Standards and Guldelmes call for comph- 
ancemth State andlocal mrquahtyreqwements, 
and mmmizing of smoke encroachment from 
prescnbed burning. 

2. BIOMASS What kinds and amounts of 
biomass can be utilized for energy while meeting 
ecologxal needs? 

A total of about 165,000 tons of biomass will be 
made available each year as by-products of For- 
est actinties Forest Standards and Guidelines 
encourage the energy utilization of biomass that 
is surplus to other needs 

3. CULTURAL RESOURCES How should 
the Forest most effectively provlde for protection 
and interpretation of prehistonc and histoneal 
resources, while managmg its land for other 
uses? 

Forest Standards and Guidelines call for inven- 
tory and protection of important cultural 
resources and for their interpretation to the 
public. Management Area Direction gives guid- 
ance on protection of specific areas 

4. ENERGY How should the Forest be man- 
aged and operated to  best support local and 
regional energy needs? 

Forest Standards and Guidelines call for con- 
tinuing energy audit and conservation measures 
of Forest bulldings, vehicles, and equipment. 
(See the Biomass and Firewood issues for those 
aspects of the energy picture, and the Minerals 
issue for energy from geothermal and oil and 
gas ) 

5. FACILITIES What transportation systems 
and other facilities should be established and 
maintained on the Forest t o  provlde for manage- 
ment needs? 

The Plan specifies the average road mileage (66 
miles) and trail mleage (3 5 miles) to be con- 
structedorreconstructed peryear It also requres 
the maintenance of the systems in a cost-effi- 
cient manner, and directs the maintenance of 
dams and administrative sites More specific 
guidance on constructing and maintaining fa- 
cilities (such as roads) appear in the Forest 
Standards and Guldehnes, Management Pre- 
scnptions, and Management Area Direction. 

6. FIRE AND FUELS What fire management 
and fuel treatment programs will best protect 
life, property, and environmental quality while 
assisting in resource management? 

Forest Standards and Guidelines gwe general 
direction on cost-effective fire suppression, pre- 
vention, and fuels management including 
prescnbed burning Each Management Prescnp- 
tion gwes direction on fire suppression strategy, 
acres allowed per fire, and acceptable acres 
burned, and gwes guidance on fuel loadings and 
prescnbed fire use. The Plan calls for about 
6,050 total acres of fuel treatment per year 
through prescnbed burning 

7. FIREWOOD How can a sustained supply of 
firewood be provided and what should be the 
pnorities in its allocation? 

The Plan expects about 69,000 cords offirewood 
to be available per year, and assigns 8,200 acres 
of lodgepole pine to  firewood management In 
addition the Plan gwes personal use offirewood 
pnonty over commercial and industnal uses, 

~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 
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and reqmres measures to keep areas accessible 
to firewood cutting. 

8. FISH What productivlty, quality, and diver- 
sity of fish habitat should be provlded and 
protected? 

The Planliststhe amount ofresident andanadro- 
mous fish expected to  be produced on the Forest 
Forest Standards and Guldelines require mainte- 
nance of fish habitat; Management Prescnptions 
and Management Area Direction specify extra 
protection and enhancement of habitat in key 
areas 

9. FOREST HEALTH What biologxal pests 
affect timber and other resources on the Forest, 
and what pest management methods should he 
used? 

Forest pests are identified in the FEIS Chapter 
3, Affected Envlronment. Forest Standards and 
Gmdelines call for use of integrated pest man- 
agement t o  reduce impacts of forest pests. 

10. GEOLOGY What significant geolo@cal 
features are there on the Forest and how should 
they be developed, protected, or interpreted? 

Forest Standards and Guldelines requlre geo- 
logxal inventones where needed. Three new 
Geologwal Special Interest Areas are classified 
(designated) in the Plan. They are the Black 
Rock, Crater Lake, and Deep Hole Special Inter- 
est Areas 

11. LANDS How should the Forest coordinate 
land use practices with adjoining public and 
pnvate landowners, and to  what extent should it 
reduce possible conflicts with intermingled lands 
by implementing land ownership adjustments? 

Forest Standards and Guidelines gme direction 
on landowner coordination, land ownership ad- 
justment  planning, r ights  of way, land 
mthdrawals, special use permits including small 
hydroelectnc projects, utility corridors, and un- 
authorized occupancies Management Area 
Direction lists specific land adjustment opportu- 
nities 

12. LAW ENFORCEMENT What priorities 
and strateDes should be followed in the enforce- 
ment of laws on the Forest? 

Forest Standards and Guldelines pnontize the 
types oflaw enforcement and resource protection 
opportunities 

13. M I N E W S  How should mineral develop- 
ment activlty be encouraged while protecting 
surface resources? 

Forest Standards and Gmdelines encouragemin- 
era1 (including energy) development while 
ensunng protection of surface resources. The 
Plan lists cntena for denymg energy leasing and 
for conditional leasing It also gwes direction on 
mineral mthdrawals 

14. RANGE Where, how, and m t h  what range 
improvements should livestock grazing occur on 
the Forest? 

The Plan sets the level of livestock grazmg at 
48,500 AUMs per year, and lists Forest Stan- 
dards and Guidelines that provlde for protection 
of other resources The Management Prescrip- 
tions further specify livestock management 
measures, andManagementArea Dlrection gwes 
the management stratepes for each allotment. 

15. RECREATION What types of recreation 
facilities and opportunities should be provided 
on the Forest, and in what amounts, proportions, 
and locations? 

The Plan sets the lebel of developed recreation 
(mainly campgrounds) at about 820,000 recre- 
ation vlsitor days (RVD's) per year, and provldes 
other land for different types of dispersed recre- 
ation, totalling about 400,000 RVD's per year 
How the Forest mll provlde a vanety of recre- 
ation opportunities is answered generally by the 
Forest Standards and Guidelines and more spe- 
cifically by the Management Prescriptions. 
Management Area Direction provldes gudance 
for managing specific units of land such as dis- 
persed campsites, recreation residences, and 
snowmobile parks. 

16. SENSITIVE PLANTS What Sensitive 
plantsgrow on theForest and how should they be 
preserved? 

The Sensitive plants are identified 111 the Plan 
Chapter 3, section 16 Forest Standards and 
Guidelines require protection of all Sensitive 
plant habitat on the Forest 
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Management Area Direction requires inventory 
and protection of Sensitive plants where be- 
lieved to occur. 

17. SOILS How should the Forest soil resource 
be protected and where should it be enhanced? 

Forest Standards and Guidelines prohibit irre- 
versible loss of soil productivity and require 
restoration of degraded areas. Management 
Area Direction requires protective measures in 
specific problem areas The Plan calls for oppor- 
tunities to enhance soil productivlty to be assessed 
in the future 

IS. SPECIAL AREAS Should management of 
existing special areas on the Forest be changed? 
Should additional special areas be established 
for unique resources, and if so, where should 
they be located and how should they be man- 
aged? 

The Plan continues current management of ex- 
isting special areas It recommends SIX candidate 
Research Natural Areas, classifies (designates) 
seven Special Interest Areas, and requires man- 
agement to protect the natural values for which 
they are established Locations are shown on the 
Management Area Maps 

19. TIMBER Where and how should the Forest 
manage its timber resources, while providing for 
other resource values such as ecologmal diver- 
sity and recreation? 

The Plan sets the amount, type, location, and 
timing of timber harvests Approximately 
342,040 acres are available for intensive timber 
management production An additional 254,301 
acres are available for timber production on a 
very limited basis Annual harvest will average 
96 million board feet, nsing to 113 million board 
feet in five decades, using even-aged manage- 
ment as the preferred silvleultural system, and 
reforesting an average of 3,600 acres of regenera- 
tion units per year Rocky and sparse timber 
lands (about 26 percent ofthe suitable acres) will 
receive only selection harvest 

Plantation precommerical thinning and weed 
control will be conducted on 2,800 acres of plan- 
tation per year In addition, an estimated 1,900 
acres of existing wild stands will be precom- 
mercially thinned per year during decade 1 

Commercial thinning of naturally regenerated 
stands to improve stand vlgor mll produce both 
board feet (lumber) and tons of biomass Ap- 
proximately 4,000 acres per year will be 
commercially thinned dunng decade 1 

Forest Standards and Guidelines gwe measures 
to  protect soil, vlsual, wildlife, and other re- 
sources Management Prescriptions list the 
typeb) of timber harvesting emphasized and the 
type(s) permitted on a gwen type of land 

20. VEGETATION AND ECOLOGICAL DI- 
VERSITY Where and how should the Forest 
manage its vegetation resources over time, to 
maintam diversity while provlding other resource 
outputs? 

Forest Standards and Guidelines require ad- 
equate vegetation and ecological diversity 
conditions to  support wildlife, scenic quality, and 
other needs Older-aged stands are maintained 
by implementation of a late-successional stage 
vegetation prescription Many timbered and 
non-commercial timbered areas will receive pre- 
scnptions that manage timber at  less than full 
intensity, thereby providing high levels of 
diversity elements such as snags, dead and down 
wood, and hardwoods Prescnbed burning in 
non-timbered types will maintain a diversity of 
age classes Significant examples of major veg- 
etation types will be maintained in Research 
Natural Areas 

21. VISUAL QUALITY What visual quality 
objectives should be maintained on the Forest? 

The Plan assigns visual quality objectives to  the 
Forest, as mapped on the accompanymgAdopted 
Visual Quality Objective Map, and requires that 
management activities meet or exceed them 
Management Prescriptions gwe guidelines on 
how to accomplish this for each visual quality 
objective Management Area direction empha- 
sizes the above direction for specific points of 
interest such as the Pacific Crest Trail 

' 22. WATER How should watersheds on the 
Forest be managed to  protect and enhance water 
quality and quantity? 

Because most Management Areas are discrete 
watersheds, the combination of Management 
Area Direction (including scheduled activlties) 
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and Management Prescnptions best define what 
actinties m11 occur in that watershed Forest 
Standards and Gmdelines direct that “Best Man- 
agement Practices” be applied to protect water 
quality and that a cumulative watershed impact 
analysis be performed for such activities in wa- 
tersheds containing Class I fishenes. They also 
require maintenance of nparian areas and com- 
pliance with Federal, State, and local water 
quality standards The Plan allocates the Ripar- 
i a f i s h  Prescnption to most bodies of water on 
the Forest (except for special areas). 

23. WILD AND SCENIC RIVERS What nver 
segments should be recommended for inclusion 
in the Federal Wild and Scenic River System? 

The Plan recommends designation of Mill Creek, 
Deer Creek, and Antelope Creek as Wild and 
Scenic Rivers and directs their interim manage- 
ment pending designation by Congress (These 
recommendations are preliminary and will re- 
ceive renew and possible modification by the 
Chief of the Forest Service, the Secretary of 
Agnculture, and the President ) 

24. WILDERNESS AND FURTHER PLAN- 
NING AREAS How should the Forest’s three 
existing Wildernesses be managed to maintain 
their wilderness character, and how should the 
Forest’s SIX further planning areas be allocated 
and managed? 

The Plan recommends three of the further plan- 
ning areas and a portion of a fourth as new 
wilderness, and the remaining areas for non- 
wilderness (The wilderness recommendations 
are preliminary and will receive review and 
possible modification by the Chief of the Forest 

Semce, the Secretary of Agnculture, and the 
President. Congress establishes wilderness 
The Wilderness Prescription gwes direction on 
management for existing and proposed wilder- 
ness, to be supplemented by Wilderness 
Implementation Plans for individual wilder- 
nesses 

25. WILDLIFE What type, amount, and diver- 
sity of wildlife habitats should be provided 
through time on the Forest? 

The Forest Plan gves projected populations for 
keywildlife species. Forest Standards and Guide- 
lines require the protection of Threatened and 
Endangered species and their habitat and mam- 
tenance ofhabitat for species dependent on snags, 
cavities and down logs, maintenance of habitat 
for viable populations of spotted owls (40 pairs), 
goshawks (113 pars),  fisher, and marten, and 
cooperation with other agencies and coordina- 
tion with other resource projects Management 
Prescnptions specify which mldlife species are 
provided for, which habitat practices are em- 
phasized, and which are permitted Management 
Area Direction lists species to be emphasized 
and any special measures to protect or improve 
habitat 

26. SOCIO-ECONOMIC What are the costs, 
benefits, and socio-economic effects of manage- 
ment of the Forest? 

Plan Chapter 3, sections B and C, and FEIS 
Chapter 3, Affected Environment, descnbe the 
economic and social environment, and FEIS 
Chapters 2 and 4 gwe the economic and social 
effects of each alternative including the Pre- 
ferred Alternative (this Plan) 
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CHAPTER 3 - SuRlRlARY OF THE ANALYSIS OF 
THE MANAGEMENT SITUATION 

A. INTRODUCTION 

This chapter summanzes the Analysis of the 
Management Situation (AMs), a set of docu- 
ments that examines the existing situation for 
each resource on the Forest The AMs is part of 
the Planning Records 

Descnptions for each resource are in Chapter 3, 
Affected Environment, of the accompanylng Fi- 
nal Envlronmental Impact Statement In con- 
trast, this Chapter focuses on the management 
implications of these resources Future man- 
agement direction provided for each resource 
by this Forest Plan is summarized in the prevl- 
ous chapter Sections B and C below descnbe the 
economic and social envlronment, followed by 
management descnptions of the resources in 
alphabetical order Unless o themse  noted, the 
descnptions below refer to the geographical area 
of the Lassen National Forest itself, not the 
reson or State 

B. ECONOMIC 
E " I M E N T  

The Forest's impact counties are Butte, Lassen, 
Plumas, Shasta, andTehamaCounties Portions 
of the Forest ais0 lie in Modoc and Siskiyou 
Counties, but its influence on them is slight The 
five impact counties are significantly affected by 
timber, range, mldlife, and recreation actinties 
on the Forest, as well as by its direct employ- 
ment 

1. Population 
The impact counties' population has grown sub- 
stantially in the past two decades-an average 
annual rate of 3 7 percent from 1970 to 1989 
Future growth is expected to  average 2 0 percent 
per year through the year 2000 People movlng 
into the area, pnmarily urban emigrants and 
retirees, account for over three quarters of both 
past and future growth 

2. Employment 
The economy of the area has been dominated by 
four employment sectors government (26 per- 
cent of the workforce), services (20 percent), 
retail trade (20 percent), and manufactunng (11 
percent) Trends show a decreased reliance on 
National Forest-related industries for employ- 
ment Unemployment in the impact area has 
remained significantly higher than both State 
and national averages The influx of people has 
broughtmorejob-seekers thanthe economy could 
absorb, and the seasonal nature ofmany timber, 
recreation, and tounsm related jobs has also 
raised the unemployment rate Reduced em- 
ployment has resulted in reduced per capita 
income compared to the State and national aver- 
ages 

3. Economic Role of Forest 
In addition to resource production, the Forest 
contnbutes directly to the local economy prima- 
nly through the Forest Reserve Fund payments 
and its own budget. 

Forest Reserve Fund (FRF) The Forest re- 
ceives revenues from timber sales, grazing fees, 
campground fees, mineral permit fees, and land 
use fees About 98 percent of its revenues are 
from timber sales Twenty-five percent of a 
Forest's gross revenues go into the Forest Re- 
serve Fund, which is returned to the counties in 
which the Forest is located The dollars are split 
equally between county road and school pro- 
grams Forest Reserve Fund payments fluctuate 
sharply from year to year, but represent a very 
important income source for county government 
The Forest returned about $3 1 million in FRF 
payments in 1982, and $6 9 million in 1990 

Forest Budget In 1982 the Forest employed 
over 300 permanent employees and more than 
150 summer (seasonal) employees, who contrib- 
ute t o  the local economy In the summer of 1990, 
the Forest employed 234 permanent employees 
and 193 seasonal employees for a total of 427 
people The Forest also spends many thousands 
of dollars each year in the local economy for a 
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variety of purchases and contracts The total 
Forest budget was around $12.3 million in 1982 
and $16 0 million in 1990 

In addition, the Forest contnbutes indirectly by 
provlding timber for harvesting and nulling, 
range forage for livestock operations, and 
recreation opportunities €or tounst business, 
etc 

C. SOCIALENVIRONMENT 

1. Social Groups 

The Forest plays an important role in the lives of 
residents of the impact area Long-time resi- 
dents and newcomers alike prefer the natural 
setting and resources that the Forest provldes 
All social groups utilize the Forest for recreation 
and firewood, but the groups differ in several 
other land management demands and issues. 
The four social groups and their relationship to 
Forest management are summarized below 

Ranchers Once dominant in all aspects of the 
local economic, political, and social structure, 
ranchers still form the core of many local 
communities They still have strong ties to the 
Forest's lands and rely on them for range, wood, 
andwater, as wellaswildlifeandfish Trahtional 
ranchers prefer to preserve their rural lifestyle 
and retain local control over management of the 
Forest's commodity and amenity resources 

Timber Industry Workers Like ranchers 
before them, the timber industry also once 
dominated the local economy. The industry 
depends directly and heavlly on the Forest Its 
workers include loggers, mill workers, managers, 
and small business operators Increased 
competibon forjobs in a depressedlumber market 
is causing unemployment and threatening 
economic sumval  of small loggmg operators 
Industry workers favor intensive and efficient 
timber production and development ofthe Forest 
commodity values. Secondanly they value its 
recreational opportunities, especially hunting 
and fishing 

Government Workers Public employees are a 
diverse group Attitudes and values include 
those of the other groups, but  in  general 

government workers share an interest in public 
policy and Forest management, in protection of 
its amenity resources, and in orderly economc 
development. The government sector since 1980 
has been by far the largest employer, totaling 27 
percent of the workforce in the impact area, 
including 49 percent in Lassen County 

Urban Emigrants Within the last two decades 
urban emgrants have greatly modified the local 
communities. They are drawn from most other 
social groups and mclude retirees, second-home 
owners, professionals, small businessmen, 
government workers, and craftsmen Mosturban 
emgrants favor the amenity aspectsoftheForest 
over the commodity aspects, and expansion of 
recreabonal opportunities An activlst component 
ofthis group has deep concerns for envlronmental 
preservation, participates in political circles, and 
demands more involvement in Forest policy 
decisions. 

2. MinoritieslEthnic Groups 

The racial and ethnic make-up ofthe impact area 
is predomnmtly white (88 percent) Persons of 
Hispanic ongm constitute the largest ethnic mi- 
nonty group (6.6 percent), whle Native Ameri- 
cans constitute the largest racial mnority group 
(two percent). Most mnority employment is in 
resource-based industnes, often seasonal. 

AllethnicandracialgroupsdependontheForest 
for recreation, firewood, and as a component of 
the rural lifestyle. 

Native Americans Descendants of several 
indigenous hunting and gathenng groups, Native 
Amencans retain a distinct set of attitudes and 
beliefs alongmthlong-standmgties to the Forest 
Some Native Americans gather traditional 
natural products from Forest lands, and certain 
localities are used for the practice of religous 
ntes Native Amencan groups and indimduals 
have, therefore, expressed strong concerns about 
Forest management in the past Threats to their 
cultural hentage, such as timber harvest or  
energy development in significant areas, ml1 
incur responses in the future Native Amencans 
are also often employed in the timber and 
agnculture industnes 
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D. RESOURCE 
ENVJ.RO”T 

1. AIRQUALITY 

a. Current Management 

The Forest complies mth State and county air 
quality protection standards It is considered an 
“attainment” area because it meets or  exceeds 
the National Ambient Am Quality Standards 
(NAAQS) mandated by the Cleanhr  Act of 1963 
as amended. The Canbou, Thousand Lakes, and 
Lassen Volcanic Wilderness Areas are desig- 
nated as Class I areas, allowing no degradation 
in air quality The remainder of the Forest 
(including the Ishi Wilderness) is Class 11, 
allowing some reduction To achieve compli- 
ance, the Forest adopts mitigations for projects 
that create particulate matter Timber purchas- 
ers are required to  control dust on logging roads 
(water is usually applied, but chemcal dust 
treatments are increasingly being used) Pre- 
scribed burning is timed so that smoke does not 
exceed air quality standards or  contnbute to 
exceeding them Overall, the Forest’s air quality 
is high and not impaired significantly by activi- 
ties on the Forest 

b. Opportunities 

The Forest can, without constraining other re- 
source activities, continue to meet and exceed air 
quality standards and protect the clean, fresh air 
most vlsitors expect from a National Forest 

2. BIOMASS 

a.  Current Management 

In this context, the term biomass refers to the 
entire above ground part of trees. This resource 
is one of increasing interest on the Forest Once 
a discarded by-product of loggmg or thinning, 
biomass now has growing value as fuel both for 
home heating (see Firewood section below) and 
for generating electncity 

The Forest has added provlsions to timber sale 
contracts that facilitate removal and use of bio- 
mass matenal The Forest Semce has adopted 
a National policy gwing preference to personal 

use firewood gatherers over industrial users in 
the allocation of biomass Firewood gatherers 
and biomass utilizers favor different types and 
locations ofwood matenal Demand for both has 
not exceeded supplies, and competition for fire- 
wood and biomass is not expected 

b. Supply 

The Forest can sustain a supply ofwood residues 
from both timber sales and thinning operations. 
The maximum theoretical supply under present 
silvicultural practices is 165,000 oven dry tons 
per year m decade 1 In reahty, access dd6culties 
would make the practical supply somewhat 
less 

c. Demand 

Eleven wood-fired cogeneration plants currently 
operate on or near the Forest, and requre over 
one million oven dry tons of biomass per year. 
Supply for this demand comes from null waste as 
well as National Forest and pnvate ownership 
forestry operations 

d. Opportunity 

Recently, the Lassen has designed many forestry 
operations which make biomass available Ex- 
amples include stand tendmg activities designed 
to thin overstocked plantations and natural 
stands, fire salvage; and slash cleanup following 
timber sale harvest Opportunity exists t o  
increase biomass supply while still meeting the 
demand for personal use firewood. 

3. CULTURAL RESOURCES 

a. Introduction 

Cultural resources include structures, sites, ar- 
eas, and objects that have scientific, histonc, or 
cultural value. The Forest cultural resource 
overview (in the Planning Records) provldes a 
detailed description of past human occupation 
and use of the Forest Prehistoric sites include 
vlllages, camps, tool manufactunng sites, plant 
processing locations, and hunting stations Cab- 
ins, loggmg camps, emigrant trails, and wagon 
roads are common histonc sites and features on 
the Forest Remnants ofthe histonc Lassen and 
Nobles Emigrant trails are still vlsible as they 
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cross the Forest. Sites associated with particu- 
lar ethnic groups include Native American spin- 
tual and resource gathering areas, Basque aspen 
camngs, and Chinese mining camps Of par- 
ticular significance is the homeland of Ishi, the 
last Yahi Yana Indian 

b. Current Management 

The Forest manages cultural resources that may 
contribute to our understanding of the reDon’s 
cultural history and the lifeways of its past 
human occupants Cultural resources associ- 
ated w t h  traditional values of contemporary 
Native Americans are also managed. 

The Forest identifies cultural properties in con- 
junction wthresource management projects such 
as timber sales Through the envlronmental 
analysis process, project managers develop and 
apply mtigation measures to  protect cultural 
resources The Forest consults with the State 
Historic Preservation Officer and the Advisory 
Council on Histonc Preservation regardmg treat- 
ment of significant resources. Options include 
protection, preservation, documentation, resto- 
ration, or data recovery If necessary, projects 
are modified to preserve the cultural resources 
or to mitigate effects on them. Certain key areas 
are excluded from most Forest management ac- 
tivities to protect their unique cultural values 

c. Cultural Properties 

With about 48 percent of the Forest inventoned, 
1,788 cultural properties have been identified 
Of these, 60 have been evaluated for their elip- 
bility t o  the National Reaster of Histonc Places. 
One area (the 11,500 acre Lake Britton Archaeo- 
logxal District) is on the Reester An estimated 
3,000 cultural properties have not yet been iden- 
tified The major deficiencies in information 
include the identification of cultural properties 
in non-forest environments and understanding 
the contnbution cultural properties make to our 
knowledge of human behavlor 

d. Opportunity 

The Forest has an opportunity to develop a pro- 
gram to effectively manage cultural resources 
Such management will require (1) the identifi- 
cation of cultural properties outside of project 

areas, (2) the maintenance of their scientific, 
historic, and cultural values, (3) the scientific 
study of cultural resources to enhance our under- 
standing of human behavlor; and (4) providing 
information to the public on our cultural heri- 
tage 

Archaeologxal research has focused on the pre- 
historic occupations of Eagle Lake, Mill Creek, 
the Pit River, and the meadow that is now Lake 
Almanor. Local Native Amencans interested in 
maintaining their unique cultural and spiritual 
hentage show strong interest m preserving asso- 
ciated sites on the Forest. Such interests are 
expected to  increase. However, natural deteno- 
ration, looting and vandalism continually reduce 
the Forest’s cultural resources, and only limited 
means are available to  prevent such losses as 
well as t o  interpret the resources to the public 
More protection and public information would 
help reverse the situation 

4. ENERGY 

a. Current Management 

The Forest’s energy resources fall into eight 
categories Hydroelectric, wind, solar, and con- 
sumption are discussed in this section Geother- 
mal, oil, and gas are descnbed in the Minerals 
section, and wood-based energy in the Firewood 
and Biomass sections Utility corndors needed 
to transmit the energy are discussed in the Fa- 
cilities section 

Hydroelectric Hydroelectric power is the 
main energy resource associated with the For- 
est Nine hydroelectric facilities are on or  near 
the Forest, and another is partially dependent on 
water flowing from the Forest In addition, many 
applications have been filed for new “small hy- 
droelectric” facilities since passage of the Public 
Utilities Regulatory Policy Act of 1978 (PURPA). 
The Federal Energy Regulatory Commission 
(FERC) processes these applications as they are 
filed, and the Forest Servlce responds to each by 
provlding FERC with measures to mitigate any 
project’s effects The Forest also conducts an 
envlronmental analysis and may issue a special 
use permit for hydroelectric facilities, and an 
easement for a power transmission line Forest 
Service policy is to cooperate with FERC, other 
Federal and State agencies, and developers in 
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helping realize the hydroelectric potential of 
water flowing from National Forest lands The 
Forest Semce is also responsible for ensunng 
that proposed projects comply with environmen- 
tal laws and policies for National Forest lands. 

Wind The only wind power facilities on the 
Forest are several windmills used in rangeland 
water projects No private or government efforts 
have attempted togenerate electncity frommnd, 
although some sites are theoretically feasible. 

Solar The Forest has photovoltaic solar sys- 
tems on three ofits fire lookouts, and some solar- 
powered electric fences have been used on graz- 
ing allotments Other uses of solar power remain 
undeveloped 

Consumption and Conservation Manage- 
ment actinties on a National Forest consume 
substantial amounts of energy-gasoline, diesel, 
heatingoil, propane, andelectncity. Federallaw 
requres a reduction m energy consumption for 
general Forest administration and a retrofitting 
program for Forest buldings. The Forest’s ve- 
hicle fleet must also meet fuel efficiency stan- 
dards. Each Forest-related activity has a value 
both for energy consumption and for energy 
yleld. Livestock grazing, and biomass and fire- 
wood utilization have positive net energy ylelds. 
Recreation, road construction, and general ad- 
ministration have negative net ylelds Opportu- 
nities t o  decrease energy consumption include 
improved road design to  reduce logging truck 
fuel use, retrofit of buildings, and selection of 
fuel-efficient fleet vehicles The Forest is taking 
all measures listed, wherever appropnate. 

b. Supply 

Hydroelectric The ten hydroelectnc projects 
amount t o  less than two percent of California’s 
total electrical production. About 36 applica- 
tions have been received since 1981 These 
applications were processed, and many were 
eliminated for a vanety of reasons, including 
competition for the same water source, envlron- 
mental concerns, and proponents voluntanly 
surrendenng their applications The remaining 
applications were processed by FERC and the 
Forest Servlce Construction of approved small 
hydros was completed when the Lost Creek 
hydros were built in 1990. A few projects would 
be precluded by any Wild and Scenic River des- 

ignation of Deer, Mill, or Antelope Creeks Hy- 
droelectnc facilities m11 not be recommended on 
Hat Creek 

Wind Several areas of the Forest, mainly 
exposed ndges, are classified “excel1ent”formnd 
power because they offer a mean power density 
greater than 28 watts per square foot a t  a w n d  
speed of 14 miles per hour However, access, 
facility development, and electncal transmis- 
sion costs appear prohbitive 

Solar Overall, the Forest ranks “medium” in its 
sutability for solar power Again, associated 
costs appear prohibitive for development beyond 
what exists. 

Consumption and Conservation The gen- 
eral administration ofthe Forest consumes about 
42 billion Bntish thermal units (BTU’s) a year, of 
which 55 percent is for vehicles and 45 percent 
for buildings. 

c. Demand 

Hydroelectric Demand for renewable energy 
such as hydroelectnc power is expected to in- 
crease along mth the State’s population and 
energyprices Whilemost ofthe suitable sitesfor 
major hydroelectnc plants are already devel- 
oped, potential sites for “small hydro” facilities 
are theoretically numerous Filings for such 
projects increased sharply after the passage of 
PURPA in 1978, but have recently dropped off. 

Wind Demand formnd energy is not significant 
and is not expected to become so, even with 
projected increases in population and energy 
costs. 

Solar Demand for solar energy has been limited 
to Forest Servlce fire lookouts. Photovoltaic 
solar energy could be used in retrofitting other 
lookouts and remote administrative sites, but 
large-scale uses are not expected. Solar water 
heating systems could be constructed at govern- 
ment facilities and would provide long-term sav- 
ings 

Consumption and Conservation The Forest 
can meet applicable energy efficiency targets 
For hscussion of energy conservation potential, 
see Chapter 4, section G in the accompanying 
Ennronmental Impact Statement 
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5. FACILITIES 

a. Introduction 

Forest facilities include roads, trails, utility cor- 
ndors, bwldings, sewer and water systems, dams, 
and major stream crossings Each is discussed 
separately 

b. Roads 

Of the 4,732 miles of roads on the Forest, the 
Forest development road (FDR) system has 3,472 
miles, and State, county, and pnvate roads com- 
pnse 1,260 miles The combination of these 
systems provldes public access for admmistra- 
tion and movement of goods from and across 
National Forest lands The Forest works mth 
State and county agencles to insure that, as 
provlded in cooperative agreements and memo- 
randa ofunderstanding, design and maintenance 
standards match with probable National Forest- 
generated use levels In 1982, the Forest identi- 
fied seven county roads that met the cnteria for 
Forest Hlghway designation and needed improve- 
ment t o  better serve Forest users. Four roads 
were completed or  dropped Three are still in the 
Forest Highway inventory for future work con- 
sideration. 

The National Forest contains 361 mles  of arte- 
na l  roads, most of which are State Highways 
( e g  32, 36, 44, and 89) It has 464 miles of 
collector roads, most of which are Forest devel- 
oped roads that are generally unpaved and con- 
structed to meet multiple resource needs Ap- 
proximately 3,907 miles of local roads are un- 
paved and usually built for timber sales Addi- 
tional uses include timber sale improvement, 
fire protection, firewood gathenng, and dispersed 
motonzed recreation In addition, the Forest 
contains approximately 500 miles of uninven- 
toried roads As projects are planned in areas 
including these roads, Forest managers will de- 
termine whether to add them to the Forest devel- 
opment road system, or t o  obliterate them 

The Forest development road system receives 
regular maintenance to prevent resource dam- 
age Each road or road segment is assigned one 
of five maintenance levels commensurate with 
traffic management and use objectives 4 1  sys- 
tem roads are maintained to at least mainte- 

nance level 1 (custodial care) Forest Servlce 
policy is to maintain roads a t  the minimum level 
necessary for recreation, resource use, Forest 
administration, and protection of adjacent ar- 
eas Commercial users of Forest roads share in 
costs for their maintenance Where roads are 
jointly-owned, the Forest Service and the other 
owner usually exchange easements and nghts- 
of-use through maintenance agreements The 
agreements provide that each party mll  coopera- 
tively maintain and preserve the road to origmal 
standards 

The arterial road system needs upgrading to  
handle traffic demand The collector road sys- 
tem is generally adequate The local road system 
may be expanded to meet projected timber sale 
demands. Biomass gathering for wood-burning 
power plants could put adhtional demands on 
the Forest’s road system Road maintenance 
objectives may need adjustment to mitigate con- 
flict between timber, recreation, biomass, and 
firewood traffic 

e. Trails 

The 465 mles of developed trails consist of 30 
miles of National Recreation Trails, 125 miles of 
Pacific Crest Trail, and 310 miles ofother trails 
Trail use totals about 30,000 recreation visitor 
days per year. While the trails are generally kept 
open for safe use, not all meet desired standards 

There is a current need for construction of addi- 
tional trail miles in designated mldernesses, 
and further planning areas if these are added to 
the wilderness system Trail development is also 
needed for dispersed non-motonzed and motor- 
ized recreation In some cases trails can be 
located over existing roads (e.g winter snowmo- 
bile trails) Trailhead construction to  support 
the new trail systems will be required 

d. Utility Corridors 

TheForesthas about 82 easementsor specialuse 
permits that allow utility lines to cross National 
Forest lands Each right-of-way IS between 10 
and 40 feet wide Two major utllity lines will be 
constructed in 1991-1993, both crossing a small 
portion of the Shasta National Forest that is 
administered by the Lassen National Forest 
There is very little opportunity to consolidate 
these utilities into common corndors The West- 
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ern Regional Corndor Study for the State of 
California has identified a potential need for an 
east-west utility corndor through or near the 
Forest, for further discussion see the Lands sec- 
tion of this chapter 

e. Buildings, Water and 
Sewer Systems 

The Forest has about 81 buildings totaling over 
108,070 square feet Forty-eight percent of the 
Forest’s buildmgs are over 35years old Replace- 
ment of some structures has occurred, but main- 
tenance costs on the remaining older buildings 
remains significant. 

The 81 buildings are located on nine administra- 
tive sites In addition, the Forest leases two 
buildings (the Supemsor’s Office, shared by the 
Eagle Lake Distnct, and the Hat Creek Distnct 
Office) from pnvate parties This leasing re- 
quires less capital investment, but significantly 
increases annual costs for office space Con- 
structing Forest-owned buildmgs for these of- 
fices would provlde significant long-term sav- 
ings to the Government By 1993, a Forest- 
owned office for Eagle Lake Ranger Distnct will 
be constructed on National Forest land at the 
intersection of County Road A1 and Highway 36. 

Each administrative site has a domestic water 
system and sewage disposal system Most are as 
oldas the structures they serve, andare reaching 
the end of their design life Meeting current 
health and safety requirements is becoming 
costly, and replacement may be needed to  protect 
employees and other users Cost-efficient en- 
ergy retrofitting opportunities have been identi- 
fied on Forest buildings, and some are under- 
way 

f. Dams 

Of the 19 dams on the Forest, seven serve hydro- 
electric plants and are inspected by the State 
The remaining 12 dams were constructed for 
livestock and wildlife water reservoirs They are 
inspected and maintained by the Forest Main- 
tenance ofthese dams is needed to  prevent dam- 
age to streams and downstream structures such 
as culverts Depending on wildlife, range, and 
road building needs, an estimated six new dams 
wl l  be constructed within 10 to  20 years 

g. Major Stream Crossings 

The Forest has 18 road bridges, ten trail bridges, 
and 68 major structures such as culverts and 
large corrugated arches over streams. Each 
requires regular maintenance to  protect capital 
investment, provide safe crossing, and protect 
fishenes Most needed stream crossings are in 
place, potential additions will depend on future 
resource actinties 

6. FIREANDFUELS 

a. Zntroduction 

Fire has shaped the Lassen area for the past 
10,000 years Pnor to 1900, wldfires burned 
freely. In the past 80 years, fire suppression 
efforts have become increasingly effective in 
putting out unwanted fires. The use of fire as a 
management tool has also increased significantly 
in the past decade 

b. Current Management 

Federal law reqmres the protection of Forest 
resources by well planned and executed fire pro- 
tection and fire use programs The Forest is 
responsible for wildfire protection on 933,000 
acres of National Forest lands, and on 280,000 
acres ofprivate land through agreement with the 
California Department of Forestry (CDF). In 
turn, about 274,000 acres of land administered 
by the Forest are protected by CDF 

Lightning during summer and fall causes 70 
percent of the Forest’s wildfires. The remainder 
are caused by humans-arsonists, hunters, an- 
glers, campers, and other Forest users. Dunng 
the 1970’9, an average of 98 fires burned about 
157 acres per year. Only 18 fires dunng the 
decade were of significant size. one in 1973 
burned 264 acres and claimed one life, another in 
1977 burned 820 acre3 of timber Also during 
that decade, major wildfires burned tens ofthou- 
sands of acres on neighboring Forests and pn- 
vate lands, and three burned onto the Forest 
from outside This fire history demonstrates the 
potenbal for wildfire on the Forest. The past five 
years have been hot and dry Wildfires have been 
frequent, but are normally small Exceptions are 
the 23,000 acre Lost Fire in 1987, the 750 acre 
Campbell Fire in 1988, the 400 acre Feather Fire 
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in1989, the300acreGulchFirein1990, andfour 
large fires in 1990 a different Campbell Fire 
(180,000 acres ofwhich 38,000 were on National 
Forest land), the Finley Fire (totaling 23,700 
acres with 2,400 acres on National Forest land), 
the Day Fire (3,300 acres with 510 acres on 
National Forest land), and Long Valley Fire (570 
acres) 

Prevention, detection, presuppression, suppres- 
sion, and fuels management are the five pro- 
grams in fire protection Prevention includes 
public contacts, law enforcement, bullding in- 
spection, and patrols. Detection activlties are 
carned out through use of fire lookouts and 
aerial (aircraft) surveillance Presnppression 
involves arrangingforfire forces, traming, equip- 
ment, and structural improvements before they 
are needed Suppression includes firefighting 
activlties with hand crews, engmes, helitack, 
retardant aircraft, etc Fuels management pre- 
vents or reduces fires by removlng or rearrang- 
mg loggmg slash, brush, or other accumulations 
of burnable matenal 

Approximately $1 6 million is spent annually on 
the Forest’s fire and fuels program. Other agen- 
cies and pnvate parties cooperate m t h  the For- 
est to  supplement the effort The Susanville 
Interagency Fire Center (SIFC) is shared by the 
Forest Service, Bureau of Land Management, 
Lassen Volcanic National Park, and California 
Department of Forestry SIFC dispatches sup- 
pression forces, monitors air operations, and 
coordinates other fire operations for all agencies 
jointly The Forest’s major responsibility is wild- 
land fire, but Forest Semce crews may respond 
to structure (building) fires to prevent escape to 
wildland resources or  threat to human life 

Although the number of suppression crews has 
decreased in recent years, each of the three 
ranger distncts maintains two or three “out- 
stations” for fire engmes and suppression crews 
In addition, the Chester air base supports an air 
tanker, air attack plane, and helitackcrew A20- 
person Reponal Hot Shot firefighting crew re- 
sides a t  the Bogard work center, and four to  six 
mountain-top lookouts are staffed each summer 

The Forest conducts prescnbed burns on about 
6,400 acres a year An estimated 5,400 acres are 
burned to  dispose of loggmg and thinning slash 
or to prepare areas for tlmber or range regenera- 

tion The remaining 1,000 acres are burned to 
reduce hazardous brush accumulations, improve 
mldhfe habitat and livestock forage, or to in- 
crease water ylelds Prescnbed fire has recently 
been used in the Canbou Wilderness as part of a 
Forest Service effort to return fire to its natural 
role in the ecosystem, its use is being studied and 
may soon be allowed in the Ishi and Thousand 
Lakes Wildernesses as well 

In cooperation mth  CDF and adjacent landown- 
ers, the Forest conducts prescnbed burns on 
hundreds of acres each spring in the front coun- 
try near lower Deer Creek Similar opportuni- 
ties exist in chaparral areas of the Hat Creek 
Distnct Prescribed fire is just one strategy in 
fuels management, timber sales provide the pn- 
mary opportunity The Forest also treats excess 
fuels (both activlty-caused and natural) by rear- 
rangmg it into less flammable configurations, or 
utilizing it for products such as posts, chips, 
fuelwood or  biomass The objective is to reduce 
the potential for a damagmg wildfire 

e. Opportunities 

As the value of, and demands for, forest re- 
sources increase in the future, the need for their 
protection through fire and fuels management 
mll also increase Even-aged timber manage- 
ment will create more acres of fire-susceptible 
conifer plantations These will depend on a 
higher level of effective fire management pro- 
grams if they are to  survive to matunty Rural 
residence and subdivision development adjacent 
t o  Forest lands will increase fire potential, as 
will increased Forest recreation The Forest has 
the opportunity to  increase prevention and pro- 
tection measures, including improved public edu- 
cation and hazard reduction on both Forest and 
private land Utilization of prescnbed fire can 
protect the resources as well as increase their 
productivity 

7. FIREWOOD 

a.  Current Management 

One ofthe issues of public interest on the Forest 
is firewood Many local residents depend on 
wood from the Forest and adjacent lands to  heat 
their homes in the winter Forest policy is to  
insure that firewood is available to meet de- 
mands for personal use Cutting is administered 
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under two different penmt systems, one cover- 
ing personal use and another for commercial use 
The Forest takes steps to provlde more woodcut- 
ting opportunities by keeping roads open after a 
timber sale, and by opening free-use cutting 
units In 1983, the Forest began chargmg a $5 
per cord fee to  cover expenses of administenng 
the personal use program In the commercial 
program, small amounts of green timber are 
offered for sale by bid to firewood dealers. 

Illegal firewood harvest is a cont inmg problem, 
and as vehicles progress off-hghway into more 
remote and difficult terrain, associated resource 
damage results 

b. Supply 

firewood gatherers depend mainly on dead and 
down wood--typcally standmg snags, blowdowns, 
logs in cull decks, and other loggmg residue. 
However, cull decks are increasingly being pur- 
chased outright; efficient logging techniques are 
reducing residues after harvesting, and blow- 
downs are a fluctuating source often removed for 
sawtimber in salvage sales Therefore, snags are 
the main source of firewood Pine, especially 
lodgepole, is most popular, followed by cedar. 
Oak is rare, but highly valued Snag availability 
is limited by retention for mldlife (signed or 
firewood permit restnctions), steep slopes, and 
lack of road access. 

Lodgepole pine stands produce the most fire- 
wood in the form of bark beetle-killed snags As 
standmanagementintensifiesm the future, how- 
ever, the rate of beetle-kills and associated avail- 
ability for firewood will decline 

c. Demand 

Demand for firewood was slight until the fuel 
shortage of 1973-74. Since then, personal use on 
the Forest has increased over 500 percent. The 
number of permits leveled off by 1981, and in 
1983 the $5 charge was instituted However, 
non-local demand (much of it commercial use 
from the Reno, Nevada area) has continued to 
climb rapidly, and now amounts to about 25 
percent of the total Both local and non-local 
demand are expected to increase mth the popu- 
lation growth rate and energy costs 

d. Opportunities 

Construction of wood-fired power plants near 
the Forest has raised pubhc concern about com- 
petition between firewood and biomass utiliza- 
tion Studies indicate adequate supplies for both 
uses, since biomass operations harvest different 
types of material than the snags which woodcut- 
ters depend upon Conflicts may anse over other 
desirable types, locations, and availability of 
firewood. Under the Forest Service policy of 
gwing prionty to personal uses of biomass, the 
Forest can continue to provlde an adequate sup- 
ply of accessible matenal for firewood gatherers. 

8. FISH 

a. Introduction 

Much of the recreation on the Forest is related to 
fishng, both in streams and in lakes The Forest 
is noted for trout fishing, which attracts anglers 
from throughout Califorma and beyond. Less 
known, but reDonally significant, is its anadro- 
mous fishery which includes chinook salmon and 
steelhead. 

The Forest manages the fish habitat, but the 
California Department of Fish and Game man- 
ages the fish populations themselves. The dis- 
cussion below is divlded into sections on major 
lakes, other Forest lakes, streams, and anadro- 
mous fish. 

b. Supply 

The fishery resource on or adjacent to the Forest 
is significant. About 3,500 acres of lakes, 350 
miles of resident trout streams, and 86 miles of 
existing and potential anadromous habitat is 
mthin National Forest lands Eagle Lake, Lake 
Bntton, and Lake Almanor offer about 28,000, 
1,200, and 24,000 surface acres respectively on 
adjacent lands. 

At least 29 fish species inhabit Forest waters. Of 
greatest economic importance are chinook 
salmon, steelhead trout, and rambow trout Each 
ofthese is a Management Indicator Species (MIS), 
used to represent habitat requtrements for an 
entire community of fish species on the Forest 

Eagle Lake, Lake Britton, Lake Almanor 
Eagle Lake, an alkaline lake mth no outlet, is 
famous for its native Eagle Lake trout. Any 
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actions that would reduce lake volume, increase 
alkahnity, speed up eutrophication, or affect the 
trout’s pnmary forage fish (tu1 chub) would ad- 
versely affect the Eagle Lake trout Increased 
lake volume and resulting decreased alkalinity 
could also allow establishment of competingfish 
Both the Eagle Lake rainbow trout and Eagle 
Lake tu i  chub are listed by the  California 
Department of Fish and Game as species of 
special concern 

LakeBnttonis areservoirsupportingboth warm 
and cold water fish, but over 80 percent are non- 
game fish Recreational fishing is very light be- 
cause cloudy waters and heavy algae blooms 
reduce the lake’s sutability for fish Both resi- 
dent and migrant bald eagles, however, consume 
the lake’s fish 

Lake Almanor is a reservoir whose water levels 
fluctuate depending on runoff and power de- 
mand. Rambow trout, brown trout, chinook 
salmon, and smallmouth bass inhabit the lake 
and are in hgh demand, but fishinghas declined 
m recent years, pnmanly from competition mth 
non-game fish, and a diversion dam that reduces 
passage durlng spawning runs 

Resident Fish, Other  Lakes At least 108 
other lakes on the Forest supportfisheries. Most 
are cold-water fishenes, but some larger lakes 
contain warm water species as well Based on 
surveys and Habitat Capability Model critena, 
over 40 percent of the lakes, amounting to 50 
percent of surface area, have low quality habitat 
for fish Only about eight percent ofthe lakes (by 
surface area) have high quality habitat Twelve 
lakes, totalling nearly 1,300 acres (33 percent of 
the total) have potential to become high quality 
habitat 

Resident Fish, Streams Rainbow trout, brown 
trout, and brook trout earn the Forest its reputa- 
tion for stream fishmg Of the 350 miles of 
resident trout streams, 79 percent have medium 
or high habitat quality Much of the camping on 
the Forest is along streams and associated with 
fishing. Ninety percent ofthe stream miles have 
potential t o  support medium to high habitat 
quality Aportion ofYellow Creekis classified as 
a Wild Trout Stream by the California Depart- 
ment of Fish and Game. 

Anadromous Fish Chinook salmon and steel- 
head trout inhabit Deer, Mill, and Antelope 
Creeks on the west side of the Forest These 
streams areunique to both the Forest and north- 
ern Califomabecause they are free-flowmgtnbu- 
tanes to the Sacramento River Mill Creek 
contains the highest elevation spawning areas 
forsalmonin California. TheForest administers 
about 60 percent of the total mileage of anadro- 
mous habitat within these three streams Deer 
Creek has 38 miles, Mi11 Creek 32 miles, and 
Antelope Creek 23 mles mthin the Forest. Es- 
timated anadromous runs, measured in total 
average adult spawning fish per year (for 1970- 
1980), are 4,100 spring-run chinook salmon, and 
2,600 steelhead In recent years (1984-1990), 
however, the total average return for spnng-run 
chinook salmon is less than 1,000 fish No 
current population estimates are available for 
steelhead. The Forest accounts for about 30 
percent of the total Central Valley spnng-run 
chinook salmon The spnng-run is currently 
listed as a species of special concern by the 
Califorma Department of Fish and Game. Since 
much of the anadromous fish habitat has been 
lost or degraded in the Sacramento River 
watershed, these streams have become mcreas- 
ingly important to the survival ofthe nver’s wld  
anadromous stocks. 

Within the Forest, factors influencing anadro- 
mous fish habitat include (1) localized lack of 
pools, overhead cover, and instream protection, 
( 2 )  natural instream barriers, (3) possible wil- 
derness designations mthin the watersheds that 
could influence stream improvement opportuni- 
ties. Downstream from the Forest, problems 
include (1) loss of fish to diversions, ( 2 )  preda- 
tion near diversions; (3) habitat alteration in the 
Sacramento River and the delta, and (4) ocean 
and sport harvest 

c. Demand 

Each year anglers spend about 90,000 Wildlife 
and f ish User Days (WFUDs) fishing for resi- 
dent cold and warm water fish and in related 
activities A WFUD is a 12-hour activlty day 
This recreationisvalued at$1,370,000 annually 
Anestimated 1,100 WFUDs are spent fishingin 
the ocean for salmon produced in Forest streams 
Commercialharvest ofspnng-runchinook salmon 
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produced on the Forest is approxlmately 11,000 
poundsper year basedonthe 1986-1990 average 
The annual economic value of the spnng-run 
chinook salmon and steelhead fishery produced 
on the Forest is estimated at  $48,000 

The W A  target for anadromous fishenes is a 
4,200 pound increase by the year 2000, t o  be 
accomplished by habitat enhancement 

d.  Opportunities 

In Forest lakes, maintaining permanent pools 
dunng dry seasons is the main measure re- 
quired, but tlns is often outside Forest Service 
control. Improved shoreline and underwater 
cover, controlling shoreline grazing, and placing 
underwater structures are measures under For- 
est Servicejunsdiction In streams, resident fish 
habitat can be improved by developlng cover and 
pools, protecting streambanks, increasing ri- 
pananvegetation, and removlnginstream barn- 
ers and unneeded debns Three other improve- 
ment needs that are not directly under Forest 
Semce junsdiction are improvement of instream 
flows from impoundments on pnvate lands, re- 
ducing sediment from disturbed pnvate lands, 
and adjustments in fish stockmg In anadro- 
mous fishenes, five potential opportunities for 
habitat improvement on Forest lands are‘ (1) 
watershed rehabilitation (pool and cover devel- 
opment, revegetation, and channel stabilization) 
along upper Mill Creek; (2) rehabilitation of the 
fish ladder at  Upper Deer Creek Falls to open 
access to 13 miles ofpotential holding, spawning, 
and reanng habitat, (3) acqusition ofDeer Creek 
Meadows and improvement of npanan habitat 
and bank conditions there, (4) removal of rock 
barners in the upper reaches and tnbutanes of 
Deer and Antelope Creeks to  increase habitat, 
and (5) development of artificial reanngponds in 
cooperation mth the California Department of 
Fish and Game A major need not under Forest 
Service jurisdlctmn is the re-establishment of 
adequate transportation flows for both adults 
migrating upstream and juvenile fish migrating 
downstream 

9. FOREST HEALTH 
a. Introduction 

Histoncally, overall tree mortality on the Forest 
from insects and diseases has been moderate 
Forest pests evolved during the course of the 

Forest’s development and are thus an integral 
part of that environment Some pests occur a t  
certain penods in a timber stand‘s development, 
other pests are favored by certam biologxal con- 
ditions, and some pests are favored by manage- 
ment actinties Different types of pests often act 
together with environmental stresses and with 
each other, t o  form a pest complex that causes far 
greater damage than a single pest The root 
diseasehark beetle complex is a common ex- 
ample 

b. Current Management 

While no Forest pest can be fully controlled, their 
effects can be prevented or contained to varymg 
degrees. The overall approach is called Inte- 
grated Pest Management It recogmzes the in- 
terrelationships of the entire pest-host system 
and, rather than just attackmg the pest, treats 
one or more of the components in an integrated 
manner 

Annosus root rot disease, affecting 15-20 percent 
of the Forest’s pine and true fir stands, is less- 
ened by requiring application of borax to fresh- 
cut stumps in pine stands, by favonng resistant 
spenes, andbyreducmgloggmginjuries to trees 
Dwarfmstletoe attacks from 10 to  40 percent of 
the Forest, varylng with tree species; it can be 
confined by silvicultural treatments where eco- 
nomical Stem decays will become less common 
as old growth stands are converted to young 
growth, mininnzing logging damage unll reduce 
future losses Elytroderma disease is also diffi- 
cult to control Favonng nonsusceptible species 
in affected areas, and thinning to  increase tree 
vlgor may reduce tree mortality Pine bark 
beetles are one of the most destructive pests and 
kill many thousands of trees each year and many 
times that during cyclical highs. The best miti- 
gation is prevention of conhtions such as root 
diseases, mistletoe, and competition that make 
trees more vulnerable 

The Forest is participating in a program to  de- 
velop blister rust resistant sugar pine Disease- 
free trees are identified and protected from har- 
vest Seedlings grown from seed collected off 
these trees are tested for resistance to blister 
rust Approximately six percent of trees tested 
on the Lassen have proven resistant. By the year 
2000, all sugar pine reforestation needs are ex- 
pected to be met w t h  rust resistant seedlings. 

. 
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Dunng 1988, the first rust resistant sugar pine 
seedlings were planted on the Forest. 

Thinning is used to improve stand vigor Pine 
engraver beetle damage in pine stands is 
prevented by thinning also, as well as proper 
slash disposal and timing of timber harvest Fir 
engraver beetles in fir stands are also best pre- 
vented by thinning, by avoiding predisposing 
conditions, and by favoring pine on pine sites 
Douglas-fir tussock moth infestations in white 
fir are cyclical; conditions are best avoided by 
thinning to reduce the fir component on mar- 
gmal sites The Forest uses pheromone-baited 
traps to monitor the moth populations and pre- 
l e t  defoliation cycles 

Mammal pests t o  Forest resources include deer, 
cattle, pocket gophers, and porcupines, which 
eat seedlings and small saplings. The Forest 
uses vexar (plastic mesh) tubes to protect seed- 
lings in areas of heavy damage. Porcupines also 
gnaw on signs, buildings, and even radiator hoses 
and brake lmes of cars parked at trailheads 

High populations ofrodents occur in some camp- 
grounds and can cause disease outbreaks. The 
Forest takes preventive measures rangmg from 
improved sanitation, facility design, and public 
education, to direct trapping, removal, and dust- 
ing of burrows with insecticide Rodent popula- 
tions are monitored near campgrounds, which 
occasionally have been closed because of danger 
to human health. 

c. Integrated Pest Management 

Integrated Pest Management (IPM) combines 
the vanous pest management strateaes into the 
management decision-making process- preven- 
tion, surveillance, detection, evaluation, sup- 
pression, and monitonng Its goal is to  prevent 
andor reduce unacceptable vegetation losses In 
selecting the appropriate technique, all types are 
considered on a case by case basis - chemical, 
biologxal, manual, and cultural Greater re- 
source demands will necessitate a higher inten- 
sity of pest management actinties 

10. GEOLOGYAND 
GROUNDWATER 

a. Geology 

The Forest is named after Lassen Peak, an active 
volcano located within Lassen Volcanic National 
Park About 85 percent of the Forest is covered 
mth  volcanic geology of relatively recent ongm. 
The southwestern part of the Forest has steep 
slopes and stream-cut canyons, and some land- 
slide potential The southern 15 percent of the 
Forest has non-volcanic geology, consisting 
mainly of granitic, metamorphic, and sedimen- 
tary rocks The highest elevations of the Forest 
were glaciated in the last ice age 

Stability Hazard Nan-manne sediments in 
the southern part of the Forest can be unstable 
when slopes are steep (over 35 percent) Local 
instability and slumping can result when soils 
are excavated deeper than about two feet below 
ground surface Some granitic slopes also have 
this potential About SIX percent of the Forest 
has non-manne and granitic soils Most of these 
soils have a moderate stability hazard, ulth less 
than two percent having a high to very high 
hazard Much of the Forest, however, has low- 
relief volcanic topography where the stability 
hazard is low 

Volcanic Hazard A portion ofthe Forest lies in 
a potential volcanic hazard area Lassen Peak 
last erupted in 1914-21, and examples ofrecent 
volcanism cover the northern half of the Forest 
Predictions of eruptions are not yet reliable, but 
past eruptions of Mt Lassen included ash falls, 
mudflows, and lateral steam blasts Risk to  
human life would be low because of limited ac- 
cess and low populations The Forest has an 
active, cooperative role in Lassen Volcanic Na- 
tional Park‘s volcanic emergency plan 

Seismic Hazard Accurate predictions of earth- 
quakes are also not feasible However, the north 
and east sectors of the Forest lie in a “moderate” 
seismic seventy zone, and the south and west 
sectors in a “low” zone 

Known faults are avoided when locating new 
buildings and major structures 
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b. Groundwater 

The Forest has a high quality groundwater re- 
source, although it is not available everywhere. 
Approxlmately 70 domestic groundwater sys- 
tems have been developed to  serve campgrounds 
and administrative sites, about 15 wells supply 
livestock, wldlife, road dust abatement, and fire 
control needs Summer demand exceeds supply 
in the dry northern and eastern parts of the 
Forest, so the Forest has  a gradual water 
development program to improve or dnll wells 
and tap springs The vanable geology makes 
choosing well sites a challenge, in the northeast, 
groundwater supplies lie too deep for affordable 
drilling Along the Hat Creek Rim and else- 
where, dnlling has encountered inadequate wa- 
ter for desired uses. Where wells can tap re- 
Dona1 aqufers, supplies are adequate for most 
needs Geologx or geotechnical studies are con- 
ducted to locate likely sources for groundwater 
projects Little else is known about the Forest’s 
overall groundwater resource. 

The Forest has few pollution sources, and the 
quality of the groundwater is hgh.  Water qual- 
ity is monitored regularly at campgrounds and 
administrahve sites in compliance mth State 
and Federal standards Septic systems in recre- 
ation residence tracts must meet State stan- 
dards. Because over 35 percent of the inflow to 
Eagle Lake is believed to  be groundwater, par- 
ticular attention is gwen to maintainmg the 
integnty of its watershed. The high level of 
groundwater purity that the public expects 
throughout the Forest conhnues to be provided 

c. Opportunity 

No GeoloBcal Resource Inventory(GR1) has been 
conducted for the Forest. A GRI would provlde 
usefulinformation ongeological hazards, ground- 
water, geological special interest areas, and ag- 
gregate resources (cinders, sand, rock, etc ). 

11. LANDS 

a. Introduction 

In the 1982 base year, the Lassen National For- 
est boundary designated by Congress encom- 
passed about 1,375,000 total acres This total 
areaincludedabout 315,000 acres ofpnvateland 

and 1,060,000 acres of Lassen National Forest 
land The Forest also administered 83,060 acres 
of Shasta National Forest and 1,321 acres of 
Modoc National Forest, while the Plumas Na- 
tional Forest administered 14,799 acres of the 
Lassen Thus, a total of 1,129,585 acres were 
administered by the Lassen National Forest and 
are the subject ofthis Forest Plan The Forest is 
located (in descending order by acreage) in the 
counties of Lassen, Shasta, Tehama, Plumas, 
Sishyou, Butte, and Modoc. 

b. Land Ownership 

Land ownership patterns are vanable About 
one-quarter of the land within the National For- 
est boundary is pnvately owned, mostly by large 
timber land companies Both public and pnvate 
lands border the Forest penmeter - Bureau of  
Land Management parcels t o  the northeast, State 
of Cahfornia to the southwest, and LassenVolca- 
nic Park in the center, completely surrounded by 
the Forest. 

The Forest’s land adjustment program continu- 
ally exchanges Forest lands for pnvate lands to 
secure more convenient ownership patterns. The 
Forest espeually tnes to acqmre isolated pnvate 
inholdings in exchange for isolated parcels of 
National Forest. As of September 1990, the 
Lassen National Forest boundary contained ap- 
proximately 318,000 acres of pnvate land and 
1,056,728 acres of National Forest land. The 
Forest admnistered 102,832 acres for the Shasta 
National Forest and 1,321 acres of Modoc Na- 
tional Forest, while the Plumas National Forest 
administered 14,799 acres of the Lassen, for a 
total of 1,143,562 acres administered by the 
Lassen National Forest 

c. Special Uses (Non-Recreational) 

The Forest issues special use permts to  allow 
uses on National Forest land when there is a 
demonstrated lack of land 111 other ownership to 
accommodate such uses, and when such uses do 
not conflict with National Forest management. 
With some exceptions, the Forest collects an 
annual fee for each special use permt. There are 
354 special use permits (excluding recreational) 
involving about 3,200 acres and $13,233 in an- 
nual fees. In most cases, a permt for occupancy 
or use of National Forest lands hmits the re- 
maining management options available. 
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d.  Utility Corridors 

About 82 easements or special use permits have 
been issued over parts of the Forest As noted, 
management options are limited on these areas. 
The Western ReDonal Corridor Study identified 
the potential need for an east-west utility corri- 
dor through or near the Forest Two such routes 
have been identified crossing the Forest 

A 42 inch gas pipeline is to be installed by Pacific 
Gas and Electric Company in 1992-1993 adja- 
cent to the ensting 36 inch gas pipeline. It 
crosses through a portion of the Shasta National 
Forest which is adnunistered by the Lassen Na- 
tional Forest. The gas is being transported from 
Canada to Southern California to meet increas- 
ing energy needs. The Federal Energy Commis- 
sion (FERC) is the lead Federal agency on this 
project 

A consortium of power agencies called the Trans- 
mission Agency of Northern Cahfornia (TANC), 
is constructing a 500 KV transmission line This 
project is referred to as the Califorma-Oregon 
Transmission Project (COTP) Construc- 
tion is taking place dunng 1991-1992 This line 
only crosses approximately 1/2 mile of the Shasta 
National Forest lands admnistered by the Las- 
sen. It is separated from the exlsting 500 KV 
transmission hne by about two air miles (separa- 
tion was desired t o  decrease potential damage to 
both lines at once by fire or natural disaster) 

e. Withdrawals 

Several areas have been wthdrawn from m n -  
eral entry or land disposal About 21,000 acres 
are withdrawn for administrative or recreation 
sites, scenic roadways, experimental forests, or 
research natural areas, about 24,000 acres are 
wthdrawn for power and reservoir projects. 

The California Wilderness Act of 1984 brought 
the total wilderness on the Forest to 78,060 
acres WiIderness is withdrawn both from entry 
under the mining laws and from sale or disposal 
Steps are underway to  withdraw the 4,000 acre 
Cub Creek Research Natural Area from mineral 
entry 

In compliance m t h  Section 204 of the Federal 
Land Policy and Management Act (FLPMA), the 
Forest reviewed each mthdrawal in 1991 in 

conjunction w t h  the U.S. Department of Inte- 
nor  and wll determine whether each should 
continue 

fi  Rights of Way 

To assist in Forest admmistration, nghts-of-way 
are acqmred for roads, trails, and other improve- 
ments in the form of easements and use permits. 
This nghts-of-way program functions mainly to 
support timber sales and is necessary to reach 
areas formerly avoided because of difficult ac- 
cess. During this decade, the case load will be 
about 15 cases per year, tapering off t o  less than 
five per year the next decade until all needed 
nghts-of-way are acqmred 

g. Land Line Location 

There are about 2,400 miles of property bound- 
ary with private lands around and within the 
Forest National direction requires that the 
Forest Semce or project proponent mark and 
post property boundaries to  legal standards be- 
fore any project occurs adjacent t o  those bound- 
anes About 1,800 miles of boundary remain to  
be posted and marked, completion is expected by 
the year 2020 

h. Landowner Coordination 

As land management intensifies within and ad- 
jacent to the Forest, the need for closer coordina- 
tion between adjacent land owners is increasing. 

Eagle Lake The Eagle Lake basin is an area of 
high enmronmental sensitivity and public inter- 
est Land management is closely coordinated 
among the Forest Service and four other agen- 
cies that administer land or resources in the 
basin Bureau of Land Management, Cahfornia 
Department of Fish and Game, State Lands 
Commission, and Lassen County The Eagle 
Lake Interagency Admsory Board of Directors 
consists of a member from each agency and 
meets regularly to achieve coordinated, consis- 
tent land and resource management in the basin 

Lassen Volcanic National Park The Forest 
coordinates with Lassen Volcanic National Park 
on areas of mutual interest Examples are the 
jointly-provlded fire engme and crew at  the Park’s 
Manzanita Lake entrance, and the cooperative 
agreements for fire detection at  the West Pros- 
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pect Lookout, and for garbage collection. The 
two agencies have yearly coordination meetings, 
and the Forest informs the Park of proposed 
projects near Park boundaries 

Lake Britton Lake Bntton supports a signifi- 
cantbald eagle population and borders McArthur- 
Burney State Park Pacific Gas and Electnc 
Company manages the reservoir and much of the 
lake frontage under terms of a license issued by 
the Federal Energy Regulatory Commssion. The 
Forest Service submitted comments dunng the 
licensing process on the reservoir project The 
Forest has a fire protection agreement with the 
California Department of Forestry malung the 
latter responsible for the Lake Bntton area 
Othermse, coordination efforts are mostly infor- 
mal, such as seelung input onprojectsfromother 
agencies Recently, the Forest has held four 
formal consultations with the U S  Fish and 
Wildlife Servlce to deternnne impacts of pro- 
posed projects on the bald eagles 

i. Land Adjustment Plan 

The current land adjustment plan specifies for a 
portion of the Forest, what land ownership ad- 
justments are to be made and in what prionty It 
w11 he superseded by a new plan after this Forest 
Plan is approved. 

12. LAW ENFORCElMENT 

a. Introduction 

Managmg the Forest involves certain responsi- 
bilities such as the protection of resources, facili- 
ties, Forest users, and Forest employees Fed- 
eral law and regulations require protection ofthe 
Forest Law enforcement is the Forest manager’s 
tool to gain compliance with those laws and 
regulations 

b. Current Management 

The Forest Semce is gwen authonty to  enforce 
certainlawsby Title 16 oftheUnitedStates Code 
(USC) It also administers special legal orders 
called the Secretary of Agriculture regulations 
It is responsible, together with other Federal 
agencies, for enforcing specific laws and carrying 
out the cnminal procedures described in USC 
Rtle 16, 18, and 21 It administers State laws 
and local ordinances in cooperation mth State 
and local law enforcement agencies 

The Forest’s four major law enforcement prob- 
lems are (1) theft of timber, pnmarily firewood, 
(2) vandalism and removal of cultural resources, 
(3) building secunty, and (4) marijuana cultiva- 
tion Three problems of lesser magnitude are ( 5 )  
arson, (6) trespass fires, and (7) civll disorder 
The Forest‘s law enforcement plan (1983) 
descnbes these situations and how the Forest 
mll address them 

Prevention The Forest prevents law violations 
by informmg the public and employees of laws, 
rules, regulations, and of past convictions of 
nolators This information can be a meaningful 
deterrent 

Protection The Forest takes a variety of 
protective measures to insure a safe environ- 
ment for the public, for employees, and for gov- 
ernment property Clear directional signs, se- 
cured buildmgs, and two-way radios are ex- 
amples. 

Investigation Once a vlolation is committed, 
an investigation is conducted until enough evi- 
dence is gathered to successfully prosecute the 
matter 

Cooperation The Forest Servlce cooperates 
m t h  other Federal, State, and local agencies to 
provlde coordinated law enforcement coverage. 
Examples are provlding campground patrols and 
determining civll and/or criminal liability. 

13. MINERALS 

a. Introduction 

The Forest’s predominantly volcanic terrain of- 
fers little in the way ofvaluable minerals (except 
geothermal resources) Most minerals are lo- 
cated in the granitic, metamorphic, and sedi- 
mentary rocks of the southern part of the Forest, 
and in the lake deposits around Lake Bntton in 
the northern portion of the Forest. 

The Forest Service administers minerals mainly 
under 36 CFR 228 (for locatable minerals, such 
as gold and silver, and mineral matenals, such 
as sand and cinders). The Secretary of the 
Interior retains the authonty to manage locat- 
able and leasable mineral resources on National 
Forest land The Forest Semce is responsible 
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for managmg its surface resources and mineral 
matenals. 

Currently the main mining activity on the Forest 
is diatomite mining near Lake Britton Here, the 
Forest safeguards the surface resources such as 
soil, water, and wildlife by inspecting for 
compliance with the approved plans of opera- 
tion There are no active mining operations for 
gold, and no drilling or development operations 
forgeothermal, or oil and gas, although prospect- 
mg is occurring The Carr Mine is a patented 
mine (now on pnvate land) in the southern por- 
tion of the Forest that has been mined intermit- 
tently for gold Profitable rmmng of a mneral 
deposit often depends on the ability to access it 
economically. Access for mineral exploration 
and development is generally unrestncted, ex- 
cept t o  mtigate impacts to surface resources 
Exceptions include mlderness, Special Areas 
(Research Natural Areas, Special Interest Ar- 
eas, etc), Wild and Scenic Rivers, and other 
specially designated land Access to these areas 
ishmited tovalidexlstingrights andis restncted 
to protect the integrity of the area involved The 
specific restrictions for these areas are contained 
in the Forest Standards and Guidelines, pre- 
scriptions, and Management Area Direction of 
this Forest Plan 

Weeks Law Lands Minerals on parcels ofland 
withweeks Law status areleasahle, rather than 
locatable. The Forest thus has discretion whether 
or not to lease. One-hundred- sixty acres on the 
Forest have Weeks Law status, nearly all mthin 
the new Ishi Wilderness Another 20 acres are 
occupied by the Forest Service facilities in Ches- 
ter Mineral potential for these areas is low 

Outstanding and Reserved Mineral Rights 
Approximately 1,300 acres of the Forest have 
outstanding mineral rights A one-half interest 
in them is held by the United States 

b. Supply 

On the Forest, past mineral actinties have been 
limited, consisting mainly of some gold and di- 
atomite mining The Forest has approximately 
1,200 mining claims, and receives about six plans 
of operations a year 

Gold Gold on the Forest IS limited to  deposits a t  
the northern end of the Sierra Nevada province 
Significant gold mining occurred histoncally 

Although production records are incomplete and 
data are approxlmate, a mining distnct at the 
south end of the Forest produced at least 25,000 
ounces of gold (and 1,300 ounces of silver) be- 
tween 1889 and 1940, mostly from placer opera- 
tions Several gold-bearing gravel deposits in 
t h a t  a rea  have been determined to  be 
“subeconomic” Supply estimates for the entire 
Forest would only be a guess Gold prospecting 
is minimal 

Diatomite Some of the most extensive known 
deposits offreshwater-ongm diatomite are found 
in the Lake Bntton area. Although total supply 
has not been estimated, deposits are exposed 
over tensofsquaremiles,many ofthemonForest 
land Mining is underway on Forest land south 
of Lake Britton, and may expand to  private and 
National Forest land north of the lake Until 
recently, two operators were removing ahout 
150,000 tons of diatomaceous earth a year from 
open pits for use as a silica in cement 

Volcanic Materials Volcanic cinders and 
basalt are a mineral material abundant over the 
Forest’s volcanic terrain More than 200,000 
tons are removed each year, mainly for road fill 
or  surfacing, mth mnor use as aggregate in 
asphalt and building blocks One-third of the 
total tonnage is used by the Forest Service or its 
contractors The remaining two-thirds is used by 
public agencies for road building and main- 
tenance, including the “sanding” of roads in 
winter There are 40 active cinder pits and 
another five potential sites on the Forest 

Flat, volcanic basalt, commonly referred to  as 
“moss rock” is available on the north end of the 
Forest The mineral matenal is used in land- 
scaping and as a facing matenal on buildings 
and walls Volume removed fluctuates between 
50-500 tons per year 

Geothermal The Forest’s volcanic terrain 
shows signs of a potential geothermal resource 
The U S GeoloDcal Survey (USGS) has classi- 
fied the northern two-thirds of the Forest as 
prospectively valuable for geothermal resources, 
and an area south of and adjacent to Lassen 
Volcanic National Park as a Known Geothermal 
Resource Area (KGRA) Total potential of the 
KGRA was ongmally estimated at  1,000 mega- 
watts (Mw), but modeling has lowered that esti- 
mate to 75 Mw 
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Oil and Gas A usable oil and gas resource may 
exist The USGS has designated areas on the 
western edge of the Forest as prospectively valu- 
able for oil and gas General geologxal charac- 
tenstics necessary for oil and gas formation oc- 
cur under the western and northern portions of 
the Forest (Hornbrook Basin). Geophysical ex- 
ploration in the area is continuing The nature 
and extent of these resources are not well known 
and wll not be known until substantial explora- 
tion is underway 

c. Demand 

Gold Gold mining on the Forest is minimal, but 
is expected to  increase because a number of new 
claims have recently been filed. The price ofgold 
appears to be the main factor that affects gold 
mining activity, a continumg increase would be 
reflected in increased mining a t  several sites on 
the Forest 

Diatomite Diatomite demand is expected to  
increase in conjunction with the projected in- 
crease for all non-metalhc minerals. 

VolcanicMaterials Anyincreasem the pnmary 
use ofcinders-road budding and main tenance  
would increase demand for cinders fromNationa1 
Forest lands. The abundant supply will 
accommodate demand No sigmficant increase 
is expected in the Forest Service demand for 
cinders Demand for moss rock is continumg on 
a steady or slightly increasing trend, dependent 
on the housing and landscaping markets 

Geothermal Geothermal energy demand has 
been expressed by the filing of over 100 (as of 
1984) non-competitive lease applications on the 
Forest In 1982, the Forest made recommenda- 
tions to  approve these leases, but the decisions 
were appealed and are under reconsideration. 
Most of the applications have been rescinded, 
while new ones are penodically received The 
KGRA south ofthe Park has been divlded into 20 
lease areas that are proposed to  be sold competi- 
tively. Thm will gve  the best indication of 
demand for the Forest's geothermal resource 
This KGRA ranks below both the Mono-Long 
Valley KGRA and the Glass Mountain KGRA in 
estimatedpotential AForest SerncelBLMDraft 
Environmental Impact Statement has been pre- 

pared, analyzing where and under what condi- 
tions geothermal leasing may occur on National 
Forest lands in the vlcinity of Lassen Volcanic 
National Park The Final EIS and decision wll 
be issued after BLM and the National Park 
Sernce reach agreement on possible impacts of 
development on Park features. The geothermal 
EIS is consistent with the more comprehensive 
Forest Plan EIS In particular, the Forest Plan 
Appendix I, Mineral Lease Stipulation Cnteria, 
contains direction denved from the geothermal 
EIS. 

Oil and Gas Demand for oil and gas has been 
expressed by the filing ofover 50 (as of 1984) non- 
competitive lease applications on the Forest 
Three ofthese were addressed in an environmen- 
tal assessment in 1982 The other lease applica- 
tions are being processed through envlronmen- 
tal analysis now in progress. As wth geother- 
mal, oil and gas applications are occasionally 
rescmded, while new ones are received. Geo- 
physical exploration is underway, but the recent 
surge in lease activlty that followed the decon- 
trol of oil prices has waned. Demand is believed 
sensitive to oil and gas prices. Results from the 
geophysical exploration on the Forest will also 
mfluence future interest in this resource. 

14. RANGE 

a. Introduction 

The Forest's range resource consists of approxi- 
mately 410,000 acres that are suitable for live- 
stock grazing This includes the annual grass- 
lands of the western foothills; meadows inter- 
spersed wth dense fir and pine stands in the 
central portion, and mosaics of eastside pine, big 
sagebrush, and dry perennial grass meadows in 
the east. The range is divided into primary 
range, which is chiefly meadow with perennial 
grass and adequate water, secondary range, 
which is less preferred by livestock because of 
natural factors such as slope, forage conditions 
or distance to water, and transitory range, which 
is temporanly made available by timber har- 
vests or fires Using current range analysis 
methods, range resource conditions are rated as 
28 percent good, 59 percent fair, and 13 percent 
poor. 
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b. Current Management 

The Forest has 61 activegrazingallotmentsmth 
a total of 49,700 p e m t t e d  animal unit months 
(AUM’s) per year. An AUM is 1,000 pounds of 
forageneeded to support amature cow onemonth 
Most allotments are grazed from June through 
October, 10 are grazed during spring, winter or 
year long Four additional allotments are closed 
to  grazingbecause ofconflicts mth urbanization, 
and the management of other resources 

Fifty-two permittees utilize the 61 grazing allot- 
ments m t h  approximately 8,500 cattle The 
majonty of the permittees own base ranches in 
the Sacramento Valley, Hat Creek Valley, Fall 
Rwer, Susanvllle, Janesvllle, or Doyle areas 
These pernuttees depend on the Forest range 
resource as part of their ranches’ year-round 
lrvestock operations and maintenance of eco- 
nomic ranch units Generally, they summer 
their cattle on the Forest and winter them on 
their pnvate base ranches or on BLM lands. 

In the southwestern portion of the Forest, the 
range resource is also used by a herd of 
approximately 21 mld  horses, which are under 
the protection of the Wild Horse and Burro Pro- 
tection Act of 1971 The herd management goal 
is to maintain a healthy population wlthin the 
capacity of herd terntory that is compatible mth 
other resources 

The current range management objectives on 
the Forest are 

To manage range vegetation to protect 
basic soil and water resources, provide 
for ecolog.lca1 diversity, improve or main- 
tain envlronmental quality, and meet 
public needs for interrelated resource 
uses 

To integrate management of range veg- 
etation with other resource programs to 
achieve multiple use objectives contained 
in the Forest Plan 

To provide for livestock forage, mldlife 
food and habitat, outdoor recreation, and 
otherresovce values dependent on range 
vegetation 

To contribute to the economic and social 
well-being of people by providing oppor- 

tunities for economic diversity and by 
promotmgstability for communities that 
depend on range resources for their hve- 
lihood. 

5. To provlde expertise on range ecology, 
botany, and management of grazing ani- 
mals 

c. Supply 

About 410,000 ofthe Forest’s 1,129,585 acres are 
considered suitable for livestock grazing The 61 
open allotments provlde about 49,700 AUM’s. 
Current emphasis on the Lassen is to  achieve 
quality range management In this, cattle graz- 
ing is used to manage for desirable vegetative 
charactenstics in ecosystems. Livestock grazing 
systems need to be updated to  achieve npanan 
and upland management goals 

The mld horse herd consumes about 300 AUMs 
per year 

d. Demand 

Demand for the Forest’s forage comes from the 
livestock industry in communities adjacent t o  
and within the Forest This demand began in the 
late 1800’s before the National Forest was 
established Since 1906, cattle grazing on the 
Forest has shown a slight net increase. Recently 
it has fluctuated from a low of 33,890 AUMs in 
1977 to a high of 49,700 AUM’s in 1982 On the 
other hand, demand for use by sheep has de- 
creased drastically from 4,895 AUM’s in 1955 to 
0 AUM’s in 1983 

Livestock demand for the Forest’s forage will 
remain constant as long as costs to graze on 
public lands are less than costs for alternate 
sources of feed 

e. Management Conflicts 

Grazing Conflicts Livestock tend to favor 
riparian areas because of the availability of wa- 
ter and forage Conflicts in riparian areas arise 
from the degree of foragmg, trampling, stream- 
bank slumping, and water quality degradation 
caused by livestock Livestock grazing mthm 
the Eagle Lake watershed has recently raised 
public and State concerns about possible effects 
on Eagle Lake and its tributaries’ water quality - 
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Through good range management, most ofthese 
conflicts can be avoided Conflicts also exist over 
utilization of forage among livestock and big 
game, especially in nparian, meadow, bitter- 
brush, and sagebrush habitats 

TrafficHazards Some highwaysarenotfenced, 
and livestock are not impeded from crossing 
them iu search of water or forage A collision 
hazard exists between livestock and vehicles 
along these highways 

Nesting Disturbances Some wetlands have 
been developed m t h  islands for nesting water- 
fowl and other wetland species. In extremely dry 
years, water in the wetlands dnes up early and 
exposes the islands before the nesting season 
ends Livestock often graze the islands, as soon 
as they can reach them, and disturb the nests 

Management Intensity Intensive manage- 
ment can improve the rangelands while not de- 
tracting from other resources Special attention 
must be even  to protect npanan areas which 
would benefit water quality, wildlife, fishenes, 
as well as the livestock industry 

Techniques Techniques such as prescnbed 
burning, mechanical treatment or herbicides are 
used to  manipulate vegetation. Fencing or graz- 
ingsystems are usedtomanagevegetation Pubhc 
concerns anse over which techniques to use for 
rangeland improvement In the selection of the 
best technique, Forest managers consider costs, 
benefits, concerns, and the effects on the bioloa- 
cal envlronment 

Wild Horses There is concern over the stability 
of the wild horse herd and the range resource 
mthin its territory. Management ofthe terntory 
is based on the needs of the horses and guided by 
the Wild Horse and Burro Protection Act. 

f. Opportunities 

There are good opportunities t o  improve the 
range resource and its management First, im- 
proved coordination mth  other resource projects 
(e g chaparral burning, grazing systems, and 
stock ponds) mll benefit livestock as well as 
wldlife and other resources Such cooperative, 
complementary actinties can reduce their net 
cost while ylelding multiple benefits Second, 
improved coordination with the livestock per- 

mittee m11 benefit both public and private range 
resources This coordination includes worlung 
with the permittee to accept, invest in, and imple- 
ment changes in range strateges and develop- 
ments Such changes may also require the per- 
mittee to make adjustments in the home ranch 
operation, herd size, cattle breed and/or type. 
Third, greater stability for the livestock industry 
will benefit the range resource because it allows 
the permittees to  make long-term mvestments 
on their Forest allotments to improve range 
conditions 

15. RECREATION 

a. Introduction 

The Forest offers a year-round variety of recre- 
ation opportunities, including camping, hunt- 
ing, fishmg, hiking, horseback riding, dnvlng for 
pleasure, picnickmg, snowmobihng, sluing, and 
off-highway vehicle use. In 1990, the Forest’s 
recreation usage totaled 1,242,600 Recreation 
Visitor days One RVD equals 12 hours of recre- 
ation use by one person or any combination 
thereof that equals 12 hours Of that usage, 38 
percent involved dispersed recreation (which 
included one percent mlderness recreation use) 
Wilderness recreation is covered in the Wilder- 
ness and Further Planning Areas section of the 
Chapter. 

In 1990, the Forest ranked thirteenth out of 18 
Forests in the Regon for recreation use Streams, 
naturallakes, andman-made reservoirs are major 
attractions Lake Almanor, Silver Lake, Eagle 
Lake, Deer Creek, Mill Creek, and Hat Creek, 
receive the heaviest use. 

Recreation use of the Forest is summarized be- 
low, first for the vanous categones of developed 
recreation and secondly for the categories of 
dispersed recreation 

b. Developed Recreation 

1. Developed Recreation Public Sector 
The Forest has 64 developed public recreation 
facilities, of which four are campgrounds oper- 
ated by Pacific Gas and Electric Company 
(PG&E) In 1984, the Forest contracted out the 
operation of the Eagle Lake Recreation Area to a 
concessionaire under special use permit, camp- 
grounds there are now operated by the prwate 
sector Depending on convenience facilities, 

~ 
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campgrounds are either fee or non-fee, daily fees 
varyfrom$5 to $11. Campgrounduse followsthe 
same pattern each year campgrounds are open 
only in summer, as visitation occurs primarily 
between Memorial Day and Labor Day Many 
campgrounds fill t o  capacity on weekends and 
holidays, but offer ample room on weekdays The 
most desirable campgrounds and campsites are 
along lakes and streams They are filled to  near 
capacity most of the summer while others are 
sparsely used, except at peak use times The 
Eagle Lake Manna was reconstructed in 1989- 
1990, and additional facilities are proposed 

Forest Semce sanitary trailer dump stations 
are available to Forest users at Eagle Lake and 
at  Hat Creek near Old Station The Forest 
operates the sewage treatment plant at  Little 
Mernll Flat southwest of Eagle Lake. There are 
also SIX picnic areas, most located along State 
Highways 89 and 44, and a t  the Eagle Lake 
recreation complex There are four mnter sports 
sites Ashpan, Morgan Summit, Swain Moun- 
tam and Jonesvllle Snowmobile Parks (funded 
partially hy State Off-Highway Vehicle grants) 
There are five interpretive sites Two are trails, 
two are information sites, and one is a small 
visitor center operated jointly with Lassen Vol- 
canic National Park Unstaffed roadside infor- 
mation sites at  Forest entrances are also planned 
The Forest has three boat ramps on popular 
lakes and two swimming areas for sunbathing, 
swimming, and water play 

In recent years, declining budgets have caused a 
major reduction in interpretive programs Camp- 
fire programs and guided walks have been dis- 
continued on two Ranger Districts, on the third, 
a t  the Eagle Lake Recreation Area, the Forest 
Service and the concessionaire conduct campfire 
programs and guided walks 

Overall, the quality of the developed site re- 
source is high, most structures are in good repair 
and receive regular maintenance, although some 
are wearing out and need major rehabilitation 
The Forest has had a good record of providing 
full-semce management at  most sites, although 
this has been reduced recently The vegetation 
in most campgrounds is healthy and shows no 
significant signs of detenoration due to recre- 
ation use, but some campgrounds do have soil 
erosion and compaction Periodic rest would 
allow accumulation of ground litter and peren- 
nial vegetation, but no facilities would he avail- 

able to accommodate the users while these sites 
were closed for rehabilitation 

2. Developed Recreation Private Sector 
The Forest administers special use permits for 
the follomng pnvate recreational uses 400 
recreation residences mthin mne separate tracts, 
four organization camps, one lodge-resort; two 
small ski areas, one manna, and one rest stop 
The special uses are largely concentrated on the 
Almanor Ranger District in the cool mixed coni- 
fer timber zone 

Seven recreation residence lots at Lake Almanor 
are authonzed under an annual permit only 
One lot has no residence due to loss from fire 
Term permits for these lots ended in 1983 upon 
completion of a Future Use Determination which 
identified these sites for public use The infor- 
mation used in the 1983 decision mll be re- 
newed prior to notice of termination 

The two ski areas that operate on the Forest, 
Coppervale Ski Hi11 Area and Stover Mountain 
S ~ I  Area, have a combined capacity of 680 skiers 
at  one time (SAOT), hut offer limited expansion 
potential A potential area for ski development 
exists on Butt Mountain that could have a capac- 
ity of 6,000 SAOT on approximately 2,400 acres 
The Lassen Volcanic National Park Ski Area is 
proposed for phase-out in 20 years if another 
suitable facility, such as the Carter Bowl Ski 
Area on Butt Mountain, or  Dyer Mountain Ski 
Area, is developed outside the National Park 

e. Dispersed Recreation 

The Forest provides a wide variety of high qual- 
ity dispersed recreation opportunities In 1990, 
dispersed recreation was estimated to be 38 
percent of the total recreation use The most 
popular activity was motorized recreation travel, 
followed distantly by fishing, camping, hunting, 
and hiking/walking Most dispersed camping 
and fishing occurs near 40 lakes and along 120 
miles ofstreams Use is particularly heavy along 
Deer Creek, Hat Creek, and Mill Creek The 
High Lakes Basin is popular for semi-pnmitive 
motorized and non-motonzed recreation The 
Forest is also popular for hunting, particularly 
for deer and pronghorn antelope, and for water- 
fowl and upland bird hunting 

Recreationists hike and horseback ride, mainly 
on 465 miles of trails, they also snowmobile and 
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cross-country ski on trails, unplowed roads, and 
open areas. The Forest has 125 miles of the 
Pacific Crest National Scenic Trail, and several 
National Recreation Trails the McGowan Cross 
Country ShTrail, Colby Meadows, SwainMoun- 
tam, the Heart Lake Trail, and the Spencer 
Meadow Trail. Three miles of the Heart Lake 
Trail on the Hat Creek Distnct will be nomi- 
nated for inclusion in the National Recreation 
Trail System The Lassen Emigrant and Noble's 
Emigrant National Historic Trails date from the 
1850's and today offer special histoncal opportu- 
nities TheBizz JohnsonTrail(a"Rai1s toTrails" 
project) provldes excellent opportunities for hik- 
ing, biking, and cross country sluing between 
Westwood and Susanvllle West of Highway 36, 
the trad is managed by the Forest Service and 
east of Highway 36, by the Bureau of Land 
Management. Cross-country skiers ski the 
McGowan Cross Country Sh Trail and the Butte 
Lake Trad Much of the Forest's road system is 
sluable dunng mnter months when snow plow- 
mg does not occur Use ofthe Forest trail system 
is light to moderate and its user capacity is 
undetermined New trails would be bmlt to 
improve or disperse emsting use and provide 
additional opportunities Reconstruction is gen- 
erally a higher pnonty than new construction 

d. Recreation Opportunity Spectrum 

The Recreation Opportunity Spectrum (ROS) 
provldes a framework for classifylng vanous 
outdoor recreation opportumty envlronments 
The figures below represent an inventory ofROS 
classes on the Forest as of 1982 The Forest is 
mostly in the Roaded Natural ROS class as 
shown 

Table 3-1 

Recreation Opportunity Spectrum 

ROS Class Acres 

Primitive 3,393 
Semi-Primitive 

Nan-Motorized 14 6,3 8 7 
Semi-Pnmitive 

Motorized 59,350 
Roaded Natural 910,774 
Rural 9,681 

The very small area of pnmitive ROS class lies 
within the Canbou Wilderness About half ofthe 
semi-pnmitive non-motonzed land lies mthin 
the Caribou, Thousand Lakes, and Ishi Wilder- 
ness Areas; the other half lies pnmanly within 
the Forest's six further planmng areas and un- 
roaded areas 

Most ofthe Forest is open to off-highway vehicles 
with no restnctions. Off-highway vehicle ( O W )  
dnvers especially use the 36 miles of designated 
four-wheel dnve trails and the semi-primitive 
motorized ROS areas OHV use in 1982 was 
approximately two percent of the total motonzed 
use, but in 1984, 17,614 acres of semi-pnmitive 
motorized ROS class were reclassified as the Ishi 
Wilderness, a significant reduction. There is 
little use of mountan bicycles so far on the 
Forest. Current policy is to  prohibit their use 
within mlderness and on the Pacific Crest Na- 
tional Scenic Trail, but they are permitted on the 
rest of the Forest 

e. Supply 

Developed Recreation The Forest has a 
maximum practical campground capacity of 
567,155 RVD's a year, while use in 1990 was 
420,400 RVD's. The supply of developed camp- 
grounds is adequate to  meet the present de- 
mand, although desirable campgrounds often 
reach capacity. Should the need anse, the Forest 
has 184 sites identified for potential recreation 
development hstnbuted throughout the Forest. 

Recreation Residences There are 400 pnvate 
recreation residences Nahonal policy precludes 
the establishment of additional recreation resi- 
dence tracts on National Forest lands Pnvate 
subdivlsions and pnvate lands have adequate 
potential to fulfill demands for second homes, 
resorts, and summer camps in the area. 

DispersedRecreation The Forest had 471,000 
RVD's of dispersed recreation in 1990 Of that, 
70 percent was associated mth the Forest road 
system Although much of the Forest is roaded, 
there are some unroaded areas w t h  great poten- 
tial for recreation The Forest is far below its 
projected maximum carrying capacity for all 
dispersed activlty categones general dispersed 
recreation, fishmg, hunting, and OHV use. 
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f i  Demand 

Dunng the last decade most types of developed 
recreation increase din populanty Winter sports 
uses increased the most; campground, organiza- 
tion site, and recreation residence site uses were 
relatively static; swimming and hotelflodgehe- 
sort uses decreased significantly. 

Since 1973, overall recreation use has fluctuated 
up and down, but without a sustained trend. 
Statemde data on outdoor recreation suggest 
that, in the long run, use is pnmarily a function 
of population in the market area Most Forest 
recreationists are California residents and are 
fairly evenly distributed throughout the State 
Population projections for the State of Cahfor- 
nia, therefore, serve asagoodestimatorofchanges 
in use for most h n d s  of recreation Semi-pnmi- 
tive motonzed recreation has a more localized 
market area and, therefore, should follow a 
weighted average population growth of the local, 
Sacramento-Yuba City, and northern California 
areas The weighted average results in a slightly 
higher use projection for semi-pnmitive motor- 
ized than for other recreation categories The 
Forest has a total developed recreation capacity 
of 1,055,000 RVD's a year (including private 
sector facilities on Forest land) Developed rec- 
reation demand is expected to exceed supply in 
four decades 

g. Opportunities 

Developed Recreation There is a need to 
rehabilitate some of the heavily-used camp- 
grounds and campsites to meet established stan- 
dards Past reductions in capital financing for 
recreation have reduced the emphasis on con- 
struction of new facilities for developed recre- 
ation. Reductions in operation and maintenance 
funds have provlded the impetus to explore con- 
cession operation of public campgrounds by the 
pnvate sector; the operation of the Eagle Lake 
campgrounds by a concessionaire is the Forest's 
first attempt Because snowmobile use has in- 
creased recently, the Forest has improved snow- 
mobiling opportunities by constructing snowmo- 
bile parking areas and warming huts financed by 
State Off-Highway Vehicle funds Additional 
O W  recreation developments are likely 

Dispersed Recreation As population increases 
and emphasis on developed recreation facilities 

decreases, an increase in dispersed recreation is 
expected It is difficult t o  predict the trends in 
specific types of activlties Maintaining a range 
of recreation opportunities would help meet 
needs 

RecreationResidences Because ofthe antici- 
pated demand for water-onented recreation in 
the future, continued occupancy of shore front 
recreation residence lots will need to be moni- 
tored For this next ten year planning cycle, no 
additional Future Use Determinations are an- 
ticipated Other than the seven lots a t  Lake 
Almanor, continued use of 400 recreation resi- 
dences is expected Expiration of term permits 
provides the opportumty to return some key 
recreation areas to  public uses. Possible ex- 
changes of recreation residence lands for desir- 
able private lands provlde another opportunity. 

16. SENSITIVE PLANTS 

a. Introduction 

Because the Forest has large tracts of uniform 
habitat, most plant species are widely distrib- 
uted Twelve plant species designated as Sensi- 
tive by the Forest Service occur on the Lassen 
Their habitats tend to  be small and isolated, the 
plants are normally sparsely distnbuted, and 
their populations are easily overlooked. No 
Threatened or Endangered plants listed under 
the Federal Endangered Species Act occur on the 
Forest, although two are listed as Endangered by 
the State of California 

b. Current Management 

The twelve Sensitive plant species that are known 
to occur on the Forest are 

Constance's rock cress (Arabis constancez) 
grows in rocky, serpentine areas in mixed conifer 
forests near Yellow Creek 

Northern spleenwort (Asplenium septentnonale) 
grows on volcanic rock outcrops in and near 
Lassen Volcanic National Park 

hng-Haired star tulip (Calochortus longebarbatus 
uar longebarbatus) grows usually a t  the mar- 
gms of grassy meadows that are wet in spnng 
and early summer and dry out completely in 
middle to  late summer 
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Mathias’ coyote thistle (Eryngzum mathza- 
siae) grows in vemal pools and seasonally wet 
drainages in the northern part of the Forest 

Bogg’s Lake hedge-hyssop (Gratzola 
heterosepala) grows in vernal pools and reser- 
voirs on the Hat Creek Ranger District Listed 
by the State of California as Endangered. 

Quincy lupine (Lupinus dalesiae) is a pea fam- 
ily plant that occurs in open rocky soil in the 
Feather River drainage 

Egg Lake monkeyflower(Mimu1uspygmaeus) 
is a rmnuscule annual restncted to moist soil 
areas in meadows, along streams, and in drylng 
muddy pools on flats 

Slender Orcutt grass (Orcuttza tenuzs) grows 
in vemal pools and similar habitat in the north- 
ern part of the Forest Listed by the State of 
California as Endangered. 

Closed-throated beardtongue (Penstemon 
personatus) is a perennial herb growng on dry 
hillsides in pine and mmed conifer forests 

American scheuchzeria (Scheuchzerza 
palustrzs uar amerzcana) is a perennial bog plant 
formerly believed extinct in California, but re- 
cently found at  Willow Lake and Doming0 Lake 

Feather River stonecrop (&dum aLbo-) 
grows on serpentinerockcliffs near Yellow Creek 

Cut-leafed butterweed (Senecio eurycephalus 
uar. lewzsrosez) is a small perennial plant found 
on serpentine soil near Yellow Creek 

These twelve species occupy unique specific and 
localized habitats within the Forest. Because no 
comprehensive Sensitive plant surveys have been 
conducted, it is likely that additional popula- 
tions of these plants wll be located 

In addition to the twelve species known to occur, 
ten other plant species with low population num- 
bers have a high probability of occumng on the 
Forest: 

Stoloniferous pussytoes (Antennaria 

Wilkin’s harebell (Campanula wzlkznszana) 
flagellaris) 

Talus collomia (Collomza debilis spp 

Butte County fritillary (Frztzllarza 

Cantelow‘s lewisia (Lewzsra cantelowzi) 
Bellinger‘s meadowfoam (Lzmnanthes 

Stebbins’ monardella (Monardella 

Modoc County knotweed (Polygonum 

Short petalled campion (Silene muasa) 
Salmon Mountains wakerobin (Trillium 

larsenzz) 

eastwoodiae) 

floccosa spp bellzngeriana) 

stebbinsla) 

polygaloides spp esoterzcum) 

ouatum spp oettingeri) 

These plants occur on lands surrounding the 
Lassen National Forest in habitats similar to 
those on the Forest The Forest can improve its 
Sensitive plant program by increasing the rate 
and intensity of inventorylng specific habitats 
for these species, and by provlding appropriate 
management t o  any newly located populations. 

All Sensitive plant locations are managed 
according to  the policy direction in the Forest 
Service Manual and Reaon 5 handbook on the 
Threatened and Endangered Plants Program 
In planning and implementingresource projects, 
known locations of Sensitive plants are avoided 
or effects are mtigated If a new Sensitive plant 
location is encountered, it receives similar pro- 
tection 

c. Opportunities 

The Forest m11 conserve Sensitive plant popula- 
tions by identifymg their specific habitats and 
preventing their disturbance or destruction The 
first step is to complete a comprehensive survey 
of all suitable and potential habitats. Care can 
then be taken not to adversely affect their habi- 
tats and thereby insure species vlability 

The Forest can maintain or increase Sensitive 
plant populations by assessing all planned tim- 
ber sales and other projects for Sensitive plants. 
It may also become necessary to  modify existing 
grazing uses, change proposed road locations, 
alter planned timber harvest units, relocate bum- 
ing unit boundaries, or modify other habitat 
disturbances The need for such action is likely 
only in occasional, isolated situations. 
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17. SOILS 

a. Introduction 

Soil drectly or indirectly supports all other For- 
est resources Soil productiwty is necessary for 
wood, forage, vegetation, habitat, and watershed 
protection. Vanous soil charactenstics deter- 
m n e  whether the soil is suitable for such uses as 
timber harvest, road construction, developed 
recreation, or range and wildlife habitat im- 
provements 

b. Current Management 

Soil productiwty is defined as the capacity of the 
soil, in a specific environment, to produce vegeta- 
tion The goal of current management is to  
maintain soil productiwty. This requires avoid- 
ing management actions that would irreversibly 
impair soil productivity, and monitoring pro- 
ductiwty to  detect significant changes caused by 
management actions It also reqmres restoring 
or  rehabilitating soils in degraded areas where 
there is presently a backlog 

Areas of soil degradation are scattered through- 
out the Forest Most degradation is soil erosion 
caused by downcutting of streams, but in some 
cases may include soil compaction and loss ofsoil 
nutnents. Site specific locations of soil degrada- 
tion will be determined when the Watershed 
Improvement Needs (WIN) inventory is com- 
pleted during the first decade of this Plan 

Current management involves two types of ac- 
tions (1) adhering to Best Management Prac- 
tices (BMP’s) for water quality protection, and 
(2) providing input into planning of ground- 
disturbing projects BMP’s are practices em- 
ployed by the Forest Service which either di- 
rectly or  indirectly improve or protect the quality 
of the water resource In the process of protect- 
ingwater quality they also help to protect the soil 
resource For example, a BMP may reqmre 
installation of cross ditches on skid trails The 
ditches divert water off the trail into undis- 
turbed areas where the water’s energy is dissi- 
pated, thus preventing erosion 

Pacific Southwest ReDon BMP’s are described in 
a document entitled Water Quality Management 
for National Forest System Lands in Californra 
(see Appendix Q for a listing of BMP’s) Grazing 

systems and timber harvests are designed to 
avoid soil compaction, soil erosion, and stream 
sedimentation Special emphasis is gwen to  soil 
disturbing activities such as clearcut blocks, 
roads, skid trails, and landings 

The Forest is covered by two soil resource 
inventones. The portion ofthe Forest inTehama 
Countyis covered by the Order2 Tehama County 
Soil Survey (1967). The rest of the Forest is 
covered by the Lassen National Forest Soil Sur- 
vey (1984) This reconnaissance-level (Order 3) 
survey is smtable for displaying the general 
kmds and locations of soils for broad planning 
purposes, but is not suitable for project level 
planning or design 

c. Types of Soils 

Based on the Forest Soil Survey, several obser- 
vations can be made Most of the Forest soils 
have come from weathered volcanic rock mate- 
rial and have high percentages of rock frag- 
ments Minor portions are denved from granitics, 
nonmanne sediments, metavolcanics, and meta- 
sediments Depth to  bedrock varies mdely from 
shallow (less than 20 inches) to very deep (more 
than 60 inches), but in most areas it is moder- 
ately deep to  deep (20 to  60 inches) Over the 
northern and eastern portions of the Forest, the 
volcanic bedrock is highly fractured In these 
areas water normally sinks directly to  ground 
water with little overland flow The south and 
west portions have more surface runoff 

The most productive soils usually have large 
available water holding capacities and lie in 
higher precipitation zones, typically on ndge 
tops and slopes less than 35 percent Timber 
regeneration usually succeeds on these soils 

The next most productive are the moderately 
deep and stony soils, occurnng on well drained 
sites over much of the Forest, including moder- 
ate slopes Regeneration usually is successful, 
but more expensive Seedling sumval rates are 
lower than in the deep soils 

The least productive soils are shallow soils, gen- 
erally below 5,000 feet in elevation, on all slopes 
throughout the Forest They are often very 
rocky, and timber regeneration is generally not 
successful 
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d. Soil Erosion and Compaction 

Both soil erosion and compaction can reduce soil 
productivity. 

Erosion The soil erosion that occurs on the 
Forest is usually associated m t h  a management 
activlty, pnncipally timber harvesting or live- 
stock grazing. ”Natural” erosion unrelated to 
these activlties also occurs and can lead to soil 
loss and reduced soil productivlty. Sheet and nll 
erosion, and gully erosion both result from water 
movement, andcauseloss ofthe protective canopy 
cover and soil litter They affect off-site areas by 
dumping sediment into streams, detenorating 
fish life and water-dependent activities down- 
stream. Prevention is especially important be- 
cause soil losses are irreversible on the scale of 
the human lifetime. Most erosion on the Forest 
can be prevented or controlled by the use of Best 
Management Practices (BMP’s) The Forest has 
about 252,000 acres of soils with a high erosion 
hazard rating (EHR) Most ofthis land has steep 
slopes (over 35 percent), but some has erosive 
rhyolite soils or  Eocene non-manne sediments 
Metasediments, metavolcanics, granitics, and 
cinder cones can be erosive if water is concen- 
trated Most erosive soils he on the Almanor 
Distnct. 

Compaction As a result of timber sales, live- 
stock grazing, OHV use, and developed recre- 
ation, soil compaction is occurnng on the Forest 
and affecting plant growth Research is needed 
to  further define the scope and degree of the 
exlsting problem. New sources of compaction, 
such as biomass removal and increased mnter 
loggmg, need to  be analyzed Based on research 
results, the Forest then must decide on accept- 
able compaction levels. Meanwhile, the effects of 
soil erosion and compaction can be reduced by 
maintaimng adequate vegetative cover and lim- 
iting loggmg on wet soils 

e. Opportunities 

Demands for more forest products and amenities 
from the limited land base require maintaining 
exlsting soil productiwty and improvlng degraded 
areas T h s  not only increases the capability of 
the land to produce, but also keeps the Forest 
aesthetically pleasing. 

Timber regeneration is a major concern in soils 
management Amore detailed soil survey (Order 
2) would be helpful to define the extent of the 
Forest’s timber regeneration problems 

The Forest’s target for soil and water resource 
improvement averages 75 acres per year 
Although several areas needing restoration have 
been identified, a complete Watershed Im-  
provement Needs (WIN) inventory is required 
to identify and pnontize other areas The WIN 
inventory is expected to be completed in the first 
decade ofthis Plan At the present time, onlykey 
projects are heing scheduledforrestoration work. 
There is also an opportunity to continue to add 
new projects to the inventory as they are located 

In addition to restoring deteriorated soils, 
opportunities exlst to improve current soil pro- 
ductivlty levels through artificial and natural 
fertihzation 

18. SPECIALAREAS 

The Forest has four types of exlsting or potential 
special areas a )  Experimental Forests, b) 
Research Natural Areas, c) National Natural 
Landmarks, and d) Special Interest Areas. “Spe- 
cial areas” is a general and informal category for 
some areas that have been given special atten- 
tion and management direction by the Forest 
Service. 

a.  Experimental Forests 

Introduction 

An expenmental forest is an outdoor laboratory 
set aside for purposes of research and develop- 
ment of forest management techniques. The 
Pacific Southwest Forest and Range Experiment 
Station is responsible for the management of 
expenmental forests in the Region The Na- 
tional Forest in which the experimental forest 
lies is responsible for implementing the Station’s 
management direction for it. The decision to 
establish experimental forests is made by the 
Chief of the Forest Semce, rather than Forest 
Supemsor or Regonal Forester Therefore, this 
Forest planmng process does not consider any 
change in their status 

~~ ~ 
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Blacks Mountain and Swain Mountain Of 
the nine expenmental forests in the Region, two 
are located on the Forest. The Blacks Mountain 
Expenmental Forest covers about 10,252 acres 
of the eastside pine type on the Eagle Lake 
Ranger District The Swam Mountain Expen- 
mental Forest covers about 6,000 acres of the 
true fir type on the Almanor Ranger Distnct 

Within the Blacks Mountain Expenmental For- 
est are five small parcels that constitute a Re- 
search Natural Area (RNA) which is managed in 
natural condition for baseline and research 
purposes Outside the RNA, much ofthe Expen- 
mental Forest timber is being harvested under 
various silvlcultural systems. 

Essentially, expenmental forests are established 
andmanaged entirely for research purposes, and 
are wthdrawn from sustamed timber produc- 
tion. Each expenmental forest is managed un- 
der a long range plan of operation (approved in 
1980 for Blacks Mountain and 1979 for Swam 
Mountain). 

b. Research Natural Areas (RNA’s) 

Introduction 

Research Natural Areas (RNA’s) are areas set 
aside in perpetuity as baselines Qf natural eco- 
logical conditions They are established by the 
Chief of the Forest Semce for several reasons. 
(1) to contnbute to the preservation of examples 
of all significant natural ecosystems for purposes 
of research and ecologxal study, (2) to provlde 
gene pools, and (3) where appropnate, to protect 
habitats of rare and endangered species of plants 
and animals (FSM 4063, R-5 Supplement 3) The 
National Forest Management Act (NFMA) regu- 
lations direct that Forest planning recommend 
new RNA’s for establishment to meet the needs 
of research, ecologxal study, and education The 
existing RNA’s on the Forest are 

Cub Creek RNA 3,922 acres on the Al- 
manor Ranger District representing the 
nnxed conifer timber type in the Cascade 
Range provlnce 

Blmks Mountain RNA 471 acres (111 four 
small areas) representing the intenor pon- 
derosa pine timber type, and 50 acres in one 
area representing the open sagebrush veg- 

etation type, all in the Cascade Range prov- 
ince. All are on the Eagle Lake Ranger 
District within the Blacks Mountain Ex- 
penmental Forest 

The Forest has SIX candidate RNA’s: 

Green Island Lake 1,210 acres on the 
Almanor Ranger Distnct representing a bog 
aquatichotanical type in the Cascade Range 
provmce. 

Indian Creek 3,890 acres on the Almanor 
Ranger District representing the blue oak/ 
digger pine type in the Cascade Range prov- 
ince. 

Soda Ridge 1,295 acres on the Almanor 
Ranger Distnct representing the white fir 
type in the Cascade Range province 

Timbered Crater 1,117 acres (adjacent to 
290 acres BLM land) on the Hat Creek Dis- 
trict representing the Modoc Cypress type 
and Northern Basalt Flow Vernal Pool type 
in the Modoc Plateau provlnce. 

Graham Pinery 660 acres on the Almanor 
Ranger Distnctrepresentingthe Pacific pon- 
derosa pine type in the Cascade Range prov- 
ince 

Mayfield 980acresontheHat CreekRanger 
Distnct representing the knobcone pine type 
in the Modoc Plateau provmce 

Until final selection and approval of RNA’s by 
the ReDonal Forester and Chief, the Forest will 
manage all candidate areas to maintain their 
inherent qualities 

e. National Natural Landmarks 

The National Natural Landmarks program was 
established to (1) encourage the preservation of 
sites illustrating the geologwal and ecologcal 
character of the United States; (2) enhance the 
educational and scientific value of the site thus 
preserved, and (3) foster a greater concern in the 
conservation of the Nation’s heritage 

The National Park Service conducts theme stud- 
ies to identify potential sites that appear t o  meet 
the criteria for natural landmarks Direction for 
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Forest planning is to recommend to the National 
Park Service areas to  be nominated to the Na- 
tional Regutry of Natural Landmarks. In the 
Forest Plan or outside it, the Forest Supervisor 
can nonunate sites that these theme studies 
identify as illustrating the diversity of the 
Nation’s envlronment After evaluation by the 
USDI National Park Semce, the Secretary of 
the Intenor can then approve the nominations. 
OnceanareaisdesignatedasaNationalNatural 
Landmark, the ReBonal Forester takes the ap- 
propnate steps to protect the important fea- 
tures. Provided the integnty of the landmark is 
protected, no restnctions are placed on manag- 
ing the site under the multiple use concept On 
the Forest, 21 areas were studied as potential 
National Natural Landmarks. Seven of them 
(Bogard Buttes, Deep Hole, Devil’s Parade 
Ground, Eagle Lake area, Hat Creek Valley, 
Murken Bench, and Red Lake Mountain) ap- 
peared ehable and are summarized in Table 3-2. 

Any area nominated as a NNL wd1 be managed 
as such until action by the Secretary of Intenor 
Upon designation, a NNL management plan will 
be prepared 

Table 3-2 

Potential National Natural Landmarks 

Area Feature Size Ranger 
(Acres) Distnct 

Bogard Buttes Aligned cinder 5,120 Eagle 
cones Lake 

Deep Hole Pit crater 100 Hat Creek 

Devll’s Parade Black oak 710 Almanor 
Ground vegetation type 

Eagle Lake Multiple 40,280 Eagle 
Area features Lake 

Hat Creek Volcanism 7,700 Hat Creek 
Valley and faulting 

Murken Bench Volcanism 43,737 Hat Creek 
and faulting 

Red Lake Rare quartz- 4,942 Hat Creek 
Mountain basalt - 

Total 102,589 

d. Special Interest Areas 

Special Interest Areas (SWs) are broadly de- 
fined to  include areas of unusual or outstanlng 
botanical, aquatic, scenic, geologx, zoologwal, 
paleontoloacal, cultural, or other unique char- 
actenstics that may ment special attention and 
management 

Forest planning direction IS t o  identify potential 
SINS and establish recommended ones through 
the Forest Plans, as approved by the Reaonal 
Forester There are many areas on the Forest 
that may be appropriate for SIA status. Many 
potential areas have been initially identified. 
Screening to the final candidate list is based on 
(1) uniqueness and relative significance, and (2) 
special management need 

Established SIA’s are managed to  protect their 
unique resources and, where appropnate, to fos- 
ter their use and enjoyment by the public. 

The supply of potential SIA’s is gradually de- 
creasing as man’s activities alter the scenic and 
unhsturbed qualities of many areas. Of the 
many potential sites analyzed, approxlmately 60 
areas were identlfied as having significant val- 
ues. Fourteen appeared eliDble for SIA’s and are 
listed in Table 3-3 Seven of them (Black Rock, 
Crater Lake, Deep Hole, Homermeerheart, Mont- 
gomery Creek, Murken, and Willow Lake Bog) 
are designated as SWs by this Forest Plan. Any 
area approved as an SIA in the Forest Plan will 
be managed under an area management plan 
which wdl be prepared after Forest Plan ap- 
proval 
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Table 3-3 

Potential Special Interest Areas 

Area Feature Size Ranger 
(Acres) Distnct 

Black Rock Geologuz 15 

Crater Lake Geolonc 200 

Deep Hole Geologc 100 

Deer Creek Geologx 14,108 

Diamond Scenic 5,399 
Mountain 

Eagle Lake Area Scenic/ 40,280 
Geologw 

Hat Creek Valley Zoo logd  7,700 
Botanic I 
Geologd 
Scemc 

High Lakes Scenic/ 17,054 
Geologx 

Homermeerheart Scenic 1,480 

Lake Britton Cultural 600 

Montgomery Botamc 20 
Creek 

Murken Botamc 380 

Rock Creek Falls Scemc 10 

Willow Lake Bog Aquatic/ 110 
Botanic 

Total 87,546 

Almanor 

Eagle Lake 

Hat Creek 

Almanor 

Eagle Lake 

Eagle Lake 

Hat Creek 

Almanor 

Eagle Lake 

Hat Creek 

Hat Creek 

Hat Creek 

Hat Creek 

Almanor 

19. TIMBER 

a. Introduction 

The Lassen is known as a timbered Forest About 
73 percent of it is forested with commercial 
conifers, including 770,110 acres (68 percent) 
which are available and tentatively suitable for 
timber production Available means that the 
land is not set aside as wilderness, expenmental 
forests, or research natural areas Tentatively 
suitable means that regeneration of the timber is 
possible on the land 
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Forest Land Description The forested land is 
divided into four major timber types. mixed 
conifer, eastside pine, red fir, and lodgepole pine 
The mlxed conifer type occupies 57 percent ofthe 
productive land and is found on the west slope of 
the Cascade and Sierra Nevada ranges, and on 
the Forest's east side on north-facing slopes The 
eastside pine type occupies 29 percent of the 
forested land and is located in the northeastern 
portion oftheForest. The red firtype occupies 10 
percent ofthe productive land and is found at  the 
higher elevations, usually above 6,500 feet The 
lodgepole pine type occupies four percent of the 
productive land, and is found on wetter sites at  
middle and higher elevations 

Size Class Distribution The Forest's timber 
size distribution leans toward the small and 
medium size classes, and away from the smallest 
and largest size classes Note that 78 percent is 
small sawtimber or smaller 

Table 3-4 

Size Class Distribution 

Percent of 
Size Category Diameter Conifer Land 

Seedlings/ 
~ap~ lngs  

Poles 
0 - 5  

5-11" 
4 

19 
Small Sawtimber 11-24 55 
Medium-Large 

Sawtimber >24 19 
Two-Storied 

Stands Mixed 3 

Suitability Classes Forested land suitable for 
timber management under the current timber 
plan is divlded into three intensities of manage- 
ment full, modified and limited The lands 
available for full or modified timber manage- 
ment (about 80 percent of the sutable land) can 
be regenerated readily with even-aged harvest 
methods, including clearcutting, seed tree, and 
sheltenvoodcutting Intermediatecuttingmeth- 
ods (commercial thinning and sanitation har- 
vests) are also used. 

The land available only for limited timber man- 
agement (about 20 percent of the tentatively- 
suitable forested land) is either (1) too rocky to be 
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regenerated artificially following an even-aged 
harvest; (2) poorly stocked eastside pine; or (3) 
devoted pnmanly to other resource values n m -  
ber stands on poor-siteland. about five percent of 
the forested land, have low density of trees and 
slow growth Artificial regeneration is expected 
to be successful, but may requre one or more 
replantings Harvests on both rocky and poorly 
stocked land consist of salvage of mortality or 
removal of high nsk trees. 

Timber Sell Volume Average annual sell 
volume under the 1975 Timber Management 
Plan was 179 MMBF, adjusted to 175 5 MMBFin 
1978 Sale size has ranged from under 100,000 
board feet t o  over 35 mllion board feet 

LoggingSystems Tractorloggmgis, by far, the 
most common techmque on the gently-sloping 
majonty ofthe Forest It is suitable for slopes up 
to about 35 percent, or 20 percent on cinder 
cones. Cable logging is being used more often as 
harvests extend into steeper, remote areas. 
Helicopter loggmg is used in the relatively infre- 
quent cases where both tractor and cable loggmg 
would be prohibited by physical, envlronmental, 
or economic factors 

Regeneration Regeneration of trees is acheved 
by both natural and artificial methods. Artificial 
regeneration is used mainly on lands that are 
suitable for full timber management and where 
the pnmary objective is timber production. For- 
est land that is poorly stocked due to past har- 
vesting, fires, or pests will continue to  be regen- 
erated 

Site Preparation Site preparation for the 
regeneration of harvested stands is done by pre- 
scribed burning, mechanical means, chemcal 
means, or a combination of those techniques 
Mechanical site preparation (tractor piling, wind- 
romng) is the most common. Broadcast burmng 
and chemical methods are sometimes used 

Timber Stand Improvement Most timber 
stand improvement (TSI) on the Forest is thin- 
ning by mechamcal shearing and plantation re- 
lease from competing vegetation. The slash is 
treated either by piling and burning, or by chip- 
ping for use by local power plants 

Even-AgedManagement Longrangeharvest 
schedules of the 1960 and 1975 nmber Manage- 

ment Plans were based on even-aged timber 
management Regeneration techniques utiliz- 
ing clearcut, shelterwood, and overstory removal 
are even-aged management. Until recently, most 
of the regeneration on the Forest consisted of 
overstory removal Many stands which have had 
repeated intermediate harvests in the past are 
now in need of regeneration. 

Biomass and Commercial Thinning Re- 
cently, commercial thinning and biomass sales 
have become commonplace. Dense natural stands 
of conifers are thinned to promote stand ngor. 
Much of this harvesting is done by mechanical 
shears. 

Sustained Yield; Non-Declining Flow Con- 
gressional and Forest Semce direction require 
that National Forest timber he managed under 
the pnnciples of sustamed yleld capacity (a level 
that continues indefimtely) and non-declimng 
flow (timber outputs can increase over time, but 
cannot decrease) Forest Planning direction al- 
lows analysis of departure from non-dechmng 
flow, but not from sustained yleld 

Herbicides Aenal application of herbicides on 
the Forest for plantahon site preparation or 
release began in 1965 No spraying has been 
done since 1978. In March 1989, the Pacific 
Southwest Reaon of the USDA Forest Semce 
issued a Final EIS for Vegetutaon Management 
for Reforestation The EIS assumes a full range 
of vegetative management methods for refores- 
tation and timber standimprovement Through- 
out California, appeals and court cases have 
delayed proposed herbicide projects. Timber 
ylelds of regenerated stands would be expected 
to drop, and/or costs of vegetative management 
(site preparation and release) would increase, if 
the use of herbicides was restncted. On the 
Forest, mechanical and hand cutting of brush 
started in 1980 and has continued on an mcreas- 
mg scale 

Christmas Trees Christmas trees come from 
surplus trees found in saphng and pole stands 
that need thinning or in the form of unsaveable 
small trees under a sawtimber overstory. The 
number of trees sold for commercial Chnstmas 
tree sales has stayed relatively steady over the 
last few years Personal use permits have been 
sold for several years on the Ranger Distncts. 
Demand is strong and is increasing. 
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b. Supply 

According to the latest inventory (1980), the 
Forest has approxlmately 11.4 billion board feet 
of standing timber, roughly unchanged from the 
prevlous (1970) timber mventory on the tenta- 
tively sutable acres. The Forest supplies timber 
to about 15 local mills 

The Forest sells a relatively constant volume of 
timber each year, but annual harvest volumes 
fluctuate mth market conditions. When de- 
mand for lumber and wood products is down, 
purchasers refrain from harvesting the timber 
until demand increases 

From 1970 through 1990, an average of 174 
nullion board feet a year have been harvested 
from the Forest This represents about one-fifth 
of the harvest in the impact counties, and 4.5 
percent of the State’s Because harvests in the 
State and impact counties have declined in re- 
cent years, the Forest’s share has grown As a 
result ofthe depressed timber market, theForest’s 
harvest fell to 88 million board feet in 1982. 

c. Demand 

Most of the timber harvested from the Forest is 
processed in mills mthin the impact counties of 
Lassen, Plumas, Shasta, and Tehama Over the 
next 50 years, the wood product markets are 
expected to place greater demands on timber 
supplies 

The bid value of timber on the Forest has been 
among the highest in the Reson for several 
years because of high mdustry demand, high- 
value tree species, and low loggmg costs. De- 
mand is high because mill capacity in the local 
area is about three times the Forest’s annual sell 
volume, leading to highly competitive bidding on 
most sales The high value tree species are 
ponderosdJeffrey pine and sugar pine, which 
make up about 25 percent of the Forest inven- 
tory Loggmg costs are low because most of the 
Forest has easy to moderate terrain, few stream 
crossings, and extensive road networks As the 
average size of logs harvested decreases, bid 
values per unit mll also decrease In the future, 
it is expected that all timber offered for sale by 
the Forest will be sold, although the bid price and 
volume actually harvested w111 continue to fluc- 
tuate 

20. VEGETATION AND 
DIVERSITY 

a. Vegetation 

In addition to the commercial forest discussed 
under fimber, the Forest contains substantial 
areas of other vegetation This may be classified 
into broad types Abundant vegetative types 
include western juniper and noncommercial co- 
nifers, hardwoods, chaparral, sagebrush, and 
herbaceous vegetation. Intermingled within 
these types are 12,000 acres ofripanan habitat. 
The extent of each of the vegetation types on the 
Forest is shown below 

Table 3-5 

Vegetation Types 

Percent of 
Forest 

Conifer Forest 73 
Chaparral 8 
Western Juniper/ 

Non-Commercial Conifers 5 
Hardwoods 5 
Sagebrush 4 
Herbaceous Vegetation 3 
Water and Barren 2 

These types are descnbed in the follomng sec- 
tions. 

Conifer Forest About 825,000 acres (three- 
quarters) ofthe Lassen consists of the four major 
types of conifer forest. mxed conifer, eastside 
pine, red fir, and lodgepole pine. Red fir, mixed 
conifer and eastside pine are climax types, and 
their species compositions naturally remiiln fairly 
constant over time The main species in the 
mixed conifer type are white fir, ponderosa, Jef- 
frey and sugar pine, Douglas-fir, and incense 
cedar. Eastside pine consists mainly of pon- 
derosa and Jeffrey pine Lodgepole pine grows in 
pure stands on moist “flats” and around lakes at 
higher elevations 

Western Juniper and Non-Commercial 
Conifers The western juniper type is normally 
located between the eastside pine and sagebrush 
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shrub types in the northern half of the Forest. It 
often exists as a sparse overstory for sagebrush 
vegetation Digger pines occupy dry, rocky areas 
on the west side, usually below the elevation of 
commercial conifers Knobcone pine is found on 
similar sites, but only on the northernmost edge 
of the Forest 

Hardwoods This includes about 13,000 acres 
ofthe blackoak habitattype, 36,000 acres ofblue 
oak savannah, and 4,000 acres of Oregon white 
oak on the Forest Smaller but significant acre- 
ages ofthe npanan deciduous type occur, includ- 
ing maple-dogwood, cottonwood-alder, qualung 
aspen, and cottonwood associations 

Black oak is usually interspersed with the 
wedgeleaf ceanothus, blue oak, and annual grass 
types in the front country foothills (Deer, Mill, 
and Antelope Creek areas) and in the Pit River 
drainage The blue oak savannah intermutes 
w t h  foothills chaparral, black oak, and annual 
grasslands on the western slope of the Forest 
between 500 and 3,000 feet Oregon white oak 
grows on low elevation slopes of the front country 
and along the Pit River. The remaimng hard- 
wood types are associated with riparian areas 

Vegetational changes are occurnng in the hard- 
wood type Fire suppression has allowed some 
black oak stands to be invadedby conifers, whch 
could lead to a shading-out of oaks Neither blue 
oaks nor white oaks are reproducing success- 
fully, and white oak stands are often stunted, 
old, and dense Riparian hardwoods, especially 
aspen, alsolackadequate regeneration, and many 
existing stands are being eliminated by old age. 
These types can be perpetuated through apphca- 
tion of silvicultural prescriptions and prescribed 
burning 

Although not intense, demand for hardwood and 
woodland types includes providing livestock for- 
age, wildlife habitat, watershed protection, fuel- 
wood, and vlsual quality Presently, the Forest 
limits cutting standing oaks, live or dead, for 
firewood 

Chaparral Montane chaparral occupies 33,000 
acres The type is composed of mixed shrub and 
greenleaf manzanita communities Stands are 
generally scattered throughout the conifer zone 
above 3,000 feet Montane chaparral is impor- 

tant in provlding erosion control, cover for wld- 
life, and linuted forage for wildlife and livestock. 
Opportunities exist t o  burn or crush these areas 
to provlde more livestock and wildlife forage, 
reduce fuels, and increase habitat diversity 

Foothill chaparral, consisting primarily of 
wedgeleafceanothus, covers 53,000 acres of For- 
est land It grows most commonly below 3,000 
feet in the front country foothills and in the Pit 
River drainage The wedgeleaf ceanothus is 
adapted to fires every 15 to 20 years Because of 
fire suppression, many of the stands are now 
decadent. The Forest has recently begun burn- 
mg wedgeleaf ceanothus with prescnbed fire. 
Burns have been multi-agency efforts covenng 
several hundred to  several thousand acres, in- 
cluding pnvate land and lands admnistered by 
other agencies This burning increases livestock 
forage and stream flow, reduces fire hazard, and 
improves winter range for deer herds 

Demand for foothill chaparral management 
comes from both the pnvate and public sectors. 
Ranchers want foothill chaparral burned to  in- 
crease the amount and quality of livestock for- 
age. The California Department of Fish and 
Game actively supports a burning program to 
help meet wnter  range objectives for deer herds. 
Coordination and cooperative management be- 
tween National Forest and pnvate lands could 
he formalized in Coordmated Resource Manage- 
ment Plans 

Sagebrush The sagebrush formation consists 
of 26,000 acres of big sage, 1,500 acres of low 
sage, and 20,000 acres of bitterbrush. Most 
occurs on relatively flat topography in the north- 
ern and northeastern portions of the Forest. 
Sagebrush is used mostly for livestock grazing 
and wldlife habitat Sagebrush density has ex- 
panded at the expense of forbs and grasses 
Herbage production on certam sagebrush sites 
canhe increasedby prescnbedburning, spraying 
m t h  herbicides, chaining, plowing and/or chang- 
ing livestock management 

Demand for treatment ofsagebrush is high since 
it increases livestock forage and habitat diver- 
sity Currently, the Forest plows and seeds 
about 200 acres per year t o  grass This rate could 
beincreased substantially, ifwayscouldbe found 
t o  make it cost effective 

Chapter 3-Summary of the A.M.S. 3-31 



Herbaceous Vegetation Annual grasslands, 
perennial grasslands, and sedge-rush habitats 
cover 6,000, 10,000 and 16,000 Forest acres, 
respectively. Annual grasslands occur in the 
front country foothills and near the Pit River 
Perennial grasslands are scattered in the for- 
ested portions ofthe Forest. The sedge-rush type 
grows in seasonal wetlands on the northern and 
eastern portions of the Forest 

Most of these areas are not in satisfactory condi- 
tion Additional acres of herbaceous vegetation 
could be temporanly created by type conversion 
involving the use of prescnbed burning, herbi- 
cide spraymg, mechanical treatment and modi- 
fied grazing practices 

Local demand is high for herbaceous areas be- 
cause they are some of the most productive for 
livestock forage and wildlife habitats 

b. Diversity of Plants and Animals 

Diversity of plants and diversity of animals are 
closely related Generally, the greater the diver- 
sity of vegetation, the greater the diversity of 
animals Diversity may be evaluated according 
to three components nchness, euenness, and 
pattern. 

Richness Animal species nchness on the For- 
est is represented by 361 vertebrate species 
These include 24 species of amphibians and rep- 
tiles, 224 species of birds, 29 species of fish, and 
84 species of mammals Species nchness has 
probably remained fairly stable over the last 100 
years 

Plant communityrichness can be represented by 
the number of different habitat types on the 
Forest The presence of 17 habitat types on the 
Forest indicates that the Lassen is a diverse 
Forest Animal species nchness is also high, as 
a result of the diversity of habitat types 

Another aspect of richness is the abundance of 
certain special habitat features within habitat 
types This within-stand diversity component 
refers to the numbers of snags, down logs, hard- 
woods, shrubs, and overall pattern of vertical 
vegetative diversity within conifer forest stands 
Currently, within-stand diversity is generally 

moderate to high Over time, there is concern 
that this type of diversity could decline 

Evenness Evenness of both plant and animal 
communities can be denved from the propor- 
tions of the Forest in each vegetation type. A 
large majority of the Forest is in the conifer 
habitattypes, muchlesser amounts areinshrubs, 
oaks, nparian woodlands, and herbaceous types 

Evenness can be expressed by dividing forma- 
tions into categories based on the size, density, 
and age ofvegetation type For example, there is 
a dlsproportionate share of conifer forests in very 
small or  medium sized trees, and relatively few 
acres in old, large diameter trees Animal spe- 
cies that favor young timber stands, therefore, 
are more abundant overall than species that 
prefer old stands As the amount of old growth 
forest continues to  decline, populations of ani- 
mal species that favor old growth communities 
will also decline The chaparral and sagebrush 
formations are dominated by older age classes as 
a result of fire suppression Over 83 percent of 
these types are in an overmature condition (over 
40 years of age) while only eight percent is in 
young vlgorous condition (0-20 years) 

Pattern Pattern refers to the physical location 
of diverse vegetative formations and how they 
intermingle Grasslands, chaparral, and oak 
woodlands dominate the lower elevations East- 
side pine and sagebrush dominate the northeast- 
ern portion of the Forest, and mixed conifer and 
true fir forests dominate at  the middle to  high 
elevations As a result of past loggmg and fire 
management, younger stands are more common 
in the pine type and on flatter ground, while 
older stands are mainly on steep terrain within 
the mixed conifer and red fir types Sizes of 
stands created by fire vary widely, stands regen- 
erated by loggmg are small, usually 5-30 acres 
Most brush stands a t  lower elevations are large, 
a t  higher elevations they vary widely in size 

Plant and animal diversity on the Forest is high 
If present trends continue, habitat for species 
that favor younger vegetation in both forest and 
shrub types will increase, while habitat for spe- 
cies favonng intermediate and older vegetation 
will decline 
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21. VISUAL RESOURCES 

a. Introduction 

The vlsual resource is how the Forest looks to 
those passing through or recreating in it The 
Forest lies mthm three different landscape prov- 
inces and has a highly diverse visual re- 
source. The southernmost ten percent of the 
Forest is in the Sierra Nevada landscape prov- 
ince, the westernmostten percentisin the Sierra 
Foothill landscape pronnce, and the remainder 
is in the Northeast Volcanic landscape prownce, 
whch includes portions of the Modoc Plateau 
and the Southern Cascade Mountains geomor- 
phic provmces. 

These general landscape types provide the set- 
tings for points of interest enjoyed by Forest 
vlsitors and permanent residents The natural 
appearance of all these landscapes contributes 
significantly to  their populanty and appeal 

b. Demand 

The California State Scenic Highways Master 
Plan recognizes Highways 89 and 299 as poten- 
tialState ScenicHighways TheTehamaCounty 
General Plan recognizes that Highway 32 along 
Deer Creek has county-level scenic significance 
Highway 44 with its old-growth pines has been 
identified as a potential Scenic Byway. A loop 
consisting of Highways 44, 89, and 36 is cur- 
rently under study as a Scenic Byway. 

In 1990, there were about 1,242,600 RVD’s (Rec- 
reation Visitor Days) of recreation use on the 
Forest. Activities that are enhanced by scenic 
quality, such as sightseeing, dnvlng for plea- 
sure, and hilung, represent 70 percent of that 
total recreation; the recreationist’s concern for 
scenery is known to be high. Studies project that 
demand in activities associated mth  visual qual- 
ity mll increase significantly by the year 2000. 

c. Visual Resource Management 

The Forest Service has developed a vlsual man- 
agement system to  assess the current and poten- 

tial condition of the vlsual resource. It mcludes 
two baseline inventones the InitialVisual Qual- 
ity Objectives (IVQO), and the Emsting Visual 
Con&tion (EVC) 

Visual Quality Objectives result  from a 
combination of three intermediate inventones: 
the vlsual diversity of the landscape (variety 
class); the public’s concern for visual quality 
(sensitivlty level); and the distances at  which the 
landscape is viewed by Forest users (seen area 
distance zone). They are a management tool to 
provlde the highest possible vlsual quality in 
concert with other resource needs Visual 
quality objectives guide all ground and veg- 
etation-disturbing projects. 

Variety Class The Forest’s landscape is pre- 
dominantly common and minimal, mth only 10 
percent distinctive The large amount of mini- 
mal vanety landscape is found in the northeast- 
ern portion of the Forest mth its flat terram and 
few water bodies The distinctive landscapes are 
found mostly in the southwestern portion and 
surrounding Lassen Volcanic National Park 

Sensitivity Level An inventory of current use 
patterns indicates that 56 percent of the Forest 
has high, 17 percent average, and 27 percent low 
sensitivlty level. 

Distance Zones For Seen Areas Distance 
zones, the distance from viewer to  the landscape, 
are foreground (up to  l/2 mile), middleground 
(112 to 4 miles), and background (over 4 miles). 
The area potentially seen from eachroad anduse 
area has been mapped by &stance zone and 
sensitivity level 

d.  Visual Quality Objectives 

The initial Forest inventory reflected Visual 
Quality Objective’s (VQO’s) in the follolnng pro- 
portions: 
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Table 3-6 

Visual Quality Objectives 

Management Percent of 
VQO Actinties Are Forest 

Maximum Dominant, but 10 
Modification are not primary 

focal point 

Modification Dominant, but 27 
conform to natural 
character 

Partial Visually subordinate 39 
Retention to  natural character 

Retention Not nsually evldent 15 
(natural appearance) 

Preservation Prohibited (mlderness) 9 

These acres ofinventoned objectives were adopted 
in 1979 as intenm direction until the Forest Plan 
isapproved At that time, the inventonedvisual 
quality objectives will be modified according to  
the Plan and approved as the adopted visual 
quahty objcctlves 

e. Existing Visual Condition 

Histoncally the Forest has presented a largely 
undisturbed, natural landscape to public view, 
but the visual resource trend has declined some- 
what for the last 40 years as a result of road 
construction, timber harvesting, structures, 
brush field clearing, and utility corridors 

The Exlsting Visual Condition (EVC) inventory 
is amappingofthevisible degrees of disturbance 
to the natural landscape The areas by EVC on 
the Forest are 

Table 3-7 

Existing Visual Condition 

EVC 
Percent of 
Forest 

VI Drastic Disturbances 0 01 
V Major Disturbances 0 65 
IV Disturbances 3 00 
111 Minor Disturbances 13 00 
I1 Unnoticed 58 00 
I Untouched 25 00 

The EVC conditions 1 through 5 correspond 
directly with the five VQO’s (Preservation, Re- 
tention, Partial Retention, Modification, and 
Maximum Modification, respecbely). In 1982, 
83 percent of the Forest’s landscape has not yet 
been noticeably changed from its natural charac- 
ter 

f. Trends 

Future problems in managmg the vlsual re- 
source unll most likely involve conflicts between 
commodity production and msual quality. De- 
mands for recreation and scenic natural envi- 
ronments are expected to increase As the need 
for Forest commodities increases, potential con- 
flicts between vlsual quality and commodity pro- 
duction are likely to occur 

Timber Management In the past, the Forest 
has used mostly partial cut harvests Future 
t imber  management  will require more re- 
generat ion ha rves t s  (mostly shelterwood, 
clearcutting and group selection) w t h  a trend 
toward harvestingsteeper slopes Conflicts with 
visual quality in sensitive areas will increase 

Energy and Minerals Proposed small hydro- 
electric projects, geothermal, oil and gas wells 
and facilities, mining, and accelerated biomass 
utilization will also impose new impacts on vi- 
sual quality 

Old Growth Other conflicts may result from 
increasing demand tomaintam oldgrowth stands 
Some of the large, old pine and fir trees remain- 
ing on the Forest are along highway corndors, 
and create a lasting public image along roads 
such as Highways 44 and 36 Corndor plans 
need to be prepared to guide vegetative manage- 
ment along the most heavily used roads, trails, 
and at  the Forest’s key recreation use areas 

Ski Area An issue that could affect the nsual 
quality is the potential Carter Bowl Ski Area 
development on Butt Mountain The north side 
ofButt Mountain has good physical potential for 
an alpine ski area Butt Mountain lies within an 
unroaded area and has a natural appearance 
Any change to the natural landscape character 
may be viewed as a decline in scenic quality In 
addition, ski area users would bring increased 
demand for scenic quality in the surrounding 
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Forest lands viewed from the ski area Such 
questrons will be analyzed if and when a specific 
developmeqt proposal is made Any develop- 
ment will need to meet the vlsual quality objec- 
tives adopted In the Forest Plan 

g. Opportunities 

Ways to  improve management of the Forest’s 
natural beauty are to: 

1 Create special scenic areas with specific 
ObjeCtiveS and operating requirements 

Maintain a high level of employee train- 
ing and knowledge in the application of 
visual resource management 

Rehabilitate lands that do not meet the 
adopted VQO’s. 

Use prescribed fire to restore natural 
appearance to landscapes 

Acqmre private lands m key public view 
areas. 

6. Prepare and implement comdor plans 
for high sensitinty travel routes or use 
areas 

Use visual enhancement measures to 
improve the scenic quality in Partial Re- 
tention and Retention areas, where con- 
sistent nnth other resource objectives 

2 

3 

4 

5 

7 

22. WATER AND RIPARIAN 
AREAS 

a.  Water 

1. Introduction 

Forest lands include hundreds of streams, in- 
cluding several major nvers and creeks Forest 
lands are also watersheds for many lakes, 
including natural lakes such as Eagle Lake, 
reservoirs such as Lake Almanor, and many 
small alpine and shallow pothole lakes in the 
Caribou and Thousand Lakes Wildernesses and 
other high-elevation areas Water flowing from 
the Forest is vital for fisheries, wildlife, riparian 

- 

Chapter 3-Summary of the A.M.S. 

habitat, livestock, and downstream uses The 
Forest includes important tnbutaries used by 
anadromous fish of the Sacramento River sys- 
tem-Deer Creek, Mill Creek, and Antelope 
Creek The source of all the Forest’s water is 
precipitation which falls mainly during the win- 
ter, summers are very dry Although streams 
abound on the southern and western sectors of 
the Forest, the northern and eastern portions 
have scant surface runoffand few streams Water 
quality in Forest streams and lakes is good, it 
meets State standards in all major streams. 

2. Supply 

Quantity TheForesthas 1,650miles ofstreams 
Forest lands produce a total average stream flow 
of 1,308,000 acre feet each year, not including 
flows from adjoining or  intermingled pnvate 
lands Forest streamflow could be deliberately 
increased in only two ways (1) by clearcut har- 
vesting of timber, and (2) by prescribed burning 
of chaparral At most, these activities could 
increase Forest-wide water yleld by a margmal 
two percent above current levels. While in- 
creased timber harvesting can increase total 
annual runoff, it may actually decrease summer 
stream flows because of the earlier snowmelt 
and runoff that result from the loss of shade 

The Forest can develop water sources to (1) 
betterutilizethewaterthatdoesrunoffor(2) tap 
groundwater sources The Forest maintains 
livestock and wxldllfe water holes on the dry east 
side, as well as stock ponds and wells in other 
dry, upland areas 

Quality Although water quality is acceptable in 
all Forest streams and lakes, there are emsting 
and potential water quality problems Road 
construction and clearcutting can cause sedi- 
mentation in streams, which lowers their water 
quality Microorganism (Gaardza) contamina- 
tion of surface waters, livestock grazing around 
water, hazardous spills from highways, recre- 
ation residences, campgrounds, and geothermal 
and small hydroelectric development are all 
threats to water quality Forest personnel in- 
spect most of the known problem sites regularly 
and correct deficiencies when detected 

Water quality is currently maintained and im- 
proved through the application of State-Certi- 
fied and EPA-approved Best Management Prac- 

3-35 



tices (BMP’s) for controlling non-point sources of 
pollution to surface water Methods and tech- 
niques for applymg the appropnate BMP are 
identified during on-site investigation of Forest 
projects that have the potential t o  degrade sur- 
face water quality More detailed discussions of 
BMP’s and the implementation process are pre- 
sented In Appendur Q 

In a resource project such as a timber sale, the 
Forest applies the State-approvedBest Manage- 
ment Practices (BMP’s) to minimze that project’s 
potential adverse effects on water quality For- 
est personnel also analyze cumulative water- 
shed impacts, considering the additive effect of 
many land disturbances over time and space 
Such analysis enables decision makers to keep 
the overall disturbance in any watershed below 
a “threshold” level that could lead to  adverse 
water quality effects 

Presently, all but two ofthe Forest’s fourth order 
(see Glossary, “stream order”) watersheds are 
well below the 15 percent equivalent roaded 
acres (ERA) threshold for accelerating damage 
ERA is the amount of disturbance equivalent to 
that produced by new road construction Excep- 
tions are two small, heavily-impacted water- 
sheds tributary to Lake Britton on the Pit River 
Some of the subwatersheds for Deer Creek, the 
Susan River, Mill Creek, Antelope Creek, and 
other streams have occasionally approached the 
15 percent ERA The Forest’s watersheds con- 
tain a number of Class I streams (see Glossary, 
“stream class”) Some of these are important 
fisheries for native game species, and a few are 
spawning streams for anadromous fish Some of 
these prevlously disturbed sub-watersheds still 
flush sediment into their receiving streams dur- 
ing spring snowmelt, although their ERA condi- 
tion is now below 15 percent 

Increases in regeneration harvest area would 
increase disturbance in most watersheds Be- 
cause planning resources are limited, cumula- 
tive impact analysis focuses on protecting Class 
I streams 

Cumulative impact analysis is used in several 
ways 

(1) To adjust project scheduling, so that ad- 
verse impacts are spread out through 
time, 

(2) To determine the most effective places 
and objectives for project mitigation, and 

(3) To locate and priontize watershed im- 
provement projects so that cumulative 
impacts are quickly reduced 

Private lands compnse up to  66 percent of some 
major watersheds on the Forest The cumulative 
effects BMP is most effective when more than 
two thirds of a watershed is National Forest 
When less than 50 percent of a watershed is 
National Forest, the beneficial effects of reduc- 
ing cumulative effects on National Forest land 
may be totally masked Watersheds supporting 
important fishenes that contain large areas of 
pnvate ownership include Burney Creek, Warner 
Creek, Lake Almanor, Antelope Creek, and Up- 
per and Middle Deer Creek 

A land disturbance index is used to  compare 
different alternatives’ long term effects on the 
land The index adds the relative contnbutions 
of roadbuilding, prescribed fire, and timber har- 
vesting, t o  produce the Forest’s “equivalent 
roaded acres” It includes activlties that occur in 
both sensitive and non-sensitive watershed ar- 
eas (see Glossary, “sensitive watershed lands”) 

Quantity and Quality Although both timber 
harvesting and chaparral burning increase wa- 
ter flow (quantity), they differ in their effects on 
water quality because of timing Timber har- 
vesting, occurring mostly above the snow line, 
causes earlier snowmelt and therefore higher 
spnng runoff This can reduce water quality 
Chaparral burning occurs mostlybelow the snow 
line and primarily increases the summer flows 
It has little effect on water quality, except that 
minor amounts of sediment may wash from 
burned watersheds into streams 

3. Demand 

Quantity Most of the Forest’s streamflow that 
goes east is utilized by the Lassen Irngation 
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District and other agncultural users Much of 
the streamflow that goes west flows into the 
Feather River or  the Pit River, each of which has 
a senesofPG&E hydroelectric facilities Some of 
the water from the northwestern part of the 
Forest also reaches hydroelectric stations at  
Shasta and Keswick dams Summer flows are 
particularly valuable for both agncultural and 
for hydroelectric purposes 

Water flowing west into the Central Valley has a 
basic value of $59 per acre foot, reflecting the 
Valley’s intensive agricultural use for orchards, 
nce, and other crops Water flowing east has a 
value of only $12 per acre foot, reflecting less- 
intensive agricultural uses downstream such as 
growing hay and irrigating pasture The reser- 
voirs and hydroelectric facilities on many west- 
side streams add different values to  water in 
those streams Water that flows into Mountain 
Meadows Reservoir passes through six hydro- 
electric plants before reaching the Central Val- 
ley and has a total value of $131 per acre foot 

The Forest Service holds about 350 water nghts 
for uses varying from stockponds and wetlands 
to highway rest stops and campgrounds The 
Forest has adequate water t o  meet most ofits on- 
Forest needs, but demand exceeds the supply for 
convenient water sources for road-dust abate- 
ment and fire protection Although the Forest 
has several high-quality fisheries, no adjudica- 
tions or other water rights have been established 
to protect instream resources 

The Lassen National Forest contains no mu- 
nicipal watersheds that are managed under any 
type of agreement Some streams have diver- 
sions that supply individual, domestic uses The 
most “municipal”ofthese diversions is the water 
system shared by the community of Mineral and 
the nearby administrative site for Lassen Volca- 
nicNationa1 Park The water comesfromMartin 
Creek and nearby springs Water quality in 
Martin Creek is protected by designating stream- 
side management zones and by applying other 
BMP’s Upstream activities have included 
roadbulding and timber harvestingin past years 
The envlronmental analyses for these projects 
considered possible impacts of activities on Mar- 
tin Creek’s water quality and ways to mitigate 
those effects 

Quality Demand for water quality derives from 
the value ofclean water for Forest rerreationists, 
fisheries, and downstream users The State sets 
water quality standards to which the Forest 
adheres by implementing the BMP’s Timber 
harvesting and road buildiiig are generally kept 
away from nparian areas Forest crews have 
also worked in several watersheds to rehabih- 
tate damaged channels and npanan vegetation 

Watershed improvements are needed on an esti- 
mated 1,500 acres This area will be better 
assessed by the Watershed Improvement Needs 
inventory, to be completed within the first de- 
cade of this Plan After this micial backlog of 
restoration work on known problem areas is 
completed, there will remain a long-term need to  
work on smaller areas indefinitely, both to main- 
tain existing improvements and to  solve minor 
new problems This long-term work is estimated 
a t  five acres per decade 

b. Riparian 

Introduction 

Riparian areas occur in stream corridors, along 
lakeshores, and around springs, wetlands, and 
wet meadows The Forest has over 12,000 acres 
of ripanan areas, including about 2,600 acres of 
perennial stream corridors, 3,700 acres of lake- 
shores and wetlands, and 4,300 acres of inter- 
mittent and ephemeral stream corndors Veg- 
etation in riparian areas is often aspen, alder, or 
mllow, and larger and more vlgorous trees ofthe 
same species as found on adjacent uplands Ri- 
pananvegetationis cnticalformaintaimng water 
quality, fishenes, and wildlife habitat Human 
activities in npanan areas include camping, 
fishing, hikmg, mining, timber harvesting, road 
building, boating, and aesthetic enjoyments 

Riparian areas are protected by establishing 
streamside management zones in timber sale 
areas and by regulating livestock grazing Ri- 
parian areas have been damaged in places by 
livestock grazing, roadbuilding, skidding logs, 
timber harvest, fire, or  temporary crossings. 
Some problems have been corrected, but other 
problems persist Restoration includes such mea- 
sures as seeding with grass, planting riparian 
hardwoods (willows, aspen, alders, and/or cot- 
tonwoods), building streambank protective mea- 
sures, and fencing to exclude livestock 
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Some enhancement work to  cure persistent n- 
panan problems has been done in recent years 
using watershed, range, timber sale area im- 
provement (KV) or fisheries fundmg. Consider- 
ing practical limitations of funds, time and labor, 
restoring 20 acres of npanan habitat each year 
is a feasible effort. 

Streamside Riparian Currently, livestock 
grazing is damagmg npanan areas in some 
stream corridors, especially in mid to late 
summer. The effects of grazing vary by area 
Damage from trampling of streambanks and 
foraging on young hardwoods is sigmficant on 
some streams 

Lakeshore Riparian The Forest’s lakeshore 
riparian areas vary greatly in condition 
Recreation, livestock grazing and fluctuating 
water levels are the major causes of disturbance 
around larger lakes, especially where the 
lakeshores are near roads Trails, campsites, 
tramplmg, heavy grazing, and littenng are the 
main types ofdamage The nparian areas around 
potholelakes andother smalllakes areimportant 
buffers against their pollution from nearby 
activities 

Opportunities The Forest cannot increase the 
quantity of stream or lakeshore npanan areas 
except by budding new wetlands Vegetative 
condition and diversity can be improved in 
existing riparian areas by improving bank 
stabllity, shade patterns, canopy heights, crown 
density, and covering effects of vegetation 
Beneficianes include fish, mldlife, range, and 
recreatiomsts 

Opportumties emst t o  better coordmate fire, graz- 
mg, and loggmg practices to avoid reducing the 
extent and quality of available riparian area, 
and to provide mitigation measures to  prevent 
small hydroelectnc projects from significantly 
reducmgtbe amountofwaterinimportant stream 
reaches 

As mature timber is harvested from upland ar- 
eas, unlogged ripanan areas will take on added 
importance for huntmg, fishmg, hiking, camp- 
ing, andmldhfe habitat, especially for old-growth 
species As demand intensifies, the value of 
npanan areas mll increase Management ef- 
forts must intensify accordingly to  better protect 
these sensitive areas 

23. WILD AND SCENIC RIVERS 

a. Introduction 

A Wild and Scenic River is designated by Con- 
gress to preserve certain natural and recreational 
nver values as defined in the 1968 Wild and 
Scenic Rivers Act The Act allows for three levels 
ofnverclassification “wild”, “scenic”and “recre- 
ational”. Free-flowing condition and “out- 
standingly remarkable values” are required for 
a nver segment to be eliBble for Wild and Scenic 
River consideration The degree of naturalness 
determines which classification is appropn- 
ate. 

The 1981 Nationmde Rivers Inventory (NRI) 
identified by physiographic reeon those nvers 
(or segments) m a relatively natural and unde- 
veloped condition Forest Semce direction re- 
quires that the Forest planning process assess 
el ighhty and suitability of those nvers listed on 
the nationwide inventory A Forest determines 
a river’s ehghihty and suitability by applymg 
standard cntena from the Act and the agency’s 
published implementing guidelines 

b. Candidate Rivers 

The three rivers that  cross Forest land and ap- 
pear in the NRI are Deer Creek, Mill Creek, and 
Big Chico Creek. Additionally, the public 
requested that several other nvers on National 
Forest land be considered for Wild and Scenic 
status including Antelope Creek, Cub Creek, 
Butte Creek, Hat Creek, Feather River, and Pit 
River After renew of the elighlity and suitabil- 
ity criteria, the Forest concluded that three riv- 
ers should be considered as candidate Wild and 
Scenic Rivers. Antelope, Deer, and Mill Creeks 
The assessment of the candidate rivers is de- 
scribed in FEIS Appendix E, Wild and Scenic 
Rivers Evaluation 

Antelope Creek  Antelope Creek begms on the 
slopes of Turner Mountain, flows southwest 
through mured conifer forest, oak woodlands, 
chaparral, and grasslands, and enters the Sacra- 
mento River It cuts through a narrow secluded 
canyon lined with riparian vegetation The area 
has cultural resource significance, challengmg 
trout fishing, and important habitat for the rem- 
nant rnns of spnng-run chinook salmon and 
steelhead The length of the studied segment is 
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seven miles of the North Fork and seven miles of 
the South Fork Two miles are on private land. 

Deer  Creek Deer Creek flows southwest 
through the Forest into the Sacramento River It 
cuts through rugged, forested mountruns and 
deep canyons mth spectacular geologx forma- 
tions The canyon has nationwide cultural sig- 
nificance because it was part of the area inhab- 
ited by Ishi, thelast smvorofthenowvanished 
Yahi Yana Inhan tnbe Deer Creek offers valu- 
able spawning grounds for spnng-run chinook 
salmon and steelhead The total length of the 
inventoned nver mthin the Forest boundary is 
38 miles, 31 of which flow through National 
Forest lands 

Mill Creek Mi11 Creek flows southwest through 
meadows and dense forests, through a spectacu- 
lar basaltic canyon, and into the Sacramento 
River. Mill Creek also has an anadromous fish- 
ery, and contains the highest elevation spawning 
areas for salmon in California As part of Ishi's 
home territory, it also has high cultural signifi- 
cance The total length of the inventoried nver 
is 32 miles, of which 26 5 miles are on National 
Forest lands. 

24. WILDERNESSANDFURTHER 
PLAN"GAREX9 

a. Introduction 

As provided by the Wilderness Act of 1964, a 
mlderness is a unit of undeveloped Federal land 
designated by Congress It retains its pnmeval 
character without permanent improvements or 
human habitation Wilderness is protected and 
managed to preserve its natural condition On 
this Forest, the Wilderness Act of 1964 desig- 
nated the Canbou and the Thousand Lakes Wil- 
derness Areas 

Twenty-one unroaded areas on the Forest were 
studied as potential new wilderness areas in the 
1977-79 RARE I1 process The California Wil- 
derness Act of 1984 added 1,800 acres to the 
Canbou Wilderness and designated the new Ishi 
Wilderness, bringng the Forest wilderness total 
to 78,060 acres or seven percent of the Forest 
The Forest Plan recommends either mlderness 
or non-mlderness for the areas assigned to  fur- 

ther planning by the California Wilderness Act 
of 1984 

b. Existing Wilderness 

Caribou Wilderness The 20,625 acre Canbou 
Wilderness lies along the eastern boundary of 
Lassen Volcanic National Park and shares many 
of the same features It has gentle, rolling, 
forested topography, many forest-fnnged lakes, 
and 18 miles oftrails. In 1991, it received 14,600 
recreation vlsitor days (RVD's) 

Thousand Lakes Wilderness The Thousand 
Lakes Wilderness is located northwest of Lassen 
Volcanic National Park. It offers many clear 
lakes, 16,335 acres of contrasting topography 
and vegetation types, and 22 miles of trail 
revealing volcanic and glacial formations, rocky 
ravlnes and mountain slopes, open meadows, 
and stands of lodgepole pine and red fir. The 
mlderness is dominated by the 8,677 foot Crater 
Peak, the highest point on the Forest In 1991, 
the wilderness received 5,500 RVD's of use. 

Ishi Wilderness The 41,100 acre Ishi Wilder- 
ness lies in the southwest portion ofthe Forest 111 
the transitional zone between the warm Sacra- 
mento Valley and the Sierra Nevada. It is the 
only mlderness that preserves a major area of 
the SierrdCascade foothill ecosystem The land- 
scape is a network of flat ridges, sheer canyon 
walls, and deep ravmes, as well as caves, pillars, 
and rushing rapids in the creek bottoms. Mill 
and Deer Creeks flow through rugged canyons 
The area is used for a vanety of activlties includ- 
mg hiking, camping, hunting, fishing, and graz- 
ing. Pnor to its wilderness designation, annual 
dispersed recreation was estimated a t  6,100 
RVD's including 2,200 RVD's of motorized recre- 
ation Motonzed use is now prohibited, and non- 
motonzed use mll probably increase as the area 
becomes publicized and as demand increases for 
primitive recreation In 1991, the wilderness 
received 7,800 RVD's of use 

L Wilderness Activities 
Recreation use in the Caribou, Ishi and Thou- 
sand Lakes Wildernesses represented 1 85 per- 
cent (27,900 RVD's) of the total recreation use on 
the Forest in 1991 The use data are based on a 
combination of self regstration at  trailheads, 
vehicle counts and one-on-one contacts with us- 
ers A permit system was used a t  one time and 
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may be reinstated in this planning period Per- 
mits provide specific information on numbers, 
sizes ofgroups, purpose ofvlsit, boats, and horses 
using the areas. Wilderness Permits are not 
presently requlred on this Forest. 

At the time permit information was available, 
wilderness use included camping (35.8 percent), 
hking (26.5 percent), and fishing (23.5 percent) 
Use in the Ishi Wilderness probably wl l  follow a 
different pattern from the Caribou and Thou- 
sand Lakes Wildernesses Ishi is snow-free and 
available for use any time of the year. 

2. Wilderness Demand 
Although recreation is the most common use of 
wilderness, many people enJoy wilderness 
vicanously (Fisher, e t  a1 1972) They may never 
set foot in mlderness, but still value its exist- 
ence Other wilderness uses include scientific, 
educational, therapeutic, and cultural actinties 
Despite short-term fluctuations, demand for 
wilderness has been stable and growing in the 
long run The projected rate of increase in wl- 
derness use on the Forest will closely follow the 
rate of population increase in California 

3. Existing Management 
The Canbou Wilderness Management Plan and 
the Thousand Lakes Wilderness Management 
Plan (USDA 1976, 1977) gude the administra- 
tion of the two pre-1984 wildernesses Both 
plans contain specific direction to implement 
three management objectives common to both 
wildernesses 

1 Perpetuate natural conditions 

2 Provlde for recreation consistent with 
natural processes, pnmitive conditions, 
and opportunities for solitude. 

Provlde freedom from rules and restric- 
tions while preserving the wlderness 
resource 

3 

The Forest prepared the Ishi Wilderness Imple- 
mentation Plan in 1989 comprising these same 
management objectives A supplement will be 
prepared to address two remainingissues graz- 
ing and inholder access Updated Wilderness 
Implementation Plans will tier to this Forest 
Plan and serve to  help implement its general 
direction 

In the Canbou and Thousand Lakes Wilder- 
nesses, concentrations of backpackers and horse 
groups at  popular sites can damage fragde mead- 
ows and lakeshores This localized overuse is a 
management concern, and conflicts between hik- 
ers and horse nders is a potential problem. A 
common health hazard exists from water sources 
contaminated by Gzardsa microorganisms As 
use increases, the Forest wl l  need to  assess the 
extent of such conflicts or damage, and amend 
the exlsting management plans to  maintain wl -  
derness values 

The 1982 Lassen Fire Management Plan for the 
Canbou Wilderness and adjacent Lassen Volca- 
nic National Park allowed fire, under prescnbed 
conditions, to resume its natural role in Lassen 
Volcanic National Park and Canbou Wilderness 
ecosystems In 1988, all prescribed natural fire 
plans wereputonholduntilacommitteecouldbe 
formed to review policy, direction, guidance cn- 
teria, and processes used in managmgprescnbed 
fire This was a result of the problems experi- 
enced during the 1988 fire season and the 
Yellowstone fires In 1989, the renew and final 
direction on a fire management policy was re- 
leased The Forest and Lassen Volcanic Na- 
tional Park met to revlse the 1982 plan with the 
new direction The rensed plan should be ap- 
proved and in place by June 1992 The Forest is 
prepanng similar Fire Management Action Plans 
for the Thousand Lakes and Ishi Wildernesses 

c. Further Planning Areas 

In 1984, the President signed the California 
Wilderness Act On this Forest, the Act desig- 
nated three roadless areas as wilderness, six as 
further planning areas, and 12 as non-wilder- 
ness Three of those non-wilderness areas had 
been designated as further planning areas in 
RARE I1 and nine had been recommended as 
wilderness The non-wilderness areas are not 
managed for other multiple use purposes due to 
public concerns 

The Forest’s six further planning areas are sum- 
manzed in Table 3-8 For detailed, complete 
descnptions of each, see Appendix C in the FEIS 
Net acres refer t o  only National Forest land 
within the further planning area, while gross 
acres refer t o  both National Forest and privately 
owned lands 
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Table 3-8 

Further Planning Areas 

Name 
Gross Net 
Acres Acres 

Butt Mountain 8,300 8,300 
Heart Lake 9,289 9,289 
Ishi B (split unit) 25,312 20,027 

Antelope Unct 18,855 17,624 
Brushy Mtn Unct 6,457 2,403 

Mill Creek 9,815 7,990 
Trail Lake B 1,115 1,115 
Wild Cattle Mountain l Q G 5  2%..%5 
Total 59,096 51,686 

d. Available Wilderness 

In addition to this Forest’s three wlderness 
areas, most of Lassen Volcanic National Park is 
designated unlderness (78,982 acres). The Bucks 
Lake Wilderness is on Plumas National Forest t o  
the south and the South Warner Wilderness is on 
Modoc National Forest to the north. Nearby 
Forests surrounding the north end of the Sacra- 
mento Valley also have wlderness areas from 
whch users can choose. 

25. WILDLIFE 

a. Introduction 

The Forestprovldes habitat for an estimated 361 
species of animals The bald eagle, peregnne 
falcon, and Shasta crayfish are Federally classi- 
fied as Endangered. The northern spotted owl 
has been listed as Threatened by the U S. Fish 
and Wildlife Semce. Seven other species are 
designated as Sensitive on the Lassen National 
Forest The Sensitive wildhfe species are. Sierra 
Nevada red fox, marten, fisher, great grey owl, 
goshawk, willow flycatcher, and California spot- 
ted owl Forty-five species provlde recreational 
hunting and trapping opportumties. 

Most mldhfe species can be generally grouped 
into two categones 1) early successional spe- 
cies-those most dependent on young vegeta- 
tion, and 2) late successional species-those 
most dependent on mature or overmature veg- 
etation Other species depend on special habi- 
tats (riparian areas, wetlands, etc.) or special 

habitat elements (snags, dead and down wood, 
etc.) Many species depend on combinations of 
the above 

In an attempt to consider the habitat needs and 
insure vlable populations of all native species on 
the Forest, 18 Management Indicator Species 
were identified by Forest biologsts. These spe- 
cies represent the range of habitats and habitat 
elements of all species on the Forest (See Table 
3-9). 

Not all Threatened, Endangered or Sensitive 
plant and ahimal species have been chosen as 
Management Indicator Species Some have 
habitats that are very specialized and restncted 
in geographic and/or ecologcal requirements 
Adding Management Indicator Species status 
would not provide them any more protection 
than they already are gwen 

The California Department of Fish and Game is 
responsible for managmg mldlife populations, 
while the Forest Semce is responsible for man- 
agmg wldlife habitat on National Forest lands. 
The State and Forest Semce work closely to- 
gether t o  attain common goals The U.S Fish 
and Wildlife Semce enters this multi-agency 
effort where Threatened and Endangered spe- 
cies, migratory waterfowl, or animal damage 
control are involved. 

The relative abundance and distribution of fish 
and wildlife are affected by most land manage- 
ment actions Forest managers need to decide 
howmuchofwhattypesofwildlifehabitat should 
be provlded through time 

b. Supply 

1. Threatened and Endangered Species 

Bald Eagles The Forest supports 14 breedmg 
pairs of bald eagles T h s  density ranks the 
Forest as one ofthe most productive for breeding 
bald eagles in California. In addition to the 14 
occupied terntories, five suitable unoccupied ter- 
ntones also occur Approxlmately 6,900 acres on 
the Forest are mcluded in bald eagle nest terri- 
tories 

Current management includes monitoring nest- 
ing success and coordmating bald eagle recovery 
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goals m t h  other resource activities, and other 
agencies. Needs for existing and future eagle 
nesting habitat are coordinated mth the Forest’s 
timber sale program. 

Peregrine Falcon Although only one occupied 
terntory of peregnne falcons is known, poten- 
tially suitable habitat is abundant The Forest 
monitors nesting success annually and conducts 
surveys to locate possible new nest sites The 
Forest can meet species recovery goals by pro- 
tecting mld eynes and by accelerating attain- 
ment of population recovery objectives with the 
release of birds from captive breeding programs 
d o  the mld 

Shasta Crayfish Shasta crayfish habitat oc- 
curs in the Pit River and Hat Creek drainages 
The species requires a clear, constant tempera- 
ture aquatic envlronment found in spring-fed 
streams and lakes An inventory of potential 
Shasta crayfish habitat was conducted in 1990 
on the Forest, but no populations were found In 
all management actions, the Forest will protect 
or enhance all known and potential habitat for 
the Shasta crayfish 

2. Sensitive Species 

Fisher and Marten Both marten and fisher 
are classified as Sensitive by the Pacific South- 
west Repon Martens depend on large blocks of 
mature and overmature forest for denning and 
foragmg Meadow edges adjacent to timbered 
stands are also important foragmg grounds. 
Optimal habitat is dense and open stands of 
conifer or  mured coniferhardwood forests with 
multi-stoned stand structure, large diameter 
trees, and stand decadence. 

Preferred fisher habitat consists of dense (60 
percent to 100 percent canopy closure), multi- 
stoned, mature, mlxed conifer forests mth many 
large snags (greater than 30 inches DBH) and 
numerous fallen logs These conditions offer 
adequate cover and an abundance of potential 
dens The best habitat includes close proxlmity 
to densely-vegetated ripanan comdors and to 
saddles between drainages, which are used as 
travelways, small openings (less than two acres) 
m t h  good ground cover for foragmg; and an 
absence of roads 

In March 1990, the Forest identified 19 marten 
and5fisherhabitat management areas (HMA’s) 
The majonty of this habitat is located along the 
western half of the Forest and through Lassen 
Volcanic National Park. HMA’s are linked 
mth600 foot travel comdors to provlde for ge- 
netic interchange and successful dispersion of 
young Marten areas comprise 2,100 acres while 
fisher areas contain 9,800 acres. HMA’s were 
located based on three considerations. (1) his- 
toncal sightings, (2) proper spatial distribution 
as defined in a comprehensive reBona1 htera- 
ture renew of the habitat reqmrements for these 
species, and (3)  placement in  areas already 
reserved from full timber management All 
HMA’s are deficit in suitable habitat to meet the 
medium Habitat Capability Model displayed in 
Appendix 0 of this Plan. 

Currently, the Forest lacks information on popu- 
lation numbers and trends for both of these 
species The reduction of old growth habitat 
through timber harvesting is a major concern 
with marten and fishers No scheduled timber 
management mll occur in habitat management 
areas until more information is available on 
their population size and habitat requirements 

Great Gray Owls Great gray owls are desig- 
nated as Sensitive by the Forest Semce in Cali- 
fornia They are probably the rarest owls in the 
Sierra Nevada They require stands of overma- 
ture timber containing large snags adjacent to 
large meadows There has been only one great 
gray owl located on the Forest in recent years 

The Forest can provlde for great gray owls by 
managmg meadow ecotones to  preserve large, 
overmature trees and high snag densities 

Northern Goshawks Goshawks are listed as 
Sensitive in the Pacific Southwest ReDon There 
are 20 known active goshawk nesting territones 
on the Forest, but frequent sightingsimply many 
more 

In order t o  insure that a vlable population of 
goshawks occurs over time on the Forest, a net- 
work of territones was identified throughout 
their range on the Forest The network meets 
the Reeonal Planning Direction of at  least one 
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Table 3-9 

Wildlife Management Indicator Species and Their Seral Stage 
and Special Habitat Preferences 

Management 
Indicator 
Species 

Seral Stages Special Habitats. Snags 

Near Down Hard- 
Early Late Large Water General Wood Cliffs woods Meadows Ripanan Water 

Bald Eagle x x  X 
Black Bear x x  X X 

X 

X X X 

B u f€l eh e a d 

Fisher 

Goshawk 

Hairy 
Woodpecker 

Mallard 

X 

x x  
X 

x x  

X X 

X 

X 

X X 

X 

X 

X X 

Marten x x  
Mule Deer X 

Osprey x x  X 

X X X 

X X X 

X X 

Peregrine 
Falcon 

Prleated 
Wooduecker 

X 

x x  

X 

Pronghorn x x  
Antelope 

X 

Rainbow Trout X X 

Spotted Owl x x  
(California and 
Northern subspecies) 

X 

Steelhead Trout and Chinook 
Salmon 

Western Gray Squirrel X X X 

X X 
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territory per 18 square miles, and 50 acres of 
mature habitat per p a r .  These cnteria resulted 
in a minimum population goal of 113 pairs of 
goshawks for the Forest 

The Forest can provide for goshawks by protect- 
ing mature forest habitat for nesting Future 
nesting habitat may also be provided by silvicul- 
tural treatments Foragmg habitat can be im- 
proved by increasing habitat age diversity 
through timber harvest 

Sierra Neuudu Red Fox The Sierra Nevada 
red fox is classified as Sensitive in California 
Little is know about the life cycle of this fox, but 
it seems to  be rather general in its habitat re- 
quirements and not particularly abundant in 
any habitat type There have been widely scat- 
tered sightings over many years on the Forest 

Forest management mll probably not affect the 
range or distnbution of the Sierra Nevada red 
fox, and no special management will he reqmred 

Spotted Owls Two subspecies of the spotted 
owl are found on lands managed by the Lassen 
National Forest The northern spotted owl (Strrx 
occidentalzs caurana), listed hy the U S Fish and 
Wildlife Semce as Threatened, is found north of 
Highway 299. The California spotted owl (Strrx 
occidentalrs occidentalrs) is found south of High- 
way 299 Both subspecies require similar habi- 
ta t  large blocks of mature and over-mature 
forest with appropriate structural and vegeta- 
tive attnbutes, and abundant prey. Optimal 
habitat is conifer and mixed conifer forest with 
multi-stoned stands, large diameter trees, dense 
canopy closure and stand decadence 

In January 1987, the U S  Fish and Wildlife 
Servlce (FWS) received a petition to  list the 
northern spotted owl as an Endangered species 
under the Endangered Species Act In June 
1989, the FWS proposed to list the northern 
spotted owl as Threatened Follomng this pro- 
posal, an interagency committee of scientists 
and researchers (ISC) was formed to develop a 
conservation strategy for this subspecies Their 
report, issued in April 1990, recommended the 
creation of Habitat Conservation Areas (HCA's) 
t o  replace the SOHA management concept in 

Washington, Oregon, and the Klamath Province 
of northern Califorma. One HCA is located in 
Shasta National Forest lands administered by 
the Lassen. In June 1990, the FWS listed the 
northern spotted owl as Threatened throughout 
its range 

Inventories have located at  least 87 pairs of 
California spotted owls on the Forest There are 
no known pairs of northern spotted owls on the 
Forest The total known spotted owl population 
on the Lassen as of 1991 is 191 mdividuals, one 
of which is 111 the range of the northern spotted 
owl The Pacific Southwest Regonal Gwde di- 
rects that a network of California spotted owl 
territones be established to  insure species vl- 
ability The number of SOHA's necessary to  
provlde a vlable population on the Lassen Na- 
tional Forest is 39 One more SOHA has been 
added because it contained a successfully repro- 
ducing pair of spotted owls in an area prenously 
thought t o  be outside their range on the Forest 

The decision to manage SOHA's wthin the Kla- 
math Pronnce has since been withdrawn Pend- 
ing enactment of new leaslation, any applicable 
action by the Endangered Species Comnuttee, 
adoption of a recovery plan by the Fish and 
Wildlife Service, or the results of further biolog- 
cal consultation between the Forest Semce and 
the Fish and Wildlife Semce, the Forest Semce 
will conduct timber management activities in a 
manner not inconsistent w t h  the Interagency 
Scientific Commttee recommendations 

For the Califorma Spotted Owl, each SOHA 
should have at  least 1,000 acres of base habitat 
and 650 acres of replacement habitat The cur- 
rent amounts of suitable habitat in the Lassen's 
SOHA network are below the habitat require- 
ments and the population vlability standards set 
forth 111 the Regional Guide Although proper 
distnbution of smtable habitat throughout the 
Forest may take several decades, full compliance 
with spotted owl direction is being implemented 
as rapidly as possible Dunng this interim pe- 
nod, 125 acres will be protected for each non- 
network owl pair until there are 39 nesting pairs 
wthin the SOHA's 

No scheduled timber harvesting will occur within 
the SOHA network or HCA 
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Willow Flycatcher Willow flycatchers have 
been designated as Sensitive by the Reponal 
Forester This flycatcher is dependent upon 
npanan deciduous habitat orwetmeadows with 
wdlow thickets Willow flycatchers were con- 
firmed to  inhabit the Forest in 1990 

All nparian habitat and meadows wlll be pro- 
tected using Best Management Practices (Forest 
Plan, Appendur Q). These measures should as- 
sure continuing populations of the wllow fly- 
catcher 

3. Other Species 

Osprey Ospreys on Forest lands total about 32 
pairs, and the population has increased since the 
late 1960's The Forest modifies timber manage- 
ment activlties within active and potential nest- 
ing areas to prevent disturbance, and to  provide 
current and future nest trees Populations on 
National Forest lands could be increased by 
approximately 20 percent at  Eagle Lake and by 
a small amount a t  McCoy Flat Reservoir. 

Mule Deer and Black-Tailed Deer About 
200,000 acres of the Forest lie mthin deer winter 
range, but only about 53,000 are smtable for 
treatment to increase carrymg capacity for deer. 
Most of ths is in wedgeleaf ceanothus in the 
Almanor and Hat Creek Distncts For the past 
several years, the Forest has prescribed burned 
several thousand acres of winter range per year 
in a program cooperatively financed with the 
California Department of Fish and Game Such 
work should be coupled with improvement of 
fawning habitat and summer range to be most 
effective. Coordination of timber harvest loca- 
tion, size, and timing would help provide desir- 
able forage-to-cover ratios and fawrung habitat. 

Pileated Woodpecker Pileated woodpeckers 
are found throughout the Forest mthin conifer 
and conlfer-hardwood stands, where large diam- 
eter softwood snags are present. Conflicts in 
managng this species occur primanly from tim- 
ber and fuels management activities which re- 
duce the older age class of timber, remove stand- 
ing snags and down logs, and salvage recent 
tunber mortality. Fuelwood gathenng also hm- 
its the number of standing snags on the Forest 
where vehicle access is easy Management guide- 

lines for snags and dead and down wood will help 
maintain this species 

Pronghorn The Forest provldes approximately 
seven percent of the total habitat (primarily 
summer range) used by the Lassen sub-herd of 
pronghorn antelope Pronghorn numbers prob- 
ably can be increased if the Forest Service con- 
tinues to develop water, allocates additional for- 
age to antelope, and modifies fences to  permit 
free antelope movement Some reduction in 
forage use by domestic livestock may also be 
necessary 

Western Gray Squirrel Gray squirrels are 
present throughout the Forest wherever oaks, 
pines, and snags are present. Abundant popula- 
tions of gray squirrels currently emst on the 
Forest. Opportunities exist t o  improve habitat 
for this species by manipulating young stands of 
hardwoods to  produce older age classes, by pro- 
tecting oak stands dunng timber harvesting ac- 
tivlties, and by regenerating older oak stands 
through timber management and burning. 

Oaks and Aspens Oaks are an important and 
vaned wildlife habitat component. Management 
indicator species that depend on oaks are gray 
squlrrel, deer, and black bear. Retention of oaks 
in mixed conifer-oak stands, and management 
for their replacement over time, is key to main- 
taining habitat for these indicator species and 
for other wildlife A number of management 
activlties can improve oak habitats Shrub oak 
types could benefit from burning Dense Oregon 
oak shrub stands can be thinned to increase tree 
size, and there may be a future need to improve 
blue oak and black oak regeneration The black 
oak type can benefit from burning to regenerate 
shrub stands and remove encroaching conifers, 
and from thinning to enhance mast production 
and longevity. The mixed-conifer/oak type could 
benefit from removal of competing conifers by 
harvest or burning 

Aspen is another important hardwood commu- 
nity. Disturbance, such as fire or cutting, is 
necessary to  perpetuate decadent aspen stands. 
Pilot projects using cutting and fencmg have 
been implemented. 
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Snags, andDeadandDown Wood Snags, and 
dead and down wood are important t o  many 
wildlife species Management Indicator Species 
dependent on these components are the buflle- 
head, hairy woodpecker, pileated woodpecker, 
marten, fisher, gray squirrel, black bear, bald 
eagle, osprey, and spotted owl The Pacific South- 
west Regmnal Guide specifies that, to the extent 
possible, an average of 1 5  snags per acre be 
maintained wthin each timber compartment 
Except in the eastside pine type, most of the 
Forest has adequate snag densities to insure 
population viability of cavlty dependent species 

Additional snags for wldlife w11 be maintained 
by restncting firewood cutting of standing dead 
trees and limiting salvage harvesting, where 
necessary to  achieve snag goals Live cull trees 
may also be substituted for dead snags provlded 
a t  least one dead snag remains per acre 

The lack of dead and down wood is a concern, 
particularly in size classes larger than 15 inches 
in diameter and longer than 20 feet Species 
dependent on these matenals can presumably be 
maintained through effective coordination be- 
tween timber, fuels, and wildlife management 

Waterfowl and Riparian Species Riparian 
vegetation ranges from sedges and rushes to  
willow, alder, aspen, oaks, maples, and dogwood 
Management Indicator Species that use nparian 
habitat as important components of their life 
cycles are the black hear, mallard, bufflehead, 
spotted owl, deer, marten, fisher, chinook salmon, 
steelhead trout, and rainbow trout Grazing by 
domestic livestock has reduced the productivlty 
of some nparian areas The Forest is continuing 
a program of npanan enhancement Significant 
opportunities exist to improve riparian areas by 
fencing selected reaches of streams from hve- 
stock and by using improved grazing systems 
Use of Best Management Practices (BMP’s) for 
streamside management zones has helped dra- 
matically in preventing loggmg damage typical 
of past decades Restonng past damage is an 
important prionty for riparian habitat 

About 60,000 acres of perennial and seasonal 
wetland habitat are on or adjacent t o  the Forest 
Lake Almanor and Eagle Lake account for about 
51,000 of these acres The wetlands provlde 
significant habitat for breeding and wintenng 

waterfowl Excellent opportunities exist t o  in- 
crease wetland habitat quality and waterfowl 
production on at least 5,000 wetland acres 

e. Demand 

The Forest generates an estimated 62,400 
Wildlife and Fish User Days (WFUD’s) annually 
from wildlife-associated recreation (a WFUD is a 
12-hour activlty day) This recreation is valued 
a t  $1,105,000 per year Deer and waterfowl 
hunting are the major actinties Bird watchmg 
and associated activities a re  the  major 
nonconsumptive demand for wldhfe 

Public interest in bald eagles and peregrine fal- 
cons is extremely high. National demand will be 
great a t  least until recovery levels are achieved 
The Forest’s share of bald eagles needed to meet 
recovery is 16 breeding pairs, two more than 
presently exist Likewise, two additional breed- 
ing pairs of peregrine falcons are needed to  meet 
species recovery goals on the Forest 

There is considerable public interest in spotted 
owls, goshawks, marten and fisher due to  their 
status as Sensitive species and concern for their 
vlabihty Because oftheir secretive nature, these 
species do not generate appreciable amounts of 
WFUD’s They are not subject t o  mewing, nor 
are they game species 

Hunter demand for pronghorn antelope far ex- 
ceeds supply Huntingpermits areissued only to 
a small fraction of those who apply The Cahfor- 
nia Department of Fish and Game’s long-term 
goal is to  increase the sub-herd that uses the 
Forest from 1,400 to 2,500 animals 

Demand for deer also far exceeds supply and will 
increase on the Forest The California Depart- 
ment of Fish and Game deer herd plans request 
higher deer populations in most ofthe deer herds 
in the State. Waterfowl hunting will continue to  
be in high demand as private landowners con- 
tinue to  limit hunting on their lands Relatively 
few other National Forests have potential for 
significant waterfowl production 

Satisfymg the demand for riparian habitat, oak 
habitats, wetlands, snags, dead and down wood, 
and plant and animal diversity is a goal of major 
importance This will depend on the Forest 
maintaining viable populations of all animals, 
and perpetuating productive and healthy ecosys- 
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. 
CHAPTER 4 - MANAGEMENT DIRECTION 

A. INTRODUCTION 

The purpose of this chapter is to (1) define the 
resources to  be emphasized in different parts of 
the Forest, (2) establish goals and objectives for 
commodities and services to be provlded, and (3) 
prescnbe standards, gudelines, and practices to 
achieve the goals and objectives This manage- 
ment direction provldes the framework for inter- 
disciplinary project-level planmng 

Direction for management of National Forests 
comes from law, regulation, policy, and proce- 
dures The many laws enacted by Congress for 
this purpose include, among others, the Orgamc 
Administration Act of 1897, the Multiple-Use 
Sustamed-Yield Act of 1960, the Forest and 
Rangeland Renewable Resources Planning Act 
of 1974, and the National Forest Management 
Act of 1976. Regulations developed by the Secre- 
tary of Agnculture are found in the Code of 
Federal Regulations (CFR) Policies developed 
by the agency are listed in the Forest Semce 
Manual (FSM), and procedures developed by the 
agency are descnbed in the Forest Service Hand- 
books (FSH). 

The Forest m11 continue to  be gcuded by these 
laws, regulations, and Forest Service Manual 
policy and Handbook procedures T h s  Forest 
Plan supplements, but does not replace, the 
direction from these sources The Plan generally 
does not restate this direction, except where it is 
necessary to clanfy treatment of an issue or 
concern 

In this Plan, management direction for the Forest 
consists of three integrated components 1) 
Forest-wide Direction, 2) Management 
Prescriptions, and 3)  Management Area 
Direction. Forest-mde Direction applies to the 
entire Lassen National Forest and expresses the 
intent of laws and regulations Management 
Prescriptions identify t h e  resource-use 
activities t o  be emphasized on particular types 
of land Management Area Direction gives 
additional policy unique to  specific areas of the 
Forest Figure 4-1 shows the hierarchy of the 

management direction. Note that management 
direction applies only to  National Forest land, 
not to pnvate land or other agency lands mthm 
or near the National Forest 

Forest-wide Direction Forest-mde Direction 
includes Forest Goals, Forest Objectives, and 
Forest Standards and Guidelines Forest Goals 
state the management philosophy of the Forest 
Plan established in response to identified issues 
and concerns Forest objectives allocate acre- 
ages to management prescnptions and establish 
targets for Forest-mde resource outputs, activi- 
ties, and costs by decade Forest Standards and 
Guidelines gude the management activlties for 
each resource throughout the Forest 

Management Prescriptions A Management 
Prescnption assigns a pnmary management 
purpose to a particular kind of land (camp- 
grounds, wdderness, timber management area, 
etc ), recognizingits physical and biologxal char- 
acteristics, existing access, productive ca- 
pacity, andother attnbutes Prescnptions speedy 
management practices in adhtion to  Forest Stan- 
dards and Guidehnes that apply to  the allocated 
areas. Most importantly, prescnptions define 
the array of appropnate vegetation manipula- 
tion actiwties that are compatible mth the pur- 
pose of the prescription 

Management Area Direction Management 
Area Direction establishes additional goals, ac- 
tivlties, and output targets for 48 Management 
Areas that have been delineated to facilitate 
forest management This direction supplements 
both the Forest Standards and Guidelines and 
the Management Prescnptions, to accommodate 
the unique charactenstics of each Management 
Area 

Deviations from Forest-mde Direction, Manage- 
ment Prescnptions, and Management Area Di- 
rection may occasionally be appropriate due to  
site-specific conditions The Forest will not dew- 
ate, however, from direction that is based on law 
or regulation Moreover, any modifications will 
reflect the intent of Forest goals In any case, 
dunng project planning the Forest mll analyze 
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F i g u r e  4-1 

Hierarchy of Management Directior 

Forest Goals 

Forest Standards 
& Guidelines 

Management Prescription 

.... .... 

I Management Area 
Direction 

any devlations from Plan dwection that appear 
warranted and m11 record the analysis and con- 
clusion in the appropnate environmental docu- 
ment 

B. DESIREDFUTURF: 
CONDITION 

The desired future Condition is a concise, general 
descnption of what the Forest should be, ap- 
proximately 50 years in the future It is the 
resulting conhtion of meeting the goals and 
objectives, and standards and guidelines of this 
Plan The difference between the existing condi- 
tion and the desired future condition represents 
the anticipated change from mplementing the 
Plan 

The overall desired future condition for the Las- 
sen National Forest can be summarized as the 
follolvlng 

About 53 percent of the Forest is available and 
smtable for timber production Approxlmately 
342,040 acres are allocated for intensive timber 
management, producmg generally even-aged tim- 
ber stands m t h  a diversity of age classes among 
stands. They will provlde timber, biomass, fire- 
wood, and other forest products on a sustained 
level whle maintaimng other resource values. 
Timber lands managed less intensively for tim- 
ber production will emphasize other resource 
objectives, such as wildlife habitat and/or vlsual 
quality. Old growth retention areas, spotted owl 
habitat areas, and marten and fisher habitat 
management areas mll receive limted or no 
scheduled timber management to provlde habi- 
ta t  for species dependent on old growth forests 

Biologxal diversity remams high, m t h  vlable 
populations of all native nnldlife and plant spe- 
cies mamtained Ripanan areas are healthy, 
and streams continue to provide clean water and 
high quahty habitat for all native and compat- 
ible non-native game fish species. Rangelands 
are productive in terms of livestock forage, wild- 
life and fisheries habitat, and water quality 
Range productivity is in a satisfactory or better 
Condition wth a stable or improving trend. Rec- 
reation fanlities are well maintained and are 
sufficient to handle the vlcreased demand Wil- 
derness, semi-pnmtive, Wild and Scenic Rivers, 
Special Interest Areas, and other special areas 
are managed to provide generally pnmitive rec- 
reational expenences whde maintammg healthy, 
natural ecosystems Mineral and energy devel- 
opment continues in areas where such uses are 
compatible m t h  other multiple use objectives 
Soil productivity and  water quality remain high, 
water quality mll continue to meet or exceed 
State standards Sigmficant cultural resources 
are protected and interpretive programs con- 
tinue to  educate the public about cultural re- 
source values. 

Present air quality is mamtamed Baseline 
condhons for all a r  quality related values are 
defined and limits of acceptable change are es- 
tablished for Class I mlderness areas A moni- 
tonng program evaluates changes in air quahty 
related values Prescnbed fire, thinning, and 
slash management are used in forest stands to  
minimize the probability of catastrophic loss 
from mldfire or forest pests Prescribed fires or 
other treatments are used to create a mosax of 
seral stages in brushfields to benefit wildlife 
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The appearance of the Forest from designated 
throughways and vantage points appears mostly 
unchanged by management activlties, from other 
areas, harvest openings and roads may be VIS- 
ible. Non-commodity outputs such as  wild- 
life, bioloacal diversity, and scenic quality are 
emphasized equally with commodity outputs. 

C. FOREST GOALS 

Goals for achievlng the desired future conhtion 
for the Forest for each significant resource are 
listed below. 

l. AIRQUALITY 

a Mamtain air quality to  meet or exceed legal 
requirements of appropriate levels of gov- 
ernment. 

Minimize encroachment of prescnbed fire 
smoke on population centers 

b 

2. BIOMASS 

a Provide for the use ofbiomass that is surplus 
to ecological, silvicultural, and personal fire- 
wood gathenng needs 

b. Consistent wth (a) above, sell biomass from 
thinnings in both plantations and wild stands 
to offset costs of Forest Timber Stand Im- 
provement programs. 

3. CULTURAL RESOURCES 

a. Protect, preserve, and complete the inven- 
tory of cultural properties on the Forest, in 
the first decade. This shall be accomplished 
by a combination of general inventones and 
those required for resource-use projects 
Detenmne the ehability of 20 percent of the 
properties for inclusion on the National Reg- 
ister of Histonc Places per decade. 

Insure that Forest actions are not detrimen- 
tal to traditional Native Amencan rehDous 
nghts and practices 

Provlde information about cultural resources 
for public education and enjoyment. 

b 

c 

4. ENERGY 

a. Create energy-efficient facilities through 
state-of-the-art design for both new con- 
struction and upgradmg emsting facilities 

b. Encourageenergy-efficientvehicleoperations 
through the use of fuel efficient vehicles for 
the Forest fleet 

5. FACILITIES 

a Provlde a stable and cost-efficient road sys- 
tem through appropnate construction, re- 
construction, andlor maintenance 

b. Cooperate w t h  Federal and State agencies, 
counties, and pnvate entities to obtainneeded 
modifications of roads under their junsdic- 
tions 

Provlde a stable and cost-efficient trail sys- 
tem through appropriate construction, re- 
construction, andlor maintenance 

Provlde administrative sites and facilities 
that effectively and cost-efficiently serve the 
public and the Forest Semce workforce 

e. 

d 

6. FIREANDFUELS 

a Rely on fuel reduction and an effective fire 
protection organization to minimize wldfire 
losses. 

Promote fire prevention commensurate with 
resource values a t  nsk. 

Reduce fuels by prescribingfire and allovvlng 
biomass use, while maintaining soil and wa- 
ter quality 

b 

c 

7. FIREWOOD 

a. Provlde a sustained supply of firewood, DV- 
ing pnonty to  personal use 

8. FISH 

a Maintain or improve habitat for all native 
and compatible non-native species 
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9. FORESTHEALTH 

a Reduce impacts of forest pests on all re- 
sources t o  acceptable levels through inte- 
grated pest management. 

10. GEOLOGY- 
GROUNDWATER 

a Conduct geoloacal inventories needed for 
assessments of proposed projects. 

1L LANDS 

a. Initiate land ownership adjustments to 
achieve ownership patterns facilitating For- 
est management and mnimizing adminis- 
trative costs 

Survey, mark and post property boundanes 
adjacent t o  pnvate lands, mlderness and 
mld and scenic rivers pnor to Forest activity 
adjacent t o  them. 

Acquire rights-of-way needed to efficiently 
manage Forest resources and provlde public 
access 

d. Pursue land mthdrawals from mineral en- 
try or disposalwhenneededtoprotect Forest 
improvements and areas of special sigmfi- 
cance. 

Issue special use permits, in conformance 
mth Management Area Direction, if a net 
public benefit will cesult 

Avoid the proliferation of separate utility 
rights-of way. 

g. Resolve all unauthorized occupancies on Na- 
tional Forest land 

Continue to coordinate with concerned agen- 
cies t o  preserveuniqueresourcesin theEagle 
Lake, Lake Britton, and Lassen Volcanic 
National Park areas 

Designate the following as multi-user elec- 
tronic sites Turner Mountain, Hamilton 
Mountain, Morgan Summit, Keddie Ridge, 
Colby Mountain, and Hall's Flat 

b 

c 

e 

f. 

h 

i 

12. LAW ENFORCEMENT 

a Protect Forest resources to insure public 
safety and retain resource values. 

13. MINERALS 

a Provide for nuneral exploration and develop- 
ment while protecting surface resources 

14 RANGE 

a Provlde for long-term rangeland productiv- 
ity for fishenes, mldlife, soil, water, timber, 
and livestock forage values 

Revlse allotment management plans as nec- 
essary to meet management direction and 
vegetative management goals. 

Establish Forest standards for vegetative 
utilization until site specific utilization stan- 
dards are in place. 

Manage ripanan areas forest-wide to reach 
natural or achievable site potential and de- 
sired ecoloacal conditions Desired future 
conditions, where site potential exists, are 
late seral communities in good or better 
condition. 

b 

c 

d 

15. RECREATION 

a Provlde a wide range of outdoor recreation 
opportunities to meet public demand by fur- 
nishing different levels of access, service, 
facilities, and information 

Provide interpretive servlces and facilities t o  
inform the public about Forest resources and 
management 

Provlde diverse opportunities for off-high- 
way vehicle recreation 

Provide diverse opportunities for winter 
sports 

e. Manage recreational residences as compo- 
nents of the overall National Forest recre- 
ation program Work in partnership with 
the holders of recreation residence permits 

b 

c. 

d 
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to utilize the recreational benefits of these 
residences 

Continue pnvate operation of National For- 
est developed recreation sites where it best 
serves public recreation needs. 

Work in partnership with local communities 
to expand recreational facilities, programs 
and trails on both public and private land. 

f 

g 

16. SENSITIVE PLANTS 

a. Maintain habitat and vlable populations to 
contribute to eventual de-listing of Sensitive 
plants that are found on the Forest 

Manage Sensitive plants to insure that spe- 
cies do not become Threatened or Endan- 
gered because of Forest Service actions 

b 

17. SOILS 

a Prevent irreversible losses of soil produc- 
tivity 

b. Restore all substantial areas of significantly 
degraded soil. 

18. SPECIALARW 

a Protect areas of outstanding scientific, sce- 
nic, botanic or geolosc value as Research 
Natural Areas (RNAs) or Special Interest 
Areas (SIA's) 

19. TIMBER 

a. Provide a sustained quantity of forest prod- 
ucts by selecting silvicultural practices from 
the full range available on an indimdual 
stand basis, with consideration of biologxal 
requirements, economic efficiency, and For- 
est Goals for other resources. Prefer even- 
aged management where all of these criteria 
can be met 

20. VEGETATIONANDDIWRSITY 

a Provide vegetative diversity to maintain sce- 
nic quality, nable populations of plants and 
wildlife. and to minimize loss from wildfire 

21. VISUAL RESOURCES 

a Throughout the Forest, maintam vlsual qual- 
ity commensurate with other resource needs 
Adopt and apply specific Visual Quality Ob- 
jectives (VQOs) for all areas of the Forest. 

Where past management actinties do not 
meet adopted visual quality objectives, use 
visual rehabilitation to return visual quality 
to an acceptable level. 

b 

22. WATERANDRIPARIANAREXS 

a. Provide water of sufficient quality and quan- 
tity to meet current needs. Meet additional 
future demand where compatible with other 
resource needs 

b. Limit indindual project impacts as needed 
to  avoid significant cumulative effects on 
water quality and fishenes 

Comply with Federal, State, resonal, and 
local water quality regulations requirements 
and standards 

d. Maintain or  improve ripanan-dependent re- 
sources in and around wetlands, stream cor- 
ndors (including ephemeral and i termit-  
tent streams), lakes, seeps, spnngs, and wet 
meadows. 

Evaluate riparian zones forest-wide and 
manage to reach natural or achievable site 
potential and desirable future conditions. 
Desired future conditions, where site poten- 
tial exists, are late seral communities in good 
or better condition 

c 

e 

23. WILD AND SCENIC RIVERS 

a Recommend eliDble, suitable rivers for fed- 
eral Wild and Scenic River designation 

Protect and enhance outstandingly remark- 
able values and the free-flowing condition of 
recommended and designated Wild and Sce- 
nic Rivers 

b 
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24. WILDERNESS AND FURTHER 
PLANNINGAREAS 

a Protect mlderness character in designated 
and recommended mlderness 

25. WILDLIFE 

a Assist in recovery efforts for Threatened and 
Endangered species 

b Provide formable populationsofspottedowls 
and goshawks through coordinated manage- 
ment of an established network of nesting 
territories in appropriate habitat. 

Contribute toward the population viability 
of marten and fisher through coordinated 
management of established habitat manage- 
ment areas in appropnate habitat 

Create desirable habitat size, shape, and 
bstnbution to  provlde both forage and cover 
for deer populations 

c 

d 

e. Provide sufficient habitat for species depen- 
dent on snags, nest cavities, and dead and 
down wood 

f. Enhance ecotones and provide other special 
habitat elements t o  maintain or increase 
species diversity 

g Cooperatemth Federal, State, andlocal agen- 
cies in improvlng wildlife habitat for all spe- 
cies 

h Coordinate unldlife management programs 
with other resource management programs 
to meet habitat or population objectives es- 
tablished for “Management Indicator Spe- 
cies” (see Glossary in FEIS) 

i Manage habitatfor Sensitivewildlife species 
to insure that these species do not become 
Threatened or Endangered due to Forest 
Service actions. 
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figure 4-2 shows the acres ofthe Forest allocated 
to each Management Prescnphon. Table 4-1 
lists the target commohty outputs and resource- 
management actinties for the ten year planning 
penod along wlth potential outputs and activi- 
ties for the following 40 years Table 4-2 lists 
additional objectives for timber management on 
an annual basis. Wildllfe habitat objectives for 
the plannlng period are shown on page 4-13 

D. FOREST OBJECTIVES 

The followmg tables show the land-use alloca- 
tions and target commodity outputs, resource 
management actinties, and operating costs that 
would accomplish or be compatible m t h  Forest 
Goals 

Figure 4-2 

Acreage Allocation by Prescription* 

Non-Txmber Wildlife A 
RangeiWildhfe B 

Firewood C 
Developed Recreation D 

Early Successional E 
R ipanMish  F 

Old Growth/Goshawk** G 
RockyISparse Txmber K 

Late Succesional L 
Senu-Pnmitive Motonzed M 

Semi-Pnmitive Non-Motonzed N 
Range R 

Special Areas S 
Txmber T 

Viewmmber V 
Wilderness W 

Minimal Management Z 

* Presenptions represent general management intent f inal  land allocations m11 be done at 
the project level, after a site-specific envlronmental analysis has been completed 
Prescnption maps do not generally display areas smaller than 200 acres More than one 
prescnption may apply to an area See Prescnption Application Pnonty in the Plan Chapter 
4, section F, for a listing of which prescnptions take precedence 

** G Prescnption acres were modeled, hut not field venfied They do not appear on present 
prescnption maps When mapped, the number of acres in this bar mll change, representing 
acres not allocated to more restnctive prescnptions Other prescnption acreages may be 
reduced when G acreage is adjusted 
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Table 4-1 
Average Annual Outputs by Decade for PRF Alternative 

1980 RPA Goals 
OutDut/Activltv BaseYear 1990 2030 

1982 
ECONOMIC 

Total Budget (MM $1 13 9 17.9 193  
Total Cost (MM $) 14 5 

B X O W S  a! 

. (M-O.D,TQI$ 
FACILITES 
Roads & Trruls (mles) 

Reconstruction 

148 . 
I (j ~ * -  ~ b 8 % a  .*A + -  

Biomass Ayailable 

Tral Construction/ 0 3 3 

Road Construction 15 
Road Reconstruction 80 
Road Mamtenance b/ 2,862 

-Dams &Reservoirs ".* c. [nipber] _ i - p - A  4 .e ,:*. 
B 'a ~ b ri  a&rap@ Siqyige - = ' ,  ~ ' j  , >  

i d  e Otherpedepl .~ o . *  , .  I"*"% 8.*n~PeT?F*. d ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ o f i g r s ~ ~ ~ &  i %, d .s,.,-,*=- ',' s i  

-."PBvai% ~. 8 ' 

i -  

AXIS - 

Administrative Sites (number) 
Forest Service Owned 12 
Leased 4 

FIRE AND FUELS 
FeelQeatment., ~ ,~ . , i &630 @ d;pr b j F  a i,q,ji;b'=,x:8 

' (totalawes) 
Fire.Related Treatment 1,000 
Timber-Related 8,990 

Treatment 
* FbgeiWildlife Fuel 1,640 
' Treatment 

Expected Acres Burned by Wildfire 
Intensity Class 1 328 

Intensity Class 3 6 
Intensity Class 4 113 
Intensity Class 5 6 

Total 566 

Intensity Class 2 74 

Intensity Class 6 39 

1 

16 3 
17 5 

165 

3 5  

16 
50 

3,552 

' = i o  

* -  2 

11 
1 

"x 6,050 

1,150 
3,600 

1,300 

380 
91 
8 

228 
8 

45 
760 

Decade 
2 3 4 5 

192 21.4 257 3 0 1  
20 5 22.8 27.1 314 

165 165 179 -187 

3 5  3.5 3.5 3.5 

7 6 5 4 
46 56 60 55 

3,667 3,732 3,787 3,832 

11 11 11 11 
1 1 1 1 

410 436 450 439 
98 105 108 105 

8 9 9 9 
246 262 269 263 

8 9 9 9 
92 52 54 53 

862 873 899 878 
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Table 4-1 (continued) 
Average Annual Outputs by Decade for PRF Alternative 

1980 RPA Goals Decade 
OutputJActivlty Base Year 

1982 
FIREWOOD 

Cords) 
Firewood (Thousand 

FISH 
Resident Rsh 

(M pounds) 
Anadromous Fish- 
Commercial Harvest 

Anadromous Fish-Sport 
(M pounds) 

(M pounds) 
Total WFUDs 

Direct Habitat 
Improvement (WFUDs) 

Resident fish 
Anadromous Fish-Sport 

Direct Habitat 
Improvement 
(acreslstructnres) 

Resident Fmh 
Anadromous Fish- 

Commercial & Sport 

LANDS 
Land Acqmsition (acres) c/ 

Minerals 
(plans & permts) 

Locatable Minerals 
Mineral Materials 
Leasable Minerals 

RANGE 
Grazing (M AUMs) 

RECREATION 

(M RVD) 

(M RVD) 

Developed Public 

Developed Private 

Dispersed (M RVD) 
(including mldemess 
use, exclurhng 
WFUD's) 

70 

48 

100 

39 

18,750 

300 
115 

1.5110 
1/10 

1,600 

58 

6 
52 
0 

49 7 

591 

190 

312 

1990 2030 1 2 3 4 5 

53 

100 

39 

0 

51 

50.5 

639 

202 

336 

69 69 70 79 83 

57 51 52 54 54 54 

103 100 100 101 101 101 

40 39 39 39 39 39 

19,400 19,400 19,400 19,400 19,400 

2,000 3,700 4,000 4,000 4,000 
1,000 1,000 1,000 1,000 1,000 

3/30 3/15 111 111 111 
3/20 .5/1 511 .5/1 .5/1 

0 2,000 2,000 200 200 200 

65 

6 6 6 6 6 
46 49 50 52 54 
2 4 6 8 10 

53 2 48 5 48.5 48 5 48.5 48.5 

930 629 726 810 886 997 

294 190 190 190 190 190 
- 

448 402 451 493 533 589 
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Table 4-1 (continued) 
Average Annual Outputs by Decade for PRF Alternative 

1980 RPA Goals 
OutputlActivlty BaseYear 1990 2030 

1982 

RECREATION (continued) 
Open Usable O W  Areas, 961 
Summer (M acres) 

Open Usable OHV Areas, 961 
Winter (M acres) 

Roads & Trails Open to  2,240 
O W  Use, Summer (mi) 

Roads CB; Pads Open to 3,070 
OHV Use, Wmter (mi) 

SPECIAL AREAS (number of areas/M acres) 
Research Natural Areas 
Nahonal Natural 

Special Interest Areas 
Landmarks 

TIMBER 
Allowable Sale Quantity 

MMCF 
MMBF 

Long Term Sustained Yield 
MMCF 
MMBF 

Reforestation (acres) 
Timber Stand 

Improvement (acres) 

VISUAL RESOURCE 
Visual Quahty Index 

WATER 
Quality (M acre-feet % 

Quantity (M acre-feet) dl 
Increased Quant~ty 

Watershed Improvement 

Ripanan Area 

standards) 

(M acre-feet) 

(acres) 

Improvement (acres) 

214 4 
0 

0 

27 
171 

30 
195 

600 
2,200 

57 

1,308 

1,308 

15 

5 

28 29 
176 187 

606 707 
2,586 2,637 

2,102 2,124 

170 200 

Decade 
1 2 3 4 5 

763 763 763 763 763 

763 763 763 768 763 

2,301 2,422 2,542' 2,662 2,782 

3,132 3,252 3,372 S,492' - 3,612 

.. . ~- 

~ d -3:- 
~ . - a  - 

8/14 3 81143 8114.3 8/14 3 81143 
p/o'--: ,o/o 

8 s -  s i *  . oio o/o - . 010 

712.3 712 3 712.3 712 3 712 3 

15 15 15 17 ,. '18 
96 96 96 108 113 

r -pzi 7' b (S w&"yx& sa 2z 
22 .-*, 22 . e I #& ~W * 

139 139 139 139 139 

3,600 3,500 3,500 3,300 3,200 
4,700 4,700 .4&700 - '  "5,700" "7~000 

56 56 55 55 54 

1,304 1,299 1,299 1,300 1,301 

1,304 1,299 1,299 1,300 1,301 

-4 -9 -9 -8 -7 

75 75 5 5 5 

20 20 20 20 20 
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Table 4-1 (continued) 
Average Annual Outputs by Decade for PRF Alternative 

1980 RPA Goals Decade 
OutpuVActinty Base Year 1990 2030 1 2 3 4 5 

1982 

WILD & SCENIC Miles Recommended 
RIVERS 

Wild 
Scenic 
Recreational 

WILDERNESS 

0 
0 
0 

Wilderness Acres 78,060 
Wilderness Unita 3 
Wilderness Use 20.4 
(MRVD) e/ 

WILDLIFE 

485 485 485 485 485 
10.0 10.0 10.0 10.0 10.0 
175 17.5 175 175 17.5 

99,644 99,644 99,644 99,644 99,644 
7 7 I 7 7 

374 411 453 498 548 

Threatened & Endangered 
Species 
Bald Eagle (pairs) 14 16 19 19 19 19 
NorthernSpotted Unmanaged 1 1 1 1 1 
OwlM[CA 
Peregnne Falcon (pairs) 1 3 5 5 5 5 

Other Wildlife 

Deer (animals) 49,000 54,800 54,800 45,600 46,000 46,400 46,800 47,200 
Califomia Spotted Owl Unmanaged 40 40 40 40 40 

Goshawk Management Unmanaged 113 113 113 113 113 
Habitat Areas 

Areas 

Total WFUDs 62,400 58,100 58,600 59,100 59,600 60,100 

Direct Habitat 
Improvement (WFUDs) 

Deer 400 540 540 540 400 400 
Small Game and 800 800 800 700 600 600 
Non-Game 

Wildlife Habitat 
Improvement (acres) 

Deer 2,000 1,300 1,300 1,300 1,300 1,300 
Small Game and 50 80 80 80 80 80 
Non-game 

a/ Excludes matenal c 4  dameter, precommercial thinning, firewood. 
b/ Mileages shown are mid-decade averages for new construction - - 
d Fwe-year average 
d/ Flow figures do not include runoff contributed from pnvate lands, while the RPA figures were 
based on entire watershed areas 
e/ 1982 base year includes RVD’s for Canbou and Thousand Lakes Wilderness Areas 

Note Decade 2-5 potential outputs are shown for purpose of long-range comparison of alternatives 
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Pable 4-2 

rimber Management Outputs and Activities 
lnnual Average Acreage in Plan Period 1: 
Management Practice AcresNear 

Regeneration Harvest 

a By Forest Type. 

Mxed Conifer 

Eastside Pine 

Red Fir 

Lodgepole Pine 

Total for Forest Types 

b By Cutting Methods 

Clearcut 

Shelterwood 

Overstory RemovaUStand Mamtenance 

Group Selection 

Total Cutting Methods 

Intermediate Harvestlother Products 

Total Harvest 

Other Practices 

Timber Stand Improvement 

3,000 

600 
300 

100 

4,000 

1,600 

1,000 

900 

500 
4,000 

5,500 

9,500 

4,700 

Reforestation 1/ 3,600 

Allowable Sale 
Quantity 

MMCF/ MMBF/ 
year year 

9.9 63 

1.5 10 

2.2 14 

.6 4 
14.2 91 

6.4 41 

3.5 22 

2.4 14 

1 9  14 

14 2 91 

.9 5 

15 1 96 

l/ Approximately 3,600 out of 4,000 acres of regeneration harvest will be planted. The 
.emaning acres will be reforested by natural seed fall or already have advanced natural 
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Fish and Wildlife Habitat Management Objectives 

The follomng are minimum management objec- 
tives to be achieved dunng the planning period. 
Annual acreages are averages for the period and 
are not necessanly annual targets. 

BaldEagle Maintainsuitabilityofhabitat a t  14 
bald eagle territones known to be occupied 
Maintain five additional suitable terntones that 
are not occupied This m11 provlde a choice of 
areas for new pairs t o  select, so that the Forest’s 
recovery population objective of 16 pairs may be 
reached as soon as possible Protect all signifi- 
cant winter roost habitat a t  major lakes and 
reservoirs 

Peregrine Falcon Maintain suitability ofhabi- 
tat  a t  one known peregnne breeding terntory 
that is currently occupied. Maintain four poten- 
tial territones that are currently unoccupied, t o  
achieve the recovery population of three pairs. 
Support efforts to increase the population through 
artificial enhancement measures 

Shasta Crayfish Protect known populations 
and habitat of Shasta crayfish where they occur 
Cooperate with the U S. Fish and Wildlife Ser- 
vice in any future recovery efforts 

Northern Spotted Owl Provlde the Forest’s 
contnbution to a viable population by managmg 
one Habitat Conservation Area and all present 
and potential northern spotted owl habitat as 
specified by the U S Fish and Wildlife Semce. 

California Spotted Owl Provide the Forest’s 
contnbution to  a viable population of California 
spotted owls. Maintain a minimum of 1,000 
acres of suitable habitat and 650 acres of re- 
placement habitat in spotted owl habitat areas 
(SOHA’S) distributed across the Forest within 
the range of the California spotted owl If 1,000 
acres is not currently available, manage the 
forest t o  create 1,000 acres of suitable habitat as 
soon as possible. 

Goshawk Prowde the Forest’s contribution to a 
wable goshawk population by maintaining a 
network of 113 goshawk management areas 
(GMKs) Each GMA should consist of a mini- 
mum of 50 acres of mature forest in one or two 
stands 

Great Gray Owl Maintain suitability of habi- 
tat of known great gray owl locations There are 
two reported sightings of great gray owls on the 
Forest Support efforts to inventory new loca- 
tions Protect large snags along meadow edges 
for potential nest locations 

Willow Flycatcher Maintain currently suit- 
able mllow flycatcher habitat by preventing deg- 
radation of willow/ripanan communities Man- 
age nparian areas to  enhance willow reproduc- 
tion and sumval  to create additional habitat 
suitable for nesting willow flycatchers. 

Marten Manage a system of 19 marten habitat 
management areas, each a mnimum of 2,100 
acres in size, connected by comdors 600 feet 
wide This will provide late seral habitat in 
sufficient quantity and spatial arrangement to 
maintain the Lassen’s contribution to popula- 
tion viability for the species on the National 
Forests 

Fisher Manage a system of five fisher habitat 
management areas, each mth approximately 
9,800 acres of suitable habitat and connected by 
comdors 600feetmde, toprovlde forthe Lassen’s 
contnbution to a viable population of this spe- 
cies 

Deer Habitat treatments for deer include regen- 
erating 4,000 acres per year In addition, 600 
acres per year will be regenerated under the 
Early Successional Prescnption. Approxlmately 
1,300 acres per year of non-timber vegetation in 
deer winter and summer ranges will be pre- 
scribed burn 

Wetlands Improve at  least 100 acres per year 
for waterfowl and other waterbirds by construc- 
tion of water-control structures, nesting islands, 
and fences if needed to exclude domestic live- 
stock. 

Riparian and Meadow Improve at least 20 
acres ofripanan and meadow habitat per year by 
silviculturally treatlng aspen and other hard- 
woods; removing lodgepole from meadows; seed- 
ing; other vegetative treatments; and construct- 
ingfences, check dams, and nprap for soil protec- 
tion and bank stabilization 
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Hardwoods Improve a t  least 50 acres of hard- 
wood habitat per year by silvicultural treatment 
(thinning, removal of encroaching conifers, re- 
generation) and prescnbed burning. 

Anadromous Fish Where potential spawning 
streams are longer than 0.5 miles, remove mi- 
grational barriers to fish Improve three acres of 
stream channel and install 20 habitat improve- 

ment structures in decade 1 by fencing, modify- 
ing debns, planting nparian vegetation, and 
placing combinations of boulder and logs. 

Resident Fish Improve three acres of habitat 
and install 30 habitat improvement structures 
(fencing, log weirs, boulder dusters, plantings, 
manipulated debns) in decade 1 
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E. FOREST STANDARDS 
ANDGUIDELINES 

The Forest Standards and Guidelines apply to 
the entire Forest. They expand the Forest Goals 
into more specificmanagement direction for each 
resource To maintain the close link between 
these two levels of direction, the pnmary direc- 
tion statements (a, b, c, etc )of the Forest Stan- 
dards and Guidelines are identical to the state- 
ments of the Forest Goals listed above 

The two adhtional levels of direction below the 
Forest Standards and Gudelines-Management 
Prescnptions and Management Area Direction- 
are consistent with, but more location-specific 
than these Standards and Guidelines. 

1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 
9 
10. 
11. 
12 
13 
14 
15 
16 
17 
18 
19 
20. 
21 
22 
23 
24. 

25. 

1. 

Resources 

Aw Quality 
Biomass 
Cultural Resources 
Energy 
Facilities 
Fire and Fuels 
Firewood 
Fish 
Forest Health 
Geology and Groundwater 
Lands 
Law Enforcement 
Minerals 
Range 
Recreation 
Sensitive Plants 
soils 
Special Areas 
Timber 
Vegetation and Diversity 
Visual Resources 
Water and f ipanan Areas 
Wild and Scemc Rivers 
Wilderness and Further 

Wildlife 
Planning Areas 

AIR QUALITY 

&gg 

4-15 
4-15 
4-15 
4-16 
4-16 
4-17 
4-18 
4-19 
4-19 
4-20 
4-20 
4-21 
4-21 
4-22 
4-24 
4-26 
4-26 
4-27 
4-27 
4-29 
4-30 
4-30 
4-32 

4-33 
4-34 

a Maintam air quality to meet or exceed legal 
requirements of appropriate levels of gov- 
ernment 

b. 

2. 

a 

b 

3. 

a 

(1) Comply with the Federal Clean Aw 
Act, as amended, and State and local 
air quality regulations. 

Minimize encroachment of smoke from pre- 
scnhed fires into the Sacramento Valley, 
Lake Almanor basin, Fall Rivervalley, Eagle 
Lake basin, Burney basin, and Honey Lake 
Valley 

(1) Cooperate withlocalArPollution Con- 
trol Distncts dunng burning activities 
t o  minimize the total contannnation 
occumng at  any one time 

Conduct burning activlties on desig- 
nated “burn” days when atmospheric 
conditions result in acceptable wildfire 
hazard and provlde for rapid disper- 
sion of pollutants. Only in rare cases 
w11 variances be requested 

Design each burn plan so that air qual- 
ity standards will be met or exceeded 

(2) 

(3) 

BIOMASS 

Provlde for the use ofbiomass that is surplus 
to  ecologxal, silvicultural, and personal fire- 
wood gathering needs. 

(1) Provlde hiding and thermal cover for 
deer in biomass treatment areas 

Consistent mth (a) above, sell biomass from 
thinningsin both plantations andwldstands 
to  offset the costs of Forest Timber Stand 
Improvement programs. 

CULTURAL RESOURCES 

Protect, preserve, and complete the inven- 
tory of cultural properties on the Forest in 
the first decade This shall be accomplished 
by a combination of general inventories and 
those required for resource-use projects 
Determine the ehgbility of 20 percent ofthe 
properties for inclusion in the National Reg- 
ister of Histonc Places per decade 

(1) Within the first decade, identify and 
inventory cultural properties 
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Develop and implement agreements 
with the State Histonc Preservation 
Officer and the Advisory Council on 
Historic Preservation for the manage- 
ment of cultural properties on or eh- 
ghle for inclusion on the National Reg- 
ister 

Protect cultural properties listed or 
eliglble for inclusion on the National 
Regster from detenoration or destruc- 
tion 

Where protection of cultural proper- 
ties is not feasible, recover the values 
that result in their ellability for inclu- 
sion on the National Reaster 

Allow the scientific study of cultural 
properties 

b. Insure that Forest actions are not detnmen- 
tal to trahtional Native Amencan religious 
rights and practices 

(1) Identify areas used m the practice of 
traditional Native Amencan relieon 
and d e t e m e  present use for reli- 
gous purposes 

(a) Determine the probable effect of 
any Forest action on these areas 
and resources 

(b) Per the Amencan Indian Religious 
Freedom Act of 1978, seek to m- 
sure that Forest actions do not re- 
strict the practice of traditional 
Native American religon by Na- 
tive Americans. 

c. Provlde information about cultural resources 
for public education and enjoyment 

(1) Increase public awareness of cultural 
resources by distributing information 
from scientific studies, prepanng ex- 
hibits, and interpretlng sites that mll 
not be degraded by such use 

Designate and preserve segments of 
emigrant trail routes and associated 
features that significantly character- 
ize these routes and contnbute to  trail 
interpretation 

(2) 

4. ENERGY 

a Provlde energy-efficient facilities through 
state-of-the-art design forboth newconstruc- 
tion and upgrading emsting facilities. 

(1) To meet the requirements of the Na- 
tional Energy Conservation Policy Act 
(NECPA), audit energy use and retro- 
fit Forest-owned or leased buildings as 
appropnate Pnontizeretrofitprojects 
on the basis of highest ratio of energy 
cost savlng to retrofit investment cost 

b. Encourage energy-efficient vehicle fleet op- 
erations through the use of fuel efficient 
vehicles 

(1) Conduct sufficient vehicle travel and 
utilization stuhes to insure efficiency 
and conservation in vehicle use 

(2) Obtain, mthm procurement regula- 
tions, fuel efficient vehcles for the For- 
est fleet 

5. FACILITIES 

a Provlde a stable and cost-efficient road sys- 
tem through appropnate construction, re- 
construction, andor maintenance 

Maintain each Forest road to  a speci- 
fied maintenance level as defined in 
Appendur G 

Maintain all roads and related struc- 
tures to a) protect resources of adja- 
cent areas; b) meet contractual and 
legal obligations, and c )  provlde an 
efficient transportation system 

Modlfy or obliterate portions of the 
Forest Development Road System as 
needed to meet changmg traffic de- 
mands or other management direction 
herein 

Construct or reconstruct each road to  
satisfy envlronmental and economc 
cnteria identified in the Road Develop- 
ment Guidelines of Appendix F 
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(5) In streams supporting a fishery, use 
stream crossings that permit fish pas- 
sage. Forexample, use archculverts or 
bndges when needed and where suit- 
able foundation conditions exist 

Areas with road densities of 2 mles  
per square mile or higher wlll be evalu- 
ated for habitat effectiveness Roads 
and travel networks will be assessed 
for existing and future needs. Roads 
no longer needed for administrative 
purposes will be closed to enhance wild- 
life habitat, and to  protect water qual- 
ity and soil productivlty Some roads 
may be obliterated and the land re- 
stored to a near natural gradient 

Cooperate mth Federal and State agencies, 
counties, andpnvate entities to obtain needed 
modifications of roads under their junsdic- 
tions 

(1) 

(6) 

b 

Renew locatiqn and design specifica- 
tions for roads bullt under permit or 
license, and require protection of all 
resources 

c Provide a stable and cost-efficient trail sys- 
tem through appropriate construction, re- 
construction, andor maintenance 

(1) Complete management plans for the 
Pacific Crest Scenic Trail, Spencer 
Meadows National Recreation Trail, 
Lassen Emigrant Trail, and Noble’s 
Emigrant Trail, as required by the Na- 
tional Trails System Act of 1968 Meet 
current objectives for trail manage- 
ment and use of all designated hiking, 
equestrian, off-highway vehicle, and 
over-snow trails. 

Maintain all trails  and^ related struc- 
tures to. a) protect the recreation 
amenities of adjacent areas, b) provide 
reasonable access, c) be an efficient 
transportation system; and d) provide 
various expenence levels according to  
type and volume of use 

Modify parts of the Forest Develop- 
ment Trail System as needed to meet 
changmg use demands 

(2) 

(3) 

(4) Construct, reconstruct, and maintain 
each trail to satisfy reasonable envl- 
ronmental and economic critena 

When constructing or reconstructing a 
trailhead, provide for equestrian ve- 
hicle parking where feasible. 

Look for opportunities to convert roads 
that are no longer needed to eques- 
trian, mountain bike anflorpedestnan 
trails 

(5) 

(6) 

d. Provide administrative sites and facilities 
that effectively and cost-efficiently serve the 
public and the Forest Semce workforce 

Maintain all dams on National Forest 
landto: a)protecthumanlifeand down- 
stream property; b) protect adjacent 
resources, c) meet contractual and le- 
gal obligations; and d) function effi- 
ciently 

Maintain all buildings and related fa- 
cilities to. a) preserve the facility’s de- 
sign-life, b) function efficiently, and c )  
exhibit a pleasant appearance to  the 
public and the workforce Maintain 
facilities to meet codes applicable a t  
the time of construction, unless other- 
wise required by law 

In all remodeling, new construction, or 
building leasing, comply with an ap- 
proved Administrative Site Develop- 
ment Plan to provide functional, aes- 
thetically-pleasing, energy-efficient, 
and cost-effective facilities. Comply 
mth  all applicable Federal, State, and 
local building codes. 

Remove those buildings and related 
facilities no longer meeting the needs 
of managmg the Forest, subject t o  re- 
quirements of cultural resource pro- 
tection. 

6. FIREANDFUELS 

a Rely on fuel reduction and an effective fire 
protection organization to minimize mldfire 
losses Maintain a Fire Management Ef- 
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fectiveness Index (FMEI) of 1 54 (see Appen- 
dix H) 

exist without the activity, an analysis 
is required to  determine the level of 

Suppress all wildfires using confine- 
ment, containment, and/or control 
strateDes as specified in the appli- 
cable prescnption of this chapter. 

Take presuppression and suppression 
actions that protect life and property, 
and mininnze resource degradation 

Avoid fire line construction with bull- 
dozers on slopes steeper than 40 per- 
cent or soils with an Erosion Hazard 
Rating of “high 

Cooperate with other agencies, and 
utilize the “closest forces” concept for 
fire suppression 

Assign a Forest Semce representative 
to  all fires larger than 10 acres m t h  
potential to become larger in Manage- 
ment Areas under non-Forest Semce 
protection 

Within the planning penod identify 
project areas where fire from naturally 
occumng unplanned ignition may be 
allowed to safely burn mthin a prede- 
termined prescnption. 

Complete prescnbed burning plans for 
mlderness areas (see Appendix A) 

treatment appropnate. to meet land 
and resource objectives. 

Dispose of all site preparation fuels 
(piles, mndrows, culls, etc that are 
not needed for wildlife or  soil protec- 
tion purposes 

Plan and conduct fuels management in 
compliance with Best Management 
Practices 

In areas used by livestock, apply fuels 
management that facilitates forage pro- 
duction and ease of livestock move- 
ment, if compatible with other re- 
source objectives 

Encourage and cooperate mth  other 
agencies and adjacent landowners to  
treat fuel accumulations that threaten 
public lands 

Use prescnbed under-burning to  mi^- 
mize fuels, prevent invasion of sage- 
brush and rabbit brush, and promote 
native grasses and forbs 

Govern each prescnbed burn by a pre- 
scribed burn plan containing specific 
resource objectives and prescriptions 

(3) 

(4) 

(5) 

(6 )  

(7) 

(8) 

7. FIREWOOD 
b Promote fire prevention commensurate with 

resource values at risk. 

(1) 

a. Provlde a sustained supply of firewood, gw- 
ing pnority to personal use 

(1) 
Design prevention efforts t o  minimize 
human-caused wildfires and unaccept- 
ahle resource value change 

Give preference to personal use over 
industrial use of firewood 

c Reduce fuels by prescnbingfire and allowing (2) Limit firewood removal as needed to  
biomass use, while maintaining soil and wa- assure viability of cavlty- and snag- 
ter quality dependent mldhfe populations 

(1) Modify or  maintain activlty and natu- (3) Use timber sale contract provlsions to  
provide accessible matenal smtable for 
firewood 

Keep designated roads open for a suffi- 
cient penod of time after loggmg is 

(2) Whenever management activlty cre- complete to allow firewood utilization 

ral fuels t o  levels that result in the 
most cost-efficient fire protection pro- 
gram to  meet land and resource man- 
agement goals and objectives (4) 

ates a fuel hazard greater than would 
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Designate free-use areas to utilize less 
desirable species, meet fuel treatment 
prionties, encourage firewood gather- 
ing in less accessible areas, or meet 
other management objectives 

Designate where no woodcutting is al- 
lowed by signing trees or areas impor- 
tant for wildlife 

Restnct cuttingofstandmghardwoods 
(dead or alive) for firewood except t o  
meet specified management objectives 

8. FISH 

a. Maintain or improve habitat for all native 
species and compatible non-native species 

Apply the R i p a n d s h  Prescription 
t o  ail perennial, intermittent and 
ephemeral streams (as needed), lake- 
shore areas, wetlands, and around 
seeps, springs, and wet meadows. 

Provide habitats required by Manage- 
ment Indicator Species as specified in 
suitable Fish Habitat Capability Mod- 
els. 

Where site potential exlsts, provlde 
high habitat capability, as defined in 
appropnate Habitat Capability Mod- 
els, for species emphasized in the Man- 
agement Area Direction. 

Identify and inventory pnmary water- 
sheds to assess existing habitat condi- 
tions utilizing the Reaon 5 Fish Habi- 
t a t  Assessment Handbook (FSH 
2609 23) 

Coordinate with the California Depart- 
ment of Fish and Game and other con- 
cerned agencies to update the state- 
mde California Fish and Wildlife Man- 
agement Plan (Sikes Act Plan) 

Continue cooperation with California 
Department of Fish and Game for fish 
stocking in desired mlderness lakes 
and other lakes 

Cooperate with the California Depart- 
ment of Fish and Game in projects to 
enhance natural populations ofanadro- 
mous fish 

Approve water developments only if 
potential adverse impacts on fisheries 
can be avoided or mitigated. 

Evaluate all proposed projects for po- 
tential impacts to the fishery resource, 
particularly projects that may affect 
anadromous fishenes 

9. FORESTHEALTH 

a Reduce impacts of forest pests on all re- 
sources to acceptable levels through inte- 
grated pest management 

(1) Use an integrated pest management 
(IPM) approach to managmg pests dur- 
ing the planning and implementation 
of all activities that influence vegeta- 
tion Consider a full range of pest 
management alternatives for each 
project Select treatment methods 
through anenvlronmental analysis pro- 
cess that considers the envlronmental 
effects, treatment efficacy, and cost 
effectiveness of each alternative De- 
terrmne monitonng and enforcement 
plans dunng this site-specific process 
Also use pest detection, surveillance, 
evaluation, prevention, suppression 
and post-action evaluation as integral 
components of this IPM approach 

Coordinate actions to control signifi- 
cant animal damage with the Cahfor- 
nia Department of Fish and Game, the 
U S Fish and Wildlife Service, and 
other agencies and cooperators 

Cooperate with the State and counties 
in control of nonous weeds and preda- 
tion 

Perform direct rodent control (trap- 
ping or fumigation) within or adjacent 
to developed recreation sites as neces- 
sary to  protect public health 

(2) 

(3) 

(4) 
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(5) Coordinate control of public health 
problems with the California Depart- 
ment of Health Services and appropn- 
ate local health agencies. 

10. GEOLOGYAND 
GROUNDWATER 

a. Conduct geologx inventones needed for as- 
sessments of proposed projects. 

(1) Conduct a Forest-wide Geologic Re- 
sources Inventory of a sufficiently spe- 
cific nature to  allow for the delineation 
of potential geolo@c resources (rock 
aggregate, water bearing gravels, etc.) 
and the delineation of geologw con- 
straints (landslide hazard, high volca- 
nic hazard, etc ) within the planning 
penod 

Pnor to  any site development, perform 
a Geologw Resources Inventory allow- 
ing classification of soils, surface de- 
posits, and rock matenals and identi- 
fylng engmeenng properties of soil and 
rock matenals as may be relevant to 
the project. 

(2) 

(3) Consider volcanic, earthquake, and 
avalanche hazards when planning fa- 
cihty locations. 

11 LANDS 

Initiate land ownership adjustments to 
achieve ownership patterns facilitating For- 
est management and minimizing adminis- 
trative costs. 

Survey, mark and post property boundaries 
adjacent t o  pnvate lands, wilderness and 
wild and scenic rivers prior to Forest actinty 
adjacent t o  them 

Acquire nghts-of-way needed to efficiently 
manage Forest resources and provide public 
access 

(1) When analyzing a proposed nght-of- 
way, evaluate the need for full public 
access vs limited use (admnistrative 

and commercial hauling only), consid- 
e n n g  

(a) proportion of public ownership, 

(b) roadmaintenanceresponsibilities, 

(c) alternate public access, 

(d) need for closures for resource man- 
agement 

(2) Participatein cost-shanngagreements 
with adjacent landowners 

Pursue land withdrawals from mineral en- 
try or hsposal when needed to protect Forest 
improvements and areas of special signifi- 
cance. 

(1) Confine mthdrawal applications to 
cntical lands vulnerable to  mineral or  
hydropower development that are 

(a) occupied by permanent improve- 
ments (e g. developed recreation 
sites, admnistrative facilities), or  

(b) mthout improvements, but mth 
significant values that may be 
threatened (e g Research Natural 
Areas, Expenmental Forests). 

Renew all existing withdrawals with 
the Department of the Intenor before 
October 1993, to determine whether 
each mthdrawal should continue and 
for how long. Renew withdrawals from 
mineral entry first and wthdrawals 
from sale anddsposal (includngpower 
sites) second. 

(2) 

Issue special use permts, in conformance 
mth Management Area Direction if a net 
public benefit will result 

(1) Do not approve special use applica- 
tions if a similar use can reasonably be 
made of pnvate land 

Inventory and set aside w t h n t h e  plan- 
ning penod those electronic sites ap- 
propnate for the use of the Forest Ser- 
vice and private pernuttees 

12) 
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(3) Bury new telephone lines, and new or 
reconstructed power lines less than 33 
KV, unless (a) Visual Quality Objec- 
tives can be met mthout burymg; (b) 
geologic conditions make burying in- 
feasible, or (c) burylng would produce 
greater long-term site disturbance. 

To evaluate special use applications 
for an infrastructure serving a pro- 
posed subdivision within the National 
Forest boundary 

(a) consider impacts generated by the 
long-term needs of the pnvate de- 
velopment, including utilities, fire 
stations, solidwaste disposal sites, 
etc 

(4) 

(b) generally confine to private land 
those facilities that are essential to 
the development. 

(c) allow only one access route per 
subdivision or parcel, unless pub- 
lic safety warrants alternate es- 
cape routes in cases of fire or other 
natural hsaster 

(5) For a proposed hydroelectric project 
requiring a Federal Energy Regula- 
tory Commssion (FERC) license, evalu- 
ate likely environmental impacts and 
prepare a 4(e) letter to FERC listing 
mitigation requirements (see Chapter 
8, Glossary, in the FEIS) When the 
FERC license is issued, prepare a spe- 
cial use permit including mitigation 
requirements for those facilities on 
Forest land. 

For an emsting hydroelectric facility 
licensed hy FERC, regulate in coopera- 
tion with other agencies 

( 6 )  

Avoid the proliferation of separate utility 
nghts-of-way 

Resolve all unauthorized occupancies on Na- 
tional Forest lands 

(1) Resolve unauthonzed use on National 
Forest lands by removing the occu- 
pancy, issuing special use permits, or 

adjusting land ownership (including 
use of the Small Tracts Act) 

h. Continue to coordinate with concerned agen- 
cies to preserve unique resources in the Eagle 
Lake, Lake Britton, and Lassen Volcanic 
National Park areas 

Designate the following as multi-user elec- 
tronic sites: Turner Mountain, Hamilton 
Mountain, Morgan Summit, Keddie Ridge, 
Colby Mountain, and Hall’s Flat 

i 

12. LAW ENFORCEMENT 

a Protect Forest resources to insure public 
safety and retain resource values. 

(1) Maintain the Forest resource protec- 
tion plan and conduct law enforcement 
according to the following pnonties 

(a) take action in any situation that 
threatens injury to the public or an 
employee 

(h) investigate and apprehend tres- 
passers engaged in resource de- 
struction or illegal drug activity 

(c) takeappropnate actionin response 
to property theft, property dam- 
age, or civil disorder 

(d) investigate and prosecute all other 
felony trespass. 

(e) investigate and prosecute misde- 
meanor vlolations, especially those 
involvlng repeat offenders, fraudu- 
lent practices, or high visibility. 

(0 investigate and document cases 
that could possibly lead to tort 
claims 

(g) in advance of needed action with 
cooperating agencies, identify re- 
sponsibilities and procedures for 
search and rescue and other law 
enforcement 

~~~ ~~~ 
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13. MINERALS 

a Provide for mineral exploration and devel- 
opment while protecting surface resources. 

In actively producing sites, or in areas 
containing known mineral reserves, 
undertake only those Forest activities 
that are Compatible mth mineral ac- 
t inty Consider exceptions if unique 
resource values are present 

Avoid or minimize capital investments 
in or adjacent t o  areas with known 
reserves and ahenated mineral nghts 
(those held by other parties on Na- 
tional Forest land). 

In plans of operations, require recla- 
mation of lands disturbed by mining 
compatible mth ManagementAreaDi- 
rection 

Recommend denial of mineral lease 
applications in areas proposed for land 
exchange, or in areas in where the 
Forest Semce or U S Fish and Wild- 
life Semce has concluded that mining 
would jeopardize the sunrival or recov- 
ery of a Federally-listed Threatened or 
Endangered species. 

Evaluate and minimize potential im- 
pacts to LassenVolcanic Nationalpark 
when processing mineral lease apph- 
cations 

When consenting to mineral leasing, 
recommend special stipulations if 
needed to  protect surface resources and 
uses, as  guided by the mineral lease 
stipulation critena in Appendix I 

Maintain an inventory of mineral ma- 
tenals sites, specifjmgwhich are avail- 
able for public and/or Forest Semce 
use 

Prepare a site development and reha- 
bilitation plan before development and 
use of a mineral materials site 

Within areas withdrawn from mineral 
entry, have a Forest Service mineral 
examiner verify any claimed valid ex- 

isting rights pnor to authonzation of 
any surface-disturbing mineral or ac- 
cess development actinties 

Restrict access and development in spe- 
cially designated areas (and in areas 
wthdrawn from mineral entry where 
valid emsting nghts may be exercised) 
to the extent needed to protect those 
values for which the area was created 
or mthdrawn 

14. RANGE 

a. Pronde for long-term rangeland productiv- 
ity for fishenes, wildllfe, soil, water, timber, 
andlivestock forage values Emphasizeman- 
aging rangelands to meet desired ecological 
conditions 

Manage grazing to achieve desiredveg- 
etative conhtions on all rangelands 
Desired vegetative conditions means 
all rangelands are in satisfactory or 
better ecologx condition with stable or 
upward trends 

On perennial grass rangelands, base 
forage utilization on existing ecologx 
condition and trend, plant community 
sensitinty, desired future condition 
and grazing management system 
Proper use standards m11 be followed 
as explained in the ReDon 5 Range 
Analysis Handbook(FSH2209.21) On 
annual grass rangelands, leave a mini- 
mum of 1,000 pounds of current year’s 
herbaceous production per acre to pro- 
tect the soil and to maintain an ad- 
equate germination seedbed. 

Implement livestock management sys- 
tems and cost-effective range improve- 
ments to protect resource values and to 
meet vegetative management goals 

Structural and non-structural range 
improvements mll pronde for the needs 
of wldlife and other resource values, 
as well as livestock 

Where recommended, allow no live- 
stock grazing on perennial grass range 
for two growing seasons after pre- 
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(6) 

(7) 

scnbed or natural fires and plantingor 
seeding forage species to allow desir- 
able plants to establish 

Take advantage of non-use for per- 
sonal convenience by not filling in with 
temporary grazing permits, or allow- 
ing pernutted livestock from other al- 
lotments, until unsatisfactory resource 
conditions improve or proper mitiga- 
tion has been implemented 

management plans and annual operating 
plans of use for each allotment Implement 
these standards so that they are in practice 
for all livestock grazing by the end ofthe first 
decade 

Generally, those allotments with manage- 
ment strateges that provlde for improved 
plant physiologxal vlgor and protection of 
npanan dependent resources wdl have higher 
acceptable levels of proper use of forage spe- 
cies 

(1) 
Analyze resource conditions on allot- 

as necessary to correct any unsatisfac- 
tory conditions. 

ments, and make management changes 

b. Revise allotment management plans, as nec- 
essary, to meet management direction and 
vegetative management goals 

(1) Coordinate allotment management 
planmng and activities mth other re- 
sources including water, soils, fish, 
wldlife, timber, and npanan. A list of 
the allotments on the Forest, ranked 
by current pnontyfor revlsion, is found 
in Appendix V This list will be revised 
as resource conditions and/or manage- 
ment priorities change 

Forage utilization standards wll be 
based on vegetative type and condi- 
tion, and ml1 be incorporated into al- 
lotment management plans Allotment 
management plans may include utih- 
zation standards which are lower or 
occasionally higher than specified in 
the Forest Plan Higher utilization 
standards m11 be acceptable when they 
are designed to meet resource ObJeC- 
tives and desired future conditions for 
a gwen management area. 

Develop a management plan for the 
Brushy Mountain Wild Horse Terri- 
tory 

(2) 

(2) 

(3) 

c Establish Forest standards for vegetation 
utilization until site specific utilization stan- 
dards are in place Site specific utilization 
standards will be identified in allotment 

Upland Rangelands Allow 50 per- 
cent utilization of perennial rangeland 
vegetation that is in at least fair condi- 
tion mth  stable trend and not associ- 
ated mth riparian zones Decrease 
utilization to  0-49 percent on peren- 
nial vegetation where rangeland con- 
dition is in less than fair condition or  
has a downward trend Utilization is 
based upon current annual year’s 
growth (actual percent by weight) 

Riparian Zones Site potential and 
desired future condition mll be de- 
fined for specific areas Standards will 
be developed to  achieve these condi- 
tions Until site specific standards are 
in place, the following will be used to 
maintain or improve nparian condi- 
tion 

(a) Streamsides 

Stubble Heaght - Retain 4-6 inches on 
streamside vegetative biomass at  
end of the grazing season. This 
standard may be modified depend- 
ingupon streamcondition and graz- 
ing system 

Bank Stabalaty - Apply management 
strateDes to achieve at least 80 
percent of naturally occurring stre- 
ambank stability Stability will be 
measured in linear feet by stream 
reach 

Uti2azataonr -Do not exceed 45 percent 
use of streamside herbaceous veg- 

* Utilization is based upon current annual year’s growth, actual percent by weight 
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etation withno reductioninground 
cover for streamside zones in good 
condition (Utilization may exceed 
45 percent when intensive systems 
are used to restore streamside 
zones to good condition or to main- 
tain riparian zones already in good 
condition ) For streamside zones 
in poor condition, utilization may 
be 0-25 percent until restored to 
fair condition 

(b) Rzpanan Areas 

OtherRzparzan areas (wetlands, mead- 
ows, lakeshores) Other riparian 
areas will be treated as special 
situations Desired future condi- 
tion will be descnbed for each of 
these areas. Management stan- 
dards wll be designed to  achieve 
these desired conditions 

Manage streamsides and other ripanan ar- 
eas forest-wide to reach natural or achiev- 
able site potential and desired ecologcal 
conditions Desired future conditions, where 
site potential exists, are late seral communi- 
ties in good or better condition. (Refer t o  
npanan condition classifications in the Wa- 
ter andRiparianAreas StandardsandGulde- 
lines.) 

d 

Witlnn grazing allotments, designgraz- 
ing systems and manage livestock to 
achieve good or better ecologcal condi- 
tion with stable or upward trends in 
nparian areas 

Allow no salting or  livestock supple- 
ment stations within 1/4 mile of water 
developments, streams or other npar- 
ian areas 

Modify grazing schedules, institute or 
modify grazing systems, reduce num- 
bers, or eliminate livestock as neces- 
sary to prevent or correct damage to 
nparian vegetation or streambanks. 

15. RECREATION 

a. Provlde a mde range of outdoor recreation 
opportunities to meet public demand by fur- 

nishing different levels of access, semce, 
facilities. and information. 

Provlde a choice of developed recre- 
ation opportunities ranging from re- 
mote and pnmitive to accessible and 
highly developed (development levels 
1-4 as defined in Append= K of this 
Plan) 

Improve access for persons mth  dis- 
abilities at  recreation sites 

Manage recreation according to the 
Recreation Opportunity Spectrum 
(ROS) classes descnbed in the ROS 
User’s Guide, as specified in Appendix 
J, and the Management Prescnptions 
Refer to the separate ROS Map for the 
distnbution of ROS classes through- 
out the Forest. 

Remove hazard trees in developed rec- 
reationsites, and alongroads and trruls 

Inventory dispersed recreation use and 
impacts within the planning period 

Prepare a Recreation Opportunity 
Guide (ROG) mthin the planning pe- 
nod to increase public awareness of, 
and participation in, dispersed recre- 
ation 

Provlde and maintain adequate direc- 
tional signs to  all recreational facili- 
ties 

Provlde adequate off-road parlung a t  
trailheads to  accommodate acceptable 
levels of use 

Maintain trailhead mformation sites 
that provide safety directions and ef- 
fective recreation use mformation 

Protect recreation amenities around 
areas of concentrated use. 

Dunng project analyses, identlfy dis- 
persed campsites Near those identi- 
fied, maintain natural-appeanng tim- 
ber stands meeting a vlsual quality 
objective of Partial Retention 
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(12) Use available technology to  provlde 
odor-free, cost effective toilet facilities 
where demand warrants their place- 
ment Sanitary facilities w111 be blended 
to retain the line, form, color and tex- 
ture of the surrounding area wherever 
possible 

(13) Periodically, plant native trees in de- 
veloped campground to assure contin- 
ued tree cover for the future 

(14) When railroad lines through the For- 
est are scheduled for abandonment, 
assess the need for their use as multi- 
purpose recreation trails. File for 
railbanking appropnate lines with the 
Interstate Commerce Commission 

b Provide interpretive services and facilities to 
inform the public about Forest resources 
and management 

Promote public awareness by provld- 
ing information on forest management 
practices such as dispersed recreation 
opportunities, selected cultural re- 
source areas, timber harvesting and 
reforestation, Threatened, Endangered 
and Sensitive species, scenic areas, and 
geological and botanical special inter- 
est areas 

Cooperate with other public agencies 
and educationaYscientific institutions 
to provide a full range of natural re- 
source information to the public. 

Cooperate with citizens’ groups and 
volunteers to help staff and finance 
exhibits and publications 

Provlde recreation vlsitor maps and 
other publications a t  all Forest offices, 
developed recreation sites, and un- 
staffed vlsitor information stations 

Construct Forest entrance stations and 
new interpretive facilities. 

Cooperatein theplanning,design,con- 
struction, and maintenance of a joint 
Lassen National ForesULassen Volca- 
nic National Park (LVNP) Visitor’s 

Center on National Forest land near 
the north entrance to LVNP 

(7) Inventory and recommend quahfymg 
roads in the Forest for the Scenic By- 
ways program 

c. Provlde diverse opportunities for off-high- 
way vehicle ( O W )  recreation 

Mountainbike and OHVuse is allowed 
in all areas not specifically closed to 
protect other resource values. 

Use Sta te  of California OHV 
(Greensticker) grant monies to help 
finance design, construction, and main- 
tenance of OHV stagmg areas, trail- 
heads, and trails 

In consultation with local and State- 
wide user groups, plan and provide 
OHV facilities such as stagmg areas, 
trailheads with cleared parking, sani- 
tation facilities, information signing, 
and trails 

Cooperate with the State, other agen- 
cies, and user groups to identify and 
develop segments of OHV trails that 
contnbute to a Statewide OHV Trail 
System connecting use areas and al- 
lowing long-distance trail tounng 

Encourage OHV groups to participate 
in the Adopt-a-Trail program 

d. Provide diverse opportunities for winter 
sports. 

(1) Continue to implement the preferred 
alternative of the 1989 Winter OHV 
Management Plan, for the construc- 
tion of trailheads and trail networks 
for winter recreation 

Cooperate with the State of California 
to identify locations where snow re- 
moval is needed to accommodate safe, 
off-highway parking for dispersed win- 
ter use 

Designate and mark trails needed for 
additional dispersed wnter  recreation 

(2) 

(3) 
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Designate and sign cross-country ski 
trails 

Accommodate snowmobile use over 
most ofthe Forest where not in conflict 
with other uses or resources Due to 
the dispersed nature of the activlties, 
do not provide regular patrols Provlde 
first aid services only as Forest person- 
nel happen to be available 

Minimize user conflicts by specifymg 
allowable winter use on certain roads 
and trails (for example cross-country 
s h  trails, snowmobile-only trails or 
winter 4-wheel dnve only) 

Prohibit snow removal on designated 
snowmobile and cross-countryski trails 
between specified dates 

Areas for snow play will not be desig- 
nated 

e Manage recreation residences as components 
of the  overall National Forest recreation pro- 
gram Work in partnership mth the holders 
of recreation residence permits to utilize the 
recreational benefits of these residences 

Issue 20-year term permits and review 
themevery 10 years Give permithold- 
ers at  least 10 years advance written 
notice if the use is not t o  be continued 

Evaluate continuation of recreation 
residence permits w t h  public use and 
recreational demand for the area 
When considenngnon-renewal ofarec- 
reation residence use in favor of an 
alternative use, insure the weight of 
the evldence favors the alternate use 
before deciding on non-renewal 

Prevent unauthorized full-time resi- 
dence use by enforcing the terms of the 
special use permit 

f Continue private operation of National For- 
est developed recreation sites where it best 
serves public recreation needs 

(1) Work in partnership with holders of 
resort special use permits to maximize 

(2) 

(3) 

therecreation benefitsofthese resorts 
Eliminate resorts under special use 
permit if future use determinations 
indicate removal is in the public inter- 
est. 

Continue to operate the developed 
campgrounds through use of conces- 
sionaires where the quality of public 
semce can be sustained or improved 

Continue to  provlde for pnvate sector 
orgamzation camps, limit acreages to  
those clearly needed 

g. Work in partnership with local communities 
to expand recreational facilities, programs, 
and trails on both public and pnvate land 

1 

2 

3. 

4 

Include rural development consider- 
ations in resource decisions to  assist 
impact counties in achievlng long-term, 
diversified economic development and 
improved quality of life. 

Actively participate in planning and 
implementing community-based rural 
development activities 

Develop and provlde tizely and cur- 
rent research and resource mforma- 
tion on rural development opportuni- 
ties 

Communicate to Forest employees and 
the public that rural development is 
part of the agency's mission. 

16. SENSITIVE PLANTS 
a. Maintain habitat and vlable populations to  

contribute to  eventual de-listing of Sensitive 
plants that are found on the Forest. 

(1) Identify, preserve, or enhance Sensi- 
tive plant populations 

Restrict vegetative or  soil disturbance 
in areas occupied by Sensitive plants, 
unless manipulation is needed to per- 
petuate the species 

Within the planning period, develop 
Species Management Guides for Sen- 

(2) 

(3) 
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sitive plants that identify population 
goals and compatible management ac- 
tivlties 

b Manage Sensitive plants t o  insure that spe- 
cies do not become Threatened or Endan- 
gered because of Forest Semce actions 

(1) Evaluate all proposed projects for po- 
tential Sensitive plant habitat. Con- 
duct surveys a t  the correct time ofyear 
for species identification if potential 
habitat exlsts in a project area. 

If Sensitive plants are found in a pro- 
posed project, modify the project or 
take mitigative action as  necessary to 
protect the habitat 

(2) 

17. SOILS 

a Prevent irreversible losses of soil productiv- 
ity. 

(1) Assess impacts of proposed projects on 
the soil resource, and take appropnate 
mitigative action 

(a) The areal extent of detrimental 
soil disturbance (DSD) mll not ex- 
ceed 15 percent of the area dedi- 
cated to  growing vegetation 

(b) Soil cover is sufficient to prevent 
the rate of accelerated soil erosion 
from exceeding the rate of sod for- 
mation 

( c )  Soil porosity and bulk density are 
a t  least 90 percent of the measure- 
ments found under undisturbed or 
natural conditions. 

(d) Organic matter is present in  
amounts sufficient to prevent sig- 
nificant short or long-term nutri- 
ent cycle deficits 

1. Soil organic matter in the upper 
12 inches of soil is at  least 85 
percent of the total soil organic 
matter found under undisturbed 
or natural conditions. 

2 Litter and duff occurs on at  least 
50 percent of the area. 

Large woody material, when oc- 
curring in the forested area, is a t  
least 5 logs per acre in contact 
mth the soil surface, and repre- 
sents the total range of decompo- 
sition 

3 

(2) Field-venfy exlsting reconnaissance 
soil resource inventory data (Order 3 
surveys) for each land-disturbing 
project 

Conduct detailed soil surveys (usually 
Order 2) for all project areas that have 
an erosion hazard rating of “high” or 
“very h i g h  (according to  the R-5 rating 
system), landslides or unstable areas, 
potential revegetation or regeneration 
problems, active erosion, or a signifi- 
cant potential t o  contnbute to  cumula- 
tive degradation of water quality 

(4) Assesseachproposedregenerationhar- 
vest area to assure the soil is capable of 
supporting the establishment of trees 
within five years. 

(3) 

( 5 )  Assess each proposedrevegetationarea 
to  assure the soil is capable of support- 
ing the establishment of grass or brush 
within two years 

b. Restore all substantial areas of significantly 
degraded soil 

(1) Identify, evaluate, and establish treat- 
ment prionty for areas of significantly 
degraded soils Treat within two de- 
cades 

18. SPECIAL AREAS 

a Protect areas of outstanding scientific, sce- 
nic, botanic or geologc value as Research 
Natural Areas (RNA’s), or  Special Interest 
Areas (SIA’s) 

(1) Establish Research Natural Areas for 
baseline ecoloDca1 study, protection of 
gene pools, and habitat preservation 
for Forest-listed Sensitive plant spe- 
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cies Recommend to the Chief of the 
Forest Service RNA designation of the 
following areas: 

Green Island Lake 1,210 acres 
Indzan Creek 3,890 acres 
Soda Ridge 1,295 acres 
Tcmbered Crater 1,777 acres 
Mayfield 980 acres 
Graham Pcnery 660 acres 

Upon approval of this Forest Plan, the 
follomng areas are classified as Spe- 
cial Interest Areas pursuant to Title 
36, Code of Federal Regulations, Sec- 
tion 294.1 (a) and authonty vested in 
the Regonal Forester by the Chief of 
the Forest Service 

Black Rock 15 acres 

Crater Lake 200 acres 

Deep Hole 100 acres 

Homer IDeerheart 1,480 acres 

Montgomery Creek Groue 20 acres 

Murken 380 acres 

Wzllow Lake Bog 110acres 

Geologccal Area 

Geological Area 

Geologkc Area 

Scenic Area 

Botanical Area 

Botanical Area 

Botanical Area 

Pnor to formal classification (or desig- 
nation), protect the identifiedvalues of 
all of the above recommended areas. 

Protect and preserve the values ofeach 
special area as identified in an estab- 
lishment report or area management 
plan, in conformance with the Special 
Areas Prescription and Management 
Area direction. 

Continue to inventory and recommend 
additional qualifying special areas 
throughout the planning period 

19. TIMBER 

a Provlde a sustained quantity of forest prod- 
ucts by selecting silvicultural practices from 
the full range available on an indivldual 
stand basis, in accordance mth biologcal 

requirements, economic efficiency, and For- 
est Goals for other resources. 

Timber harvesting shall occuron lands 
classified as suitable for timber pro- 
duction Harvesting will also occur on 
non-sultable lands where necessary to 
meet other multiple use objectives or  
to protect resource values if the Forest 
Plan establishes that such actions are 
appropnate. 

Apply both even-aged and uneven-aged 
timber management for timber pro- 
duction Apply uneven-aged manage- 
ment where necessary to protect or 
enhance other emphasized resources, 
as stated in the Management Prescnp- 
tions and Management Area direction 

Manage the landscape to  provlde a 
mosaic of even-aged and uneven-aged 
timber stands 

Where recommended, emphasize un- 
even-aged timber managementin three 
Management Areas (MA’S) t o  test the 
feasibility of that system over large 
areas of land MA #I4 Eagle (eastside 
pme), MA #I7 Lost (mured conifer), 
and MA #28 Feather River (nuxed co- 
nlfer and red fir) Apply elsewhere in 
the Forest where appropnate. 

Implement even-aged silvicultural 
treatments that m11 allow groups of 
saplingsand poles toberetainedwhere 

(a) retention will not add significantly 
to logging cost; 

(b) the groups mll be fully stocked 
withcrop treesfreeofdwarfmistle- 
toe and capable of normal growth 
(releasable); 

(c) the groups mll not be excessively 
damaged by site preparation ac- 
tinties and future harvesting, 

(d) effects on vlsual quality and mld- 
life habitat can be mtigated by 
leavlng advanced regeneration or 
a partial overstory, 
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(e) effects on soils and water quality 
can bemitigated by leavingislands 
of undisturbed areas or  near natu- 
ral conditions 

Choose loggmg systems based on sale 
area character, sale objectives, resource 
protection, and costs. Alternatives in- 
clude, but are not limited to, tractor, 
cable, and helicopter systems 

Avoid tractor skidding on slopes greater 
than 35 percent and on soils with an 
erosion hazard rating greater than 9 

On cinder cones mth  a shallow (less 
than 20 inches) soil mantle, avoid trac- 
tor sktdding on slopes greater than 20 
percent 

Design the size, shape, and distribu- 
tion of openings to meet objectives for 
visual quality, recreation, fire man- 
agement, and mldlife habitat stated 
herein and to  permit efficient harvest. 

(10) Select clearcutting only when it is the 
optimum silvlcultural method and sup- 
ported by site specific analysis Miti- 
gate resource impacts from clearcut- 
ting b y  

(a) avoiding clearcuts greater than 20 
acres in size, 

(b) designing clearcuts to maintainvl- 
sua1 quality objectives , provlde 
continuity of wildlife habitat and 
travel corndors, and protect soil 
productivity; 

( c )  dispersing clearcut units, if pos- 
sible so that a logcal future bar- 
vest unit of at  least five acres sepa- 
rates them, 

(d) pre-designating landings and skid 
trails t o  minimize the areal extent 
of detrimental soil disturbance 
(DSD), 

(e) establishing streamside manage- 
ment zones of suficient width to  
protect water quality, fish and mld- 

life habitat, andother npananval- 
ues; 

(D designing clearcut units to save 
advanced natural regeneration 
where possible; 

(g) designing fuel treatments and site 
preparation activities to minimize 
soil compaction, loss of organic mat- 
ter and soil nutnents; 

(h) leavlng acceptable levels of large 
and small woody debris for soil 
cover, nutnent recycling, and wild- 
life habitat, 

(1) reforesting clearcut units t o  main- 
tain the vegetative composition of 
natural stands where appropriate. 

(11) Obtain Forest Supemsor approval for 
proposedclearcuts largerthan 20 acres 
Obtain ReDonal Forester approval for 
proposedclearcutslarger than40 acres 

(12) On a case by case basis, allow up to  
fifteen percent of a clearcut penmeter 
t o  be in common m t b  other "openings" 
A clearcut will be considered an open- 
ing until 

(a) minimum stocking levels are met, 

(b) an average true height of4 5 feet is 
attained, and 

(e) the stocking is free to  grow 

Young conifers are Considered free to 
grow if they have the growth potential 
to meet yield table projections mthout 
further treatment of competing veg- 
etation or other forest pests 

(13) Regenerate harvested lands to achieve 
minimum stocking standards within 
five years of final harvest, unless a 
different period is needed to  achieve 
wildlife, visual, or other resource ob- 
jectives stated in this Plan For mini- 
mum and desired stocking levels, see 
Appendix C 
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When artificially regenerating har- 
vested lands, maintain a mix of tree 
species approximating the composition 
ofnatural stands where recommended 

Strive to maintain a tree seed collec- 
tion that meets the “Base Level Pro- 
gram”described in “Tree Improvement 
Plan for the California Region”, 1976, 
and that provldes reserves for 10 years 
of planting 

Wherevegetation competition will sub- 
stantially inhibit tree survlval and 
growth, analyze a full range of avail- 
able vegetative management tech- 
niques Select the best method for each 
project through site-specific environ- 
mental analysis that reflects the rela- 
tive effectiveness of these techniques 
and the guidance of the applicable pre- 
scnptions and Management Area di- 
rection Develop monitoring and en- 
forcement provisions through the en- 
vlronmental analysis, and mclude them 
in the project plans. 

Permit personal-use Chnstmas tree 
cutting Provlde commercial Chnst- 
mas tree sales to utilize trees that 
would othennse be destroyed dunng 
sawtimber harvest and in areas where 
timberproductivlty u l l  be maintained 
or enhanced. 

Provide a diversity of tree species and 
mix of size classes when commercial 
thinning uneven-aged stands. 

Conduct an active program of salvage/ 
sanitation harvesting while meeting 
specified snag levels as stated in the 
Forest-wide Standards and Guldelines, 
Management Prescnptions, and Man- 
agement Area direction 

Conduct a plantation inventory in con- 
junction with the next timber inven- 
tory This inventory u l l  determine if 
growth goals assumed in the Forest 
yields tables are being achieved 

Continue the seed collection and plant- 
ing program for sugar pine to  develop 

(22) 

seedlings with genetic resistance to 
white pine blister rust 

Use grazing as an option to reduce 
vegetative competition with seedlings 
in plantations. 

20. VEGETATION AND DIVERSITY 

a. Provlde vegetative diversity to  maintain sce- 
nic quality, vlable populations of plants and 
wldlife, and to minimize loss from uldfire 

Provlde a mosaic of chaparral age and 
size classes to  meet Management Area 
direction 

When treating chaparral near private 
lands or lands administered by other 
agencies, coordinate with pnvate land- 
owners, the California Department of 
Forestry, the Bureau of Land Manage- 
ment, and other agencies 

Provlde a t  least five percent of the 
acreage of each vegetation type that 
occurs in a Management Area in each 
seral stage The vegetatTon types are 
mixed conifer, eastside pine, red fir, 
hardwoods, andchaparral. Seralstages 
are defined in Appendix U The re- 
quired minimum acreages per seral 
stage for each Management Area are 
given in the “Desired State for Diver- 
sity” sections of the Management Area 
Direction 

Where five percent of each vegetative 
type and seral stage is currently not 
available, plan to correct the deficit 

For each ManagementArea, d e t e m n e  
the arrangement of vegetation types 
and seral stages needed to  maintain 
vlability of all wildlife species, based 
on accepted habitat capability models 
and other information 

Maintain late seral stage acreage in 
old growth retention areas designated 
in eachManagementArea Old growth 
retention areas are chosen based on 
stand suitability and inclusion or prox- 
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imity to areas reserved from timber 
management It can be assumed that 
early and mid-seral stages are ad- 
equately represented, based on past 
andcurrent management Limited tim- 
ber management may take place in old 
growth retention areas, but onlywhere 
necessary to enhance the desirable 
charactenstics of old growth stands 
Where this occurs, Standards and 
Guidelines in the G Prescription will 
be followed 

Replace old growth retention areas 
that are lost due to fires or other natu- 
ral catastrophes mth  suitable late se- 
ral habitat in the Management Area 

As apart oftimber stand regeneration, 
plant or otherwise encourage all na- 
tive commercial tree species in natu- 
rally occurnng proportions across the 
entire Forest 

21. VISUAL RESOURCES 

a Throughout the Forest, maintain vlsual qual- 
ity commensurate with other resource needs 
Adopt and apply specific Visual Quality Ob- 
jectives (VQO’s) for all areas of the Forest 

(1) Meet or exceed VQO’s identified on the 
“Adopted Visual Quality Objective 
Map” or in the prescriptions and Man- 
agement Area Direction Refer t o  Ap- 
pendix N for VQO definitions To meet 
Retention and Partial RetentionVQO’s, 
use additional guidelines listed in the 
Viewmmber Prescnption To meet 
Modification and Maximum Modifica- 
tion VQO’s, use additional guidelines 
gwen in the Timber Prescnption. 

Keep Visual Quality Objectives com- 
patible with Recreation Opportunity 
Spectrum classes as specified in Ap- 
pendur J. 

Vegetative treatments should be de- 
signed to  blend as much as possible 
mth the charactenstic landscape 

(2) 

(3) 

(4) Buildings or other structures owned by 
the Forest Service, or under special 
use p e n t ,  should be shaped and col- 
ored to  blend with the natural land- 
scape 

(5) Roadconstruction andother earthwork 
should be designed to minimize cuts 
and fills Areas of bare soil should be 
revegetated by natural or  artificial 
methods. 

b Where past management actinties do not 
meet adopted vlsual quality objectives, use 
visual rehabilitation to  return vlsual quality 
to an acceptable level 

(1) If Adopted VQO’s cannot be met for 
management activities in response to 
fire, insect and disease attack, or other 
catastrophic event, then assess and 
document any such devlation in a site- 
specific envlronmental analysis 

22. WATERANDRIPARIANAREXS 

a. Provlde water of sufficient quality and quan- 
tity t o  meet current needs Meet additional 
future demand where compatible with other 
resource needs. 

Implement Best Management Prac- 
tices (BMP’s) (Appendix Q) to meet 
water qualityobjectives statedin22 c 
below, and maintain and improve the 
quality of surface waters on the Forest 
Identify methods for applying the 
BMP’s during envlronmental analysis 
of proposed projects, and incorporate 
theminto project planning documents. 

Provlde water for Forest uses by filing 
for and maintaining all water nghts 
needed for such uses Deny special use 
permit applications and protest other 
parties’ water rights applications that 
jeopardize Forest uses or  fish and wild- 
life needs 

Observe the following pnority for use 
of lakes and reservoirs (1) fish and 
wildlife habitat, (2) livestock water, (3) 
fire suppression, and (4) road water- 
ing Priority use for stockponds is 
livestock water 
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(4) If a lake, reservoir, or stock pond is 
depleted by fire suppression, replenish 
it if possible 

When a lake, reservoir, or stock pond is 
used forroadwatering(dust abatement), 
do not deplete it below one-halfcapacity 
unless authonzedby theDistnctRanger 
after considenng all resource needs. 

(5) 

b Limit individual project impacts as needed to 
avoid adverse cumulative impacts on water 
quality and fishenes 

Consider third-order watershed areas 
when analyzing a proposed project’s ef- 
fects 

Use a quantitative method to assess 
project effects, consistent wth the Re- 
gional Best Management Practice to 
mitigate cumulative effects 

Give pnonty to analysis of projects that 
may affect anadromous fisheries, do- 
mestic uses, other Class I streams (see 
FEIS Glossary under “stream class”) or 
Eagle Lake 

Conduct formal cumulative watershed 
effects analysis in accordance with R5 
FSH2509.22, Chapter20. Adjustproject 
impacts and/or timing to keep distur- 
bance below the appropriate threshold 
ofconcern (T0C)inall affectedsubbasins 
and watersheds. 

Where formal analysis of a project’s 
cumulative watershed effects is not nec- 
essary or feasible, document the rea- 
sons and limit disturbance to five per- 
cent per decade in sensitive areas, per 
Land Management Planning Direction 
for the Pacific Southwest Regon (4- 
1 H 2.b(2)) (Sensitive areas are water- 
shed acres that have h g h  erosion po- 
tential, steep slopes, or h g h  instability 
See FEIS Glossary under “sensitive 
watershed lands” ) 

Where appropriate, protect water qual- 
ity and aquatic resources by prohibiting 
or restricting use of internal combus- 
tion boat motors on small lakes 

c Comply with Federal, State, regonal and lo- 
cal water quality regulations, requirements 
and standards 

Comply mth discharge requirements 
of the Clean Water Act, State drinking 
water and sanitary regulations, and 
State and Reaonal Water Quality Con- 
trol Board basin plans and rulings. 

Take immediate remeha1 action if ac- 
tivities under Forest Servlce manage- 
ment violate water quality standards 

Coordmate with appropnate federal, 
State, and local agencies and nearby 
downstream water users when water 
quality may be affected by Forest 
projects. 

Participate in cooperative hydrology 
projects, such as snow surveys and 
Eagle Lake water quality monitonng 

Restrict operations in flood plains and 
wetlands to comply mth current Ex- 
ecutive Orders 

Plan and administer all projects in the 
Eagle Lake Basin, orin the areas tnbu- 
tarytoEagleLake, toprotectthewater 
quality of the lake 

d Maintain or improve npanan-dependent re- 
sources in and around wetlands, stream 
corridors (includmg ephemeral and inter- 
mittent streams), lakes, seeps, spnngs, and 
wet meadows. 

(1) Where uses conflict, favor protection of 
mpanan-dependent resources (water, 
fish, vegetation, wildlife, and aesthet- 
ics) over other resources 

As directed in Management Area Di- 
rection, apply the Ripanan/Fish Pre- 
scnption to all areas bordenng peren- 
nial, intermittent and ephemeral 
streams (as needed), lakes, wetlands, 
seeps, springs, and wet meadows At a 
minimum, apply the prescnption to 
landswthm loofeetoflakes, tostream- 
side management zones (SMZ’s) in ac- 
cordance w t h  the guidelmes detailed 
in Appendix R, and wthin 50 feet of 
other areas mentioned above Analyze 
and document any deviations from 
these standards in the ennronmental 
analysis for proposed projects 

(2) 
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(3) Analyze environmental effects of pro- 
posed projects mthin nparian areas m 
a NEPA document 

Prepare and adhere to a project imple- 
mentation plan for any activity within 
a nparian area, and include at  least 
the following 

(a) objectives for vegetative manage- 
ment based upon the needs of ri- 
parian-dependent resources, 

(b) maximum amount of vegetation 
manipulation, and manipulation 
procedures, 

(4) 

(c) the limit of soil exposure, and ero- 
sion control or  other mitigation 
measures; 

(d) analysis of areas having slopes 
greater than 60 percent, very high 
erosion potential, or high instabil- 
ity, and procedures to  limit distur- 
bance of these areas; and 

(e) opportumties and procedures for 
restoration of any deteriorated 
area. 

e Evaluate all riparian areas forest-wide and 
manage to reach natural or achievable site 
potential and desired ecoloDcal conditions 
Desired future conditions shall be determined 
for each riparian area to  meet site specific 
management objectives 

(1) Site Potential Site Potential is de- 
fined as the condition or state that 
exlsted prior to disturbance (natural 
site potential) or a condition or state 
that can be obtained where natural 
site potential cannot be restored 
(achievable site potential) 

(2) Condition Classification 
(a) Good - At least 80 percent of 

streambanks are stable and well 
vegetated Bank sloughing and 
erosion are uncommon The stream 
channel is graded relative to  the 
floodplain The stream overflows 
onto the floodplain during peak 

- ~ 
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flows Overhangngbanks are com- 
mon Ripanan vegetative commu- 
nities are at  or near natural or 
achievable site potential 

(b) Fair - Less than 80 percent of 
streambanks are stable and well 
vegetated, The stream channel is 
graded relative to the floodplain 
The stream overflows onto flood- 
plain dunng peak flows Over- 
hangmg banks are not common 
Ripanan vegetative communities 
are near natural or achievable site 
potential 

( c )  Poor - Less than 80 percent of 
streambanks are stable and well 
vegetated. The stream channel is 
incised or  overbroadened Incised 
banks are unstable, actively erod- 
ing and not well vegetated Peak 
flows are contained within chan- 
nels that are incised and seldom 
overflow onto floodplains Banks 
of overbroadened channels have 
nearly hofizontal angles Ripar- 
ian vegetative communities are 
early seral and are much less than 
site potential 

23. WILD AND SCENIC RTVERS 

a Recommend eliDble, suitable nvers for fed- 
eral Wild and Scenic River designation. 

(1) Recommend Antelope, Deer and Mill 
Creeks for Wild and Scenic River des- 
ignation Classification for recom- 
mended segments are shown in Table 
4-3 

These recommendations are prehmi- 
nary administrative recommendations 
that will receive review and possible 
modification by the Chief of the Forest 
Sermce, the Secretary of Agriculture, 
and the President Congress has 
reserved the authonty to make final 
decisions on designating rivers to the 
National Wild and Scenic Rivers Sys- 
tem Therefore, these recommenda- 
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Table 4-3 

Recommended Wild and Scenic Rivers 
Segment 

Antelope Creek 1 

2 

3 

Deer Creek 3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

Mill Creek 1 

2 

3a 

3b 

4 

5 

Classification 

Wild 

Wild 

Wild 

Recreational 

Scenic 

Wild 

Scenic 

Wild 

Recreational 

Recreational 

Scenic 

Wild 

Scenic 

Wild 

ADDroximate Location 

North Fork below 
Ponderosa Way to 
McClure Place. 
North Fork from 
McClure Place to  Forest 
boundary. 

South Fork below 
Ponderosa Way to North 
Fork. 
Elam Campground to 
Deer Creek-Hwy. 32 
junction. 
Hwy. 32 junction to  Sec. 
26, T.27N., R.3E. 
Sec. 26, T 27N, R.3E to 
Beaver Creek 
Beaver Creek to Ishi 
Wilderness. 
Ishi Wilderness to  
western forest boundary 
Lassen National Park 
boundary to Hwy 36. 
Hwy 36 to below 
Hole-In-the-Ground 

Below Hole-In-Ground 
to  below Big Bend. 
Below Big Bend to Black 
Rock. 
Black Rock to Ishi 
Wilderness. 
Ishi Wilderness to  
Forest boundarv. 
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tlons are not appealable under the 
agency’s administrative appeal proce- 
dures 

b Protect and enhance outstandingly remark- 
able values and the free-flowing condition of 
recommended and designated Wild and Sce- 
nic Rivers 

(1) Administer nver comdors commensu- 
rate m t h  their proposed Wild and Sce- 
nic designations, as provided in the 
Wild and Scenic Rivers Act, the Special 
Areas Prescription, and Management 
Area direction 

( 2 )  Submit alegdativeenvlronmentalim- 
pact statement (Append= E of the 
FEIS) and prepare river management 
plans as provlded in the Special Areas 
Prescnption 

24. WILDERNESS AND FURTHER 
PLANNING AREAS 

a Protect wilderness character in designated 
and recommended wilderness 

(1) Conduct management achvities accord- 
ing to the Wilderness Act of 1964, the 
Wilderness Prescription in this Plan, 
and any applicable wilderness plan 

(2) Recommendformlderness HeartLake, 
and portions of Mill Creek, Trail Lake 
B, and Wild Cattle Mountain (north- 
ern 3,900 acres) RARE I1 further plan- 
ning areas (These recommendations 
are prelinnnary administrative recom- 
mendations that will receive renew 
and possible modification by the Chief 
of the Forest Service, the Secretary of 
Agriculture, and the President. Con- 
gress has reserved the authority to 
make final decisions on Wilderness des- 
ignation. Therefore, these recommen- 
dations are not appealable under the 
agency’s administrative appeal proce- 
dures.) 

Protect wilderness qualities in recom- 
mended wilderness until a final deci- 
sion is made by Congress 

(3) 

(4) Define and implement Limits of Ac- 
ceptable Change (see Glossary) for each 
wilderness and incorporate into the 
wilderness plans 

25. WILDLIFE 

a Assist in recovery efforts for Threatened and 
Endangered species 

(1) Provlde suitable habitat for all nesting 
pairs of bald eagles and peregme fal- 
cons needed to meet the Forest’s share 
ofThreatened and Endangered species 
recovery goals Manage newly-occu- 
pied areas to  help meet species recov- 
ery goals 

Limited timber management may oc- 
cur in bald eagle and peregrme falcon 
habitat Where harvestingis proposed, 
apply the Standards and Guidelines 
for the G Prescription. Seasonal re- 
stnctions may apply during the nest- 
ing season 

Pending enactment of new legmlation, 
any applicable action by the Endan- 
gered Species Committee, adoption of 
a recovery plan by the Fish and Wild- 
life Service, or the results of further 
biolog.lca1 consultation, conduct tim- 
ber management activities in northern 
spotted owl habitat in a manner not 
inconsistent with the Interagency Sci- 
entific Committee recommendations 

Conduct no scheduled timber harvest- 
ing within the HCA Determine the 
suitability of thinning or salvage har- 
vesting through the NEPA process and 
a biologxal evaluation to insure that 
the quality of habitat will be main- 
tained 

Use biologxal and silvicultural exper- 
tise in developing an HCA manage- 
ment plan 

lnventory and protect suitable habitat 
for the Shasta Crayfish 

( 2 )  

(3) 

(4) 

(5) 

(6) 
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b Provlde for viable populations of California 
spotted owls and goshawks through coordi- 
nated management of an established net- 
work of nesting territories in appropnate 
habitat. 

California Suotted Owls - 
Establish and maintain a network of 
40 spotted owl habitat areas (SOHA'S). 

In each spotted owl habitat area, man-  
tam a minimum of 1,000 acres of smt- 
able base habitat and 650 acres of re- 
placement habitat. Where 1,000 acres 
currently do not exlst, manage the 
SOHA to create it as soon as possible 

SOHA'S will be managed under a no 
scheduled timber harvest prescnption 
Determine the stntabihty of thinning 
or salvage harvesting through the 
NEPA process and a biological evalua- 
tion to insure the quality of habitat is 
maintained or enhanced 

Use biological and silvlcultural exper- 
tise in developing individual SOHA 
management plans 

Until habitat requirements within 
SOHA's are met and nesting pairs are 
found in all of them, protect 125 acres 
for non-network owl pairs to insure 
that 39 reproductive spotted owl pairs 
will provide for species viability 
throughout the planning period 

Manage SOHA'S by applymg the Stan- 
dards and Guidelines in the L Pre- 
scnption 

Goshawks - 

(7) Establish and maintain a habitat net- 
work of 113 goshawk nesting ternto- 
nes  

In each goshawk territory, provide at  
least 50 acres of suitable mature-tree 
nesting habitat, including a nest stand 
and an alternate nest stand 

(8) 

(9) Limited timber management may oc- 
cur in goshawk temtones. Apply the 
Standards and Guidelines for the G 
Prescription. 

e. Contribute toward the population viability 
of marten and fisher through coordinated 
management ofestablished habitat manage- 
ment areas in appropriate habitat. 

Marten and fisher - 

Estabhsh and maintain 19 habitat 
management areas (HMA's) for mar- 
ten and 5 HMA's for fisher 

In each marten HMA, maintain 2,100 
acres ofsuitable habitat Where 2,100 
acres currently do not exlst, manage 
the HMA to create it as soon as pos- 
sible 

In each fisher HMA, maintain approxi- 
mately 9,800 acres of suitable habitat. 
Where 9,800 acres currently do not 
exist, manage the HMA to  create it as 
soon as possible 

Corridors linking marten and fisher 
habitat management areas ulll be a 
minimum 600 feet mde honzontal dis- 
tance 

Manage habitat areas by applying the 
Standards and Guidelines in the L 
Prescnption These Standards and 
Guidelines are based, in part, on cur- 
rent habitat capability models found in 
Appendix 0 

Conduct no scheduled timber harvest- 
ing in marten and fisher HMA's De- 
termine the suitability of thinning or 
salvage harvesting through the NEPA 
process and a biological evaluation to 
insure that the quality of habitat is 
maintained or enhanced. 

No new roads will be constructed in 
marten or fisher management areas 
until a biological evaluationdetemnes 
thattheyulllnot degrade habitatqual- 
ity for these species. 
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(8 )  New management activities will not be 
permitted in habitat management ar- 
eas unless supported by a bioloacal 
evaluation 

Establish the location of HMA’s by 
December 1992, pending additional 
management direction and field re- 
view of tentatively selected areas 

(10) Use bioloacal and silvicultural exper- 
tise in developing habitat management 
plans for each HMA, if needed for man- 
agement activities t o  occur 

(9) 

d Create desirable habitat size, shape, and 
distnbution to  provlde both forage and cover 
for deer populations 

(1) Maintain summer range to provlde at  
least 20 percent forage and 20 percent 
thermal cover in 500 to 1,000 acre 
blocks See Glossary for definition of 
hiding and thermal cover 

Timber harvesting, thinning or  bio- 
mass operations should provide hiding 
and thermal cover in all treatment 
areas as specified in the habitat capa- 
bility model in Appendix 0 

A restncted operating penod may be 
imposed in identified deer fawning ar- 
eas 

(2) 

(3) 

e Provide sufficient habitat for species depen- 
dent on snags, nest cavlties, and dead and 
down wood 

(1) Where necessary to insure sufficiency 
of snags, identify, sign, and protect 
future snag replacement trees 

To the extent possible, maintain an 
average of at  least 1 5 snags per acre on 
forested land units compnsed of 1,000- 
5,000 acres each Meet the snag char- 
acteristics shown for “medium” habi- 
tat  capability in the wildlife habitat 
capability models (see Appendix 0)  
Green culls can be substituted for snags 
down to the level of at  least one re- 
maining snag/acre A green cull is 

(2) 

(3) 

(4) 

(5) 

defined as being a t  least 30 feet tall 
and havlng a t  least one ofthe following 
charactenstics Spike tops on the top 
1/4 of the tree, broken tops, large dead 
limbs, existing cavities or  defects in 
the bole that could become cavities 

Where possible, provlde snags in groups 
along meadow edges, in brushfields, 
near streams and lakes, and in ripar- 
ian areas. 

Where firewood or biomass removal 
may create a deficit in snag density, 
designate snags in inaccessible areas 
and maintain the inaccessibility Close 
areas to  encourage natural snag re- 
cruitment 

Provlde a t  least the following densities 
of downed logs by vegetation type on 
lands compnsed of 50 to 200 acres In 
unmanaged stands, accept naturally 
occurring densities of down logs 

Densitv 
Vegetation Type (logs/acreJ 

Oak woodland, eastside pine 1 5  
Mixed conifer, lodgepole pine 3 
True fir, mountain hemlock 4 

(6) For purposes ofnumber (5) above, con- 
sider a log to be a t  least 15 feet long 
with a large-end diameter of a t  least 15 
inches Count short log segments 
greater than 15 inches in diameter in 
proportion to their length 

f Enhance ecotones and provide other special 
habitat elements t o  maintain or increase 
species diversity For each project 

(1) Develop objectives for management of 
natural openings larger than five acres 

Develop objectives for ecotones that 
provide for retention or  recruitment of 
snags, mature trees, and hiding cover 

Perpetuate and improve existing hard- 
wood components 

(2) 

(3) 
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(4) Regenerate deteriorating stands to 
maintain existing aspen and cotton- 
wood vegetation 

When harvesting in stands that con- 
tain oaks, maintain or increase to  pro- 
vide an average of 25 square feet ofoak 
composition basal area per acre Dur- 
ing regeneration harvests, retain 10 
square feet of oaks per acre, and allow 
sprouting of cut trees to achieve 25 
square feet per acre within 20 years 

(5) 

g CooperatewthFederal, State, andlocalagen- 
cies in impronng wildlife habitat for all spe- 
cies. 

(1) Coordinate with California Depart- 
ment of Fish and Game, U S Fish and 
Wildlife Sernce, and other concerned 
agencies in  the  preparation and 
implementation of Federal and State 
Endangered Species recovery plans, 
the California Fish and Wildlife Man- 
agement Plan (Sikes Act Plan), and 
species habitat plans 

(2) Pernut scientific investigations, moni- 
toring, and artificial propagation as 
needed to  reach population recovery 
levels for Threatened, Endangered and 
Sensitive species 

h Coordinate wildlife management programs 
wi th  other resource management programs 
to meet habitat or  population objectives es- 
tablished for Management Indicator Spe- 
cies. 

(1) Provide habitat for Management Indi- 
cator Species as directed in the Pre- 
scnptions or Management Area direc- 
tion, according to  specifications in the 
wildlife habitat capability models in 
Appendix 0 

For species emphasized in the Man- 
agementArea du-ection, provlde at  least 
“medium” or better habitat capability, 
as defined in accepted habitat capabil- 
ity models (See Appendix 0 ) 

Where pronghorn antelope passage is 
currently or potentially restricted, 

(2) 

(3) 
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modify emsting fences and design new 
fences to  permit free movement, 

Manage habitat for Sensitive wildlife species 
to insure that these species do not become 
Threatened or Endangered due to Forest 
Servlce actions 

(1) Management activities mthin habitat 
occupied by Sensitive species, orwhere 
potential habitat exists, will not be 
permitted unless supported by a bio- 
loBcal evaluation 

i 

F. MANAGEMENT 
PRESCRIPTIONS 

INTRODUCTION 

The Management Prescnptions apply a theme 
for management of specific land areas Within 
the general framework of the Forest Standards 
and Gudelines, they identify the specific actin- 
ties that are to  be emphasized or permitted on 
each type of land Management Prescnptions 
consist of five parts 

A. Purpose This describes the manage- 
ment objective of the prescnption 

B. Management Practices There are 
two types of management practices 
emphasized and permitted 

Emphasized Practices These are to be 
implemented as an integral part of the 
prescription The Management Prac- 
tices are defined in Appendix E “Em- 
phasized” means that the Forest Ser- 
vice will use some or all of these prac- 
tices whenever it implements the pre- 
scription 

PermittedPractices These are permit- 
ted in the implementation of the pre- 
scnption, but are not necessarily em- 
phasized “Permitted” means the For- 
est Service mll occasionally use the 
practices, but they are incidental ac- 
tivities Management Practices not 
listed either as emphasized or permit- 
ted are incompatible under that gwen 
prescription 
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C. Application Areas This descnbes 
the type of land to which the prescrip- 
tion is applied 

D. Prescription Standards andGuide- 
lines These gwe further guldance on 
specifically how to implement the pre- 
scription 

This plan is based on 17 Management Prescrip- 
tions They range from emphasizing full timber 
management, t o  emphasizing wilderness char- 
acter, t o  mmimal management Any gwen acre 
of National Forest has one, and only one, pre- 
scription The “Forest 0bjectives”and “Manage- 
ment Area direction” sections D and G of this 
chapter show the Forest acreage assigned to 
each prescnption in each Management Area 

WILDLIFE HABITAT CAPABILITY 

The Forest Semce has legal authority to man- 
age wildlife habitat, but not the wildlife popula- 
tions directly Wildlife habitats are descnbed in 
the prescnption Standards and Guidelines ac- 
cording to  their potential or capability to support 
animal populations. The Standards and Guide- 
lines list the relative Capabilities ofhabitats t o  be 
promded for various Management Indicator Spe- 
cies that are emphasized under the prescription 
The conditions necessary to achieve relative habi- 
ta t  capabilities are defined in Wildlife Habitat 
Capability Models (Shlmamoto and Arola 1981) 
Examples of habitat capability models for Man- 
agement Indicator Species are found in Appen- 
dix 0 

PRESCRIPTION APPLICATION 
PRIORITY 

Only one prescription can apply to a gwen acre of 
land Where two or more prescriptions could 
apply to an area of land, a prescription priority is 
needed (for example, a research natural area 
mthin mlderness, or a riparian area within a 
timber area) The pnority is shown above 

Prescription Application 
Letter Priority 

W 

S 
2 
L 
F 

A 

B 
N 

M 

R 

D 

G 

K 
E 
C 

V 

T 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

I 
8 

9 

10 
11 

12 13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

Prescription Name 

Wilderness 

Special Areas 
Minimal Management 
Late Successional 
Ripanaf l ish  
Non-mmber Wildlife 

RangeJWildlife 

Semi-Pnmitwe Non- 
Motorized Recreation 

Semi-Pnmitive 
Motorized Recreation 

Range 

Developed Recreation 

Old GrowtWGoshawk 
Rocky/Sparse Timber 

Early Successional 
Firewood 

Viewmmber 

Timber 

~ ~~ ~ 
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A NON-TIMBER WILDLIFE PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose ofthis prescnption is to maintain or 
improve habitat for species that are at least 
partially dependent on non-forest or non-com- 
mercial forests The prescnption m11 provlde 
high habitat capabilityfor deer, blackbear, prong- 
horn antelope, hairy woodpecker, and ground 
squirrel The prescnption is based on active 
habitat manipulation and modification of other 
resource actinties to enhance the habitat qual- 
ity for wildlife and fish Snag, nparian, and 
hardwood habitat will be managed to produce 
medium to  high habitat capability. Where con- 
flicts occur over forage, wildlife will have pnonty 
over livestock No timber harvest will be sched- 
uled under this prescnption. 

B. MANAGEMENT 
PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Visual Resource Management 
Wildlife Habitat Management - 

Threatened and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Management - 

Harvest Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - 

Other Management Indicator 
Species and Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

Permitted: 
Facility ConstructionIReconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Minerals Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Interpretive Facilities and Servlces 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 

Maintenance 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies t o  lands that are not 
sutable for commercial timber production, but 
have high potential for wildlife habitat improve- 
ment through vegetation manipulation. Map- 
pable applicatlon areas are marked “A” on the 
Management Area maps. 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Facilities 

1 Relocate roads where necessary to protect 
significant wildlife habitat 

2. Seasonally close roads where necessary to 
protect wildlife during critical periods 

Fire and Fuels 

1 Protect snags dunng fire suppression wher- 
ever safety considerations allow 

2. Manage fuels to improve habitat and forage 
production for wildlife. 

Use prescnbed fire to increase wildlife habi- 
tat  diversity while retaining important habi- 
tats 

4. When underburning in the eastside pine 
forest, use a bumng  prescnption that pro- 
vides for desired quality and quantity of 
bitterbrush 

3 

Range 

1. Modify existing and planned range improve- 
ments to meet habitat needs of wildlife. 

2. Through allotment management plans, pro- 
vide habitat for emphasized mldlife species 
listed in the Management Area direction 
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Recreation Wildlife 

1 Provide opportunities for mewing wildlife, 
hunting, gathenng forest products, and ve- 
hicle camping 

Manage recreation according to the specified 
Recreation Opportunity Spectrum classes 
(See Forest Standards and Guidelines) 

2 

Soils 

1 Retain ground-covenng litter, duff, andlor 
vegetation on a t  least 90 percent of non- 
rocky ripanan areas, except when removal is 
needed to improve vegetative diversity or 
wildlife habitat 

Timber 

1 Harvest timber only to support wildlife or 
fishery values 

Visual Resources 

1 In areas with an adopted visual quality ob- 
jective of Retention or Partial Retention, 
visually blendvegetation manipulation (such 
as prescnbed burns) into the surrounding 
landscape 

1 Maximize the sustainable carrying capacity 
of winter deer range by directly improving 
habitat and coordinating resource use activi- 
ties Where feasible, provide a continual 
supply of forage, and maintain at least 40 
percent of the area as cover 

Uniformly distribute escape cover in 10 to 40 
acre units throughout the area, gmng prior- 
ity to areas adjacent t o  meadows and open- 
ings 

Where water is desired, but not available, 
develop it if feasible 

2 

3 

4 Where habitatiscapable, maintainhighhabi- 
tat  capability for species dependent on snags 
and hardwoods, such as hairy and pileated 
woodpeckers and gray squirrels (see Appen- 
dix 0 under snags) 
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B RANGE/WILDLIFE PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescnption is to  prowde 
forage for livestock and wildlife, and to improve 
soil and  vegetative conditions. Plant and soil 
conditions are to be improved through direct 
vegetation and soil restoration, improved live- 
stock management, and regulation of other re- 
source uses Investment m improvements will be 
moderate, benefiting livestock, watershed, and 
wildlife. Forage utilization will be managed to 
provide for both livestock and wildlife needs No 
timber harvest mll be scheduled under this pre- 
scription 

B. MANAGEMENT 
PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Visual Resource Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - 

Threatened and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Maintenance 

Fish Habitat Management 

Permitted: 
Facility ConstructiodReconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Minerals Management 
Interpretive Facilities and Servlces 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Limited mmber Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescription applies to lands that are not 
suitable for commercial timber production, but 
are suitable for domestic livestock grazing and 
wildlife habitat Mappable application areas are 
marked “ B  on the Management Area maps 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Fire and Fuels 

1 Dunng fuels treatment, maintain natural 
barners to livestock movement (for example, 
mndrows, brushfields, thickets) where the 
bamers meet grazing plan requirements and 
do not result in conflicts mth other manage- 
ment objectives. 

Protect important forage vegetation from 
fire dunng penods when severe damage could 
occur 

Use prescnbed fire from planned and un- 
planned ignitions to improve forage for live- 
stock and wildlife 

4. Consider limiting or excluding grazing by 
domestic livestock from burned areas to al- 
low establishment of desirable forage spe- 
cies 

Range 

1 

2 

3 

Through allotment management plans, en- 
hance range productiwty andutilizahon, and 
provlde a t  least medium habitat capability 
for wildlife species emphasized in the Man- 
agement Area direction Maintain or  en- 
hance satisfactory ecological condition 

Recreation 

1 Manage recreation according to  the specified 
Recreation Opportunity Spectrum class, 
which is primanly Roaded Natural 
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Timber Wildlife 

1 Harvest timber only to  protect or enhance 1 Through allotment management practices, 
provlde sufficient quantities of suitable for- 
age, cover and water for wildlife needs 

range and wildlife values 

Visual Resource 

1. In areas with a visual quality objective of 
Retention or  Partial Retention, vlsuallyblend 
vegetation manipulation (such as prescnbed 
burns) into the surrounding landscape 
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c FIREWOOD PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescription is to make fire- 
wood available for personal and commercial use. 
All timber management practices and most other 
resource actinties are compatible, but sawlog 
production is not intended No timber harvest 
mll be scheduled in this prescnption. This 
prescnption provides for maintenance of wildlife 
habitat and species viability, significant cultural 
resources, and water quality 

B. MANAGEMENT 
PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Facility Constructiofleconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Modlfied Timber Management 

Permitted: 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Mmerals Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Visual Resource Management 
Interpretive Facilities and Semces 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Limited nmber  Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Maintenance 

and Endangered Species 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies to lands supporting 
lodgepole pine that are specifically designated 
for commercial and personal uses of firewood. 
Mappable application areas are marked “C” on 
the Management Area maps. 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Recreation 

1. Manage recreation according to Recreation 
Opportunity Spectrum class of Roaded Natu- 
ral (see Forest Standards and Guidelines) 

Wildlife 

1 Personal use firewood permits will consider 
the need for leaving large snags for wildlife 
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D DEVELOPED RECREATION PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescription is to facilitate 
quality recreation experiences at campgrounds, 
picnic areas, trailheads, visitor information sta- 
tions, and water-based facilities, whether they 
are Forest Service sites or recreation sites oper- 
ated by the pnvate sector under special use 
permits It applies t o  existing sites and desig- 
nated future sites (see Appendix L) Recreation 
amenities in and adjacent to future sites are to  be 
conserved 

Development levels (see Appendix K) range from 
1 to 4 and correspond to  the five Recreation 
Opportunity Spectrum classes Support sys- 
tems, such as water and sanitation facilities, 
roads, trails, and signs, may be dominant, but 
must harmonize with the natural setting 

Vegetative management may be necessary to 
maintain the health of the vegetation and to  
protect the users, but no timber harvesting will 
be scheduled under this prescnption Livestock 
grazing is to  be excluded from development level 
3 and 4 campgrounds, day-use sites, and devel- 
oped lakefront sites. All sites are to be recom- 
mended for withdrawal from locatable mineral 
entry. 

B. MANAGEMENT 
PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Facility ConstructionReconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Visual Resource Management 
Interpretive Facilities and Servlces 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 

Permitted: 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Range Administration and Management 
Limited Timber Management 

Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies to all developed recre- 
ation sites as described above Areas of applica- 
tion extend up to 1/2 mile beyond site penmeters 
so as to include areas seen as foreground from 
the sites Mappable application areas are too 
small t o  appear on the Management Area maps, 
but are represented by the recreation sites shown 
thereon. 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Facilities 

1 For roads providing pnmary access to or 
within developed recreation facilities, set 
road maintenance levels commensurate with 
the recreation development level and any 
unrelated additional traffic needs 

Fire and Fuels 

1 In areas seen as foreground from the recre- 
ation sites, dispose of all fuels from resource 
management activities within one year of 
the activlty Consider campfire use as a 
means of disposal 

Use only planned ignitions for prescribed 
fire 

2 

Forest Health 

1 Do not use chemical forms of animal control 
within or immediately adjacent to a site, 
unless the animals pose a significant hazard 
to human health (for example, bubonic plague 
in squirrels) 
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Range 

1. 

2 

3 

Manage livestock, forage utilization, and 
range improvements to complement recre- 
ational experiences. 

Prevent livestock concentration around de- 
veloped recreation sites 

Install natural-appeanng fences and cattle- 
guards at  entrances to development level 3 
and 4 campgrounds, day-use sites, and lake- 
front developed sites where needed to  ex- 
clude cattle 

Recreation 

1 Design and construct facilities and access to 
protect the recreation site, allow efficient 
maintenance, and promote user convenience 
Use partnerships and volunteers t o  the maxi- 
mum extent 

Construct atleastonenew campground 
of approximately 125 people-at-one- 
time capacity per decade Refer to 
Appendix L for a pnoritized list of 
development projects 

Where feasible, locate campsites and 
toilets a t  least 200 feet from streams 
and lakes Where such separation is 
not feasible, design facilities to create 
the least possible impact on banks, 
shorelines, and water quality. 

Make portions of most developed sites 
accessible to the physlcally challenged 

Construct nature trails, photo blinds, 
and interpretive sites where they en- 
hance the recreation experience 

Rehabilitate existing developed sites 
when conditions reach below-standard 
levels 

When planning for rehabilitation of 
sites, plan for multiple or small group 
units 

g. Replace facilities when rehabilitation 
costs exceed 50 percent of replacement 
costs orwhen the facilities arenolonger 
compatible m t h  the Recreation Oppor- 
tunity Spectrum classification 

2 Operate and maintain facilities and access to 
protect natural site conditions and promote 
user convenience 

a 

b. 

C. 

d 

e 

f 

g 

Soil 

Maintam developed recreation sites in 
a satisfactory condition 

Inspect sites for fire and tree hazards 
at  the start of the recreation season 
and thereafter as appropnate Re- 
strict use until unsafe conditions are 
corrected 

Perform other resource management 
activities in or adjacent t o  recreation 
sites only duringthe off-season, unless 
a cntical resource objective cannot be 
met. Close a site only as a last resort 

Provlde attendants or volunteer hosts 
at  some development level 3 sites and 
all development level 4 sites t o  dis- 
courage vandalism, encourage appro- 
pnate site use, and provlde public con- 
tact. 

Close campsites that are temporarily 
wet from high water table or flooded 
(e g Memll Campground, due to the 
rising of Eagle Lake) until the entire 
site has dry, firm soil Obliterate camp- 
sites that are consistently flooded or 
wet after July 4th 

Manage recreation use to designated 
capacities 

Consider campground rest-rotation 
strateaes in the preparation ofvegeta- 
tive management plans for recreation 
sites (see Timber below) 

1 Design campgrounds to  encourage users to 
stay on designated pathways, parkmgspurs, 
and campsites 
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2 Prevent surface drainage from recreational 
roads, parking areas, and campsites directly 
into streams or lakes, especially in the Eagle 
Lake basin 

3. Useappropnate control measures to prevent 
compaction of wet soils, particularly on low- 
lymgsites dunng rainyweather or  snowmelt 

Timber 

1. Prepare a vegetative management plan for 
each developed recreation site providing for 
short- and long-term vlsual quality; vegeta- 
tion health, vigor, and diverslty both on site 
and mthin foregrounds seen from the site, 
protection from fire, insects, disease, and 
other pests, vegetation replacement, haz- 
ardous tree control, and appropriate mom- 
toring 

2 Harvest timber only to support recreational 
values 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet a visual quality objective of Retention 
in that portion ofthe sites seen as foreground 
from roads and trails Employ the guidelines 
for Retention listed in the Viewmmber Pre- 
scnption, Visual Resources Section 

Wildlife 

1 Improve wildlife habitat adjacent to devel- 
oped sites to increase the number and diver- 
sity of wildlife sightings. 
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E EARLY SUCCESSIONAL 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose ofthis prescription is to  maintain or 
improve forage to provide high habitat capability 
for wildlife species that are partially dependent 
on young vegetation (early successional) stages 
of forest types It is also intended to provlde 
transitory range for livestock and to improve 
plant and animal diversity. Livestock use w111 be 
compatible with wildlife needs Early succes- 
sional stage wldlife species include black bear, 
deer, and pronghorn antelope 

Timber harvest mil be scheduled under this 
prescnption Treatment of forest vegetation to 
provlde desired wildlife habitat charactenstics 
is the pnmary method to achieve the habitat 
goals Cutting unit sizes and locations, timing of 
stand entnes, and the intensity of site prepara- 
tion, release, and thinning are modified from 
normal silvicultural practices to perpetuate de- 
sirable wildlife forage and cover conditions 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Facility ConstructionReconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Modified Tnnber Management 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Maintenance 

Species 

Permitted: 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Minerals Management 
Visual Resource Management 
Interpretive Fanhities and Services 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 

Limited Timber Management 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies t o  lands that are suit- 
able for timber production Mappable applica- 
tion areas are not marked on the Management 
Area maps because many are too small to show, 
and their exact locations can only be determined 
after site-specific project planning for timber 
sales However, the total acres receivmg this 
prescriptionin each Management Area are shown 
in the Management Area direction 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Facilities 

1. Emphasize screemng of important forage 
areas, resting and escape cover, water 
sources, and travel routes for deer when 
locating and designing roads 

Close roads to  motorized vehicles as appro- 
priate t o  meet the needs of deer, black bear, 
and other emphasized species listed in the 
Management Area direction 

2 

Fire and Fuels 

1. Use prescnbed fire as a part of silvlcultural 
activity to maintain or enhance forage 

Range 

1 Construct or modify range improvements t o  
accommodate utilization of early seral for- 
age by both livestock and wldlife 
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Recreation 

1 Manage recreation according to the Recre- 
ation Opportunity Spectrum class of Roaded 
Natural (see Forest Standards and Guide- 
lines) 

Timber 

1 Design release practices for young conifer 
plantations to perpetuate grass, forb, and 
shrub cover as long as possible 

Design the use of herbicides to provide us. 
able forage for livestock and wildlife 

Design grazing schedules for livestock to 
allow establishment of timber seedlings 

2 

3 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet visual quality objectives of Modifica- 
tion and Maximum Modification where speci- 
fied on the Adopted Visual Quality Objective 
Map Employ the Visual Resources guide- 
lines of the Timber Prescnption 

Wildlife 

1 Uniformly distribute 10 to 40 acre escape 
cover units, gwmg priority to ecotone areas 
adjacent t o  meadows and openings Imple- 
ment at  the rate of 600 acredyear 
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F RIPAFtIAN/FISH PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescnption is to maintain 
and improve riparian-dependent resources, in- 
cluding (1) water quality, (2) fish habitat, espe- 
cially for anadromous fish, (3) wildlife habitat, 
(4) water-associated aesthetics, (5)npanan hard- 
woods and other vegetation Limited timber 
harvest is scheduled under this prescnption only 
when riparian values can be maintained. No 
more than 2 5 percent of the standing inventory 
may be harvested iu any one decade. 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Road Obliteration 
Fuels Management 
Limited Timber Management 
Visual Resource Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 
Dispersed Recreation Activities 

Permitted: 
Facility Construction/Reconstruction 
Range Administration and Management 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Restricted Off Highway Vehicle Use 
Fire Management 
Minerals Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Interpretive Facilities and Services 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Trail Construction 
Developed Recreation at  Designated Sites 

Maintenance 

Species 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies to all lands in and 
adjacent to lakes, streams, ephemeral and pe- 
rennial wetlands, bogs, seeps, and pothole lakes 

It applies to perennial andintermittent streams 
and, as needed, to ephemeral channels It al- 
ways applies t o  nparian vegetation bordenng 
lakes and other bodies of water Mappable apph- 
cation areas are all bodies ofwater on the Forest, 
marked “F” on the Management Area maps, 
unless contained in an area allocated to  a higher 
priority prescnption, such as wilderness, semi- 
primitive area, etc Ripanan areas too small to 
map will also receive this prescription 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Facilities 

1 Limitstreamcrossings tostablerockorgravel 
areas or where streambank damage will be 
minimal Where this is not feasible, develop 
crossings that minimize disturbance to ri- 
parian-dependent resources Crossings ulll 
be as near right angles as possible. 

Disperse flows from ditches or culverts t o  
keep upland area runofffrom reaching ripar- 
ian zones. 

3. Route roadside drainage through armored 
ditches or  culverts across erodible areas 

4. Minimize short-term degradation of water 
quality from channel-altenng projects by in- 
stalling flow deflectors or riprap; building 
stream crossings, dams, and weirs; excavat- 
ing pools, and placement of boulders 

2 

5 Before installing fish passageimprovements, 
refer to the Forest Service publications “Fish 
Passage Through Culverts” (November, 1990) 
and “Planning Forest Roads to  Protect 
Salmon Habitat” (PNW-109, June 1980) 
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6 

I. 

Outslope roads to minimize collection water. 

When directly drafting water from streams 
for dust abatement, maintain a mmimum 
flow of two cubic feet per second (cfs) down- 
stream from drafting points 

11. Limit prescnbed burning in and adjacent to 
npanan areas to protect ripanan and aquatic 
values Use prescribed fire t o  improve wild- 
life habitat, pnmanly by stimulating aspen 
and willow regeneration 

Fish 
Fire and Fuels 

1. 

2 

3 

4 

5. 

6 

I. 

8 

9 

10 

Minimize lsturbance from fire suppression 
Allow low intensity fires to burn where they 
will cause less disturbance than suppression 
activlties 

Avoid the use of bulldozers in stream chan- 
nels dunng fire suppression. 

Avoid application of fire retardant chemicals 
to streams, other bodies of water, and npar- 
ian zones, unless necessary to protect human 
hfe 

Avoid locating fire camps and other facilities 
in npanan areas Where this is not feasible, 
locate sanitary facilities a t  least 100 feet 
(slope &stance) from streams, lakes, ormead- 
ows. 

Fiehabhtate intensely burned areas promptly. 

Set fuel loading standards to meet npanan 
zone needs 

Within normal high water zones, remove all 
timber harvest slash not needed for soil pro- 
tection or fish and wildlife habitat Yard 
unmerchantable material 

Dispose of chipped, crushed, or lopped mate- 
na l  so it will not eventually enter stream 
courses 

Do not locate burn piles wtbm the normal hgh 
water area of dramage or stream courses 

Minimize soil disturbance during fuel treat- 
ment‘ 

a. Hand pile and burn, or limit broadcast 
burning to low intensity fire (less than 
2 foot flame length) 

Retain natural amounts of duff and 
fine fuels to serve as sediment filters 

b 

1 Where site Capability permits, provide “high” 
habitat capability for chinook salmon, steel- 
head, and rainbow trout m areas where these 
species can occur. 

2. Management Areas where fish are emphasis 
species and site capability permits, provide 
sufficient streamside cover t o  shade at  least 
70 percent of all stream surfaces from 10 
a m. to  4 p.m dunng the summer months 
(June 1 to September 30) 

3. Where natural conditions permit, achieve or  
mamtain stable channel conditions over a t  
least 80 percent ofthe total linear distance of 
stream channels 

Where site capability permits, improve 
stream channel conditions to achieve desired 
frequency of pool to  riffle ratios (between 
40 60 and 60.40) to insure reanng, spawn- 
ing, and food producing areas are well dis- 
tributed 

Provlde woody debris for instream struc- 
tural diversity by maintaining natural re- 
cruitment of trees from adjacent riparian 
areas 

4 

5 

Range 

1 Manage livestock as needed to protect or 
enhance riparian areas. 

a. Allow no salting or livestock supple- 
ment stations within 1/4 mile of water 
developments, streams, or other ri- 
panan areas 

Modify grazing schedules, institute or 
modify grazing systems, reduce num- 
bers, or  eliminate livestock, as neces- 
sary to prevent or  correct damage to 
ripanan vegetation or streamhanks 

b 
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c In updating or initiating new allot- 
ment plans, give priority to  allotments 
with degraded riparian areas (e g. 
tributanes to Eagle Lake, especially 
Pine Creek, and anadromous fish 
streamssuchasDeerCreek,MillCreek, 
and Antelope Creek) Within those 
allotments, gwe pnority to ripanan 
rehabilitation 

Strongly consider not filling in behind 
termgrazing permits approved for per- 
sonal convenience non-use to  reduce 
administration costs and to encourage 
recovery of vegetative conditions 

d 

Soils 

1. Occasionally, small openlngs in the nparian 
canopy created by w n d  thrown trees, tree 
mortality due to insects and disease, or har- 
vesting may require tree planting to assure 
future canopy cover When prepanng these 
openings for planting, limit ground disturb- 
ing actinties t o  the minimum needed for tree 
establishment Use handscalping to  clear 
small areas (usually less than 4 square feet 
per tree) of vegetation and duff for planting 
indimdual trees Hand pile debris (slash) as 
needed instead of tractor piling or  brush 
raking. 

e. Fence critical w a n a n  areas where 2. Keep ground-covenng litter, duff, andforveg- 
none of the measures above result in 
improved ripanan area condition. 

etation on at least 90 percent of non-rocky 
npanan areas. 

2 In streams and lake nparian areas, deter- 3. Manage for reduced soil exposure, erosion, 
and sedimentation, and minimize cutbanks mine grazing use through allotment man- 

agement plans and hank sloughing 

3. Coordinatewrthgrazingpemtteesandother Ember 
interested parties in developing management 
s t ratews or actions thatmayaffectnparlan 
areas 

1 Limit tree hamest to individual tree selec- 
tion, except as noted in Item 2 below 

Recreation 2 Other tree harvest prescriptions may he ap- 
plied to benefit npanan dependent resources 

1 
Keep skid trails and roads away from 
lakeshores and out of stream corndors, ex- 
cept for stream crossings 

Place all new structures (except docks, boat 
ramps, and bridges) at least 100 feet from 
lakeshores and streams, and beyond the 100 
year floodplains 

3 

2. Where recreation is encouraged, locate most 
facilities outside of nparian areas Where 
heavy fishing use has resulted in multiple 
paths, build a single trail that will better 
protect water quality 

Confine off-highway vehicles, except over- 
snow vehic!es, to designated roads, trails, 
and stream crossings in nparian areas 

3 

4 Minimize timber harvest effects in stream 
corridors by designating skid trail crossings 
and using directional felling, stage felling, 
and endlining. 

5 Locate landings and log decks well away 
from streamside management zones (BMP 
18, Appendix Q) and from npanan areas 
(BMP 1 12) 

4 Coordinate with the California Department Vegetation and Diversity 
of Fish and Game dunng planning of recre- 
ational facilities that c&id affect fish and 
wildlife populations or  local demand for 
planted trout 

Manage to enhance the npar- 
ian vegetative community by maintaining or 
improvingexisting species and age diversity, 
and distnbution 
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2 Maintain or improve stream channel stabil- 
ity by retaining or establishing vegetation in 
stream corndors Where appropnate, retain 
or establish late seral ripanan vegetation 

Visual Resources 

1. Meet a vlsual quality objective of Retention 
or Partial Retention wthm the foreground 
as vlewed from Sensitivlty Level 1 streams 
and lakeshores, as designated on the Adopted 
Visual Quality Objective Map 

Employ the guidelines for these vlsual qual- 
ity objectives as listed in the View/Timber 
Prescription, Visual Resources Section 

2 

Water and Riparian Areas 

1 Protect perennial, intermittent, and ephem- 
eral streams within project areas by using 
Best Management Practices (see Appendix 
Q) to limit adverse effects of loggmg road 
construction, maintenance, and other activl- 
ties 

Restnct operations in floodplains and wet- 
lands in compliance with Executive Orders 

In degraded nparian areas identified during 
project planning or watershed monitoring 
and inventory, adjust grazing systems, re- 
duce livestock numbers, limt public use, 
andor plant ripanan vegetation as neces- 
sary to  rehabilitate each area 

2 

3 

4 Manage designated ephemeral stream chan- 
nels by mnimizing ground disturbance and 
soil compaction within SMZs from roads, 
timber harvesting, fuel removal, and site 
preparation activities 

Wildlife 

1 Where site productivity permits, provide 
“high” habitat capability for ripanan, hard- 
wood, and snag-dependent species 

Promote diversity of vegetation and favor 
species and age classes that best meet wild- 
life and fishery needs Favor ripanan areas 
when designating old growth stands, con- 
necting corndors, or wildlife nesting trees 

Enhance vegetation and ground cover around 
seeps, bogs, and spnngs 

Maintain or improve npanan hardwood com- 
munities 

2 

3 

4 

5 Where beavers create adverse effects t o  
stream channels and riparian areas, manage 
populations as needed to  meet and maintain 
desired ecologxal conditions 

In all management activities, protect or  en- 
hance suitable habitat for the Endangered 
Shasta crayfish in the Pit River and Hat 
Creek drainages 

6 

~~ 
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G OLD GROWTWGOSHAWK PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescnption is to pronde for 
vegetative diversity through maintenance of old 
growth ecosystems, and to maintain or  improve 
high habitat capability for goshawks and bald 
eagles The maintenance ofvisual quality is also 
compatible with this prescription Timber man- 
agementmll focus on long rotations with arange 
of size classes and proper spatial distnbution of 
stands t o  pronde desired habitat conditions 
Treatment through timber harvesting may he 
needed t o  achieve this 

Limited timber management is expected to oc- 
cur Salvage harvesting may be appropnate in 
certain circumstances to remove heavy concen- 
trations ofinsect or drought killed timber, and to 
protect stands against catastrophic wildfire 
losses In goshawk territories or  bald eagle 
areas, no  timber harvesting will occur unless a 
hiolopcal evaluation and NEPA analysis deter- 
mine that timber management will maintam or 
enhance the quality of their habitat Manage- 
ment activities will not be visually endent, and 
natural-appeannglandscapes wlll be maintained 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Road Maintenance 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Visual Resource Management 
Limited Timber Management 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 
Management of Indicator Species and 

and Endangered Species 

Special Habitats 

Permitted: 
Facility ConstructionReconstruction 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Mineral Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Interpretive Facilities and Servlces 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

Maintenance 

Species 

This prescription applies to lands identified as 
needed for old growth habitat, bald eagle areas, 
and goshawk terntones Application areas will 
be marked “G” on the Management Area maps 
pending field verification of tentatively identi- 
fied habitat and final selection Currently active 
nest sites wll take preference in the delineation 
of a habitat network for goshawks. Some bald 
eagle areas are large enough tobe displayed The 
number of areas to be mapped are listed under 
section D Wildlife Habitat Allocations for each 
Management Area 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Facilities 

1 Locate and design roads to avoid important 
wildlife hiding and escape cover, watering 
sources, and travel routes 

In cooperation wlth the California Depart- 
ment ofFish and Game, close roads to  motor- 
ized vehicles as appropriate Coordinate 
road closure and motorized vehicle access 
needs with theDepartment tomeettheneeds 
ofdeer, black hear, and other wildlife empha- 
sis species listed in the Management Area 
direction 

2 
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Fire and Fuels 

1 

Recreation 

1. Manage recreation according to  the Recre- 
ation Opportunity Spectrum classes of Semi- 
Pnmitive Non-Motorized, Semi-Primitive 
Motonzed, or Roaded Natural (see Forest 
Standards and Guidelines). 

Use prescnbed tire for silvlcultural purposes 

Timber 

1 Schedule silvlcultural treatments t o  continu- 
ally maintain large trees over24 dbh Main- 
tain the minimum size ofhabitat units based 
on the needs ofthe emphasis species listed in 
the Management Area direction. 

Harvest timber to  protect or  enhance vegeta- 
tive structure and diversity 

2 

Wildlife 

1 Provlde at  least the following densities of 
down logs by vegetation type on lands com- 
pnsed of 50 to  200 acres. 

Density 
Vegetatlon Type (logdacre) 

Eastside pine 4 
Mixed conifer, lodgepole pine 8 
True fir, mountain hemlock 10 

2 In unmanaged stands, accept naturally oc- 
curring densities of down logs. 

For purposes of number 1 above, consider a 
log to be a t  least 15 feet long with a large-end 
diameter of at  least 20 inches. Count short 
log segments greater than 20 inches in 
diameter in proportion to their length 

Maintain habitat Capability for late succes- 
sional species by maintaining the following 
snag guidelines on land units compnsed of 
50 to 200 acres each: 

Snag DBH 
High Habitat 
Capability 
(reamred) Average Density 

3 

4 

2 4  > 5/acre 

>15 - 2 4  >3facre 

Total >3 5lacre 

5 Accept naturally occurring snag densities 
until high habitat capability requirements 
are met 

A seasonal restriction to exclude timber har- 
vesting mthin occupied bald eagle and gos- 
hawk nest stands dunng nesting seasons 
will be imposed 

6 
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K ROCKY/SPARSE TIMBER PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescnption is to  maintain 
timber stands on rocky, unplantable (by artifi- 
cial means) land and on lands with sparse to 
poorly stocked eastside pine Investments will 
be made in reforestation in the form of site 
preparation and release for naturally regener- 
ated stands, stand improvements, and resource 
protection. Timber harvest will be scheduled 
under this prescnption. This prescnption is 
compatible mth the maintenance of forest eco- 
systems at the medium habitat capability level 
for species that are a t  least partially dependent 
on larger diameter trees in sparsely stocked 
stands mth high snag densities The mainte- 
nance of visual quality is also a compatible pur- 
pose with this prescription 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Visual Resource Management 
Lmited nmber Management 
Wildlife Habitat Management 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management 

Threatened 

Harvest 

Other 
Management Indicator Species 
and Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

Permitted: 
Facility Construction/Reconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Minerals Management 
Modified Timber Management 
Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvements and 

Maintenance 

Interpretive Facilities and Sernces 
Restricted Off Highway Vehicle Use 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescription applies t o  lands that are suit- 
able for timber production Because of physical 
site charactenstics, artifiaal regeneration within 
five years is not certain. Mappable application 
areas are marked “K” on the Management Area 
maps Areas too small to map are found mthin 
other prescriptions. 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Fire and Fuels 

1 Useprescribedfire for silviculturalpurposes 

Recreation 

1 Manage recreation according to the Recre- 
ation Opportunity Spectrum classes of Semi- 
Pnmitive Nan-Motorized and Roaded Natu- 
ral (see Forest Standards and Guidelines) 

Timber 

1 

2. 

Schedule silvicultural treatments to con- 
tinually maintain large trees over 2 4  dbh. 
Management will emphasize uneven-aged 
harvest methods, pnmanly indindual tree 
selection. Base the minimumsizesofhabitat 
units on the needs of emphasis species listed 
in the Management Area direction. 

Whenever feasible, deslgn silvlcultural treat- 
ments to provlde corndors and islands of 
cover linking larger units of old-growth tim- 
ber 
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Wildlife 

1 Provide a t  least the following densities of 
downed logs by vegetation type on land com- 
prised of 50 to  200 acres 

Density 
Vegetation Type (logslacre) 

4 Maintain habitat capability for late succes- 
sional species by maintaining the following 
snag guidelines on land units comprised of 
50 to 200 acres each 

Snag DBH 
High Habitat 
Capability 
(required) Average Density 

Eastside pine 4 

True fir, mountain hemlock 10 

2. In unmanaged stands, accept naturally oc- 
curring densities of down logs 

Where habitat is available, maintain high 
habitat capability for snag dependent spe- 
cies such as hairy and pileated woodpeckers, 
and gray squirrels. (See Appendix 0 under 
snags.) 

Mixed conifer, lodgepole pine 8 

3 

24" > 51acre 

>15" - 2 4  >3/acre 

Total >3 5Iacre 

5 Accept naturally occurring snag densities 
until high habitat capability requirements 
are met 
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L LATE SUCCESSIONAL PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescription is to provide for 
vegetative diversity through maintenance of old 
growth ecosystems, and to  maintain or  improve 
habitat to provide high habitat capability for 
species that are a t  least partially dependent on 
old (late successional) timber stands with large 
diameter trees and obvious stand decadence 
These species include spotted owl, pileated and 
hairy woodpeckers, marten, and fisher Timber 
management will focus on long rotations w t h  a 
range of size classes and proper spatial distnbu- 
tion of stands to provide desired habitat condi- 
tions 

No timber harvesting will be scheduled within 
spotted owl habitat areas (SOHA’S), the Habitat 
Conservation Area (HCA) and furbearer habitat 
management areas Salvage activities or  thin- 
ningmay be appropnate in certain circumstances 
to remove heavy concentrations of insect or  
drought killed timber, to protect stands against 
catastrophic wildfire losses, and to reduce stock- 
inglevels for habitat enhancement SOHA’s and 
furbearer habitat comprise most of the areas 
receiving this prescnption 

E. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Visual Resource Management 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Permitted: 
Interpretive Facilities and Services 
Facility ConstructionReconstruction 
Restricted Off Highway Vehicle Use 

Minerals Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Limited ‘hmber Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescription applies t o  lands identified as 
needed for wildlife species that prefer old growth 
wildlife habitat Most of these areas are suitable 
for timber production Application areas are 
marked “L” on the Management Area maps 
Habitat for marten and fisher areas was not 
placed on Management Area maps pending field 
venfication of tentatively selected management 
areas 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Maintenance 

Species 

Facilities 

1 Locate and design roads to avoid important 
wildlife hiding and escape cover, watermg 
sources, travel routes, nesting sites and for- 
agmg areas 

In cooperation with the California Depart- 
ment of Fish and Game, close roads to motor- 
ized vehicles as appropnate Coordinate 
road closure and motorized vehicle access 
needs with the Department to meet the needs 
of deer, black bear, and other wildlife em- 
phasis species listed in the Management 
Area direction 

2 

Fire and Fuels 

1 Use prescnbed fire for silvicultural purposes 
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Recreation 

1. Manage recreation accordmg to the Recre- 
ation Opportunity Spectrum classes ofsemi- 
Primitive Non-Motorized, Semi-Primitive 
Motonzed, or Roaded Natural (see Forest 
Standards and Guidelines) 

Timber 

1. A no scheduled timber harvest prescription 
mll be applied to  all SOHA's, HCAs and 
martedfisher habitat management areas 
(HMA's). 

2 No vegetative treatments will be imple- 
mented within the SOHA network unless 
NEPA analysis and a bioloBca1 evaluation 
indicate harvestingwouldmaintam the qual- 
ity of owl habitat 

3. No vegetative treatments will be planned 
mthin marten and fisher habitat areas, or 
their connecting corndors, unless NEPA 
analysis and a biologxal evaluation deter- 
mine timber management is needed to main- 
tam the quality of habitat for these species 

Design vegetative treatments t o  continually 
maintain large trees over 24' dbh 

4 

Wildlife 

1 Provlde a t  least the follomng densities of 
down logs by vegetation type on lands com- 
pnsed of 50 to 200 acres. 

Density 
Vegetation Type (lopslacre) 

2 In unmanaged stands, accept naturally oc- 
curnng densities of down logs 

For purposes of number 1 above, consider a 
log to be a t  least 15 feet long with a large-end 
diameter of a t  least 20 inches. Count short 
log segments greater than 20 inches in diam- 
eter in proportion to their length 

Maintain habitat Capability for late succes- 
sional species by maintaining the follomng 
snag guidelines on land units comprised of 
50 to 200 acres each 

Snag DBH 
High Habitat 
Capability 
(required) Average Density 

3 

4 

2 4  

>15" - 24" 

> 5lacre 

>3/acre 

Total >3 5tacre 

5. Accept naturally occurnng snag densities 
until high habitat capability requlrements 
are met. 

Through NEPA analysis and biolog.lca1 evalu- 
ations, address the needs of wildlife, timber, 
and other resources mthin spotted owl, mar- 
ten and fisher habitat areas, before starting 
management activlties that might change 
their special vegetative characteristics. 

6 

Eastside pine 4 
Mixed conifer, lodgepole pine 8 
True fir, mountain hemlock 10 
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SEMI-PRIMITIVE MOTORIZED RECREATION 
PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

This prescnption is derived from the Recreation 
Opportumty Spectrum (ROS) class ofsemi-Pnmi- 
tive Motorized (SPM) (see Appendix J for the 
definition of this class). It is mtended to facih- 
tate dispersed, motorized recreation, such as 
snowmobiling, four-wheel dnvlng, and motorcy- 
clmg , in areas essentially undisturbed except for 
the presence offour-wheel dnve roads and trails 
Non-motorized activlties such as hilung, fishing, 
hunting, picniclung, and cross-country skiing 
are also possible Motonzed travel may be sea- 
sonally prohibited or restricted to designated 
routes to  protect other resources. 

Although timber harvest will not be scheduled in 
these areas, timber may be selectively removed 
to  protect recreational values Management ac- 
tivities are  not to be visually evident, and natu- 
ral-appearing landscapes are to be maintained. 
The prescnption mll provlde high habitat capa- 
bility for species that are at  least partially depen- 
dent on snags, dead and down wood, and late 
successional stands 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Visnal Resource Management 
Interpretive Facilities and Services 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Wildlife Habitat Management - 

Threatened and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Spec i e s 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

Permitted: 
Facility Construction/Reconstruction 
Road Obliteration 
Minerals Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Limited Timber Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 

Maintenance 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescription applies pnmarily to the High 
Lakes and Ishi B areas as shown on the Man- 
agement Area maps and the Forest Plan Pre- 
scription Maps Mappable application areas are 
marked “ M  on the Management Area maps 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Site-specific standards and guidelines are given 
in the Management Area direction The follow- 
ing standards and guidelines apply throughout 
the SPM areas 

Facilities 

1 Design motonzed routes to take advantage 
of recreation and scenic opportunities, in- 
sure successful rehabilitation of soil and veg- 
etation, and provlde motonzed recreation 
challenges. 

Prohibit road upgrading that would detract 
from motonzed recreation opportunities. 

Close specific areas or travel routes season- 
ally or year-round as needed to facilitate 
management of adjacent areas, prevent dam- 
age to other resources, prevent use conflicts, 
and avoid unnecessary costs 

2 

3 

4 Construct facilities m t h  native matenals 
whenever possible 
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Fire and Fuels Soils 

Avoid or minimize ground disturbance dur- 
ing fire suppression activlty 

Use prescribed fire according to  approved 
plans to  perpetuate natural forest ecosys- 
tems, return ecosystems to natural condi- 
tions, reduceunacceptable damage from wild- 
tire, or protect adjacent resources 

Limit rehabilitation of areas burned by wild- 
fire t o  restoration of natural conditions and 
protection of resource values. 

1 Rehahilitate areas of significant soil degra- 
dation caused by O m s .  Close trails and 
areas to motonzed use ifnecessary to protect 
soils 

Timber 

1 Harvest only dead or high nsk trees Har- 
vest timber only if needed to maintain or  
enhance semi-primitive values (for example, 
to allow construction of motorized routes or  
to control insects or disease) 

Use the “limited timber management” prac- 
tice (see Appendix E) only in response to 

2 

Recreation catastrophic occurrences such as wildfire or  

Within the planning penod, determine ac- 
cess, sanitation, trail, and trailhead needs of 
each area as needed to  facilitate motorized 
recreation 

Provide foot and horse trails in areas not 
needed or appropnate for motonzed routes. 

Monitor andlimitvlsitor use through aquota 
permit system when other resources are dam- 
aged or recreation expenences are reduced 

Develop water sources where appropnate 

Limit recreation facilities t o  those of Devel- 
opment Level 2 Primitive toilets, campfire 
rings, recreational stock control devlces, 
trails, and trailheads Keep all signing to  a 
minimum 

Fish 

insect epidemic 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet the visual quality objective of Reten- 
tion to protect or enhance the semi-pnmitive 
landscape Apply the guidelines for Reten- 
tion listed in the View/Timber Prescription, 
Visual Resources section. Allow pnmitive 
roads to meet the vlsual quality objective of 
Partial Retention where necessary 

Rehabilitate areas where the visual quality 
objective of Partial Retention is not cur- 
rently met 

2 

Wildlife 

1 Provide “high” habitat capability for harvest 
species and other species that have a rela- 
tively low tolerance to human activlty 

2. Let natural vegetative succession occur, un- 
less specific vegetation treatments are nec- 
essary to meet fish and wildlife objectives 

1 Coordinate with the California Department 3 When treating vegetation in non-forest ar- 
of Fish and Game for enhancing fishenes 
habitat and stocking of fish in lakes and 
streams 4 Where water is desired, but not available, 

eas, favor the use of prescribed fire 

develop it if feasible 
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5. 

6 

7 

Provlde at least the following densities of 
down logs by vegetation type on lands com- 
prised of 50 to 200 acres 

Density 
Vegetation Type (logslacre) 

Eastside pine 4 

True fir, mountain hemlock 10 
Mixed conifer, lodgepole pine 8 

In unmanaged stands, accept naturally oc- 
cumng  densities of down logs 

For purposes of number 1 above, consider a 
log to  be at least 15 feet long with a large-end 
diameter of at least 20 inches Count short 
log segments greater than 20 inches in 
diameter in proportion to their length 

8 Maintain habitat capability for late succes- 
sional species by maintaining the following 
snag guidelines on land units compnsed of 
50 to 200 acres each 

Snag DBH 
High Habitat 
Capability 
(required) Average Density 

24" > 5lacre 

>15" - 2 4  >3/acre 

Total >3 5lacre 

9 Accept naturally occurnng snag densities 
until high habitat capability requirements 
are met 

~ 
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SEMI-PRIMITIVE NON-MOTORIZED RECREATION 
PRESCRIPTION 

k PURPOSE 

This prescnption is denved from the Recreation 
Opportunity Spectrum(R0S) class ofSem-Pnnn- 
tive Non-Motonzed (SPNM) See Appendix J for 
the definition of this class It is intended to 
facilitate dispersed recreation such as hilung, 
mountain bicycling, horseback ndmg, huntmg, 
and cross-country sluing in unroaded, essen- 
tially undisturbed areas outside of existing and 
proposed mlderness areas Motonzed recre- 
ation is prohibited 

Although timber harvest m11 not be scheduled in 
these areas, timber may be selectively removed 
to protect semi-primitive recreational values 
Management actinties are not to be visually 
evldent, and natural appearing landscapes are 
to be maintained The prescnption m11 provide 
high habitat capability for species which are 
intolerant ofhuman disturbance and are at least 
partially dependent on snags, dead and down 
wood, and late successional stands. Recreation, 
vlsual, wildlife, fisheries, and npanan resource 
values are emphasized 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Range Administration and Management 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Restncted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Fire Management 
Interpretive Facilities and Servlces 
Visual Resource Management 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species 
and Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

Permitted: 
Facility ConstructionReconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Fuels Management 
Minerals Management 
Range Structural Improvements and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Limited Timber Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 

Maintenance 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies to the Chips Creek, 
Cinder Butte, Ishi B, Keddie Ridge, Onion 
Spnngs, Prospect, Polk Spnngs, andsnow Moun- 
tain areas, as marked with “N” on the Manage- 
ment Area maps. 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Site specific standards and guidelines are gwen 
in the Management Area direction. The follow- 
ing Standards and Guidelines apply throughout 
the SPNM areas 

Facilities 

1 Permit no upgrading of existing roads Close 
roads permanently to  public motonzed use 
Allow the continuation of existing access for 
the maintenance and operation of utility 
facilities Convert to trails those roads not 
needed for authorized activities 

Construct no new permanent roads 

Approve new temporary roads only for such 
purposes as salvage logging, access to valid 
mining claims or  utility operations, based on 
environmental analysis for specific projects 

Obliterate and revegetate temporary roads 
after use 

2 

3 

4 
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5. 

6 

7 

Locate, design, construct, and mamtain trails 
suitable for foot and horseback travel 

Allow mountain bicycles on trails where not 
otherwise restncted. 

Construct facilities with native matenals 
whenever possible 

Fire and Fuels 

1 

2 

3. 

Avoid or minimize ground disturbance dur- 
ing fire suppression activity 

Use prescribed fire according to  approved 
plans to perpetuate natural forest ecosys- 
tems, return ecosystems to natural condi- 
tions, reduce unacceptable damage from wld- 
fire or protect adjacent resources 

Limit rehabilitation of areas burned by wild- 
fire to restoration of natural conditions and 
protection of resource values. 

Fish 

1 Coordinate mth the California Department 
of Fish and Game for enhancing fisheries 
habitat and stockingfishin lakes and streams 
to  help disperse recreation use 

Recreation 

Witlun the planning penod, determine ac- 
cess, sanitation, trail, and trailhead needs of 
eachareaasneededtofacilitatehikmg, horse- 
back nding, mountain bicycling, and cross- 
country skiing. 

Design trails t o  take advantage of recreation 
attributes such as vlstas, streams, lakes, and 
areas of geologw interest 

Monitor and limit vlsitor use when other 
resources are damaged or recreation expen- 
ences are reduced 

Develop water sources where appropriate to 
enhance semi-pnmitive related values 

Generally limit facilities to those of Develop- 
ment Level 1 primitive toilets, campfire 
rings, recreational stock control devices, 

6. 

trails, and trailheads. Keep all signing to a 
minimum. Provlde developed sites exceed- 
ing Development Level 1 standards if neces- 
sary for protection of other resources 

Prohbit motonzed recreation, mcludmgfour- 
wheel drivmg, motorcycling, and snowmo- 
biling. 

Timber 

1. 

2 

3. 

4. 

Plan no scheduled timber harvest 

Harvest only dead or high nsk trees Har- 
vest timber only if needed to maintain or  
enhance sem-pnmitive recreational values 
(for example. to allow trail construction) 

Use low-impact loggmg methods. Construct 
only temporary roads and obliterate them 
immediately following any project 

Use the “limited timber management” prac- 
tice (see Appendix E) only in response to 
catastrophic occurrences, such as mldfire or 
insect epidemc 

Visual Resources 

1. 

2 

Meet or exceed a vlsual quality objective of 
Retention to enhance or  protect the sem- 
pnmitive landscape. Apply the guidelines 
for Retention listed in the Viewmimber Pre- 
scnption, Visual Resources section. 

Rehabilitate areas where the visual quality 
objective of Retention is not currently met 

Wildlife 

1 

2. 

3 

4 

Provlde “high” habitat capability for harvest 
species and other species that have a rela- 
tively low tolerance to  human activlty. 

Let natural vegetative succession occur un- 
less specific vegetation treatments are nec- 
essary to meet fish and wildlife objectives 

When treating vegetation in non-forest ar- 
eas, favor the use of prescribed fire 

Where water is desired, but not available, 
develop it if feasible 
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5 Provide at  least the following densities of 
down logs by vegetation type on lands com- 
pnsed of 50 to 200 acres 

Density 
Vegetation Type (logslacre) 

Eastside pine 4 
Mixed conifer, lodgepole pine 8 
True fir, mountain hemlock 10 

6 In unmanaged stands, accept naturally oc- 
curnng densities of down logs 

For purposes of number 1 above, consider a 
log to be a t  least 15 feet long with a large-end 
diameter of at  least 20 inches Count short 
log segments greater than 20 inches in 
diameter in proportion to  their length 

7 

8 Maintain habitat capability for late succes- 
sional species by maintaining the following 
snag guidelines on land units comprised of 
50 to 200 acres each 

Snag DBH 
High Habitat 
Capability 
(required) Average Density 

24" > 51acre 

>15" - 2 4  >3/acre 

Total >3 5facre 

9 Accept naturally occurring snag densities 
until high habitat capability requirements 
are met 
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R4NGE PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescnption is to provlde 
rangelands that are managed to  meet vegetative 
management objectives, desirable wildlife habi- 
tat, clean water, healthy nparian ecosystems, 
stable soils and forage for domestic livestock 
The goal is to maintain rangeland condition at  or  
above satisfactory levels, with stable or upward 
trends Rangeland condition is to  be maintained 
or enhanced through forage improvements, hve- 
stock management and coordination with other 
resource uses Investment in range improve- 
ments wdl be moderate t o  high No timber 
harvest will be scheduled under this prescrip- 
tion 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Visual Resource Management 

Maintenance 

Permitted: 
Facility ConstructionReconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Minerals Management 
Interpretwe Facilities and Serwces 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Limited Timber Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescription applies t o  lands that are not 
suitable for commercial timber production, but 
are sultable for domestic livestock grazing 
Mappable application areas are marked “R” on 
the Management Area maps 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Fire and Fuels 

1 Suppress wildfire that threatens livestock, 
range improvements, or long-term soil pro- 
ductivity or forage production 

Use prescribed fire to increase the amount of 
palatable forage 

Where recommended, exclude grazing by do- 
mestic livestock for at  least 2 years on peren- 
nial grass range following burning to  allow 
for re-establishment of desirable forage spe- 
cies 

Range 

2 

3 

Develop, update, and implement allotment 
management plans utilizing the interdisci- 
plinary team approach to  provide for satis- 
factory ecological range conditions with 
stable or upward trends 

Through allotment management plans, pro- 
vide suitable habitat for emphasis wildlife 
species listed in the Management Area direc- 
tion 

Refer t o  Forest Standards and Guidelines for 
more specific direction regardingrange man- 
agement in these areas 
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Recreation 

1. Manage recreation according to the specified 
Recreation Opportunity Spectrum class 
which is primanly Roaded Natural (see For- 
est Standards and Guidelines) 

Timber 

1 Harvest timber only to  support the range or 
range-associated resource 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet the visual quality objectives as shown 
on theAdoptedVisua1 Quality Objective Map 

Invisually sensitive areas, design structural 
improvements t o  minimize contrast mth the 
surrounding landscape 

2 

Water and Riparian 

I See the Range, and Water and Riparian 
Areas Standards and Guidelines for detailed 
npanan zone management standards 

Wildlife 

1 Allotment management practices w111 pro- 
vide sufficient quantities of suitable forage 
species for mldhfe needs 
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SPECIAL AREAS PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescnption is to  preserve 
areas with unusual historical, geoloecal, botani- 
cal, zoologxal, paleontologxal, or other special 
charactenstics for public enjoyment or research 
Expenmental Forests, Research Natural Areas 
(RNA’s), Special Interest Areas (SIA’s), and 
Wild and Scenic Rivers are included. These 
areas a re  managed primarily to produce benefits 
other than timber, range, forage, minerals, and 
other commodities Timber harvest will not be 
scheduled under this prescnption. 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

For Research Natural Areas 

Emphasized: 
Fire Management 
Visual Resource Management 

Permitted: 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 

For all other types of special areas, the above 
Emphasized and Permitted Practices apply, as 
well as the follomng: 

Permitted: 
Facility ConstructionfReconstruction 
Interpretive Facilities and Services 
Road Maintenance 
Minerals Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Limited l lmber Management 
Modified Timber Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Maintenance 

and  Endangered Species 

Species 

Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 
Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies to any area designated 
or recommended for special classification, except 
wlderness It applies to the Blacks Mountain 
and Swain Mountain Expenmental Forests, the 
Blacks Mountain and Cub Creek RNA’s; the 
Green Island Lake, Indian Creek, Soda Ridge, 
mmbered Crater, Mayfield and Graham Pinery 
candidate RNA’s; the established Black Rock, 
Crater Lake, Deep Hole, Homermeerheart. Mont- 
gomery Creek Grove, Murken, and Willow Lake 
Bog Special Interest Areas, the proposed Ante- 
lope Creek, Deer Creek, and Mill Creek Wild and 
Scenic Rwers Areas are marked “S” on the 
Management Area maps 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Management specific t o  each area is descnbed in 
the Management Area direction The follomng 
standards and guidelines apply to  all of the 
areas 

General 

1. Unless specified otherwise in the Manage- 
ment Area direction, mthin the planning 
penod develop a plan for managmg each 
special area, conforming to the follomng 
drection and to the applicable Management 
Area direction. 

Fire and Fuels 

1 Use suppression methods that minimize or 
avoid mechanical disturbance of special ar- 
eas or that are compatible m t h  research 
projects in Expenmental Forests 
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2. With the exception of Experimental Forests, 
avoid use of fire retardant chemicals unless 
they are necessary to protect life, property, 
and research values, or unless otherwise 
specified and justified in the area manage- 
ment plan 

3. In Expenmental Forests, conduct only those 
prescnbed burning and fire hazard reduc- 
tion projects specified in adopted research 
plans 

Minerals 

1 Upon classification of a new special area by 
the Chief or Reaonal Forester, recommend 
its withdrawal from mineral entry and/or 
mineral leasing if necessary to protect the 
values for which the area was designated 

Recreation 

1. Manage recreation according to the desig- 
nated Recreation Opportunity Spectrum 
classes (see Forest Standards and Guide- 
h e s )  

2. Prohibit motorized vehicles within Research 
Natural Areas 

Special Areas 

1. Continue to implement the long-range plan 
for the Black's Mountain Expenmental For- 
est (1980) and Swain Mountain Experimen- 
tal Forest. 

Continue to comply with the provisions of 
Establishment Reports forthe Blacks Moun- 
tain and Cub Creek Research Natural Areas 
(RNA's) Prepare or review draft Estabhsh- 
ment Records and Designation Orders for 
recommended RNA's, and comply with the 
Designation Order upon establishment of 
each RNA by the Chief of the Forest Service 

3. Protect each recommended RNA as if it were 
an approved RNA until completion of Estab- 
lishment Records and final decision by the 
Chief of the Forest Service 

2 

Timber 

1 In Research Natural Areas, allow no timber 
harvesting 

2 In a Special Interest Area, harvest timber 
only if it would not detract from the natural 
values for which the area was designated 
and only after preparation of an area plan 
that authorizes such harvest 

In a proposed Wild and Scenic River corridor, 
harvest timber only in compliance with the 
Wild and Scenic Rivers Act, the estabhsh- 
ment act for recommended nvers, and the 
management plans for designatedrirers (See 
FEIS Table E-17 for further guidelines on 
appropnate activlties.) 

In Expenmental Forests, harvest timber in 
compliance mth management plans for these 
areas 

3 

4 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet the follomng visual quality objectives 

a. Research Natural Areas: Preserva- 
tion 

Proposed Wild and Scenic Rivers, 

1 Wild Segment: Preservation 
2 Scenic Segment: Retention 
3 Recreation Segment Partial Re- 

h 

tention 

c Special Interest Areas. As shown on 
the Adopted Visual Quality Objective 
Map. 

d. Experimental Forests As shown on 
the Adopted Visual Quality Objectives 
Map 

Wild and Scenic Rivers 

1. Allow public recreation and other resource 
use activlty based on the recommended cat- 
egory of each nver segment. 

2. Do not expand developed recreation site ca- 
pacity or existing access until river plans are 
adopted 

3. Permit resource uses that are compatible 
m t h  the nver's outstandingly remarkable 
values. 
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4 Prepare and implement a Wild and Scenic 
River plan (including final segment classifi- 
cations and boundary descnptions) for each 
river within one year of designation by Con- 
gress. 

Until action by Congress and implementa- 
tion of a nver management plan, administer 
nver segments commensurate with their 
proposed wld, scenic, or  recreational classi- 
fication. 

a 

5 

Allow no degradation of free-flowing 
condition, outstandingly remarkable 
values or qualifylng features for the 
proposed classification 

To the extent of Forest Service author- 
ity, permit no development of hydro- 
electric power facilities 

b 

c. Manage segments in accordance with 
the direction in theUSDA-USDI Gude- 
lines for Ehg.lbility, Classification, and 
Management of River Areas (1982); 
and Forest Servlce Handbook 1909 12, 
section 8 12 and 8 2 (This direction is 
summanzed in FEISAppendixE, Table 
E-17 ) 

6 Within designated wilderness, manage Wild 
and Scenic Rivers in accordance with the 
above guidelines or the applicable wilder- 
ness implementation plan, whichever is more 
restnctive 
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m 
‘1 ’ TIMBER PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

This prescnption emphasizes wood production 
and utilization while maintainingother resource 
values Timber harvesting is scheduled under 
this prescnption. Investments mll be made in 
road construction, fuels management, reforesta- 
tion, vegetative management, and timber stand 
improvement Vegetative management may in- 
clude biologcal, chemical, mechanical, and/or 
hand treatment methods Timber management 
practices must be compatible with Forest Stan- 
dards and Guidelines, Management Area direc- 
tion, and the provlsions of this prescnption 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Facility Constructiofleconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Full Timber Management 

Permitted: 
Road Closure 
Road Obliteration 
Minerals Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Visual Resource Management 
Interpretive Fachties and Servlces 
Restncted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Modified Timber Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Speclal Habitats 

Maintenance 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies t o  lands that are suit- 
able for full timber management (see Appendix 
E). It does not apply to  rocky, unplantable land 
or to eastside pine stands that are poorly stocked 
due to envlronmental conditions Mappable ap- 
plication areas are marked “T” on the Manage- 
ment Area maps. 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Fire and Fuels 

1 

Forest Health 

1. Tocontrolgophers thatdamage timbercrops, 
use direct methods such as trapping and 
poisoning, and indirect methods of habitat 
modification 

Use prescribed fire for silvicultural purposes 

Range 

1. Manage livestockgrazingwithin plantations 
as  needed to prevent unacceptable damage 
to seedlings. 

2. Implement range management techniques 
to utilize transitory range while protecting 
tree seedlings 

Timber 

1. Develop sale area improvement plans to pro- 
duce timber and improve range, wildlife, 
recreation, soil, and water resources. 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet vlsual quality objectives of a t  least 
Modification and Maximum Modification, as 
specified on the Adopted Visual Quality Ob- 
jective Map 
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2. Apply these guidelines to meet the msual 
quality objective of Modification 

a. Management activities may dominate 
the charactenstic landscape 

vegetative alterations will be wlthin 
the scale of the surrounding area or 
charactenstic landscape 

Vegetation alterations wlll borrow from 
natural form, line, color, or texture so 
completely that it resembles the sur- 
rounding area or charactenstic land- 
scape 

Design openings to  avoid strmght, geo- 
metric lines and to borrow form and 
size from natural openings 

b 

e. 

d. 

e. Avoid disruptionofthe continuous sky- 
line 

3 Apply these guidelines to meet the msual 
quality objective of Maximum Modification 

a Management actimties may domnate 
the charactenstic landscape 

b. 

C. 

d 

e 

Vegetative alterations may be out of 
scale with their surrounding natural 
landscape when viewed as foreground 
or middleground 

Vegetative alterations may not com- 
pletely borrow from natural form line, 
color, or texture when mewed as fore- 
ground or middleground. However, 
when mewed as background they must 
resemble the surrounding area or char- 
actenstic landscape 

Design openings to avoid straight geo- 
metric lines and shapes 

Avoid disruption ofthe continuous sky- 
line. 

Wildlife 

1 Provlde at least “medium” sutable habitat 
as identified in the Habitat Capability Mod- 
els for emphasized wildlife species listed in 
the Management Area direction 
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v VIEW/TIMBER PRESCRLPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescription is to provide 
scheduled timber harvests while maintaining 
and enhancing scenic qualities in areas that are 
visually sensitive or have high scenic value 
Highway or trail corridor plans or  special vegeta- 
tive management plans may need to  be devel- 
oped to implement this prescription Timber 
management and transportation development 
meeting the adopted visual quality objectives 
are permitted The vlsual quality objectives are 
Retention and Partial Retention (distnbuted as 
shown on the Adopted Visual Quality Objective 
Map) 

E. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Road Obliteration 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Visual Resource Management 
Interpretive Facilities and Semces 
Limited nmber Management 
Modified Timber Management 

Permitted: 
Facility Constructiofleconstruction 
Road Maintenance 
Road Closure 
Minerals Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Restricted Off-Highway Vehicle Use 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Maintenance 

and Endangered Species 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies to suitable timberlands 
in areas seen from high-use roads, trails, lakes, 
developed recreation sites, and communities It 
also applies to areas of exceptional scenic qual- 
ity Mappable application areas are marked “V” 
on the Management Area maps 

D. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Range 

1 To the extent possible, build fences and other 
range structural improvements with natu- 
ral-appearing materials 

2. Prevent livestock concentration around de- 
veloped recreation sites 

Recreation 

1 Manage recreation according to  the Recre- 
ation Opportunity Spectrum (ROS) class of 
Roaded Natural or  Rural (see Forest Stan- 
dards and Guidelines). 

Timber 

1 Along major highway corndors (State High- 
ways 89, 299, 44, 32, and 36), use the full 
range of silvicultural practices if the visual 
quality objective of Retention or Partial Re- 
tention can be met 

Visual Resources 

1 Within the planning period, develop corndor 
plans that identify key visual elements of 
Sensitivity Level 1 vlewsheds and define 
desirable long-term landscape character to 
guide project planning Where recommended 
in the Plan, include retention of trees over 
30” diameter in foreground areas for their 
attractive old growth Characteristics 

~~ -~ 
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2 Retention in the Foreground - Apply these 
guidelines to meet a nsual quality objective 
of Retention in the foreground as viewed 
from designated Sensitivlty Level 1 roads, 
trails, streams, lakes and other recreation 
use areas 

a Manage vegetation to maintain or in- 
crease the diversity oftree, shrub, forb 
and/or grass species common to the 
area Manage timber stands to achieve 
a range of age and size classes up to 48” 
dbhinmulti-storied stands Treespac- 
mg should be irregular to retain the 
appearance of unmanaged timber 
stands 

Emphasize the Limited Timber Man- 
agement practice (Appendix E), using 
uneven-aged silvicultural methods 
(group and indimdual tree selection) 
for sanitation or  salvage of high nsk 
trees 

Apply the Modified Timber Manage- 
ment practice (Appendix E) where ap- 
propriate to enhance or maintain vi- 
sual quality or vegetative diversity 

Treat slash to restore aesthetic values 
within one year of project completion 
Require slash cleanup of up to 100 
percent Examples of the expected 
cleanup level are in “Photo Senes For 
Quantifying Forest Residues in the 
Sierra Mixed Conifer Type and Sierra 
True Fir Type” (PNW-95,1979), Pho- 
tos l-MC-CPC, 1-MC-3-PC, 3-MC-3- 
PC, 4-MC-3-PC, and 6-MC-3-PC Treat 
slash in visible areas up to  400 feet or 
wthin view, whichever is less, along 
Sensitinty Level 1 roads and trails 
Treat slash up to 150 feet or  within 
new, whichever is less, along Sensi- 
tivity Level 2 roads and trails. 

Assure that buildings and structures 
meet a vlsual quality objective of Re- 
tention as seenfrom public travel routes 
or  recreation use areas, except those 
constructed for public use and situated 
in the foreground 

h. 

c 

d. 

e 

3 Retention in the Mtddleground - Apply these 
guidelines to meet a visual quality objective 
of Retention in the middleground when 
viewed from designated Sensitivity Level 1 
roads, trails, streams, lakes and other recre- 
ation use areas 

Manage vegetation to provide diverse, 
natural-appearinglandscapes Retain 
the appearance of continuous forest 
cover in timber stands 

Apply the Limited Timber Manage- 
ment practice (Appendix E), using un- 
even-aged silmcultural methods 

Apply the Modified Timber Manage- 
ment practice (Appendix E) where ap- 
propnate to enhance or maintain n- 
sua1 quality or vegetative diversity 

Treat slash to restore aesthetic values 
within one year of project completion 

4 Partial Retentaon in the Foreground - Apply 
these guidelines to meet a nsual quality 
objective of Partial Retention in the fore- 
ground as mewed from designated Sensitiv- 
ity Level 1 and 2 roads, trails, streams, lakes, 
and other recreation use areas 

a Manage vegetation to maintain the 
diversity of tree, shrub, forb and/or 
grass species common to  the area 
Manage timber stands to achieve a 
range of age and size classes up to  36”+ 
dbhmmulti-storiedstands Tree spac- 
ing should be irregular t o  retain the 
appearance of unmanaged timber 
stands 

Treat slash to restore aesthetic values 
within one year of project completion 
Examples ofthe expected cleanup level 
are in the “Photo Series for Quantify- 
ing Forest Residues in the SierraMixed 
Conifer Type and SierraTrueFirType” 
(PNW-95, 1979), Photos 1-MC-4-RC, 

7-MC-4-PC, 7-MC-3-PC, 2-TF-4-RC, 
and 4-TF-4-RC 

b 

2-MC-4-PC, 5-MC-4-PC, 7-MC-4-PC, 
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c. Apply the Modified Timber Manage- 
mentpractice (Appendix E), usingboth 
even-aged and uneven-aged silvicul- 
tural methods. 

Design harvest units to have natural- 
appearmg, irregular shapes and edges, 
such as those found in the natural 
landscape 

d 

5 Partial Retentton in the Middleground- Ap- 
ply these guidehnes to meet a visual quality 
objective of Partial Retention in the middle- 
ground as mewed from designated Sensitiv- 
ity Level 1 and 2 roads, trails, streams, lakes 
and other recreation use areas. 

a Manage timber stands to provlde a 
range of age and size classes over time 
using Modified !hmber Management 
practices. Retain the appearance of 
irregular, naturally shaped openings 
in the forest cover. 

Design and construct roads so that 
they are visually subordinate to the 
natural landscape character 

The effects of management activities 
may be noticeable, but should not at- 
tract attention. The cumulative ef- 
fects of openings should remain vlsu- 
ally subordinate to the characteristic 
landscape 

Treat slash to restore aesthetic values 
within one year of project completion. 

b. 

c 

d 

Wildlife 

1. Promde at  least “medium” suitable habitat 
as identified in the Habitat Capability Mod- 
els for emphasized wildlife species listed in 
the Management Area direction. 
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w WILDERNESS PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE D. STANDARDSAND 

The purpose of this prescnption is to protect 
natural landscapes, plant and animal communi- 
ties, and natural biologxcal processes, and to 

GUIDELINES 

a n e r a z  
facilitate compatible public use in designated or 
recommended wildernesses. 

Revise the Caribou and Lakes 
Wilderness Management Plans as needed 

The prescription specifies management direc- 
tion in accordance mth the Wilderness Act of 
1964, assunng no permanent or long-lasting 
evldence of human use. Motorized and mecha- 
nized equipment is prohibited No timber har- 
vest is allowed In each wilderness, the provi- 
sions of this prescription will be implemented 
through a specific mlderness implementation 
plan. 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
Fire Management 
Visual Resource Management 

Permitted: 
Facility ConstructionlReconstruction 
Fuels Management 
Road Obliteration 
Range Administration and Management 
Range Structural Improvement and 

Range Nonstructural Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

Maintenance 

and Endangered Species 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescription applies to designated wilder- 
nesses and areas recommended for mldemess 
designation in this Plan, as shown on the Man- 
agement Area maps These areas include the 
Caribou, Ishi, andThousand Lakes Wildernesses 
and the proposed Heart Lake, Trail Lake B, Mill 
Creek, and Wild Cattle Mountain Wildernesses 

for conformance with this prescription and 
Management Area direction Implement the 
1989 Ishi Wilderness Implementation Plan; 
prepare a supplement for management of 
grazing and inholder access Prepare wilder- 
ness implementation plans for new areas 
subsequently designated by Congress. 

2. Determine the Limits ofAcceptable Change 
(see Glossary) for each wilderness and incor- 
porate into mlderness implementation plans. 

Prohbit motorized vehicles except where 
authonzed for emergencies or for other pur- 
poses, based on environmental analysis. 

3 

Air Quality 

1. Develop Air Quality Related Values for each 
Class I area within the planning penod. 

2. Monitorhr Quality Related Values to evalu- 
ate changes compared to limits of acceptable 
change in each Class I wilderness (Canbou 
and Thousand Lakes) 

Energy 

1 Do not p e a t  hydroelectric development in 
recommended Wilderness. 

Facilities 

1 Permit natural-appearing structural im- 
provements (such as plank treads or trails) 
so as to insure protection of the wilderness 
resource. Construct these only to the stan- 
dard necessary to accommodate anticipated 
use 

4-76 Chapter 4-Management Direction 



2 Provide rustic directional signs and inter- 
pretive signs at trailheads to facilitate use in 
designated or recommended wilderness 

Construct or reconstruct those trails speci- 
fied in the mlderness implementation plans 

Conduct regular trail maintenance to keep 
trails in a stable or improving condition 

Allow non-motorized, mechanized access for 
users with medically approved appliances 

3 

4 

5 

Fire and Fuels 

1 Until approval of mlderness fire manage- 
ment plans, use "Contain" and/or "Control" 
strategies for all mlderness fires. 

Favor indirect attack by using natural barri- 
ers and low-impact suppression techniques 
Use direct attack only when necessary to 
protect life and property in adjoining areas 

2 

3 Permit scientific studies that do not compro- 
mise wilderness values or expenences. 

Forest Health 

1. With Reaonal Forester approval, use mea- 
sures to control insects and plant diseases 
whennecessary toprevent(a)unnaturalloss 
ofthemldemessresource due toexoticpests, 
and (b) unacceptable damage to resources on 
adjacent lands 

Dunng any control activities, use measures 
that have the least adverse impact on the 
wilderness resource and are compatible mth 
the Wilderness Act and management policy 
herein 

2 

Lands 

1 Require access into private inholdings to 
minimize impacts to mlderness character 

Minerals 
3 Use existing trails, natural barners, and 

water in preference to constructedhandllnes 1 M~~~~~~~ on the charac- 
ter dunng the exercise of valid exi~t ing min- 

4 Prohibit construction of helispots eral nehts (Subiect to valid rights then 
existing, effective January 1, 1984, wlder- 
ness areas are withdrawn from all forms of 
appropnation under the mining laws and 
from disposition under all laws pertaining to  

5 Avoid use of fire retardant chemicals unless 
necessary to protect life, property, and ad- 
Joining land 

mineralleasing ) 
6 Use bulldozers for fire suppression only with 

Reponal Forester approval Range 

1 Confine grazing to areas presently used, and 
manage livestock to  prevent damage to  

7 Locate fire camps, stagmg areas, and other 
facilities outside of Wilderness 

- - 
streamside areas, lakeshores, meadows, and 
wilderness charactenstics in general 8. Use prescribed fire in accordance with ap- 

proved wilderness fire management plans 

Fish 2 Prohibit new structures such as corrals, 
fences, or water developments, unless es- 
sential to control existing livestock use 

1 Consistent with natural selection and sur- 
w a l ,  protect fisheries from hu"-caused 
conditions that could lead to species listing 
as Threatened or Endangered (e g spring- 
run chinook salmon) current levels 

Permit aerial fish stocking of lakes and 
streams where such practices are desirable 

3 phase out all range improvements not essen- 
tial to maintaining existing livestock use, 
and maintain essential improvements at 

2 
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Recreation 2 Restnct predator control activities unless 
specifically needed to protect Threatened 

Manage each wilderness to provlde primi- andEndangered species, protect public health 
tive recreation opportunities consistent w t h  and safety, or prevent senous losses of do- 
natural processes, pnmitive conditions, and mestic livestock Obtain Reglonal Forester 
solitude approval for each proposed action 

Limit the amount of on.slte regimentation, 3. Permit scientific studies that do not compro- 
such as signs, barners, or fences mise mlderness values or experiences 

Restore areas damaged by human use to the 
natural condition, as identified in approved 
wlderness implementation plans 

Where terrain permits, prohibit recreational 
stock animals within 200 feet of lakeshores 
and streambanks, except for watenng and 
stream crossing. 

Inform vlsitors about rules and regulations, 
minimum impact camping, and alternative 
areas to disperse use 

Assess capacity, monitor use, and imple- 
ment use-management measures, including 
a quota permit system if necessary, t o  keep 
wilderness conditions within the established 
Limits of Acceptable Change 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet a visual quality objective of Preserva- 
tion. 

Where occupancy for other resource use is 
specifically authonzed by legdation, require 
a visual quality objective of Retention to be 
met. 

2 

Wildlife 

1 Protect Threatened, Endangered and Sensi- 
tive species and their habitats Implement 
recovery plans as directed by the U S Fish 
and Wildlife Service for Threatened and 
Endangered species 
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MINIMAL MANAGElMENT PRESCRIPTION 

A. PURPOSE 

The purpose of this prescnption is to protect and 
mamtain emstmg charactenstics of certain lands 
through low intensity management ‘hmber 
harvest will not be scheduled under the prescnp- 
tion 

B. MANAGEMENT PRACTICES 

Emphasized: 
None 

Permitted: 
Fuels Management 
Fire Management 
Minerals Management 
Range Administration and Management 
Limited Timber Management 
Visual Resource Management 
Watershed Restoration and Improvement 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Threatened 

and Endangered Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Harvest 

Species 
Wildlife Habitat Management - Other 

Management Indicator Species and 
Special Habitats 

Fish Habitat Management 

C. APPLICATION AREAS 

This prescnption applies to certain non-forested 
lands and non-productive forested lands, and to 
that part of Butt Mountain studied for possible 
slu development Mappable application areas 
are marked “Z” on the Management Area maps. 

D. STANDARDS & GUIDELINES 

Range 

1. Maintaln the active allotments Do not re- 
initiate use of vacant allotments or create 
new allotments 

Timber 

1 Allow harvest of timber, fuelwood, or other 
products only if 

(a) 

(b) 

(C) 

long-term forest growth can be main- 
tained, 
soil and geoloec instability will not be 
aggravated, 
catastrophic damage such as wldfire, 
insect epidemic or disease epidenuc 
has occurred. 
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G. MANAGEMENTAREA 
DIRECTION 

INTRODUCTION 

A Management Area is a contiguous unit of land 
of manageable proportions, often a tributary 
watershed Each area averages 25,000 acres of 
National Forest land, often intermingled with 
pnvate lands The following descnptions and 
management direction apply only to the Na- 
tional Forest land, not to private land or other 
pubhc agency land The Lassen National Forest 
has been divided into 48 Management Areas, 
which are  aggregations of the pre-emsting tim- 
ber compartments Although based somewhat 
on administrative units, Management Areas of- 
ten have relatively homogeneous physical and 
bioloBca1 charactenstics, and similar issues and 
concerns. Management Areas by Ranger Dis- 
trict are shown in Table 4-4 

Each Management Area will be managed in 
conformance mth the Forest Goals stated in 
Section C. Forest Standards and Guidehnes 
gwen in Section E are applicable wherever rel- 
evant. The direction given in this section con- 
forms to the Forest Goals and supplements the 
Forest Standards and Gmdelines to reflect the 
unique character of each Management Area 

The management direction for each Manage- 
ment Area includes 

Management  Area Map Shows the Manage- 
ment Area boundary and the location mthin the 
Forest, general geographic features, public and 
private land, the road system, and developed 
recreation sites The red lines and letters over- 
lying the basic map information show the pre- 
scription allocations 

Due to  the map scale, the boundaries of the 
prescription allocations are not meant t o  be pre- 
cise Some boundanes were formally estab- 
lished by Congress or by previous Forest Service 
action (for example wilderness, experimental 
forests) Some boundanes are easily located on 
the ground, (for example campgrounds, edges of 
meadows), but other boundaries are purposely 
generalized boundaries (for example rangel 
wildlife and minimal management prescnption 
boundaries) These generalized boundaries will 

insure that while identified values are protected, 
the boundanes can be adjusted somewhat in the 
future as detailed project planning results in 
better information 

Also due to map scale, some small areas of pre- 
scnption allocations are not shown, but the allo- 
cations based on the defined “Application Area” 
gwen for each prescription in Section F still 
apply For example, some areas shown as the 
Rocky/Sparse Prescnption (K) actually contam 
small patches ofthe Timber Prescnption (TI, and 
wce-versa Application areas for the G Prescnp- 
tion (eagle and goshawk habitat, old growth 
retention areas) and the L Prescnption (marten 
and fisher habitat) are not shown pending field 
verificationoftentatively identified areas Habi- 
tat management area boundanes for marten, 
fisher, and goshawks mll be confirmed by De- 
cember 1992. Old growth stands w11 be selected 
as projects are proposed 

A. Description Descnbes the location, size, 
prominent features, terrain, watershed, soils, 
vegetation, wildlife, fire history, cultural re- 
sources, recreation facilities or  use, range and 
timber production, mming, and other uses Acre- 
ages gwen are those within the Forest boundary 
only 

Fuel loads are described by adjectives defined in 
the table below The fuels include only material 
that is both dead and down, not live or standing 

Adiective Wet Tons/Acre 

Light 
Moderate 
Heavy 
Extreme 

0 - 10 
11 - 30 
31 - 90 

91+ 

B. Standards and Guidelines Lists manage- 
ment direction unique to eachManagement Area, 
supplementing Forest Standards and Guidelines 
and Management Prescnptions 

C. Prescription Allocation Lists the acreage 
of the area allocated to each Management Pre- 
scription The acres, like the boundary lines, are 
not meant to be exact, but are approxlmations in 
most cases Agam, not all acres are &splayed on 
the Management Area maps due to  their small 
size G and L Prescnption acres wll be adjusted 
after final selection of habitat areas 
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D. Wildlife Habitat Allocations Lists the 
wildlife species that are to  be emphasized in each 
Management Area The number of suitable ter- 
ritories to be provided in each Area are identified 
for six Threatened or  Endangered, and Sensitive 
species: bald eagle, peregrine falcon, spotted owl, 
goshawk, marten and fisher These numbers are 
disaggregations of the Forest objectives adopted 
to achieve and maintain vlable populations Other 
management indicator species and additional 
important species to be emphasized in the area 
are also listed Although management actions 
may be taken to benefit species not mentioned, 
those species listed will receive the highest pnor- 
ity in developing habitat management and pro- 
tection objectives dunng project planning Spe- 
cific objectives for projects will be developed from 
habitat capability models (Shimamoto and Arola 
1981) in Appendix 0 

E. Desired State for Diversity Lists mini- 
mum acreages of each seral stage for the area’s 
major vegetation types-the lower limits of de- 
sirable vegetative diversity (see Forest Stan- 
dards and Guidelines for ‘‘Vegetation and Diver- 
sity” and Appendix U in this Plan) 

F. Range Allotment Strategies States the 
management strategy adopted for each range 
allotment, based on the following system 

A No Lauestock - Management excludes live- 
stock 
B Some Lavestock - Structural and non- 
structural range improvements are mini- 
mized Vegetative management ObjectiVeS 
are achieved through nding, herding, and 
salting 
C Extensive Management - Management 
objective is distnbution of livestock use over 
rangelands to meet rangeland management 
objectives using cost-effective structural im- 
provements 
D Intensive Management - Grazing sys- 
tems, and structural and non-structural im- 
provements are designed and implemented 
to mammize forage production and distribu- 
tion of livestock while achieving rangeland 
management objectives. 

The percent shown next t o  some allotments indi- 
cates the amount of the allotment that falls 
within the management area 

Table 4-4 
Management Areas By Ranger District 

Almanor 
Management Areas 

20 Caribou 
22 Swain 
26 Mineral 
27 Upper Mill Creek 
28 Feather River 
29 Benner 
30 Bailey Creek 
34 Antelope Creek 
35 Turner 
36 Upper Deer Creek 
37 ButtCreek 
38 Prattvillle 
40 Lower Mill Creek 
41 Middle Deer Creek 
42 Lower Deer Creek 
43 Lomo 
44 Jonesville 
45 SodaRidge 
46 Philbrook 
47 Mt.Hope 

Hat Creek 
Management Areas 

1 Wiley 
2 Britton 
3 Burney 
4 HatCreek 
5 Ladder 
6 Black Jack 
8 Snow Mounntain 
9 Logan 
10 Summit 
15 Thousand Lakes 
16 Red 
17 LostCreek 

Eagle Lake 
Management Areas 

7 Gooeh 
11 Ebey 
12 Harvey 
13 Ashurst 
14 Eagle 
18 Grays 
19 Crater 
21 Cone 
23 Campbell 
24 McCoy 
25 Hog 
31 Hamilton 
32 Willard 
33 Diamond 
39 Keddie 

48 Ishi 
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Figure 4-3 
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Swain. ........ ...... ..... .............................. 171 
Campbell . . . .  . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  ........................ 175 
McCoy . . . . . . . . . .  ... . 1. t. ... .. .................. 179 
Hog .... . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  .183 
Mineral . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  ........... ................... 187 
Upper Mill Creek. ..... . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  191 
Feather River ................... ................................. 195 
Benner ..... . . . . . . . . .  .... .... ......................... 199 
Bailey Creek. ... . . . . . . . . . .  ................................ 203 
Hamilton .. ................................ .................... 207 
Willard ........ ..... .................................................. 211 
Diamond .......................................................... 215 
Antelope Creek ... . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  219 
Turner ............. .... ..... ...... ......................... 223 
UpperDeerCreek . . . .  . . . . . .  . . . . . . . . . . . .  . . . . . . .  227 
Butt Creek . . . . . .  . . .  ........................... ..231 
Prattvllle . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  .......... 235 
Keddie. .... ...................................... ... ...... 239 
Lower Mill Creek . . . . . .  .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  243 
Mlddle Deer Creek . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  ....................... .247 
Lower Deer Crek ........... ............................... 251 
Lomo ........................................................ 255 
Jonesvllle . . . . . . . . .  . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . . . . . . . . .  259 
Soda Ridge . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . . . . . . . . . . . .  263 
Philbrook . . . . . . . .  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  ...... 267 

. . . . . . . . . . . .  . . .  ..... ... 271 Mt Hope. . . . . . . . . . .  
Ishi. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . .  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  275 

~~ ~ 
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Management Area 

k Q WILEY 
Scale 

0- Miles 3\8" = 1 Mile 
January 1992 



A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Wiley Management Area consists 
of a large block of Shasta National Forest land, 
and a few blocks of Modoc National Forest land, 
all administered by the Lassen National Forest. 
The land is north of Fall River Valley and borders 
the McCloud Ranger District of the Shasta-Tnn- 
ity National Forest The dominant features are 
the Big Valley Mountam range, the Whitehorse 
Mountains, and a large lava flow ongmating in 
the Medicine Lake area to the north Ownership 
patterns are complex The lava flow is mainly on 
public land, but the mountainous uplands are in 
approximately one-half pnvate and one-half 
public ownership. The pnvate land on the Day 
Bench has been subdmded into numerous small 
ownerships with many new residences. 

Physical Environment The recent volcanic 
terrain has no perennial streams, but under- 
ground nvers feed large spnngs in Fall River 
Valley. Elevations range from 3,320 feet east of 
Big Lake to  5,669 feet on Indian Springs Moun- 
tain The mountains are fairly steep mth many 
slopes of 50 percent and some up to 70 percent. 
Precipitation ranges from 20 to 30 inches The 
ground surface is primarily a mxture of recent 
lava flows, mth  little or no soil development, and 
older uplifted basalt formations The most pro- 
ductive sites are soil accumulations at  the base of 
the slopes 

BiologicaI Environment Plant communities 
range from Westside foothill and Great Basin 
brushlands toblackoaks and mixed conifer stands 
at higher elevations. Fuel loads range from 
moderate to heavy with greatest concentrations 
in the logged areas Most ofthe loggmg slash has 
been treated Major fires have burned at  the rate 
of one per decade In 1977, three major fires 

burned simultaneously in and around the area 
(12,000 acres in the management area, 198,000 
acres on adjacent lands) The lower elevations, 
especially the Day Bench area, are very impor- 
tant mule deer winter ranges This habitat use 
conflicts with much of the proposed subdivlsion 
development of the pnvate lands Other than 
mule deer, emphasis species are bald eagles, 
goshawks, gray squirrels, and hairy woodpeck- 
ers Prehistoncal and historical resources are 
mainly confined to sites on pnvate land and 
around springs Several Sensitive plant species 
are known to occur in the area 

Management Timber harvesting on the public 
land began in the late 1920's and has increased 
from a lull in the 1950's and 1960's t o  two large 
sales in the 1980's Proposed sales around Wiley 
Ranch may complete the transportation system 
The area's firewood is very much in demand from 
communities in Fall River Valley, and the wood- 
cutting area continues to  expand toward the 
north Grazing has declined from a peak level in 
the early 1900's. Today three ranching opera- 
tions depend on the area for spring and early 
summer grazing The Wiley Ranch itself is 
under intensive range management. Once a 
homestead, it was acquired by the Forest Service 
m the 1940's Considerable dispersed camping, 
especially dunng hunting season, occurs in the 
area. 

Facilities Primary access is provided ma the 
McNab Road from Pondosa and the Timbered 
Crater Road from the Fall River Valley Portions 
of the area have geothermal lease apphcations 
and other portions have oil and gas lease appli- 
cations To date, no leases have been issued 
Several hot springs occur on private land 
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Special Areas Two recommended Research 
Natural Areas are in the management area: 
Timbered Crater (1,777 acres), representing 
Modoc Cypress and Northern Basalt Flow Ver- 
nal Pools, and Mayfield (980 acres), representing 
the knobcone pine vegetation type. 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Firewood 

1 Give personal use of firewood prionty over 
commercial use 

Lands 

1 Acquire wnter  range and Threatened and 
Endangered species habitat through land 
exchange 

Deny special use pernnts that conflict mth 
deer winter range 

2 

Minerals 

1. Consider effect on the Day deer herd during 
planning of geothermal projects 

Sensitive Plants 

Monitor and protect populations of long- 
haired star tulip (Calochortus longebarbatus) 
at Wiley Ranch and other suitable habitats 

Monitor and protect slender Orcutt grass 
(Orcuttau tenuas) and Mathias' coyote thistle 
(Eryngrum mathaasiae) populations, and di- 
rect grazing away from vernal pools Inven- 
tory for Boggs Lake hedge-hyssop (Gratrola 
heterosepala) and additional slender Orcutt 
grass and Mathias' coyote thistle popula- 
tions in vernal pools and simlar habitat 

Inventory for  Bellinger's meadowfoam 
(Lrmnanthes j'loccosa spp bellingerrana) in 
vernal pools, drainages, and other season- 
ally wet areas 

Inventory for Modoc County knotweed (Poly- 
gonum polygaloides spp esoteracum) in ver- 
nal pools and adobe flat type areas 

5 Monitor and protect Egg Lake monkeyflower 
(Mcmulus pygmaeus) in the proposed mm- 
bered Crater RNA, and inventory for addi- 
tional populations in seasonally wet areas. 

Special Areas 

1 Prepare and implement RNA management 
plans for 'lhmbered Crater andMayfield when 
the RNA's are established. 

Wildlife 

1. Retain hardwoods. Prohibit firewood use of 
standmg hardwoods. 

Implement road closures to protect the bald 
eagle nest a t  Big Lake 

Give pnonty to mule deer in the allocation of 
forage 

Regenerate decadent brushfields to  improve 
deer winter range. 

Protect lava tubes and caves as necessary to 
provlde for bat roosting and maternity colo- 
nies 

Where feasible, develop wetlands toincrease 
waterfowl production and provlde habitat 
for fall migrants. 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

Prescnution Acres 

A Non-Timber Wildlife 
B Range-Wildlife 
E Early Successional 
K RockyISparse 
S Special Areas 
T Timber 
V ViewrTimber 
Z Minimal Management 

Total 

9,900 
2,000 

100 
3,580 
2,500 
5,710 
1,200 

28,620 

53,610 
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D. WILDLIFE HABITAT F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
ALLOCATIONS STRATEGTES 

Bald Eagle Territones 1 Allotment Strategy 
Goshawk Temtories 3 

North Hot Spnngs (100%) C 
Other Emphasis Species Deer ( m t e r  range), South Hot Spnngs (100%) B 

gray squirrel, hairy woodpecker 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 
Montane Shrub 
Sagebrush 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mixed 
Red Fir 

200 
70 
100 

430 
120 

0 
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' I  
Management Area 

BRITTON 
Scale 
P 
0 .5 1 2 3 4 5 Miles 3/8" = 1 Mile 

January 1992 



A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Britton Management Area is a 
large block of Shasta National Forest land ad- 
ministered by the Lassen National Forest It is 
bounded on the west by the Shasta Lake Ranger 
Distnct boundary and on the other three sides by 
the National Forest boundary Lake Britton is 
the central landmark. Land ownership is highly 
intermingled Non-Forest land includes pnvate 
holdings of major timber companies, ranchers, 
small landowners, and public land administered 
by the Bureau of Land Management and the 
State of California 

Physical Environment Elevations range from 
approximately 2,400 feet a t  the Plt River No 3 
powerhouse to  5,540 feet on Soldier Mountain. 
Precipitation averages 44 inches, rangmg from 
25 inches on the east side of the management 
area to  60 inches in the upper reaches of Screw- 
driver and Rock Creeks. A snowpack generally 
forms above 4,000-5,000 feet Landforms are 
complex and vaned In the typlcal volcanic 
landform, relatively flat areas gwe way abruptly 
to  prominent peaks such as Soldier Mountain 
andBurney Spring Mountain. Theland adjacent 
to Lake Britton is a deep, erodible diatomaceous 
earth deposit with gentle slopes The area to  the 
north of the Pit River below Lake Bntton has 
deeply dissected terrain with perennial streams 
and unstable channels The soils in this area are 
highly productive, but subject to accelerated ero- 
sion that is intensified by the steeper topogra- 
PhY. 

BiologicalEnvironment Vegetation is as vari- 
able as topography Brushland and eastside 
pine type in the lower elevations gwe way to  
mixed conifer at  higher elevations, and Douglas- 
fir forest in the Rock Creek and Screwdriver 
Creek drainages Large meadows at Cayton and 
Long Valleys, and intrusions of oak-woodland 

type, add to the diversity Within forested areas, 
fuel loads are moderate t o  heavy, rangmg from 
20 to 60 tons per acre The majonty ofthe loggmg 
slash has been treated The area averages about 
two lightning fires and three human caused fires 
per year The typical fire size is one to three 
acres Wildlife species are abundant and di- 
verse The lower elevations provide important 
mnter range for mule deer, while the area adja- 
cent to Lake Britton and the Pit River has one of 
the densest populations of bald eagles anywhere 
in California Thelakeitselfis amajorwaterfowl 
area Spotted owls have also been detected a t  
Soldier Mountain, in the Screwdriver Creek 
drainage, and along the Pit River above Pit 4 
Reservoir This management area is the inter- 
face between the northern spotted owl (Feder- 
ally listed as Threatened) and the Califorma 
spotted owl (Forest Service Sensitive) The west- 
ern portion of the management area was desig- 
nated a Habitat Conservation Area in November 
1990 with the Agency's decision to  implement 
the recommendations of the Interagency Scien- 
tific Committee to Address the Conservation of 
the Northern spotted owl Elk are found in the 
far western portion of the management area 
Bank swallows have been found to  nest in the 
walls of the sand pits located along the Pit River 
The Pit River, Lake Bntton, and Rock Creek are 
majorfisheries. Numerous prehistoric sites have 
been located, including major village sites adja- 
cent to Lake Britton An Archaeologxal District 
listed on the National Regster of Historic Places 
has been designated around the lake because of 
these sites 

Management In addition to mining, timber 
harvesting and recreation are major activities 
The Lake Bntton vicinity is an important fuel- 
wood gathering area for the communities ofBur- 
ney and Fall River Mills Cattle grazing also 
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takes place Major efforts have occurred to pro- 
tect and enhance both the bald eagle habitat and 
deer winter range Prescribed fire has been used 
for deer wmter range enhancement. The man- 
agement within the Habitat Conservation Area 
will be determined hy the recovery plan for the 
northern spotted owl At present, few manage- 
ment actinties are permitted Dusty Camp is 
the only National Forest developed recreation 
site, but a PG&E campground, a boat launching 
site, and McArthur-Burney Falls State Park are 
within the area Portions ofthe area are used for 
dispersed camping, hunting, and fishing 

Facilities About 20 miles of the Pacific Crest 
National Scenic Trail (PCT) crosses the area. 
Highways 89 and 299 and the McCloud River 
Railroad are major travel corridors Large-scale 
mming of the diatomaceous earth around Lake 
Britton began in 1982 and more extensive op- 
erations are planned Applications for oil and 
gas leases cover nearly the entire area, but no 
leases have been issued 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Air Quality 

1 Require surfacing of all roads used for com- 
mercial purposes in areas of diatomaceous 
earth 

Coordinate with air quality control agencies 
in administration of diatomaceous earth min- 
ing operations 

2 

Cultural Resources 

1 Maintain the integrity of the Lake Britton 
Archaeoloacal Distnct 

FirelFuels 

1 Assign a Forest Semce resource representa- 
tive to all fires in the Bald Eagle Manage- 
ment Unit 

Firewood 

1 Give personal use of firewood prionty over 
commercial use 

Fish 

1 Maintain natural flow in Rock Creek. 

2. Cooperate in efforts to reduce impacts on 
fisheries from water level fluctuations in 
Lake Bntton 

Lands 

1 Exchange lands under special use permit to 
McArthur-Burney Falls Memorial State 
Park 

Minerals 

1 Perrmt open pit mining where no conflict 
m t h  bald eagle management would result 

Recreation 

1 MaintamDustyCampasacampgroundtobe 
admmistered by PG&E 

Manage the undeveloped camping area at 
Rock Creek as a dispersed campsite. 

2 

Sensitive Plants 

1 Monitor and protect Dopulations of slender 
Orcutt grass (Orcuttza tenuzs), and Mathias’ 
coyote thistle (Eryngaum mathrasaae) In- 
ventory for Boggs Lake hedge-hyssop (Gra- 
taola heterosepala), Bellmger’s meadowfoam 
(Lamnanthes floccosa spp bellangeraana) and 
additional slender Orcutt grass and Mathias’ 
coyote thistle populations in vernal pools 
and other seasonally wet areas 

Inventory for Salmon Mountains wakerobin 
(Tnllaum ovatum spp oettangerr) in moist 
drainages 

2 

Soils 

1 Develop special management practices for 
all actinties on diatomaceous earth to  re- 
duce erosion and maintain soil productinty 

Timber 

1 Develop and apply special management prac- 
tices to reduce conflicts between livestock 
use and plantation establishment 
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Visual Resources 

1. Meet a vlsual quahty objective of Partial 
Retention in the foreground of the Pacific 
Crest National Scenic Trad from its junction 
unth Forest Road 11 north, from that point 
south, meet Retention. 

Water and Riparian Areas 

1. Rehabilitate Screwdnver and Rock Creeks 
Apply special management practices to pro- 
tect the sensitive nature of these water- 
sheds. 

2. Do not approve mmgoperat i igplans unth- 
out measures to protect the water quality of 
Lake Britton and the Pit River. . 

Wildlife 

1 Mamtain year-long roadclosure 111 the North 
Shore Bald Eagle Territory. 

2. Mamtamseasonalroadclosureinthe Warner 
Grademry Lakes Bald Eagle Management 
Unit. 

3. Apply speclal silvlcultural prescnptions to 
enhance bald eagle habitat 

4 Emphasize hardwood retention; prohibitfire- 
wood use of standing hardwoods 

5. When mampulatmg vegetation, emphasize 
wild turkey habitat where appropnate 

Give mule deer pnonty by allocating forage 
in winter range areas Continue regenerat- 

. ing decadent brushfields to  improve winter 
range. 

7. Provlde bank swallow nesting habitat dur- 
mg mimng reclamation if habitat potential 
exlsts. 

8. Manage the Northern Spotted Owl Habitat 
Consemation Area in a manner not inconsis- 
tent with the Interagency Spotted Owl 
Committee's recommendation. 

' 6 

C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

Prescnption Acres 

A Non-Timber Wildlife 
B Range-Wildhfe 
D Developed Recreation 
F Ripanan/Fish 
K Rocky/Sparse nmber  
L Late Successional 
T Timber 
V Viewfhmber 

4,500 
8,960 

50 
420 

3,100 
12,280 
6,890 
3,310 

Total 39,510 

D. WILDLIFEM~BITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Bald Eagle Terntones 6 
Spotted Owl 

Habitat Areas 3 
Goshawk Territones 7 

Other Emphasis Species. Osprey, pileated wood- 
pecker, hairy woodpecker, deer (winter 
range), gray squirrel, bass 

E. DESIREDSTATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 40 
Montane Shrub 255 
Sagebrush 10 

Conifer Forest. 
Eastside Pine 
Mlxed 
Red Fir 

460 
750 
0 

F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

Blue Lake (100%) C 
Clayton Valley (100%) C 
Soldm Mountain (100%) C 
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Management Area 3 BURNEY d 
Scale - 

0 .5 1 2 3 4 5Miles 1/2" = 1 Mile 

4 January 1992 



A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Burney Management Area is 
compnsed of three isolated parcels of Lassen 
National Forest land They range in size from 40 
to 360 acres and are located within eight miles of 
the town of Bumey 

Physical Environment Elevations on the re- 
maining three National Forest system land par- 
cels m this management area range from 3,400 
feet near Brush Mountain to 4,200 feet near the 
Vista Point on Highway 2993 With the excep- 
tionoftheparcelatVistaPoint, themanagement 
area is relatively flat Although the perennial 
Goose Creek and Burney Creek pass through the 
management area, neither crosses National For- 
est land Precipitation ranges from 20 to 60 
inches and averages 38 inches, the snow level is 
usually above 4,000 feet The area has well- 
developed forest soils from basalt parent mate- 
nal 

Biological Environment Vegetation is east- 
side pine type in the eastern half and mured 
conifer in the western half Fuel loadings in 
these stands are moderate. Fires in the area are 
typically low intensity and less than one acre in 
size They are distnbuted equally between hght- 
nlng and human-caused fires and occur at  the 
rate oftwo to three per year During an extreme 
drought in 1977, a wildfire consumed 820 acres, 
23 acres of which were National Forest land. 
Wildlife species in the area are typical of the 
mixed conifer and eastside pine types. The 
development and management of the private 
lands in and around Burney has a major effect on 
wldlife populations. 

Management While intensive timber cutting 
has occurred on adjacent private lands, harvest- 
ing on the National Forest land has been light 
and hmited pnmarily to  sanitation harvests 

The scattered nature of the ownership, low tim- 
ber volumes, and high harvest costs account for 
the light harvests The area is intensively used 
for firewood gathenngby Burneyresidents, caus- 
ing problems for adjacent landowners because of 
hffenng fuelwood cutting policies and poorly 
defined property lines Recent land exchanges 
have eliminated all but three parcels from Na- 
tional Forest ownership 

Facilities Management of the area has focused 
on permittee projects such as highway corndors 
(Highway 89 & 299), telephone lines, and the 
Vista Point mewing facility Some parcels have 
been subject t o  geothermal lease applications 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Air Quality 

1 Cooperate with State and local air quality 
agencies t o  monitor air quality 

Firewood 

1 Give personal use of firewood priority over 
industnal use. 

Lands 

1 Dispose of all tracts through exchanges ex- 
cept those under special use permit t o  Bur- 
ney High School, or tracts desirable for Sen- 
sitive species management 

Sensitive Plants 

1 Monitor and protect, if necessary, popula- 
tions of long haired star tulip (Calochortus 
longebarbatus) Inventory meadows for ad- 
ditional populations 
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2. 

3 

Monitor and protect slender Orcutt grass 
(Orcuttia tenuzs) and other vernal pool spe- 
cies populations, and exclude vernal pools 
from grazing allotments Inventory for pos- 
sible Boggs Lake hedge hyssop (Gratzola 
heterosepala), Mathias coyote thistle (Eryn- 
gzum mathzasae), and additional Orcuttia 
populations in vernal pools 

Inventory for possible Bellmger’s meadow- 
foam (Lzmnanthesfloccosa spp bellzngerzana) 
in vernal pools, drainages, and other season- 
ally wet areas. 

Wildlife 

1 When manipulating vegetation, emphasize 
w l d  turkey habitat where appropnate. 

C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

Prescnption Acres 

B Range-Wildlife 
V View/Timber 

370 
170 

Total 540 

D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Emphasis Species Gray squirrel, hairy wood- 
pecker 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 
Montane Shrub 
Sagebrush 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mlxed 
Red Fir 

5 
0 
0 

13 
8 
0 

F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

None 
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Management Area 4 HAT CREEK 
Scale 
P 
0 .5 1 2 3 4 5Miles 3/8" = 1 Mile 

January 1992 i 



A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Hat Creek Management Area 
encompasses Hat CreekValley It is bordered by 
the Hat Creek Rim to the east and a series of 
volcanic peaks and cones to the west This area 
is charactenzed by recent volcanic activlty Hat 
Creek (including Honn Creek), flowmgthe length 
ofthe area, and Lost Creek are the only streams 
Numerous homes, ranches, and two small towns 
are located on the pnvate land that borders 
much of the creek 

Physical Environment Elevations range from 
3,250 feet at the north end of the valley to  6,552 
feet a t  the top of Sugarloaf Mountain, a large 
volcano at the south end of the valley The 
terrain is generally flat except for Sugarloaf 
Peak and the Hat Creek Rim where slopes range 
from 30 to over 70 percent The valley receives 
about 22 inches of precipitation per year of which 
one third comes as snow The mild summers are 
conducive to  the high recreation use Soils are 
primarily volcanic in origm, although some deep 
alluvial deposits are found throughout the val- 
ley A few cinder cones occur in the area 

Biological Environment Vegetation ranges 
from extensive areas ofjunlper, digger pine, and 
brush on the lava flows to  meadows and riparian 
vegetation near Hat Creek Forested areas are 
limited to small isolated stands on the edges of 
the area Fuel loads vary from light to heavy, 
with the greatest concentrations in the forested 
areas The valley has the highest fire occurrence 
on the Hat Creek District, averaging between 15 
and 20 acres per year About half of these fires 
are of human origm The typical fire size is less 
than one acre, however, in September 1987, the 
Lost Fire started from a lightning strike and 
burned more than 23,000 acres before it was 
controlled The area is part of the winter range 
for the Hat Creek mule deer herd The riparian 

zones along Hat and Lost Creeks provide impor- 
tant wildlife habitat These creeks are also good 
trout fisheries, Hat Creek is stocked regularly 
Lost Creek ongmates in a canyon from springs 
thought to be fed from Butte Creek to the east 
Lost Creek continues across the Hat Creek Val- 
ley floor t o  pnvate land Several places along the 
valley are spiritually important to the local Na- 
tive Americans Sugarloaf Mountain is one such 
sensitive area over which disputes have occurred 
in the past 

Management Due to  the rocky, sparse nature 
of timber stands, timber production and fire- 
wood cutting are low Grazing is confined to an 
area on the east side of the valley called Murken 
Bench, which is used for spring grazing by ranch- 
ers based in the valley Recreation is a dominant 
use in the area State Highway 89 runs the 
length of the valley parallel to Hat Creek and 
provides access to several high-use developed 
campgrounds A portion of the area is within the 
designated Hat Creek Recreational Area Sev- 
eral picnic and day use areas, interpretive trails, 
a panoramic point, and a geologxal area inter- 
preting lava flows and the valley’s origm are 
present A number of trails link the valley floor 
to the Pacific Crest Trail along the Hat Creek 
n m  An active cinder mining operation is located 
in the northern end of the area a t  Six Mile Hill 

Facilities The area is primarily accessible from 
Highway 89/44, the Murken Bench road, and a 
few National Forest roads A small area has been 
subject t o  geothermal lease application, while oil 
and gas lease applications cover much of the 
area, but no leases have been issued Hat Creek 
has attracted attention for development of small 
hydroelectric facilities Such proposals have 
generated considerable local debate 
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Special Areas A 380 acre area on Murken 
Bench is established as a botanical special inter- 
est area representing a disjunct occurrence of 
vegetation from the Sacramento Valley foothills 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Cultural Resources 

1 Protect the cultural features of Sugarloaf 
Mountain and Lost Creek Canyon 

2. At recreation facilities, provide information 
on the  cultural history of the area. 

Firewood 

1 Give personal use of firewood prionty over 
commercial use 

Fish 

1 Investigate habitat improvement opportuni- 
ties in Hat Creek, including developingpools, 
riffles and instream cover, where deficient 

Recreation 

1. Improve access to Hat Creek for fishing be- 
low the Bridge Day Use area behind Honn 
Camp 

Provlde at least one site that can be used by 
the physically challenged a t  each developed 
recreation area 

Improve Hat Group Camp, and expand Bndge 
Campground thereafter 

4. Develop a water source along the Pacific 
Crest Trail a t  Rocky Jewel Mine 

Develop a roadside overlook ofthe Hat Creek 
Valley on Forest Road 18 

Maintain Hat Creek in a natural and free 
flowing condition within at least one-half 
mile of any developed recreation site. 

Maintain Hat Creek in a natural and free 
flowingcondition at  least one-halfmile north 

2 

3 

5 

6 

7 

of Lassen Volcanic National Park’s northern 
boundary 

Manage the undeveloped campsites at  Twin 
Bridges as dispersed campsites 

8 

Sensitive Plants 

1 Monitor and protect populations of Boggs 
Lake hedge-hyssop (Gratcola heterosepala), 
and other rare vernal pool species, on Murken 
Bench Inventory for additional populations 
in vernal pool type habitats 

Soils 

1 Prohibit tractor loggmgon cinder cone slopes 
steeper than 20 percent 

Special Areas 

1 Prepare andimplementaplanfortheMurken 
Special Interest Area, t o  protect and high- 
light the botanical area’s distinctive features 

Visual Resources 

1 Alongthe Pacific Crest National Scenic Trail 
north of the Hat Creek Rim lookout, meet a 
visual quality objective of Retention in the 
foreground South of the lookout meet a 
visual quality objective of Partial Retention 
in the foreground seen from the trail 

Maintain a high level ofvlsual qualityin the 
Hat Creek Valley Recreation Complex and 
within areas visible from Highways 89 and 
44 

Meet a vlsual quality objective of Retention 
along Hat Creek within one-half mile of any 
developed recreation site 

2 

3 

Water and Riparian Areas 

1 Maintain and improve riparian habitat along 
Hat Creek 

The extent of Forest Service authority, no 
development of hydroelectric power facilities 
would be permitted on Hat Creek 

2 
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Wildlife 

1. Protect lava tubes and caves as necessary to 
provlde for bat roosting and maternity colo- 
nies 

Protect and enhance foragmg and nesting 
habitat for osprey 

2 

C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

Prescnption Acres 

A 
B 
D 
F 
K 
N 

S 
V 
Z 

Non-Timber Wddlife 
Range-Wildlife 
Developed Recreation 
RipariadFish 
Rocky/Sparse nmber 
Sem-Pnmtive 

Special 
Viewmmber 
M e a l  Management 

Total 

Non-Motorized 

1,800 
2,900 
140 

1,500 
5,880 

14,900 
400 

8,360 
13,650 

49,530 

D. WILDLIFEHABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Peregrine Falcon Temtones 1 
Goshawk Territones 1 

Other Emphasis Species. Deer (nnnter range), 
rainbow trout 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 490 
Montane Shrub 250 
Sagebrush 390 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mured 
Red Fir 

380 
260 
0 

F. RANGEAUOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

Hat Creek (25%) C 
Horse Valley (75%) C 
Murken Lake (100%) C 
Sur Mile (100%) C 
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A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Ladder Management Area is 
bounded to thenorth by BureauofLandManage- 
ment lands near the Fall River Valley The main 
drainage is Beaver Creek, which is tnbutary to 
the Pit River. Lost Creek ongmates in the 
southern portion of the area, and the intermit- 
tent Proctor Creek drains some ofthe area. Afew 
small inholdings of pnvate land are present. 

Physical Environment The area IS generally 
flat, but has several small mountains and buttes 
Elevation ranges from 3,600 feet along Hat Creek 
Rim to  6,037 feet on Blacks Ridge The climate 
is characterized by low rainfall, averaging 18 
inches and reaching a maximum of 25 inches at  
the higher elevations Though the area is large, 
it has only a few small streams due to the gentle 
slopes and permeable volcanic terrain. Forest 
and range soils, derived from andesite, basalt, 
and rhyolite, vary from shallow to deep. Rhyolite 
soils are infertile and erodible 

BiologicalEnvironment Vegetation is varied 
Brush and juniper woodlands occupy the lower 
elevations, eastside ponderosa pine type is domi- 
nant in the mid-elevations; and scattered stands 
ofmixed conifers are found on the mountain tops. 
Numerous dry meadows and flats are inter- 
spersed within the pine forests Fuel loads in the 
pine stands range from moderate to heavy, and 
the majonty have been treated Fires have been 
generally limited to lightning fires; a few were 
human-caused. The largest in recent history 
was the Lost Fire of 1987, which started from a 
lightning stnke in the lava rocks along the west 
side ofthe area and burned 23,000 acres before it 
was controlled Over 4,000 acres of the area 
required reforestation after this fire The area is 
veryimportant as wlntenng and transition range 

for mule deer. Goshawk populations are signifi- 
cant, and the area also supports a modest num- 
ber of antelope. Fishenes are found mainly in 
many small reservoirs populated by warm-water 
species. The largest of these is Bald Mountain 
Reservoir which is also a very important wetland 
for waterfowl Numerous other areas have been 
developed for waterfowl, notably the Beaver 
Creek wetlands and Cone Reservoir Prehistori- 
cal and historical resources are mainly centered 
around the meadows and stream courses These 
areas were used by Native Amencans for food 
gathenng and camping, and by the sheep herd- 
ers of the late 1800's 

Management Timber production has been ex- 
tensive throughout this unit Many ofthe larger- 
sized trees have been removed, and tens of thou- 
sands of acres of young trees have been thinned 
Some of the first techniques for slash treatment 
were developed in this area The areas closest to 
Fall River Valley are important firewood areas. 
Rangelands are very productive Seven different 
range allotments (Proctor Creek, Bainbridge, 
Bald Mountain, Willow Springs, Butte Creek, 
Horse Valley, and Bear Valley) cover the area 
and provide spnng and summer grazing Hunt- 
ing and camping are major uses of the area 
dunng deer season 

Facilities The Pacific Crest National Scenic 
Trail runs along the western edge of the area 
along Hat Creek Rim. The Union Pacific Rail- 
road passes through the area The area is h e a d y  
roaded, Forest Roads 18 and 22 and County Road 
111 are the major travel routes Part of the area 
has been subject t o  geothermal lease application. 
The entire area has been subject t o  oil and gas 
lease application, but no leases have been issued 

Chapter 4-Management Direction 4-101 



B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Cultural Resources 

1. Maintain the cultural setting of Lost Creek 

Facilities 

1 Initiate a feasibility study with Lassen 
County to identify and perpetuate one major 
north-south travel route ulthin the west half 
of the management area. 

Recreation 

1. Develop a water source for the Pacific Crest 
Trail 

Manage the undeveloped camping area at 
Bald Mountain Reservoir as a dispersed 
campsite. 

2 

Sensitive Plants 

1 Monitor and protect populations of Boggs 
Lake hedge-hyssop (Gratrola heterosepala) 
Inventory for slender Orcutt grass (Orcuttza 
tenurs), Mathas’ coyote thistle (Eryngaum 
mathrasae), Bellinger’s meadowfoam 
(Lzmnanthes floccosa ssp. bellzngenanal and 
additional Boggs Lake hedge-hyssop in ver- 
nal pools, reservoir edges, and other season- 
ally wet areas. 

Soils 

1. Prohibit tractor loggmg on rhyolitic soils 
with slopes steeper than 35 percent 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet a vlsual quality objective of Partial 
Retention in the foreground of the Pacific 
Crest National Scenic Trail from the Hat 
Creek Lookout to the south, from that point 
north, meet Retention Maintain remaining 
shade 

Water and Riparian Areas 

1 Maintain Beaver Creekerosion control struc- 
tures 

Maintain and improve npanan habitat along 
Beaver Creek and around Willow Springs. 

2 

Wildlife 

1 Manage grazing to protect the integnty of 
waterfowlnestingon developed wetland sites 

Where feasible, develop wetlands to iacrease 
waterfowl production and provlde habitat 
for fall migrants 

Continue to regenerate decadent brushfields 
to improve mnter range for the West Lassen 
deer herd. 

Provlde “high” habitat capability levels of 
snags around wetlands fornpanan- and snag- 
dependent species (see Appendur 0) 

5. Enhance habitat for pronghorn antelope 
through manipulating vegetation, develop- 
ing waterholes, and limiting road density. 

Retain oaks specifically for ulldlife habitat. 

2 

3 

4 

6 

C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

Prescnption 

A Non-Timber Wildlife 
B Range-Wildlife 
E Early Successional 
F Ripariaflish 
K Rocky/Sparse mmber 
T Timber 
V Viewmmber 

Total 

Acres 

2,700 
19,440 
200 

2,180 
9,570 
31,780 
4,220 

70,090 
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D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Goshawk Temtones 7 

Other Emphasis Species. Deer (winter range), 
hairy woodpecker, mallard, pronghorn ante- 
lope, bass. 

E. DESIREDSTATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 90 
Montane Shrub 0 
Sagebrush 220 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mixed 
Red h r  

2305 
60 
0 

F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

Bainbridge (100%) D 
Bald Mountain (100%) C 
Bear Valley (50%) D 
Butte Creek (25%) D 
Horse Valley (25%) C 
Proctor Creek (100%) D 
Willow Springs (90%) D 
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A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Black Jack Management Area is 
on the eastern edge of the Hat Creek Ranger 
Distnct It is bounded on the north by the 
National Forest boundary, on the east and south 
by the Eagle Lake Ranger Distnct, and on the 
west by Blacks Ridge and the base of Blacks 
Mountain Private land extends around the base 
of Blacks Mountain and throughout the eastern 
half of the area 

Physical Environment Elevations range from 
4,400 feet in the north to 7,286 feet on Blacks 
Mountain. The terrain is dommated by the 
gentle slopes of Blacks Mountain in the west and 
Blacks Ridge in the north The area generally 
drains northerly to the Pit River and contains 
several creeks, small intermittent lakes, and 
reservoirs Precipitation averages 22 inches 
annually, usually occurring as snow dunng No- 
vember through March Soils have developed on 
an older basalt landscape The forest soils are 
often rocky The soils of the valleys are deep 
black clays and other alluvlal soils, and the 
numerous sagebrush flats are the result of shal- 
low clay soils overlyng hardpans 

Biological Environment The vegetation is 
predominantly eastside pine type forest with 
juniper and sagebrush along the northern bor- 
der Mixed conifer and true fir stands are found 
on the upper slopes of Blacks Mountain Fuel 
loads in forested areas range from light to mod- 
erate The majority of the slash on National 
Forest land has been treated, but slash remains 
heavy and untreated on adjacent private lands 
Lightning causes about three to five fires per 
year, usually under one acre in size Human- 
caused fires are rare The area includes wildlife 
habitat typical ofeastside pine Bald eagles have 
histoncally nested near Big Jacks Lake, but no 
current use in known The area is very impor- 

tant to antelope, osprey, sandhill cranes, and 
waterfowl Goshawks Inhabit the scattered old 
growth pine stands Prehistorical sites are fre- 
quently located adjacent t o  meadows and stream 
courses Blacks Mountain has relimous signifi- 
cance to Native Americans 

Management Timber is being intensively man- 
aged both on public and pnvate lands The area 
is used for firewood gathering by Little Valley 
and Pittvllle residents. It is also important for 
cattle grazing and includes parts of the Bear 
Valley, Willow Spnngs and Dixie Range Allot- 
ments Dispersed recreation occurs primarily 
dunng hunting season 

Facilities The area is crossed by many Forest 
roads. Two portions of the area have been sub- 
ject to geothermal lease application, and two 
others have been Subject t o  oil and gas lease 
application 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Lands 

1 Provlde for a Forest Service microwave link 
on Blacks Mountain 

Sensitive Plants 

1 Inventory for stoloniferous pussy-toes (An- 
tennaria flagellaris) in low sagebrush areas 

Inventory for Modoc County knotweed (Poly- 
gonumpolygalordesspp esotericum) in adobe 
flat and dry pond basin areas 

2 
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Wildlife D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 

Manage grazing to protect the integnty of 
waterfowl nesting on developed wetland sites 

Obtain water nghts and develop Long Valley 
for waterfowl production. 

Provlde “high” habitat capability levels o f  
snags around wetlands for ripanan and snag 
dependent species 

Manage to enhance bald eagle habitat a t  Big 
Jacks Lake 

Enhance hahitat for pronghorn antelope 
through manipulating vegetation, develop- 
ing waterholes, and limting road density 

Develop sandhill crane habitat where fea- 
sible. 

C. PRESCRIPTIONALLOCATION 

Prescription Acres 

A 
B 
E 

Non-Timber Wildlife 1,200 

Early Successional 200 
Range-Wildlife 5,220 

F RipanadFish 1,580 
K Rocky/Sparse Rmber 13,500 
L Late Seral 400 
T Timber 8,000 

Total 30,100 

ALLOCATIONS 

Bald Eagle Temtones i 
Goshawk Territones 4 

Other Emphasis Species: Osprey, hairy wood- 
pecker, mallard, sandhill cranes, pronghorn 
antelope, bass 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 5 
Montane Shrub 1 
Sagebrush 90 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 1035 
Mixed 390 
Red Fir 0 

F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

Bear Valley (50%) D 
Dixie Valley (>95%) D 
Willow Springs (10%) D 
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Management Area 7 - 
GOOCH 

k DESCRIPTION 

Location The Gooch Management Area is in 
the northeast corner ofthe Forest The boundary 
between the Hat Creek and Eagle Lake Ranger 
Distncts forms the western edge of the area 
Although National Forest and pnvate owner- 
ship is intermured, National Forest ownership is 
dommant in the north and east 

Physical Environment The area is part of the 
gently rolling Modoc Plateau Elevations range 
from 5,800 feet up to 7,136 feet a t  Slate Moun- 
tain. Annual precipitation, as low as 16 inches in 
some areas, averages 19 inches Soils are gener- 
ally very rocky and moderately productive, mead- 
ows have deep alluvlal soil 

Biological Environment Of the three wet- 
lands in the area, two have been developed for 
waterfowl production No significant creeks are 
present. Vegetation consists of mlved conifer, 
eastside pine, brushfield, and grass-sage com- 
munities Sagebrush flats are intermingled with 
forested islands Large areas of noncommercial 
forest land are sparsely stocked mth scattered 
pine and juniper. In forested areas, fuel loads 
are moderate to heavy as a result of loggmg and 
precommercial thinning. Although several large 
fires burned here in the 1940’s and 1950’s, only 
ten small fires, mostly lightning-caused, have 
occurred in the past ten years. Habitat for mule 
deer, pronghorn antelope, sandhill cranes, mal- 
lard, goshawk, pileated woodpecker, and hald 
eagles is present The southeast corner of the 
Hayden Hill State Game Refuge is within the 
area Prehistorical and histoncal cultural sites 
are numerous. 

Management Many of the area’s larger-sized 
trees have been harvested. Over 1,000 acres of 
eastside pme have beenprecommercially thinned 
The Gooch Valley Range Allotment and slivers of 

the North Eagle Lake and Champs Flat Range 
Allotments provide cattle grazing in the area 
Deer hunting is substantial in the fall 

Facilities Several oil and gas lease applications 
have been filed for lands in the area Existing 
cinder pits lie atop Dow Butte and Lava Peak 
The area is accessed by Forest roads, since it is 
locatedseveralmiles west of StateHighway 139. 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Lands 

1 Acquire lands to allow the development of 
additional waterfowl nesting habitat 

Sensitive Plants 

1 Inventory for stoloniferous pussy-toes 
(Antennaria flagellaris) in low sagebrush 
areas. 

Inventory for Modoc County knotweed (Poly- 
gonumpolygaloides spp esoterzcum) in adobe 
flat and dry pond basin areas 

2 

Wildlife 

1 Encourage waterfowl production a t  Summit 
and Bullard Lakes, and modifylivestockgraz- 
ing to maintain the integrity of developed 
wetlands 

Protect and enhance nesting habitat forsand- 
hill cranes 

Provlde, a t  a minimum, “medium” habitat 
capability for deer summer range 

2 

3 
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C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

Prescnption Acres 

A Non-nmber Wildlife 1,200 
B Range-Wildlife 6,960 
E Early Successional 100 
F RipanadFish 100 
K Rocky/Sparse nmber  6,900 

Total 15,260 

D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Goshawk Territories I 

Other Emphasis Species Deer (summer range), 
mallard, sandhill crane, pronghorn antelope, 
fisher 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 0 
Montane Shrub 0 
Sagebrush 110 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 440 
Mixed 40 
Red Fir 0 

F. WGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

Champs Flat (<5%) D 
Gooch Valley (100%) D 
North Eagle Lake (15%) D 

4-1 10 
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A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Snow Mountain Management 
Area is an isolated block on the west side of the 
Forest surrounded by pnvate timber company 
lands. It consists of a group of mountain peaks 
(Snow, Clover, and Green Mountains) that form 
the headwaters for many streams Hatchet, 
Green Bumey, Montgomery, Cedar, and Little 
Cow Creeks 

Physical Environment Elevations range from 
4,600 feetto6,814feet onSnowMountain Slopes 
are steep and unstable in many places, acceler- 
ated surface erosion and mass wasting can be a 
problem if soil disturbance is excessive The 
streams that flow from the area are good fisher- 
ies; several are heavily used for domestic pur- 
poses downstream Annual precipitation is high, 
averagmg 79 inches with a little over half falling 
as snow. The soils are derived from andesite and 
are very productive in the timbered areas 

Biological Environment The vegetation 
changes from a sub-alpine type around the small 
glaciallakes to  mixed conifer on thelower slopes. 
The timber site is very good and contributes a 
significant portion of the District’s potential tim- 
ber veld. Existingfuels in the forested areas are 
pnmarily natural accumulations, and loads vary 
wdely from moderate to  extreme Fires have 
been few in the past, all were lightning-caused 
The timber on public land is essentially un- 
touched Wildlife species that inhabit the Snow 
Mountain country are marten, mountain lion, 
black bear, and possibly wolverine The area is 
suitable spotted owl habitat and is an important 
fawning ground for black-tailed deer Fisheries 
on Green Burney and Hatchet Creeks have small 
populations ofbrook and rainbow trout Numer- 
ous small lakes near Snow Mountain were his- 
torically used by Native Americans for rehgmus 
purposes 

Management This management area is prima- 
nly managed for spotted owl, marten, and fisher 
habitat Timber harvest mll occur only if it is 
determined to  be compatible with habitat for 
these species. Marten and fisher habitat man- 
agement areas have not been placed on the man- 
agement area map pending field verification 

Recreation use for hiking, hunting, and camping 
is concentrated around Seven Lakes and in the 
higher country 

Facilities The area lies several miles south of 
State Highway 299 and does not have good ac- 
cess Currently, only one old road built during 
CCC days goes through the area Geothermal, 
and oil, and gas lease applications have been 
filed on most of the area, but no leases have been 
issued 

Special Areas One small stand of old growth 
trees is established as a special interest area, the 
Montgomery Creek Grove Botanical Area 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Cultural Resources 

1 Protect the cultural features of Snow Moun- 
tain and Dan Hunt Mountain 

Facilities 

1 Obliterate the Blue Lake access road 

Fish 

1 In cooperation with California Department 
of Fish and Game evaluate the opportunity 
to stock Seven Lakes with grayling 

Chapter 4-Management Direction 4-113 



Geology C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

1 Consider geoloec instability in all manage- 
ment activities and prescnptions 

Lands 

1 Maintain the management area in public 
ownership 

Minerals 

1. Recommend withdrawal of the Montgomery 
Creek Grove Special Interest Area from min- 
eral entry and mineral leasing 

Recreation 

1 Construct a trail to provide access to  the 
senu-primitive non-motorized (SPNM) area 

Close any existingmotorized access routes in 
Semi-Pnmitive Non-Motonzed areas to mo- 
tonzed public use 

Sensitive Plants 

1 

2 

Inventory for Salmon Mountains wakerobin 
(Tnllzum ovatum spp oettzngerd in moist 
drainages 

Special Areas 

1 Prepare and implement a plan for the Mont- 
gomery Creek Grove Special Interest Area to 
protect the botanical area’s distinctive quali- 
ties 

Wildlife 

1. Regenerate decadent brushfields to improve 
summer deer habitat 

Provlde “high” habitat capability for mar- 
tens, fishers, pileated woodpeckers and spot- 
ted owls 

2 

Prescnption Acres 

B Range-Wildlife 
F RipanadFish 
K Rocky/Sparse Timber 
L Late Successional 
N Semi-Pnmitive 

S Special Areas 
T Timber 
V ViewiTimber 

Non-Motonzed 

200 
100 

1,700 
3,470 

700 
20 

600 
880 

Total 7,670 

D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Marten HMA 2 
Fisher HMA 1 
Spotted Owl Habitat Areas 2 
Goshawk Territories 1 

Other Emphasis Species. Pileated woodpecker, 
and rainbow trout 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 
Montane Shrub 
Sagebrush 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mixed 
Red Fir 

0 
3 
0 

0 
290 

30 

F. RANGE ALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

None 

4-1 14 
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Management Area 9 - 
LOGAN 

A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Logan Management Area is south 
of Burney It is bounded by the National Forest 
boundary on the north and west, by Highway 89 
on the east, and by Grayback Ridge on the south. 
It completely surrounds the Thousand Lakes 
Wilderness Pnvate land is generally concen- 
trated in the north and west sides of the area. 

Physical Environment Elevations range from 
3,200 feet along Highway 89 to 7,863 feet on 
Burney Mountain The volcanic landforms are 
dominated by Burney Mountain and the slopes 
adjacent to the wldemess Topography is not 
severe except for occasional steep slopes up to 60 
percent such as on Wilcox Peak Although there 
are few perennial streams (Bunchgrass Creek 
and Cow Creek), internal drainage forms mter- 
mittent lakes such as Logan Lake, Cornaz Lake, 
andMudLake. Precipitation averages 43 inches, 
varymg significantly from 30 inches at the lower 
elevations to 50 inches 111 the south, falling pn- 
marily as snow above 4,000 feet Soils vary 
widely from deep, productive soil to glacial sedi- 
ment to rocky lava flows. Most soils are stony. A 
few cinder cones occur in this area 

Biological Environment Vegetative cover 
vanes from eastside pine type in the northeast 
corner to mlxed conifer, red fir, and lodgepole 
pine a t  the higher elevations. Mixed conifer 
stands interspersed with brush fields occur 
throughout the area. Most of the brushfields 
have been cleared and planted to ponderosa and 
Jeffrey pine. Much of the area has generally 
heavy fuel loads Slash has been adequately 
treated except in true fir stands where a signifi- 
cant problem still exists On the interspersed 
pnvate land, fuels have not been treated after 
loggmg and loads are heavy to extreme Light- 

ning starts about five to eight fires annually, 
they are typically low intensity and under one 
acre in size. Human-caused fires are rare Wild- 
hfe habitat is diverse Spotted owls, goshawks, 
osprey, pileated woodpeckers, fisher, and mar- 
ten potentially occur wthm the area Burney 
Mountain and other prominent peaks have spiri- 
tual significance to  the local Native Amencans 

Management Intensive timber production is 
the pnncipal activlty on both National Forest 
and private land The area also includes portions 
of the Hat Creek, Burney Spnngs and Magee 
Peak Range Allotments Residents of Burney 
and Hat Creek valley use the area for firewood 
cutting. Dispersed camping is heavy during 
hunting season The area is used to access the 
four trailheads into the Thousand Lakes Wilder- 
ness 

Facilities The Ashpan Snowmobile Park along 
Highway 89/44 in the southeast end of the area 
was completed in 1981 and receives significant 
mnter use It is linked to an extensive road 
system in both this and the Red Management 
Area The areais accessedbyHighway89/44and 
many Forest Servlce roads Geothermal lease 
applications have been made for two parts of the 
area, but no leases have been issued 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Firewood 

1 Give personal use of firewood priority over 
commercial use in the northern half of the 
Management Area 
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Lands C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

1. Acquire inholdings containingripanan habi- 
ta t  

Recreation 

1. Continue designation of trails and restnct 
snow plowmg of snowmobile trails for timber 
sales between December 1 and Apnl 1 

Develop new trailheads for the Cypress and 
Tamarack trails. 

Manage the undeveloped camping areas at 
Burney Spnngs, Tamarack Swale, and Logan 
Lake as dispersed campsites 

2. 

3 

Sensitive Plants 

1. Inventory for long-haired star tulip (Calo- 
chortus longzbarbatus) in meadow areas 

Soils 

1 Prohbit tractorloggmgon cinder cone slopes 
steeper than 20 percent 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet a vlsual quality objective of Partial 
Retention in the foreground of Forest Roads 
16 and 26, and require extensive slash 
cleanup for new timber sales 

2. Meet a vlsual quality objective of Partial 
Retention in the background as seen from 
the Thousand Lakes Wilderness looking 
south, Highway 44 on Hat Creek Rim, and 
Lassen Volcanic National Park 

Meet a vlsual quality objective of Partial 
Retention in the foreground ofthe Tamarack 
Trail access road 

3 

Wildlife 

Prescnption Acres 

A Non-fimber Wildlife 
B Range-Wildhfe 
D Developed Recreation 
E Early Successional 
F RipananiFish 
K Rocky/Sparse mmber 
L Late Successional 
T Timber 
V ViewiTimber 
Z Minimal Management 

3,100 
2,700 

10 
800 
350 

14,230 

8,900 
9,360 
100 

-10,300 

Total 49,850 

D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Fisher HMA 1 
Marten HMA 5 
Spotted Owl Habitat Areas 6 
Goshawk Terntories 7 

Other Emphasis Species Osprey, pileated wood- 
pecker 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 
Montane Shrub 
Sagebrush 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mixed 
Red Fir 

30 
120 

2 

40 
1695 
240 

F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

1 Regenerate decadent brushfields to  improve Allotment Strategy 
summer range for the Cow Creek deer herd 

Burney Springs (100%) A 
2 Where feasible, develop wetlands to  increase Hat Creek (25%) C 

waterfowl production and provide habitat Magee Peak (100%) A 
for fall migrants 
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Management Area 10 - 
SUMMIT 

A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Summit Management Area is 
bounded by Lassen Volcanic National Park on 
the south, Hat Creek Rim on the west, Butte 
Creek Rim and the Eagle Lake Ranger District 
boundary on the east, and a minor road on the 
north The private land is in scattered parcels 

Physical Environment The elevations range 
from 4,900 feet in the north to  7,400 feet in the 
south on the slopes of Prospect Peak, however, 
most of the area is quite flat with an average 
elevation of about 5,000 feet No perennial 
streams occur Precipitation averages 24 inches 
a year, pnmarily in the form of snow dunng 
November through March The forest soils are 
relatively deep, with small meadows found on 
alluvial soils A few cinder cones occur in this 
area 

Biological Environment Vegetation is gen- 
erallyeastside pine typemth mmed conifer stands 
at  higher elevations Fuel loads are quite vari- 
able, from light to heavy. Most of the loggmg 
slash has been adequately treated Lightning 
fires occur at  a rate of two or three per year, but 
average less than one acre per year Important 
summer range exists for mule deer and prong- 
horn antelope Wildlife is typical of that common 
to eastside pine and mixed conifer areas Gos- 
hawk, osprey, and hairy woodpecker are impor- 
tant emphasis species present Several historic 
homestead sites are found in the area, two of 
which are still in use - Butte Creek Ranch, and 
Cone and Ward Ranch An old sheepherder 
cabin is still intact a t  Mountain Home 

Management The principal management ac- 
tivities are timber production and cattle grazing 
Portions of the Butte Creek, Coyote, and Poison 
Lake Range Allotments are included Firewood 

cutting is common throughout Considerable 
dispersed recreation occurs dunng the deer hunt- 
ing season 

Facilities The Pacific Crest National Scenic 
Trail follows Hat Creek Rim along the western 
edge of the area Highway 44 bisects the area 
and is a major travel corridor The Butte Creek 
Road borders the southwest edge of the area and 
is the access route to Butte Lake Campground in 
the National Park. A small portion of the area 
has been subject to oil and gas lease application, 
but no leases have been issued 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

Cultural Resources 

1 Maintain the Mountain Home Sheepherder 
Cabin as a standing ruin 

Recreation 

1 Manage the undeveloped camping areas 
along Butte Creek and at  Bidwell Spnngs as 
dispersed campsites 

Sensitive Plants 

1 Inventory for talus collomia (Collomza debr- 
lrs uar larsenrz) on rocky slopes near Pros- 
pect Peak 

Monitor and protect Boggs Lake hedge-hys- 
sop (Gratzola heterosepala) at  Grassy Lake 
Inventory for additional populations in ver- 
nal pool type habitats 

2 
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Soils 

1. Prohibit tractorloggmgon cinderconeslopes 
steeper than 20 percent. 

Visual Resources 

1 Meet a vlsual quality objective of Partial 
Retention in the foreground of the Pacific 
Crest National Scenic Trail Maintain ad- 
equate shade. 

Meet a vlsual quality objective of Retention 
in the  foreground of the Butte Creek Road 

2 

Wildlife 

1 Regenerate the aspen stands along Butte 
Creek 

Develop wetlands where feasible to increase 
waterfowl production and provide habitat 
for fall migrants, maintain and improve ex- 
isting developed wetlands 

3. Enhance habitat for pronghorn antelope 
through manipulating vegetation, develop- 
ing water, and limiting road density. 

2 

C. PRESCRIPTION ALLOCATION 

Prescription Acres 

A Non-Timber Wildlife 600 
B Range-Wildlife 3,440 
D Developed Recreation 5 
E Early Successional 200 
F RipanadFish 100 
K Rocky/Sparse nmber  5,400 
L Late Successional 230 
N Semi-Primitive Non-Motonzed 2,800 
T Timber 16,340 
V Viewmmber 9,010 

Total 38,125 

D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Goshawk Terntories 2 

Other Emphasis Species: Osprey, deer (summer 
range), hairy woodpecker, pronghorn ante- 
lope. 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 
Montane Shrub 
Sagebrush 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mixed 
Red Fir 

10 
0 
30 

2,115 
520 
0 

F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

Butte Creek (75%) D 
Coyote Spnngs (100%) D 
Poison Lake (25%) D 
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ManagementArea 11 - 
EBEY 

A. DESCRIPTION 

Location The Ebey Management Area is in the 
northwest corner of the Eagle Lake Ranger Dis- 
tnct, adjoinlng the Hat Creek Ranger Distnct 
State Highway 44 is the area's southern bound- 
ary A large tract of pnvate land lies in the 
central portion. Poison Lake is a major land- 
mark 

Physical Environment Topography is flat to 
gently slopingin the west. Cal, Cone, and Patter- 
son Mountains in the east have moderate slopes 
Elevations range from 5,400 feet to 6,682 feet on 
Patterson Mountain Precipitation averages 26 
inches a year. Bedrock consists of basalt lava 
flows. Residual soil and ash overlie the bedrock, 
although exposed bedrock and loose boulders are 
common. A few cinder cones occur in this area 
The western area drains into Butte Creek. 

Biological Environment Major forest types 
are eastside pine and mured conifer Grass-sage 
communities are on the dry flats, and marsh- 
meadow vegetation is in the wetlands Fuel 
loads in forested areas are moderate, except for 
some logged areas with heavy loads. Blacks 
Mountain Experimental Forest has some ex- 
treme fuel loadings. Scars remain from large 
wildfires in the 1920's and 1940's on Cal and 
Cone Mountains; hundreds ofacres are now pine 
plantations, and many are being invaded by 
brush Some brush-grasslands are being 
succeeded by pine. An average of three small 
fires burn each year, and most are caused by 
lightmng. Poison Lake and other wetlands have 
been developed for waterfowl production. Bald 
eagles frequent Poison Lake, but no nests are 
known. Harvest species are mule deer, black- 
tailed deer, pronghorn antelope, and waterfowl. 
A portion of the Blacks Mountain State Game 
Refuge (Refuge 1-F) is in the area. Habitat for 

goshawk, pileated woodpecker, sandhill crane, 
and red fox is also present An ethnographic site 
is near Poison Lake Blacks Mountain has reli- 
DOUS significance for Native Amencans. 

Management Overstory removal and mterme- 
diate cuts have harvested many of the larger 
trees over much of the area. Cattle graze the 
sagebrush flats in the Poison Lake and Grays 
Valley Range Allotments Recreation use is 
light The 10,252-acre Blacks Mountain Experi- 
mental Forest, established in 1934 for study of 
the intenor ponderosa pine forest type, is in the 
area. Therein, 521 acres constitute the Blacks 
Mountain Research Natural Area 

Facilities The historic Lassen and Nobles trails 
traverse the area Cinders are regularly quar- 
ned from several Forest Service pits in the area, 
and geothermal lease applications for explora- 
tion have been filed Lassen County Road 111 
and Forest roads access the area The Union 
Pacific Railroad traverses the area 

B. STANDARDSAND 
GUIDELINES 

FirelFuels 

1 Give high priority to fuel and fire manage- 
ment in and adjacent t o  theBlacksMountain 
Expenmental Forest 

Minerals 

1 Manage the JeskeyandPoison Cinder Pits to 
reduce visual impacts as seen from Highway 
44 
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Sensitive Plants 

1 Monitor and protect Egg Lake monkeyflower 
(Mzmulus pygmaeus) a t  Swains Hole and 
inventory for additional populations in sea- 
sonally wet areas 

Soils 

1. Restrict tractor loggmg on cinder cone slopes 
steeper than 20 percent 

Wildlife 

1. Provide “high” habitat capability for prong- 
horn antelope through seeding, planting, and 
coordmating other resource-use activities. 

2. Encourage waterfowl and sandhill crane pro- 
duction at developed wetlands through struc- 
tural improvements and modificationofgraz- 
ing systems. 

3. Investigate the potential for developingwet- 
lands throughout the area, and implement 
wetland development projects as appropri- 
ate. 

4. Protect and enhance nesting habitat capa- 
bility for bald eagles a t  Poison Lake. Close 
the area to vehicles during the nesting sea- 
son as needed to protect the eagles 

C. PRESCRIPTIONALLOCATION 

Prescription Acres 

A Non-Timber Wildlife 
B Range-Wildlife 
E Early Successional 
F R i p a n a f l i s h  
K Rocky/Sparse nmber  
S Special Areas 
T Timber 
V Viewmimber 

1,500 
4,230 

200 
200 

1,700 
10,600 
8,700 
5,650 

Total 32,780 

D. WILDLIFE HABITAT 
ALLOCATIONS 

Goshawk Territones 2 

Other Emphasis Species. Deer (summer range), 
mallard, bufflehead, sandhill crane, prong- 
horn antelope, bass, red fox, pileated wood- 
pecker. 

E. DESIRED STATE 
FOR DIVERSITY 

Vegetation Acres 

Shrub 
Chaparral 
Montane Brush 
Sagebrush 

Conifer Forest 
Eastside Pine 
Mixed Conifer 
Red Fir 

2 
0 

150 

1,000 
240 
0 

F. RANGEALLOTMENT 
STRATEGIES 

Allotment Strategy 

Grays Valley (25%) D 
Poison Lake (50%) D 
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